RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid “Pyronyl Crop Spray| P |Peitagard and/or
Deltamethrin Imperium
2.00%, 2 x 2.5 Part Number No Bid No Bid N/A 1511662-Deltagard
1500646-Imperium
1 galicase, Orderable Unit of 1 Gal.x4
DeltaGard, or 0-1 No Bid No Bid ' 2.5 Gal. Jug
Measure Gallons/Case
approved Price Per
equivalent Orderable Unit No Bid No Bid $ 1,389.08 $ 625.00
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid $ 1.67 $ 1.97
Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid “Pyronyl Crop Spray| p |Pé/tagard and
Imperium
Deltamethrin, . . i511663-Deltagard
2.00%, 30 gal Part Number No Bid No Bid 826890 i500647-Imperium
drum, Orderable Unit of . .
2 DeltaGard, or 0-1 Measure No Bid No Bid 55 Gal. Drum 30 Gal. Drum
approved Price Per . .
equivalent Orderable Unit No Bid No Bid $ 17,500.00 $ 7,305.00
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid $ 1.53 $ 1.92
Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid S |Perm-X UL 4-4 P |Perm-X 4-4
Permethrin,
4.6% Piperonyl Part Number No Bid No Bid 845638 1501382
Butoxide; 4.6%, -
3 2.5 gal jug, 0.1 |Orderable Unitof | 1\ gy No Bid 2.5 Gal. Jug 2.5 Gal. Jug
. Measure
Pursuit RTU 4-4 Price Por
or approved . No Bid No Bid $ 70.58 $ 64.47
equivalent Orderable Unit
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid $ 0.71 $ 0.65




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid Perm-X 4-4 PermaSease 4-4 Perm-X UL 4-4 S |Perm-X 4-4
Permethrin,
4.6% Piperonyl Part Number 100208989 Sease44-2x2.5 845638 501382
Butoxide; 4.6%, Orderable Unit of
4 |2x2.5gallcase,| 0-1 2 X 2-1/2 Gal. Case 2 X 2.5 Gal. Case 2 X 2.5 Gal. Case 2.5 Gal. Jug
; Measure
Pursuit RTU 4-4, Price Por
or approved . $ 146.80 $ 145.90 $ 141.16 $ 128.94
equivalent Orderable Unit
Price Per Acre $ 0.73 $ 0.61 $ 0.71 $ 0.65
. Chemical Bid S [Perm-X 4-4 PermaSease 4-4 Perm-X UL 4-4 P [Perm-X 4-4
Permethrin,
o/ b
4.6% Piperonyl Part Number 100208943 Sease44-55 845631 1501457
Butoxide; 4.6%,
30 gal drum, Orderable Unit of
5 Pursuit RTU 4-4, 0-1 Measure 30 Gal. Drum 55 Gal. Drum 30 Gal. Drum 30 Gal. Drum
or approved Price Per
aquivalent. Orderable Unit $ 743.20 $ 1,625.25 $ 846.96 $ 638.00
Price Per Acre $ 0.61 $ 0.62 $ 0.71 $ 0.54
_ Chemical Bid P |Anvil 2+2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sumithrin,
0,
éaollo %,2X2.5 Part Number 11599-2.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 |[case, Anvil 2+2, | 0-1 |Orderable Unit of . . .
or approved Measure 2.5 Gal. Jug No Bid No Bid No Bid
equivalent Price Per . . .
Orderable Unit $ 230.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre 2.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid Anvil 2+2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sumithrin, . , .
2.00%, 30 gal Part Number 11601 No Bid No Bid No Bid
drum, Anvil 2+2, Orderable Unit of . . .
7 or approved 0-1 Measure 30 Gal. Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
equivalent Price Per . . .
Orderable Unit $ 2,723.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 2.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid Anvil 2+2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sumithrin, . . .
2.00%. 55 gal Part Number 11602 No Bid No Bid No Bid
drum, Anvil 2+2, Orderable Unit of . . .
8 or approved 0-1 Measure 55 Gal Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
equivalent Price Per . . .
Orderable Unit 3 4,926.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 2.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sumithrin, Chemical Bid Duet No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.00%,
Prallethrin 1%, 2 Part Number 11780-2.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
x 2.5 gal/case, .
9 |Duet, or 0-1|Orderable Unitof | 15 g Gal. Jug No Bid No Bid No Bid
Measure
approved Price Per
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 590.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre 2.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid P |Duet No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sumithrin,
5.00%, Part Number 11781 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prallethrin 1%, -

10 |30 gal drum, 0.1 |OrderableUnitof| a5 oot Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
Duet, or Mgasure
approved (P)”ge Pslr Unit $ 6,991.80 | |No Bid No Bid No Bid
equivalent rderable Uni

Price Per Acre $ 2.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid
_ Chemical Bid P [Duet No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sumithrin,
5.00%, . . .
Prallethrin 1%. Part Number 11782 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 gal drum, Orderable Unit of . . .

11 Duet, or 0-1 Measure 55 Gal Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
approved Price Per . . .
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 12,294.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Per Acre $ 2.23 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid No Bid Dibrom No Bid No Bid
Concentrate
(o)
Naled, 87.40%, Part Number No Bid DIB-30 No Bid No Bid
30 gal drum,

12 |Dibrom, or 0 -1 |Orderable Unit of No Bid 30 Gal. Drum No Bid No Bid
approved Measure
equivalent Price Per . . .

Orderable Unit No Bid $ 8,044.20 No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 2.09 No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid No Bid Fyfanon ULV Fyfanon ULV No Bid
Malathion, . .
96.50%, 5 gal Part Number No Bid FYF-5 846163 No Bid
pail, Fyfanon Orderable Unit of . .
13 ULV Mosquito, 0-1 Measure No Bid 2x2.5 Gal. Case 2 X 2.5 Gal. Case No Bid
or approved Price Per . :
equivalent Orderable Unit No Bid $ 447.25 $ 480.00 No Bid
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 0.50 $ 0.58 No Bid
Chemical Bid No Bid Fyfanon ULV No Bid No Bid
Malathion, . . .
96.50%, 55 gal Part Number No Bid FYF-55 No Bid No Bid
drum, Fyfanon Orderable Unit of . . .
14 ULV Mosquito, 0-1 Measure No Bid 55 Gal. Drum No Bid No Bid
or approved Price Per . : .
equivalent Orderable Unit No Bid $ 4,682.70 No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 0.47 No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid No Bid *VectoPrime FG No Bid P |Sustain MBG
Bti-5.71%, . .
Sustain MGB 40 Part Number No Bid VPRFG-40 No Bid 1506411
15 |lb. bag, or 0-1 [Orderable Unit of No Bid 40 Lb. Bag No Bid 40 Ib. Bag
approved Measure
equivalent Price Per . .
Orderable Unit No Bid $ 166.00 No Bid $ 301.20
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 83.00 No Bid $ 150.60




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid Fourstar Bti 45 *Vectomax WSP No Bid No Bid
Briquets
i 0
Bti-7.00%, Part Number 100519560 VMXWSP-800 No Bid No Bid
Fourstar Bti

16 |Briquets, 45day,| 5, |Orderable Unitof | 1,54 o cage 800 WSP/Case No Bid No Bid
200 ct., or Measure
approved Price Per . .
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 302.00 $ 1,438.40 No Bid No Bid

Price Per Acre $ 657.00 $ 1,566.42 No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid Fourstar Bti 150 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Day Briquets
HR 0
Bti-7.00%, . Part Number 100519561 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fourstar Bti
Briquets, 150 Orderable Unit of . . .

17 day, 200 ct.. or 0-1 Measure 200 Ct Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
approved Price Per . . .
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 782.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Per Acre $ 1,703.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bti-10.00%. Chemical Bid Fourstar Bti CRG No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fourstar Bi Part Number 100515259 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Multi-Brood

18 |CRG, 35 Ib. 0-1 |[Orderable Unit of 35 Lb. Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid
bag., or Measure
approved Price Per . . .
equivalent Orderable Unit 3 455.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Per Acre $ 130.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Bti-10.31%, Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid Summit BTI p [Summit Mosquito
o Briquets Dunks
Summit Bti
Briquets, one Part Number No Bid No Bid 746895 1505893
case of 12 -
19 |individually 0.1 |Orderable Unitof| 1y gy No Bid Case 1 Case
packaged 2 Me_zasure 12 cards = 24
packs, or (F;”ge Pslr Ui No Bid No Bid $ 72.60 $ 52.10
approved rderable Uni
equivalent Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid $ 1,317.69 $ 945.62
. . . . Summit BT Summit Mosquito
Ch | Bid No Bid No Bid .
emical =t ' ' Briquets P |Dunks - 12x6 Pack
Bti-10.31%, Part Number No Bid No Bid 688009 i511184
Summit Bti -
20 [Briquets, 72ct., | 0-1 Orderable Unit of No Bid No Bid Case 1 Case
or approved Measure 12 cards=72
X Price Per . .
lent
equivalen Orderable Unit No Bid No Bid $ 111.00 $ 94.42
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid $ 671.55 $ 571.24
Chemical Bid P :",mm'tt Bt No Bid Summit Bti Briquets | S |Summit Bti Briquets
Bti-10.31%, riguezs
Summit Bti Part Number 11036 No Bid 653683 502908
Briquets, 100 ct., -
21 lor approved 0-1 a;daesrjge Unitof | 1400 ct. case No Bid 100 Ct. Briquets 100 Ct. Briquets
equivalent Price Por
Orderable Unit $ 99.20 No Bid $ 110.00 94.21
Price Per Acre $ 400.74 No Bid $ 479.16 410.38




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid No Bid Vectobac WDG p [Aqua Bac WDG No Bid
3000
Bti-37.40%, 25 Part Number No Bid VECWDG-25 843800 No Bid
Ib. drum, -
22 |VectoBac WDG, | 0- 1 a;daesrage Unitof | INo Bid 25 Lb. Drum 55 Lb. Bag No Bid
or approved - J
equivalent Price Per No Bid $ 1,106.37 $ 2,100.00 | |No Bid
Orderable Unit ’ ’ ’ )
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 38.72 $ 33.41 No Bid
Chemical Bid Natular DT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinosad, . . .
7.48%, 600 ct.. Part Number 11860R No Bid No Bid No Bid
tablets Natular Orderable Unit of . . .
23 DT, or approved 0-1 Measure 600 Ct. Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
equivalent Price Per . . .
Orderable Unit $ 341.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 975.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid Natular DT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinosad, . . .
7.48%. 2500 ct. Part Number 11860PK50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 |tablets Natular 0 -1 |Orderable Unit of 2500 Ct. Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
DT, or approved Measure
equivalent Price Per . . .
Orderable Unit $ 1,386.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 958.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid P |Natular XRT No Bid No Bid No Bid
Spinosad, . , .
6.25% 220 ct., Part Number 11850 No Bid No Bid No Bid
o5 |briquet Natular ), |Orderable Unitof | 1556 of case No Bid No Bid No Bid
XRT, or Measure
approved Price Per . . .
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 1,075.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 2,121.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid P | Fourstar Bti WSP VectoMax WSP No Bid No Bid
Bti-3%, Bs-3%,
800 Part Number 100514312 VMXWSP-800 No Bid No Bid
pouches/case, -
26 |Fourstar 0.4 |Orderable Unitof | 1,44 ot case 800 WSP/Case No Bid No Bid
Measure
WSP, or Price Per
approved ) $ 684.00 $ 1,438.40 No Bid No Bid
equivalent Orderable Unit
Price Per Acre $ 1,489.00 $ 1,566.42 No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid P |Fourstar MBG gﬁg\g"ﬂ;ﬁ J No Bid No Bid
Bti-3%, Bs-3%,
40 Ib. bag, Part Number 100514310 VMXFG-40 No Bid No Bid
Fourstar Multi- -
27 |Brood Granule, | 01 |Orderable Unitof 146 1) Bag 40 Lb. Bag No Bid No Bid
Measure
or approved Price Por
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 396.80 $ 383.04 No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 99.20 $ 191.52 No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid P |Fourstar CRG No Bid No Bid No Bid
i_40 _Qo,
BUi-1%, Bs-9%, Part Number 100514311 No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 Ib. bag,
Fourstar Multi- Orderable Unit of . . .
28 Brood CRG, or 0-1 Measure 35 Lb. Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid
approved Price Per . . .
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 580.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 165.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid ADuplex-G VectoPrime FG | A |*Duplex-G S |Duplex-G
[5) i
?'205//("3;3“ Part Number 100528485 VPRFG-40 832264 1509158
. (o]
Methoprene, 40 Orderable Unit of
29 Ib. bag, Duplex 0-1 Measure 40 Lb. Bag 40 Lb. Bag 40 Lb. Bag 40 Ib. Bag
G, or approved Price Per
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 622.40 $ 166.00 $ 622.40 $ 598.40
Price Per Acre $ 311.20 $ 83.00 $ 311.20 $ 299.20
Chemical Bid No Bid D-Fense SC P Suspend A |Suspend Polyzone
. Polyzone FH
Deltamethrin-
4.75%, 16 oz Part Number No Bid DFENSESC-12 832757 500617
bottle, Suspend -
30 Ipolyzone, or 0-1 |Orderable Unitof | I\, gig 12x1 Pint Case 16 oz. Bottle 16 oz. Bottle
Measure
approved Price Per
equivalent Orderable Unit No Bid $ 533.40 $ 59.56 $ 56.47
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 181.52 $ 68.06 $ 225.90




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid P [Lambda 9.7 No Bid S [Demand CS Demand CS
Lambda- Part Number 100208957 No Bid 651045 1506119
Cyhalothrin-
9.70%, 32 oz. Orderable Unit of .
31 bottle, Demand 0-1 Measure 6 X1 Qt. Case No Bid 32 oz. Bottle 32 oz. Bottle
CS, or approved Price Per .
equivalent. Orderable Unit $ 397.00 No Bid $ 157.14 $ 145.16
Price Per Acre $ 89.73 No Bid $ 97.20 $ 156.77
Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Demand CS
Lambda-
Cyhalothrin- Part Number No Bid No Bid No Bid i5067573
9.70%, 24 -
32 |qts./case, 0-1 |Orderable Unitof | 1y 54 No Bid No Bid 1 Case
Measure
Demand CS, or Price Por
approved . No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,280.00
equivalent Orderable Unit
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 103.46
Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid s |Altosid XR PCO Altosid XR PCO
Briquets
(s) Methoprene- . . .
2.10%. Altosid Part Number No Bid No Bid 831844 i510732
33 |XR Briquets, 40 | 0-1 |Orderable Unit of No Bid No Bid 40 Ct. Case 40 Ct. Case
ct., or approved Measure
equivalent Price Per . .
Orderable Unit No Bid No Bid $ 213.51 $ 195.50
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid $ 2,325.12 $ 2,139.89




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Metalarv XRP
A .
Chemical Bid AAltosid XR (Extended A Bﬁ';?;'fsm Altosid XR Briquet
(s) Methoprene- Release Pouch)
2.10%, Altosid Part Number 11010-B MTLXRP-200 801861 502383
XR Briquets
34 ’ i
220 ct., or 0.4 |OrderableUnitof | 1,54 o cage 200 WSP Per 220 Ct. Case 220 Ct. Case
approved Measure Case
: Price Per
equivalent
a Orderable Unit $ 818.40 $ 464.00 $ 818.40 $ 78760
Price Per Acre $ 1,620.43 $ 1,010.59 $ 1,620.43 $ 1,559.45
Chemical Bid No Bid BVAZ2 or Sunpray No Bid BVA-2
MLO
Mineral Qil-97%, Part Number No Bid BVA2-5 or MLO-5 No Bid 1507004
5 gal pail, BVA2, -
35 | or approved 0-1 |Orderable Unitof | 1\ g4 5 Gal. Pail No Bid 5 Gal. Pail
; Measure
equivalent Price Por
Orderable Unit No Bid $ 124.75 No Bid 88.94
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 124.75 No Bid 88.94
Chemical Bid No Bid Ai‘[?f or Sunpray No Bid BVA-2
. o 970 - =
Mineral Qil-97%, Part Number No Bid BVA2-55 or MLO No Bid 1507002
55 gal drum, : 55
36 |BVA2, or 0-1 |Orderable Unitof | 1y 54 55 Gal. Drum No Bid 55 Gal. Drum
approved Measure
equivalent Price Per . .
Orderable Unit No Bid $ 1,127.50 No Bid $ 869.41
Price Per Acre No Bid $ 102.50 No Bid $ 79.03




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 1: PESTICIDES
Chemical Bid P [Cocobear No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mineral Qil-10%, Part Number 11345-2.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 x 2.5 gall/case, -
37 |Cocobear, or | 0-1 |Orderable Unitof 11y £ Gal. Jug No Bid No Bid No Bid
Measure
approved Price Per
val . . .
equivalent Orderable Unit $ 130.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 156.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mineral Oil-10%, Part Number No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 gal drum, -
38 |Cocobear, or | 0-1 |OrderableUnitof |\ aiy No Bid No Bid No Bid
Measure
approved Price Per
valent . . . .
equivalen Orderable Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chemical Bid P [Cocobear No Bid No Bid No Bid
. 100
Mineral Oil-10%, Part Number 11349 No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 gal drum,
39 [Cocobear, or 0 -1 |Orderable Unit of 55 Gal Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
approved Measure
equivalent Price Per . . .
Orderable Unit $ 2,841.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Per Acre $ 154.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Clarke Mosquito Control

Products
St. Charles, IL
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

ADAPCO, LLC
Lake Mary, FL
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

ES OPCO USA, LLC
dba Veseris
Austin, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Target Specialty Products

Carrollton, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

ltem| Description Qty UOM

Price

Price

Price

Price

SECTION 2: MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS

CDC Gravid
Trap, Model
1 11712, 0-5
NSN #6545-01-
457-5511

Unit Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNMTCLUUTT DAy,
Double Ring,
Fine Mesh, NSN
2 |#3740-01-527- 0-5
5623

Model 1712

Unit Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Motor and Fan
for Miniature

3 |Traps, 6 Volt, 0-5
John W.

Hock Part #4.10

Unit Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BG-2 Sentinel
Mosquito Trap,
7.5-12 Volt,
Bioquip 2883

0-5 Unit Price

$ 199.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 241.79

Replacement
Catch Bag for
5 |BG-2 Sentinel 0-5
Trap, Bioquip
2883C

Unit Price

$ 5.95

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 2: MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS
Replacement
12Volt Fan for o . . .
6 BG-2 Bioquip 0-5 Unit Price P|$ 29.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2883F
Replacement
Intake Funnel w/
7 |Shutter Set for 0-5 Unit Price P|$ 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
BG-2
Bioquip 2883FB
Replacement
g |Power Supply 0-5 Unit Price P|$ 34.95| |No Bid No Bid No Bid
for BG-2,
Bioquip 2883PS
Battery Charger
and Maintainer, s . . . .
9 6/12 VDC, 0-5 Unit Price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ATEC
Discount No Bid 0% No Bid 0%
Discount for other Gravid Trap
Replacement Parts Source of
) No Bid N/A No Bid N/A
Discount




RFB 2023-044 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

Clarke Mosquito Control

ES OPCO USA, LLC

P - Primary Award Products ADAPCO, LLC dba Veseris Target Specialty Products
Lake Mary, FL . Carrollton, TX
S - Secondary Award St. Charles, IL Austin, TX
HUB - No HUB - No
A - Alternate Award HUB - No CO-OP - Yes HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
CO-OP - Yes CO-OP - Yes
Iltem| Description Qty UoOM Price Price Price Price
SECTION 2: MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS
Discount for other BG-2 Discount N/A 0% No Bid 0%
Sentinel Trap Replacement
Parts Source of N/A N/A No Bid N/A
Discount
Discount N/A 0% 10% 10%
Discount for items not
specified Source of TSP List Price, not
) N/A No Bid www.pestweb.com applicable for agency or
Discount .
MCP items

NOTES: Award recommendations for Section 1 are based on low bid per Acre Based on Highest

Application Rate. Equivalents were determined on the product's active ingredient and comparable
equivalent.
*Item bid did not meet specifications because the required active chemical ingredients were not
equivalent to those specified or were not in the specified percentages.
ATie bids received.
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