
RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Per Case 87.49$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Linear Foot 0.003417151$       No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid GEN No Bid No Bid
Part Number GEN218 No Bid No Bid
Packed 96 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid
Per Case 78.58$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Linear Foot 0.0061237531$     No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Georgia Pacific No Bid No Bid
Part Number GP-19880-01 No Bid No Bid
Packed 80 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid
Per Case 62.26$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Linear Foot 0.0041506667$     No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid No Bid
Part Number WC-WC3531 No Bid No Bid
Packed 96 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid
Per Case 48.21$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Linear Foot 0.0040175$           No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Tork No Bid No Bid
Part Number SCA TJ0922A No Bid No Bid
Packed 12 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid

0-65 
Cases

2* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, 
Embossed

0-6000 
Cases

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

Jumbo Toilet Paper, Economy, 2-Ply 0-1200 
Cases

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

3 Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, Basic 0-3000 
Cases

Section 1:  Toilet Paper, Facial Tissue, Toilet Seat Covers

1* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 1-Ply

4*



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-65 
Cases

2* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, 
Embossed

0-6000 
Cases

Jumbo Toilet Paper, Economy, 2-Ply 0-1200 
Cases

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

3 Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, Basic 0-3000 
Cases

Section 1:  Toilet Paper, Facial Tissue, Toilet Seat Covers

1* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 1-Ply

4*

No Bid
58.00$                   80.92$                   No Bid

0.0022656816$     0.0025698679$     No Bid
GEN Fengle No Bid
GEN218 FHG100000** No Bid
96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case No Bid

P 41.51$                   70.75$                   No Bid
0.0027309785$     0.0044937754$     No Bid

Essity Fengle No Bid
TM1616S FHG100001** No Bid
96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case No Bid

71.82$                   73.70$                   No Bid
0.0089777244$     0.005860369$       No Bid

Georgia Pacific Fengle No Bid
GPC16560 FHG100002 No Bid
60 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case No Bid

S 28.89$                   79.84$                   No Bid
0.0024075$           0.0066533$           No Bid

Essity SCA No Bid
SCATJ0922A TJ0922A No Bid
12 Rolls/Case 12 Rolls/Case No Bid

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-65 
Cases

2* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, 
Embossed

0-6000 
Cases

Jumbo Toilet Paper, Economy, 2-Ply 0-1200 
Cases

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

3 Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, Basic 0-3000 
Cases

Section 1:  Toilet Paper, Facial Tissue, Toilet Seat Covers

1* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 1-Ply

4*

S 48.75$                   A 52.26$                   54.14$                   
0.0019657512$     0.0021072853$     0.0024062$           

Roses Roses Essity
91197 91197 110291A
96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case 36 Rolls/Case

A 39.97$                   42.09$                   S 42.64$                   
0.0032235535$     0.00339453$         0.00284266$         

Roses Roses Essity
42157 42157 TM1616S
96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case

P 42.13$                   S 44.42$                   55.02$                   
0.0026341787$     0.0027773609$     0.004585$             

Right Choice Right Choice Boardwalk
78000014 78000014 BWK6145
96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case 96 Rolls/Case

A 29.85$                   32.18$                   P 28.19$                   
0.0024875$           0.0026816667$     0.00234916$         

Essity/SCA Essity Essity
TJ0922A TJ0922A TJ0922A
12 Rolls/Case 12 Rolls/Case 12 Rolls/Case

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-65 
Cases

2* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, 
Embossed

0-6000 
Cases

Jumbo Toilet Paper, Economy, 2-Ply 0-1200 
Cases

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

3 Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 2-Ply, Basic 0-3000 
Cases

Section 1:  Toilet Paper, Facial Tissue, Toilet Seat Covers

1* Toilet Paper, Single Roll, 1-Ply

4*

P 49.84$                   No Bid
0.0019469237$     No Bid

GEN No Bid
GEN218 No Bid
96 Rolls/Case No Bid

47.26$                   No Bid
0.003786859$       No Bid

Nittany Paper No Bid
NP-965004131 No Bid
96 Rolls/Case No Bid

A 39.74$                   No Bid
0.00398036$         No Bid

Nittany Paper No Bid
NP-962U No Bid
96 Rolls/Case No Bid

32.05$                   No Bid
0.00267083$         No Bid

Nittany Paper No Bid
NT5216 No Bid
12 Rolls/Case No Bid

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per Unit 34.89$                   No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Tork No Bid No Bid
Part Number SCA66TR No Bid No Bid
Packed Per Unit No Bid No Bid
Per Unit 54.28$                   No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Tork No Bid No Bid
Part Number SCA56TR No Bid No Bid
Packed Per Unit No Bid No Bid
Per Case 28.76$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Sheet 0.0095886667$     No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid LIVI No Bid No Bid
Part Number SI-11513** No Bid No Bid

Packed  100 Sheets/Box
30 Boxes/Case No Bid No Bid

Per Case P 27.16$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Cover 0.0054$                 No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid No Bid
Part Number WC-112986 No Bid No Bid

Packed 250/Pack
20 Pks/Case No Bid No Bid

Discount 10% No Bid No Bid
Source of Discount Catalog No Bid No Bid

8* Paper Toilet Seat Cover, Half Fold 0-75 
Cases

0-5 
Each5 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 

Capacity One (1) Roll

6 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 
Capacity One (2) Rolls

0-10 
Each

Facial Tissue, 2-Ply, Flat Box 0-200 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.1

7*



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Unit
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Unit
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Sheet
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cover
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount

Source of Discount

8* Paper Toilet Seat Cover, Half Fold 0-75 
Cases

0-5 
Each5 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 

Capacity One (1) Roll

6 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 
Capacity One (2) Rolls

0-10 
Each

Facial Tissue, 2-Ply, Flat Box 0-200 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.1

7*

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

22.28$                   No Bid No Bid
Essity No Bid No Bid
SCA66TR No Bid No Bid
Per Unit No Bid No Bid

A 33.54$                   No Bid No Bid
Essity No Bid No Bid
SCA56TR No Bid No Bid
Per Unit No Bid No Bid

S 22.86$                   66.075$                 No Bid
0.00762$               0.013215$             No Bid

Essity Fengle No Bid
SCATF6710A FHG100004** No Bid
100 Sheets/Box
30 Boxes/Case

100 Sheets/Case
50 Boxes/Case No Bid

S 44.04$                   76.41$                   No Bid
0.008808$             0.015282$             No Bid

Hospeco Dongfang No Bid
HOSDS5000 FHG100005** No Bid
250/Pack
20 Pks/Case

250/Pk
20 Pks/Case No Bid

0% No Bid 10%

No Bid No Bid Globalindustrial.com



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Unit
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Unit
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Sheet
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cover
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount

Source of Discount

8* Paper Toilet Seat Cover, Half Fold 0-75 
Cases

0-5 
Each5 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 

Capacity One (1) Roll

6 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 
Capacity One (2) Rolls

0-10 
Each

Facial Tissue, 2-Ply, Flat Box 0-200 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.1

7*

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

No Bid S 20.22$                   A 21.44$                   
No Bid Renown Essity
No Bid 05151-IB 66TR
No Bid Per Unit Per Unit
No Bid 58.87$                   S 32.28$                   
No Bid Renown Essity
No Bid 05150-IB 56TR
No Bid Per Unit Per Unit
No Bid 30.62$                   A 23.49$                   
No Bid 0.0102066$           0.00783$               
No Bid Right Choice Essity
No Bid 78000019** TF6710A

No Bid 100 Sheets/Box
30 Boxes/Case

100 Sheets/Box
30 Boxes/Case

No Bid 42.09$                   54.21$                   
No Bid 0.008418$             0.010842$             
No Bid Primesource Supply Source
No Bid 75004370** 25187973

No Bid 250/Pk
20 Pks/Case

250/Pk
20 Pks/Case

20% 25% 0%

List price Biggestbook.com No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Unit
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Unit
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Sheet
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cover
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount

Source of Discount

8* Paper Toilet Seat Cover, Half Fold 0-75 
Cases

0-5 
Each5 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 

Capacity One (1) Roll

6 Dispenser for Jumbo Toilet Paper, 
Capacity One (2) Rolls

0-10 
Each

Facial Tissue, 2-Ply, Flat Box 0-200 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.1

7*

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

P 18.50$                   No Bid
Palmer No Bid
PAL-RD0026-02 No Bid
Per Unit No Bid

P 31.05$                   No Bid
Palmer No Bid
PAL-RD0027-02 No Bid
Per Unit No Bid

P 19.38$                   No Bid
0.00646$               No Bid

GEN No Bid
GEN6501 No Bid
100 Sheets/Box
30 Boxes/Case No Bid

A 52.58$                   No Bid
0.010516$             No Bid

Nittany Paper No Bid
NP-TSCR20250.SS No Bid

5,000/Case No Bid

50% No Bid

Catalog No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Per Case 51.92$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Towel 0.036055$             No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Georgia Pacific No Bid No Bid
Part Number GP-23000** No Bid No Bid

Packed 12 Pks/Case No Bid No Bid

Per Case 31.48$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Towel 0.00749$               No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Morcon No Bid No Bid
Part Number MC-R12350** No Bid No Bid
Packed 12 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid
Per Case 108.43$                 No Bid No Bid
Packed 6 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid
Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packed No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Case 80.14$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Linear Foot 0.016695833$       No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Morcon No Bid No Bid
Part Number LG-MORW106 No Bid No Bid
Packed 6 Pks /Case No Bid No Bid

2* Paper Towels, Roll, Natural 0-1300 
Cases

Section 2: Paper Towels and Dispensers

1* Paper Towels, C-Fold, Bleached, 
Embossed

0-1000 
Cases

0-100 
Cases
0-1200 
Cases

5 Touchless Roll Paper Towel 
(Equivalent to GPC89490)

0-500 
Cases

4 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89490

3 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89430



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

2* Paper Towels, Roll, Natural 0-1300 
Cases

Section 2: Paper Towels and Dispensers

1* Paper Towels, C-Fold, Bleached, 
Embossed

0-1000 
Cases

0-100 
Cases
0-1200 
Cases

5 Touchless Roll Paper Towel 
(Equivalent to GPC89490)

0-500 
Cases

4 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89490

3 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89430

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

A 35.47$                   34.10$                   No Bid
0.0147791667$     0.01420833$         No Bid

Georgia Pacific Jinfong No Bid
GPC20241 FHG100006** No Bid
200 Towels/Pk
12 Pks/Case

200 Towels/Pk
12 Pks/Case No Bid

A 22.20$                   51.96$                   No Bid
0.0052857143$     0.00123714$         No Bid

Essity Fengle No Bid
SCARK350A FHG100007** No Bid
12 Rolls/Case 12 Rolls/Case No Bid

P 77.69$                   No Bid No Bid
6 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid

P 77.69$                   No Bid No Bid
6 Rolls/Case No Bid No Bid

77.69$                   45.43$                   No Bid
0.0161854167$     0.00946375$         No Bid

Georgia Pacific Jinfong No Bid
GPC89490 FHG100008** No Bid
6 Rolls/Case 6 Rolls/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

2* Paper Towels, Roll, Natural 0-1300 
Cases

Section 2: Paper Towels and Dispensers

1* Paper Towels, C-Fold, Bleached, 
Embossed

0-1000 
Cases

0-100 
Cases
0-1200 
Cases

5 Touchless Roll Paper Towel 
(Equivalent to GPC89490)

0-500 
Cases

4 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89490

3 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89430

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

No Bid 21.99$                   P 20.96$                   
No Bid $0.0091625 0.00524$               
No Bid Right Choice Essity
No Bid 78000010** MB540A

No Bid 200 Towels/Pk
12 Pks/Case

250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

P 21.56$                   S 22.21$                   22.86$                   
0.005133$             0.005266$             0.0054428571$     

Right Choice Right Choice Essity
78000002 78000002 RK350A
12 Rolls/Case 12 Rolls/Case 12 Rolls/Case
No Bid A 97.31$                   S 78.56$                   
No Bid 6 Rolls/Case 6 Rolls/Case
No Bid A 98.75$                   S 78.56$                   
No Bid 6 Rolls/Case 6 Rolls/Case

P 41.10$                   A 44.66$                   78.56$                   
0.0085625$           0.0093041667$     0.0163666$           

Morcon Morcon Georgia Pacific
W106 W106 89490
6 Rolls/Case 6 Rolls/Case 6 Rolls/Case



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

2* Paper Towels, Roll, Natural 0-1300 
Cases

Section 2: Paper Towels and Dispensers

1* Paper Towels, C-Fold, Bleached, 
Embossed

0-1000 
Cases

0-100 
Cases
0-1200 
Cases

5 Touchless Roll Paper Towel 
(Equivalent to GPC89490)

0-500 
Cases

4 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89490

3 Touchless Roll Paper Towel, 
GPC 89430

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

S 21.63$                   No Bid
0.0090125$           No Bid

GEN No Bid
GEN1510B No Bid
150 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case No Bid

24.49$                   No Bid
0.00583095$         No Bid

Morcon No Bid
MOR12350 No Bid
12 Rolls/Case No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

S 44.09$                   No Bid
0.0091854167$     No Bid

Morcon No Bid
MORW106 No Bid
6 Rolls/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packed No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Case 26.22$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Towel 0.006555$             No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid No Bid
Part Number Westcraft** No Bid No Bid

Packed 250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case No Bid No Bid

Per Case 35.12$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Towel 0.00878$               No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid No Bid
Part Number WC-WC4101W No Bid No Bid

Packed 250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case No Bid No Bid

Discount 10% No Bid No Bid

Source of Discount Catalog No Bid No Bid

Per  Bale No Bid 79.74$                   No Bid
Per Bag No Bid 0.15948$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Duro No Bid
Part Number No Bid 4331657 No Bid
Packed No Bid 500 Per Bale No Bid

0-35 
Each

7* Paper Towels, Multifold Natural, 1 Ply 0-150 
Cases

6 Dispenser,  enMotion®, 
GPC 59462

8* Paper Towels, Multifold White, 1 Ply 0-50 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.2

Section 3: Paper Bags

1 Paper Bags, #57, Grocery size 0-250 
Bales 



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Unit
Packed
Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount

Source of Discount

Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-35 
Each

7* Paper Towels, Multifold Natural, 1 Ply 0-150 
Cases

6 Dispenser,  enMotion®, 
GPC 59462

8* Paper Towels, Multifold White, 1 Ply 0-50 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.2

Section 3: Paper Bags

1 Paper Bags, #57, Grocery size 0-250 
Bales 

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

S 29.56$                   No Bid No Bid
Per Unit No Bid No Bid

S 20.49$                   92.19$                   No Bid
0.0051225$           0.0057618$           No Bid

Affex Fengle No Bid
AFXMFK200 FHG100009** No Bid
250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

500 Towels/Pk
32 Pks/Case No Bid

A 29.98$                   86.19$                   No Bid
0.00749$               0.005386875$       No Bid

Essity Fengle No Bid
SCAMB540A FHG100010** No Bid
250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

500 Towels/Pk
32 Pks/Case No Bid

0.00% No Bid 10%

No Bid No Bid Globalindustrial.com

84.80$                   $72 No Bid
0.1696$                 0.144 No Bid

Duro Huafu No Bid
DSP80076 FHG176** No Bid
500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Unit
Packed
Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount

Source of Discount

Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-35 
Each

7* Paper Towels, Multifold Natural, 1 Ply 0-150 
Cases

6 Dispenser,  enMotion®, 
GPC 59462

8* Paper Towels, Multifold White, 1 Ply 0-50 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.2

Section 3: Paper Bags

1 Paper Bags, #57, Grocery size 0-250 
Bales 

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

No Bid A 34.10$                   P 12.96$                   
No Bid Per Unit Per Unit

A 20.70$                   21.51$                   20.96$                   
0.005175$             0.0053775$           0.00524$               

Right Choice Right Choice Essity
78000012 78000012 MK520A
250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

No Bid 30.15$                   P 20.96$                   
No Bid 0.0075375$           0.00524$               
No Bid Right Choice Essity
No Bid 78000011** MB540A

No Bid 250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case

20% 25% 0%

List price Biggestbook.com No Bid

P 67.06$                   A 73.26$                   77.15$                   
0.13412$               0.1465$                 0.1543$                 

Duro Duro Duro
80076 80076 80076
500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Unit
Packed
Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Towel
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount

Source of Discount

Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-35 
Each

7* Paper Towels, Multifold Natural, 1 Ply 0-150 
Cases

6 Dispenser,  enMotion®, 
GPC 59462

8* Paper Towels, Multifold White, 1 Ply 0-50 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.2

Section 3: Paper Bags

1 Paper Bags, #57, Grocery size 0-250 
Bales 

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

P 20.21$                   No Bid
0.0050525$           No Bid

Nittany Paper No Bid
NP-MFN4000 No Bid
250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case No Bid

S 24.74$                   No Bid
0.006185$             No Bid

Nittany Paper No Bid
NP-5301 No Bid
250 Towels/Pk
16 Pks/Case No Bid

50% No Bid

Catalog No Bid

S 67.71$                   No Bid
0.13542$               No Bid

GEN No Bid
BAGSK1657 No Bid
500 Per Bale No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per  Bale No Bid 17.74$                   No Bid
Per Bag No Bid 0.03548$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Duro No Bid
Part Number No Bid 433B4BG** No Bid
Packed No Bid 500 Per Bale No Bid
Per  Bale No Bid 17.74$                   No Bid
Per Bag No Bid 0.03548$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Duro No Bid
Part Number No Bid 433B4BG No Bid
Packed No Bid 500 Per Bale No Bid

Discount 10% 5% No Bid
Source of Discount Catalog No Bid No Bid

Per Case No Bid A 83.44$                   No Bid
Per Cup No Bid 0.016688$             No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid GenPak No Bid
Part Number No Bid W4F No Bid

Packed No Bid 200 Cups/Pack
25 Pks/Case No Bid

Per Case No Bid 48.89$                   No Bid
Per Cup No Bid 0.04889$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Dart No Bid
Part Number 6J6 No Bid

Packed No Bid 25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case No Bid

2 Paper Bag, #35, Lunch Size 0-1000 
Bales

3 Paper Bags,  #4 0-10 
Bales

Section 4: Food Service, Preparation, and Storage

1 Cone Cups for Water Cooler 0-30 
Cases

2 Cups, 6 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-112 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.3



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

2 Paper Bag, #35, Lunch Size 0-1000 
Bales

3 Paper Bags,  #4 0-10 
Bales

Section 4: Food Service, Preparation, and Storage

1 Cone Cups for Water Cooler 0-30 
Cases

2 Cups, 6 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-112 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.3

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

22.51$                   No Bid No Bid
0.04502$               No Bid No Bid

Duro No Bid No Bid
DSP18408 No Bid No Bid
500 Per Bale No Bid No Bid

A 13.61$                   49.50$                   No Bid
0.0272$                 0.099$                   No Bid

Duro Huafu No Bid
DSP18404 FHG108** No Bid
500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale No Bid

0.00% No Bid 10%
No Bid No Bid Globalindustrial.com

No Bid 152.36$                 No Bid
No Bid 0.030472$             No Bid
No Bid Shangjie No Bid
No Bid FHG100014 No Bid

No Bid 200 Cups/Pack
25 Pks/Case No Bid

40.73$                   48.36$                   No Bid
0.04073$               0.04836$               No Bid

Dart Dart No Bid
DCC6J6 SJ6 No Bid
25 Cups/Pk
40 Pks/Case

25 Cups/Pk
40 Pks/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

2 Paper Bag, #35, Lunch Size 0-1000 
Bales

3 Paper Bags,  #4 0-10 
Bales

Section 4: Food Service, Preparation, and Storage

1 Cone Cups for Water Cooler 0-30 
Cases

2 Cups, 6 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-112 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.3

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

P 18.20$                   S 19.79$                   22.24$                   
0.0364$                 0.0396$                 0.04448$               

Duro Duro Duro
18408 18408 18408
500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale

P 11.91$                   21.44$                   S 13.29$                   
0.02382$               0.04280$               0.02658$               

Duro Duro Duro
18404 18404 18404
500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale 500 Per Bale

20% 25% 0%
List price Biggestbook.com No Bid

P 65.15$                   S 72.22$                   101.62$                 
0.01303$               0.014444$             0.020324$             

Genpak Genpak Dart
W4F W4F 4BR-2050
200 Cups/Pack
25 Pks/Case

200 Cups/Pack
25 Pks/Case

200 Cups/Pack
25 Pks/Case

P 34.65$                   38.59$                   A 38.48$                   
0.03465$               0.03859$               0.03848$               

Dart Dart Dart
6J6 6J6 6J6
25 Cups/Pk
40 Pks/Case

25 Cups/Pk
40 Pks/Case

25 Cups/Pk
40 Pks/Case



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per  Bale
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

2 Paper Bag, #35, Lunch Size 0-1000 
Bales

3 Paper Bags,  #4 0-10 
Bales

Section 4: Food Service, Preparation, and Storage

1 Cone Cups for Water Cooler 0-30 
Cases

2 Cups, 6 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-112 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.3

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

A 22.13$                   No Bid
0.04426$               No Bid

GEN No Bid
BAGGK8500 No Bid
500 Per Bale No Bid

14.67$                   No Bid
0.02934$               No Bid

GEN No Bid
BAGGK4500 No Bid
500 Per Bale No Bid

50% No Bid
Catalog No Bid

4.03$                     No Bid
0.02015$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
SCC4BR No Bid
25 Cups/Pk
8 Pks/Case No Bid

S 34.72$                   No Bid
0.03472$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
DCC6J6 No Bid
25 Cups/Pk
40 Pks/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per Case No Bid 37.89$                   No Bid
Per Lid No Bid 0.03789$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Dart No Bid
Part Number No Bid 6JL No Bid

Packed No Bid 100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case No Bid

Per Case No Bid 77.89$                   No Bid
Per Cup No Bid 0.07789$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Dart No Bid
Part Number No Bid 12J12 No Bid

Packed No Bid 25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case No Bid

Per Case No Bid 48.89$                   No Bid
Per Lid No Bid 0.04889$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Dart No Bid
Part Number No Bid 12SL No Bid

Packed No Bid 100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case No Bid

Per Case No Bid 45.89$                   No Bid
Per Tray No Bid 0.22945$               No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Dart No Bid
Part Number No Bid 95HT3R No Bid

Packed No Bid 100 Trays/Pack
2 Pks/Case No Bid

3 Lid, for 6 Ounce cup 0-5 
Cases

4 Cup, 12 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-118 
Cases

5 Lid, for 12 Ounce cup 0-10 
Cases

6 Tray, Styrofoam with Flip Over Lid,
3 Compartment

0-4000 
Cases



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Lid
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Lid
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Tray
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

3 Lid, for 6 Ounce cup 0-5 
Cases

4 Cup, 12 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-118 
Cases

5 Lid, for 12 Ounce cup 0-10 
Cases

6 Tray, Styrofoam with Flip Over Lid,
3 Compartment

0-4000 
Cases

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

33.88$                   41.97$                   No Bid
0.03388$               0.04197$               No Bid

Dart Dart No Bid
DCC6JL 6JL No Bid
100 Lids/Pk
10 Pks/Case

100 Lids/Pk
10 Pks/Case No Bid

66.56$                   83.43$                   No Bid
0.06656$               0.08343$               No Bid

Dart Dart No Bid
DCC12J12 12J12 No Bid
25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case

25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case No Bid

44.17$                   55.41$                   No Bid
0.04417$               0.05541$               No Bid

Dart Dart No Bid
DCC12SL 12SL No Bid
100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case

100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case No Bid

34.52$                   No Bid No Bid
0.1726$                 No Bid No Bid

Dart No Bid No Bid
DCC95HT3R No Bid No Bid
100 Trays/Pack
2 Pks/Case No Bid No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Lid
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Lid
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Tray
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

3 Lid, for 6 Ounce cup 0-5 
Cases

4 Cup, 12 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-118 
Cases

5 Lid, for 12 Ounce cup 0-10 
Cases

6 Tray, Styrofoam with Flip Over Lid,
3 Compartment

0-4000 
Cases

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

S 31.71$                   35.65$                   A 31.85$                   
0.03171$               0.03565$               0.03185$               

Dart Dart Dart
6JL 6JL 6JL
100 Lids/Pk
10 Pks/Case

100 Lids/Pk
10 Pks/Case

100 Lids/Pk
10 Pks/Case

S 58.70$                   64.09$                   A 63.87$                   
0.0587$                 0.06409$               0.06387$               

Dart Dart Dart
12J12 12J12 12J12
25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case

25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case

25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case

P 37.02$                   45.02$                   A 40.35$                   
0.03702$               0.04502$               0.04035$               

Dart Dart Dart
12SL 12SL 12SL
100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case

100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case

100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case

P 28.50$                   S 28.65$                   A 33.19$                   
0.1425$                 0.14325$               0.16595$               

Dart Dart Dart
90HT3R 90HT3R 95HT3R
100 Trays/Pack
2 Pks/Case

100 Trays/Pack
2 Pks/Case

100 Trays/Pack
2 Pks/Case



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Lid
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Cup
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Lid
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Tray
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

3 Lid, for 6 Ounce cup 0-5 
Cases

4 Cup, 12 Ounce, Styrofoam 0-118 
Cases

5 Lid, for 12 Ounce cup 0-10 
Cases

6 Tray, Styrofoam with Flip Over Lid,
3 Compartment

0-4000 
Cases

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

P 30.03$                   No Bid
0.03003$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
DCC6JL No Bid
100 Lids/Pk
10 Pks/Case No Bid

P 58.57$                   No Bid
0.05857$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
DCC12J12 No Bid
25 Cups/Pack
40 Pks/Case No Bid

S 38.95$                   No Bid
0.03895$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
DCC12SL No Bid
100 Lids/Pack
10 Pks/Case No Bid

33.31$                   No Bid
0.16655$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
DCC95HT3R No Bid
100 Trays/Pack
2 Pks/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Tray No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part Number No Bid No Bid No Bid

Packed No Bid No Bid No Bid

Per Case No Bid P 36.89$                   No Bid
Packed No Bid 1,000/Case No Bid
Per Case No Bid 36.89$                   No Bid
Per Fork No Bid 0.0369$                 No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid Dart No Bid
Part Number No Bid F6BW No Bid
Packed No Bid 1,000/Case No Bid
Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Linear Foot No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part Number No Bid No Bid No Bid
Packed No Bid No Bid No Bid

0-10 
Cases

10 Pre-Stretch Handfilm 0-600 
Cases

7 Tray, Styrofoam, 6 Compartment 0-130 
Cases

0-100 
Cases8 Spoons, White Plastic, DARTS6BW

9 Forks, White Plastic, Medium Weight



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Tray
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Per Fork
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-10 
Cases

10 Pre-Stretch Handfilm 0-600 
Cases

7 Tray, Styrofoam, 6 Compartment 0-130 
Cases

0-100 
Cases8 Spoons, White Plastic, DARTS6BW

9 Forks, White Plastic, Medium Weight

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

73.68$                   No Bid No Bid
1,000/Case No Bid No Bid

S 11.05$                   25.96$                   No Bid
0.01105$               0.02596$               No Bid

Empress Visions No Bid
RJSE175001 130HFWH1M No Bid
1,000/Case 1,000/Case No Bid

S 39.58$                   90.41$                   No Bid
0.0049475$           0.01130125$         No Bid

Intertape Changye No Bid
ITPHY120040000 FHG100016 No Bid
4 Rolls/Case 4 Rolls/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Tray
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Per Fork
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-10 
Cases

10 Pre-Stretch Handfilm 0-600 
Cases

7 Tray, Styrofoam, 6 Compartment 0-130 
Cases

0-100 
Cases8 Spoons, White Plastic, DARTS6BW

9 Forks, White Plastic, Medium Weight

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

P 45.89$                   S 50.47$                   A 59.62$                   
0.09178$               0.10094$               0.11924$               

Reyma Reyma Pactiv
SLT6NM SLT6NM 0TH10601SGBX
125 Trays/Pk
4 Pks/Case

125 Trays/Pk
4 Pks/Case 500/Case

A 56.50$                   63.83$                   S 52.03$                   
1,000/Case 1,000/Case 1,000/Case

P 10.92$                   15.60$                   A 13.67$                   
0.01092$               0.0156$                 0.01367$               

PrimeSource PrimeSource Amercare
75002491 75002491 P1203W
1,000/Case 1,000/Case 1,000/Case
No Bid A 65.10$                   P 7.05$                     
No Bid 0.01085$               0.003525$             
No Bid Western Plastics AEP Industries
No Bid MAX01 10176105
No Bid 4 Rolls/Case 1 Roll/Case



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Tray
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Packed
Per Case
Per Fork
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed
Per Case
Per Linear Foot
Brand Bid
Part Number
Packed

0-10 
Cases

10 Pre-Stretch Handfilm 0-600 
Cases

7 Tray, Styrofoam, 6 Compartment 0-130 
Cases

0-100 
Cases8 Spoons, White Plastic, DARTS6BW

9 Forks, White Plastic, Medium Weight

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

33.75$                   No Bid
0.0675$                 No Bid

Pactiv No Bid
TH10500SGBX No Bid
250 Trays/Pk
2 Pks/Case No Bid

61.33$                   No Bid
1,000/Case No Bid

61.33$                   No Bid
0.06133$               No Bid

Dart No Bid
DCCF6BW No Bid
1,000/Case No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per Case No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Napkin No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part Number No Bid No Bid No Bid

Packed No Bid No Bid No Bid

Discount 10% No Bid No Bid
Source of Discount Catalog No Bid No Bid

Per Case 20.92$                   No Bid A 14.32$                   
Per Bag 0.0209$                 No Bid 0.01432$               
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid Interplast-Pitt
Part Number WC-H242406N No Bid DPS2424-6

Packed 50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case No Bid 50 Bags/Roll

20 Rolls/Case
Per Case 19.33$                   No Bid A 14.32$                   
Per Bag 0.1933$                 No Bid 0.1432$                 
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid Interplast-Pitt
Part Number WC-L40467C No Bid WSL4046XHW

Packed 100 Bags/Roll
1 Roll/Case No Bid 10 Bags/Roll

10 Rolls/Case

Section 5: Trash Can Liners

1 Trash Can Liner, Size: 24" x 24", 
Natural, Thickness: 6 Micron

0-150 
Cases

2 Trash Can Liner, Size: 40" x 46", White, 
Thickness: .74 mil

0-2000 
Cases

11 Napkin, Full Fold for Dispensers 0-75 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.4



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Napkin
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Section 5: Trash Can Liners

1 Trash Can Liner, Size: 24" x 24", 
Natural, Thickness: 6 Micron

0-150 
Cases

2 Trash Can Liner, Size: 40" x 46", White, 
Thickness: .74 mil

0-2000 
Cases

11 Napkin, Full Fold for Dispensers 0-75 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.4

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

65.68$                   71.5800$               No Bid
0.0109466$           0.0239$                 No Bid

Essity Fengle No Bid
SCAD802A FHG100017 No Bid
500/Pk
12 Pks/Case

150/Pk
20 Boxes/Case No Bid

0.00% No Bid 10%
No Bid No Bid Globalindustrial.com

37.97$                   31.85 No Bid
0.03797$               0.03185 No Bid

Heritage Parkson No Bid
AFXZ4833RNFR1 FHG100018 No Bid
50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case

20 Bags/Roll
50 Rolls/Case No Bid

25.30$                   28.8900$               No Bid
0.253$                   0.2889$                 No Bid

Heritage Sunho No Bid
AFXH8046EWFR1 FHG100019 No Bid
25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case

20 Bags/Roll
5 Rolls/Case No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Napkin
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Section 5: Trash Can Liners

1 Trash Can Liner, Size: 24" x 24", 
Natural, Thickness: 6 Micron

0-150 
Cases

2 Trash Can Liner, Size: 40" x 46", White, 
Thickness: .74 mil

0-2000 
Cases

11 Napkin, Full Fold for Dispensers 0-75 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.4

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

A 54.47$                   P 53.24$                   S 65.25$                   
0.0090783$           0.0088733$           0.0090625$           

Essity Essity Georgia Pacific
D802 D802 37803

6,000/Case 6,000/Case 600/Pk 
12 Pks/Case

20% 25% 0%
List price Biggestbook.com No Bid

S 13.44$                   21.79$                   21.42$                   
0.01344$               0.02179$               0.02141$               

Berry Berry Heritage
HR242406N HR242406N Z4824RN LR1
50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case

50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case

50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case

S 13.26$                   15.65$                   19.30$                   
0.1326$                 0.1565$                 0.1544$                 

Berry Berry Heritage
LC4046XWH LSR4046XW H8046HC R01
25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case

25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case

 25 Bags/Roll
5 Rolls/Case 



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Napkin
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Section 5: Trash Can Liners

1 Trash Can Liner, Size: 24" x 24", 
Natural, Thickness: 6 Micron

0-150 
Cases

2 Trash Can Liner, Size: 40" x 46", White, 
Thickness: .74 mil

0-2000 
Cases

11 Napkin, Full Fold for Dispensers 0-75 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.4

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

86.77$                   No Bid
0.0144616$           No Bid

Kimberly Clark No Bid
KCC98730 No Bid
250/Pk
24 Pks/Case No Bid

50% No Bid
Catalog No Bid

18.58$                   P 10.90$                   
0.0185$                 0.0109$                 

Interplast UPC
S242406N 242406N
50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case

50 Bags/Roll
20 Rolls/Case

15.26$                   P 10.20$                   
0.1526$                 0.102$                   

Interplast UPC
WSL4046XHW-2 467W
25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case

25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

Dispose N' Save
Monroe, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Competitive Choice Inc.
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

CO-OP - Yes

Conserv Flag Company
Sidney, NE
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price
Per Case 27.29$                   No Bid A 24.82$                   
Per Bag 0.2729$                 No Bid 0.2482$                 
Brand Bid Westcraft No Bid Interplast
Part Number WC-L43479C No Bid SL4347XHW

Packed 100 Bags/Roll
1 Roll/Case No Bid 10 Bags/Roll

10 Rolls/Case
Discount 10% No Bid 50%

Source of Discount Catalog No Bid Catalog

3 Trash Can Liner, Size: 43" x 47", White, 
Thickness: .80 mil

0-52 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.5



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

3 Trash Can Liner, Size: 43" x 47", White, 
Thickness: .80 mil

0-52 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.5

Global Equipment 
Company, Inc.

Port Washington, NY
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

Price Price Price

Empire Paper Company
Wichita Falls, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - No

Foxhole Depot
Winter Garden, FL

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

27.64$                   30.975$                 No Bid
0.2764$                 0.30975$               No Bid

Heritage Sunho No Bid
AFXH8647EW FHG100020 No Bid
100 Bags/Roll
1 Roll/Case

20 Bags/Roll
5 Rolls/Case No Bid

0.00% No Bid 10%
No Bid No Bid Globalindustrial.com



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

3 Trash Can Liner, Size: 43" x 47", White, 
Thickness: .80 mil

0-52 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.5

Price Price Price

Infinity Supply & Service, 
Inc.

Denton, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes

M.A.N.S. Distributors, 
Inc.

Carrollton, TX
HUB - Yes 

CO-OP - Yes

Pollock Investments Inc., 
d/b/a 

Pollock Orora
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

No Bid 29.37$                   18.03$                   
No Bid 0.2937$                 0.1803$                 
No Bid Boardwalk Heritage
No Bid BWK4347EXH H8647EW**

No Bid 25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case

100/Roll
1 Roll/Case

20% 25% 0%
List price Biggestbook.com No Bid



RFB 2023-015 Annual Contract for Disposable Paper Plastic Products

Item Description Qty UOM

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award
A - Alternate Award

Per Case
Per Bag
Brand Bid
Part Number

Packed

Discount
Source of Discount

3 Trash Can Liner, Size: 43" x 47", White, 
Thickness: .80 mil

0-52 
Cases

Discount for items not listed in Sec.5

Unipak Corp.
West Long Beach, NJ

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Price Price

Winston Water Cooler
Mansfield, TX

HUB - Yes
CO-OP - Yes

S 19.21$                   P 17.00$                   
0.1921$                 0.17$                     

Interplast UPC
WSL4347XHW 43478
100/Roll
1 Roll/Case

25 Bags/Roll
4 Rolls/Case

50% 15%
Catalog Catalog
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