BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS
**item does not meet specifications
***\endor could not provide a sample on request Safety Zone ProcureNet American Mask Secure
Specialists: America Alliance, Inc Components, LLC
Lakeland, FL Sheridon, WY Wichita, KS Norristown, PA
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
COOP -Yes COOP -Yes COOP -Yes COOP -Yes
Item Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co. $1.35 P |$142 S| %160 AlS$ 2.20
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 20 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case - 20 20 20 400
Delivery time 30 Days 14 Days 45 Days |14-20 Days
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co $ 2.95| $2.05 P | %210 S|$2.15 A
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 20 20
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case 20 20 20 400
Delivery time 30 Days 14 Days 90 Days |14-20 Days
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N85 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
4 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity $1.85 AlS 2191% 2.22 |no bid
NG5 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 20 20
Delivery time 5 Days 14 Days 45 Days
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare $1.25 P |3 1.50 | no bid no bid
KNO5 Number Masks per box 50 50
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 20 20
Delivery time 5 Days 14 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.,
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT

FOR N95 AND KNS5 MASKS

**|tem does not meet specifications WestGrove
***\Jandor could not provide a sample on request Capital Group Maadho Watchtower PPE
LLC LNJ Capital, Inc. | Distributors, Inc Supplies, Inc
Dallas, TX Carroliton, TX Mount Kisco, NY Hicksville, NY
HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
COOP -Yes COOP -Yes COOQOP -Yes COOQP -Yes
ltem Est Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000 IMfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co. $ 1.84 [no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 400
Delivery time 3-5 Days
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co $ 229 1% 23019 2.30 |no bid
N©5 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
DTC3wW Number of Boxes per Case 400 24 20
Delivery time 3-5 Days " |10 Days 14-21 Days
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M $ 3.47 |1$3.00 S|$ 3.60 |no bid
Ng5 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case 400 24 6
Delivery time 3-5 Days 10 Days 14-21 Days
4 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M $3.49 S |no bid $3.60 A |nobid
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20
1860S Number of Boxes per Case 400 6
Delivery time 3-5 Days 14-21 Days
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity $1.79 S|s 230|$ 2.20 |$1.60 P
NO5 Number Masks per box 20 20 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 400 24 20 20
Delivery time 3-5 Days 10 Days 14-21 Days 10 Days
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare $ 24518 2.20 |81.48 A |no bid
KNg5 Number Masks per box 20 50 20
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 400 20 48
Delivery time 3-5 Days 10 Days 2-5Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Glabal Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS

**|tem does not meet specifications
***Vendor could not provide a sample on request

USA Capital Fund
dba USA Medical

Health Basics, Inc Supply Vizocom ICT, LLC| Lainere Health,
Brookiyn, NY Hollywood, FL El Cajon, CA inc
HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No New York, NY
COOP -Yes COOP -Yes COOP -Yes HUB - No
itemEst Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg:; Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co. 3 2.50 |***$1.75 3 2.11 | no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 50
2YB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 20 12 20
Delivery time 1-30 Days 10 Days 30-40 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co $ 2.50 [***$1.75 no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20
DTC3wW Number of Boxes per Case 20 12
Delivery time 1-30 Days 10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M $3.40 A 1$2.35 P |nobid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case 120 12
Delivery time 1-30 Days 14 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: 3Mm no bid $2.25 P |nobid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
1860S Number of Boxes per Case 12
Delivery time 14 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity 3 2.50 {***$1.75 $ 2.09 | no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 12 20
Delivery time 1-30 Days 10 Days 30-40 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare 3 1.50 |***$0.85 $1.44 S *$0.71
KN95 Number Masks per box 50 20 50
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 1000 12 20
Delivery time 1-30 Days 10 Days 7-10 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS
**item does not meet specifications US Health
***\andor could not provide a sample on request School Health . Express
Corporation Madea Medical Corporation
Rolling Meadows, Products City of industry, LCCS Medical
IL Pleasanton, CA CA Peoria, AZ
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
ltem Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co. no bid $ 2.10 jno bid no bid
NO5 Number Masks per box 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 400
Delivery time 18 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co $ 36013 2.21 no bid no bid
NG5 Number Masks per box 20 20
DTGC3wW Number of Boxes per Case 20 400
Delivery time 10-14 Days|18 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity no bid $ 1.87 |no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 400
Delivery time 18 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid no bid **$0.45 **$0.40
KN95 Number Masks per box
BYD Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS
**|tem does not meet specifications Simply
***\Jendor could not provide a sample on request Sophisticated dba
Golden Circle | Reveal Medical & Alanic
Group LLC Reveal Suits international MO Med Supplies
Los Angeles, TX | Grand Prairie, TX | Beverly Hills, CA Festus, MO
HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
item Est Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg: Xiantac Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid **$3.75 no bid 3 4.08
N95 Number Masks per box 20
2YB-11 Number of Boxes per Case Customizable
Delivery time 21 Days
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid **$3.75 $ 2.45 Ino bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
DTC3wW Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 30 Days
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid **$3.75 no bid no bid
Ng5 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
4 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95§ Number Masks per box
1860S Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity $ 2.05 {*$3.75 no bid $ 5.89
NG5 Number Masks per box 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 Customizable
Delivery time 30 Days 21 Days
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid **1.95 no bid no bid
KNS5 Number Masks per box
BYD Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS

**tem does not meet specifications

***\endor could not provide a sample on request US Health
United States Express Corp
Mask LLC Earth Logix LLC | Sierra Group LLC| City of Industry,
Addison, TX Cochranton, PA Hayden, ID CA
HUB - No HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No
ltem Est Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid no bid no bid no bid
Ng5 Number Masks per box
2YB-11 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
DTC3wW Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid $ 3.75 jno bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case 48
Delivery time 30 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid $ 3.75 |no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
18608 Number of Boxes per Case 48
Delivery time 30 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity **$2.50 $ 3751% 2101 % 2.30
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
1.-188 Number of Boxes per Case 48 20 20
Delivery time 15 Days 7 Days 10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid $ 3.75 {no bid no bid
KNG5 Number Masks per box 20
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 48
Delivery time 15 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS
**|tem does not meet specifications
***\Jeandor could not provide a sample on request Frontline
CPR Savers and [Crossings Medical
Just In Trend First Aid Suppy Supply GlobalGeeks Inc
Katy, TX Scottsdale, AZ Seattle, WA Moorestown, NJ
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
Item Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000 |Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid no bid **$4.85 no bid
NS5 Number Masks per box
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid $ 4.30 |no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case 400
Delivery time 28-30 Days
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid **$49.00 **$4.85 no bid
NS85 Number Masks per box 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case 60
Delivery time 120
4 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid **$4.85 no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
1860S Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 5-8 Days
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity no bid no bid **$4.30 **$3.25
N85 Number Masks per box 20
1.-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 5-8 Days
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare **$0.39 **$29.00 **$0.40 no bid
KN95 Number Masks per box 20
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 65
Delivery time 120

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N85 AND KNS5 MASKS
**|tem does not meet specifications
*#*\Vendor could not provide a sample on request
B&E Medical
Supply Equipment| HealQu LLC US Cotton LLC Unipak
San Antonio, TX | Jersey City, NJ Gastonia, NC Brookiyn, NY
HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
ltem Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid 3 2.00 {no bid $ 2.35
Ng5 Number Masks per box 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 12
Delivery time 7-20 Days 1-10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid no bid 3 2.35
N85 Number Masks per box 20
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case 12
Delivery time 1-10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid $ 4.80 |no bid $ 415
N95 Number Masks per box 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case ] 6
Delivery time 7-20 Days 1-10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid $ 5.95 {no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time 7-20 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity 3 280198 2.25 |**$2.85 3 210
N95 Number Masks per box 400 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 12
Delivery time 7-20 Days 1-10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid no bid no bid $ 2.90
KNS5 Number Masks per box 20
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 12
Delivery time 1-10 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT

FOR N95 AND KNS5 MASKS

**tem does not meet specifications

***\endor could not provide a sample on request Planet Halo dba
Highground JDD Global Planet Halo
Holdings LLC Supply Health Clark Collection
Dallas, TX San Jose, CA San Carlos,CA Prineville, OR
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
ItemEst Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000|Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid no bid **$3.50
N95 Number Masks per box
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
4 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
Ng5 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity 3 1951 % 34813 2.35 |no bid
NS5 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 20 20
Delivery time 2 Days 45 Days N/A
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid no bid no bid no bid
KN95 Number Masks per box
BYD Number of Boxes per Case

Delivery time

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN85 MASKS

**item does not meet specifications
***Vendor could not provide a sample on request

D'S Ventures dba

Krish Ventures

MCT Pro Tools

Mavich Logmet Solutions LLC dba Altocraft
Southlake, TX Decatur, GA Austin, TX Miami, FL
HUB - Yes HUB - Yes HUB -No Hub - Yes
item Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000{Mfg: Xiantac Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid $ 2.75 |no bid $ 2.35
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 12 20
Delivery time 14 Days 15 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid no bid $ 2.35
N95 Number Masks per box 20
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 15
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity 3 285|% 2.75 {no bid $ 2.35
N85 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 48 12 20
Delivery time 7-10 Days 14 15
0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare $ 2.85 {no bid **$0.26 no bid
KNS5 Number Masks per box 20
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 48
Delivery time 7-10 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS
**item does not meet specifications
***\andor could not provide a sample on request
Mini Wing USA Nations Photo Lab
Palos Verdes Mark One Mfg IP Med Inc LLC Hunt
Estates, CA Minster, OH Oceanside, NY Valley, MD
HUB - Yes HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
ltem Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
0-100,000 {Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  [**$1.95 no bid $ 28218 210
NS5 Number Masks per box 20 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 20 400
Delivery time 7-10 Days 10-14 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co »$1.25 no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M **$1.45 no bid no bid no bid
NO5 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: 3M **$1.45 no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity »$1.25 $ 2851% 2.32 |no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 20
Delivery time 3-5 Days 7-10 Days
0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare **$0.18 no bid $ 1.69 {no bid
KN95 Number Masks per box 50
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 7-10 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT
FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS

**|tem does not meet specifications
***\endor could not provide a sample on request

The MaclLean Traco Bliss Trading
Group Manufacturing Inc.| Linstol USA LLC Company
Sacramento, CA Orem, UT Naples, FL La Palma, CA
HUB - No Hub - No HUB - No HUB - Yes
ltemEst Qty Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000 leg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid no bid no bid $ 3.63
N85 Number Masks per box 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 40
Delivery time 5-7 Days
2 0-100,000 Mig: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid $ 5.63
No5 Number Masks per box 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case 30
Delivery time 5-7 Days
4 (0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity $ 2.99 Ino bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 5-8 Days
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid $ 3.05 |**$0.99 $ 3.49
KNg5 Number Masks per box 20 10
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 48 40
Delivery time 3 Days 5-7 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT

FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS US Health
**|tem does not meet specifications Express Corp dba
***Vendor could not provide a sample on request Jointown
Integra Pharma International Dunwell Supply
HSM Med Supply Solutions City of Industry, and Services
Brooklyn, NY - Tampa, FL CA Chicago, IL
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - Yes
ltem Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-1 00,000|Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  |no bid $ 4.25 [no bid $ 2.50
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20
ZYB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 0 20
Delivery time 15 Days 10 Days
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid $ 4101 % 23019 2.90
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
DTC3W Number of Boxes per Case 0 20 20
Delivery time 15 Days 15 Days 14 Days
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid $ 4.75 |no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box 20
1860 Number of Boxes per Case 0
Delivery time 15 Days
4 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
1860S Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity no bid $ 3259 2301% 275
N95 Number Masks per box 20 20 20
L-188 Number of Boxes per Case 0 20 20
Delivery time 7 Days 15 Days 14 Days
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare **$0.55 $ 2.35 |***$1.20 $ 1.50
KNS5 Number Masks per box 50 20 50
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 0 48 20
Delivery time 7 Days 20 Days 10 Days

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.




BID NO. 2021-030 ANNUAL CONTRACT

FOR N95 AND KN95 MASKS

**item does not meet specifications

***\Vendor could not provide a sample on request

Imagine Human Architechture
Positec USA StatlLab Medical Health Solutions
Charlotte, NC McKinney, TX | Sacramento, CA Fairfax, VA
HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No HUB - No
ltem Est Qty  Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 0-100,000Mfg: Xiantao Zhongyi Safety Protection Products Co.  no bid no bid $ 3.15 ino bid
N85 Number Masks per box 20
Z2YB-11 Number of Boxes per Case 20
Delivery time 35-45 Days
2 0-100,000 Mfg: Shanghai Dasheng Health Products Mfg Co no bid no bid $ 39813 2.48
Ng5 Number Masks per box 20 20
DTC3wW Number of Boxes per Case 20 400
Delivery time 35-45 Days 30
3 0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
NS5 Number Masks per box
1860 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
4 (0-100,000 Mfg: 3M no bid no bid no bid no bid
N95 Number Masks per box
18608 Number of Boxes per Case
Delivery time
5 0-100,000 Mfg: Harley Commodity $ 225|% 250 1% 2991 % 2.39
NG5 Number Masks per box 20 20 20 20
1-188 Number of Boxes per Case 20 0 20 400
Delivery time 10 Days 2 Days 30-45 Days 30
6 0-100,000 Mfg: Global Healthcare no bid no bid no bid $ 3.15
KN95 Number Masks per box 20
BYD Number of Boxes per Case 400
Delivery time 30

Lex Industries and Great Hawk Air Service were deemed non-responsive.
Global Protection Corp. submitted a no-bid.






