RFB 2021-098 PROPANE FUEL WITH PURCHASE AND REPAIR

Ferrellgas LP
Grand Prairie, TX
HUB - no
COOP - yes
Est.
ltem . Quantity | Plus or | . . . Price per | Extended
N Description - Minus Differential | per Gallon aflom Price
°. P | 4/29/2021 | 9
Gallon
Section 1: Propane Bulk Delivery Secondary
1. |Propane Delivéry 6,000 | plus | $ 0.4000| 3% 1.0700($ 1.4700| $ 8,820.00
Section 2: Propane Cylinder
Refills Secondary
Propane Cylinder
1. |REéfill at Vendor 100 plus | $ 0.7000|$ 1.0700($ 1.7700|$ 177.00
Location
Minimum Gallons Cost
Pickup and Delivery ,
2. |of Propane Cylinders 50 gallons $25.00
for Refill
Primary Award: Yellow Rose Propane: Sections 1, 2, 3
Ferrellgas LP Sections 4, 5
Secondary Award: Ferrellgas LP Sections 1, 2

Northwest Butane Gas Co was deemed non-responsive for not submitting Form 1295 as required.



RFB 2021-098 PROPANE FUEL WITH PURCHASE AND REPAIR

Northwest Butane Gas Co
Carrollton, TX
HUB - no
COOP -yes
Est.
ltem ¢ Quantity | Plusor | ... - .. Index Cost Price per | Extended
N Description ap T Differential | per Gallon allon Price
° P 412012021 | 9
Gallon

Section 1: Propane Bulk Delivery
1. |Propane Delivery 6,000 | plus | $ 0.4950 | % 1.0700 | $ 1.5650 | $ 9,390.00
Section 2: Propane Cylinder
Refills

Propane Cylinder
1. [Refill at Vendor 100| plus | $ 0.9900| % 1.0700 | $ 2.0600 | $ 206.00

Location

Minimum Gallons Cost

Pickup and Delivery
2. |of Propane Cylinders 50 gallons $175.00

for Refill

Northwest Butane Gas Co was deemed non-responsive for not
submitting Form 1295 as required.




RFB 2021-098 PROPANE FUEL WITH PURCHASE AND REPAIR

Yellow Rose Propane
Cleburne, TX
HUB - no
COOP - yes
Est. ' Index
ltem Description Quantity Plgs O | Differential Cost per | Price per Exte_nded
No. per Minus Gallon gallon Price
Gallon 4/29/2021
Section 1: Propane Bulk Delivery Primary
1. |Propane Delivery 6,000 | plus | $ 0.3100| $1.0700 | $1.3800 | $ 8,280.00
Section 2: Propane Cylinder .
Refills Primary
Propane Cylinder
1. |Refill at Vendor 100( plus | $ 0.3100| $1.0700 | $1.3800 | $ 138.00
Location :
Minimum Gallons Cost
Pickup and Delivery
2. |of Propane Cylinders n/a No Delivery Fees
for Refill




RFB 2021-098 PROPANE FUEL WITH PURCHASE AND REPAIR OF EQUIPMENT

Ferrellgas LP

Northwest Butane Gas Co

Yellow Rose Propane

Grand Prairie, TX Carroliton, TX Cleburne, TX
HUB - no HUB - no HUB - no
COOP -yes COOP - yes COOP - yes
Item Descrition Est. Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly Daily Weekly Monthly
No. P Quantity Rate Rate Rate Rate Rate Rate Rate Rate Rate
Section 3: Propane Cylinder Rental Primary
4, |Propane Cylinder 5 n/a n/a n/a 1000 {$ 1000 |$  10.00 No Rental and Delivery Fees
" |Rental, 12 Ibs.

Propane Cylinder 5 n/a n/a n/a | 10.00 | $ 10.00 | § 10.00 No Rental and Delivery Fees
5 Rental, 20 Ibs.

Propane Cylinder 5 n/a n/a n/a 13.00 | S 13.00 | $ 13.00 No Rental and Delivel:y Fees
3 Rental, 30 Ibs.

Propana Cylinder 5 n/a n/a n/a 15.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 15.00 No Rental and Delivery Fees
4 Rental, 40 Ibs. ) ’ ’

Propane Cylinder 5 n/a n/a n/a | 16.00 | $ 16.00 | S 16.00 No Rental and Delivery Fees
5 Rental, 50 Ibs.

Propane Cylinder 5 n/a n/a n/a 18.00 { $ 18.00 | $§ 18.00 No Rental and Delivel;y Fees
6 Rental, 60 Ibs.

Propena Cylinder 5 n/a n/a $  10.00 19.00 |$  19.00|%  19.00 No Rental and Delivery Fees
7 Rental, 100 Ibs.

Cage Rentall for 9 slot S 24.00 12 cylinders $15.00 per No Rental and Delivery Fees
8 Propane Cylinders week

Northwest Butane Gas Co was deemed non-responsive for not submitting Form 1295 as required.




RFB 2021-098 PROPANE FUEL WITH PURCHASE AND REPAIR OF EQUIPMENT

Ferrellgas LP

Northwest Butane Gas Co

Yellow Rose Propane

Grand Prairie, TX Carrollton, TX Cleburne, TX
HUB - no HUB - no HUB - no
COOQOP - yes COOP - yes COOP - yes
Section 4: Propane Fueling Prima
Equipment Repair vy
1. |Parts Markup Percentage 30% 35% no bid
2. |Hourly Labor Rate:
Normal Business Hours .
8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. $90.00 $90.00 no bid
After Hours .
5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m. $90.00 Hast0 i
3. |Weekend and County Holiday $90.00 $180.00 no bid
Section 5: Propane Fueling Prima
Equipment Purchase v
1 Cylinders - Markup 30% 35% 6 bid
Percentage
2. |Tanks - Markup Percentage 30% 35% no bid

Northwest Butane Gas Co was deemed non-responsive for not submitting Form 1295 as required.




