

Bid No. 2019-061 A/C for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

SECTION I - PESTICIDES			ADAPCO, LLC Sanford, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Target Specialty Products Coppell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Univar Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
1	Deltamethrin, 2.00%, 2 x 2.5 gal/case , DeltaGard or approved equivalent	1	\$1,017.65 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,562.70^ ALT: Aqua Zenivex E20
2	Deltamethrin, 2.00%, 30 gal drum , DeltaGard or approved equivalent	1	\$5,908.20 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$9,311.10^ ALT: Aqua Zenivex E20
3	Deltamethrin, 2.00%, 250 gal tote , DeltaGard or approved equivalent	1	\$48,637.50 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$81,067.25^ ALT: Aqua Zenivex E20
4	Permethrin- 3.98% Pipeonyl Butoxide- 8.48%, 2.5 gal jug , Permanone RTU or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$48.00*** - S ALT: Evoluer	\$31.20*** - P ALT: ML Kontrol 4-4
5	Permethrin- 3.98% Pipeonyl Butoxide- 8.48%, 2 x 2.5 gal/case , Permanone RTU or approved equivalent	1	\$128.55 - A	NO BID	\$96.00*** - S ALT: Evoluer	\$62.40*** - P ALT: ML Kontrol 4-4
6	Permethrin- 3.98% Pipeonyl Butoxide- 8.48%, 30 gal drum , Permanone RTU or approved equivalent	1	\$771.30 - A	NO BID	\$503.70*** - S ALT: Evoluer	\$440.40*** - P ALT: ML Kontrol 4-4
7	Permethrin- 3.98% Pipeonyl Butoxide- 8.48%, 55 gal drum , Permanone RTU or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$902.00*** - S ALT: Evoluer	\$703.45*** - P ALT: ML Kontrol 4-4
8	Permethrin- 3.98% Pipeonyl Butoxide- 8.48%, 275 gal tote , Permanone RTU or approved equivalent	1	\$7,070.25 - A	NO BID	\$4,339.50*** - S ALT: Evoluer	\$3,605.25*** - P ALT: ML Kontrol 4-4
9	Sumithrin- 2.00%, 2 x 2.5 gal/case , Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$380.90 - P	NO BID	\$222.69^ ALT: ML Kontrol 31-67
10	Sumithrin- 2.00%, 30 gal drum , Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$2,244.00 - P	NO BID	\$2,686.80^ ALT: ML Kontrol 31-67
11	Sumithrin- 2.00%, 55 gal drum , Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$4,098.05 - P	NO BID	NO BID
12	Sumithrin- 2.00%, 275 gal tote , Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$20,193.25 - P	NO BID	NO BID
13	Sumithrin-5.00% Prallethrin-1%, 2 x 2.5 gal/case , Duet or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$1,087.55 - P	NO BID	\$431.80^ ALT: Zenivex E4
14	Sumithrin-5.00% Prallethrin-1%, 30 gal drum , Duet or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$6,407.40 - P	NO BID	\$2,559.00^ ALT: Zenivex E4
15	Sumithrin-5.00% Prallethrin-1%, 55 gal drum , Duet or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$11,146.85 - P	NO BID	\$10,014.00^ ALT: Zenivex E4/120 gal.
16	Sumithrin-5.00% Prallethrin-1%, 275 gal tote , Duet or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$55,258.50 - P	NO BID	\$22,948.75^ ALT: Zenivex E4

Bid No. 2019-061 A/C for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

SECTION I - PESTICIDES			ADAPCO, LLC Sanford, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Target Specialty Products Coppell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Univar Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
17	Naled -87.40%, 30 gal drum , Dibrom or approved equivalent	1	\$6,684.30 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
18	Malathion-96.50%, 5 gal pail , Fyfanon ULV Mosquito or approved equivalent	1	\$295.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID**
19	Malathion-96.50%, 55 gal drum , Fyfanon ULV Mosquito or approved equivalent	1	\$3,142.15 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$3,299.45 - S
20	Malathion-96.50%, 260 gal tote , Fyfanon ULV Mosquito or approved equivalent	1	\$14,011.40 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$14,710.80 - S
21	Malathion-96.50%, 1000 gal>bulk/gal , Fyfanon ULV Mosquito or approved equivalent	1	\$50.00/gal - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$52.50/gal - S
22	Bti-7.00%, Fourstar Bti Briquets – 45 day, 200 ct. , or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$208.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
23	Bti-7.00%, Fourstar Bti Briquets – 150 day, 200 ct. , or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$208.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
24	Bti-10.00%, Fourstar Bti Multi-Brood CRG, 35 lb. bag or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$310.10 - A \$8.86/lb.	\$297.00*** - P ALT: Sustain MBG /40 lb. bag \$7.43/lb.	\$326.80*** - S <i>ALT: Sustain MBG/40 lb. bag</i> <i>\$8.17/lb.</i>
25	Bti-10.31%, Summit Bti Briquets, 20 ct. or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.65 - P	\$28.00 - S
26	Bti-10.31%, Summit Bti Briquets, 72 ct. or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$77.00 - P	NO BID
27	Bti-10.31%, Summit®Bti Briquets, 100 ct. or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$70.00 - P	\$73.24 - S	\$95.00 - A
28	Bti-37.40%, 25 lb. drum , VectoBac WDG or approved equivalent	1	\$927.25 - P \$37.09/lb.	NO BID	NO BID	\$1307.10*** - S <i>ALT: AquaBac XT/30 gal</i> <i>\$43.57/gal</i>
29	Spinosad-7.48%, 600 ct. , Natular DT or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$307.20 - P	NO BID	NO BID
30	Spinosad-7.48%, 2500 ct. , Natular DT or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$1,157.86 - P	NO BID	NO BID
31	Bti-4.50% Bs-2.70%, 800 pouches/case , VectoMax WSP or approved equivalent	1	\$1,528.00 - S	\$942.88*** - P Alt: Fourstar WSP	NO BID	\$1,013.33^ ALT: Spheratax SPH 50G

Bid No. 2019-061 A/C for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

SECTION I - PESTICIDES			ADAPCO, LLC Sanford, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Target Specialty Products Coppell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Univar Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
32	Bti-3% Bs-3%, 40 lb. bag , Fourstar Multi-Brood Granule or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$264.40 - P	<i>\$297.00*** - S ALT: Sustain MBG</i>	NO BID
33	Bti-3% Bs-3%, 1000 lb. bag , Fourstar Multi-Brood Granule or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$6,610.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
34	Bti-1% Bs-9%, 35 lb. bag , Fourstar Multi-Brood CRG or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$410.20 - P \$11.72/lb.	NO BID	\$266.80^ ALT: Spheratax SPH 50G/40 lb. bag \$6.67/lb.
35	Bti-1% Bs-9%, 1000 lb. bag , Fourstar Multi-Brood CRG or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$11,720.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
36	5.35% Bti-1.6%(s) Methoprene, 40 lb bag , Duplex G or approved equivalent	1	\$158.00*** - P ALT: Vectoprime VPRFG-40 \$3.95/lb.	\$570.00	<i>\$570.00 - S</i>	\$570.00 - A
37	5.35% Bti-1.6%(s) Methoprene, 2000 lb tote , Duplex G or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$27,800.00 - A	<i>\$27,800.00 - S</i>	\$27,800.00 - P
38	Deltamethrin-4.75%, 16 oz. bottle , Suspend Polyzone or approved equivalent	1	NO BID**	NO BID	<i>\$43.36 - S</i>	\$37.57*** - P ALT: Suspend SC
39	Deltamethrin-4.75%, 1 gal. jug , Suspend Polyzone or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	<i>\$303.92 - S</i>	\$277.18*** - P ALT: Suspend SC
40	Deltamethrin-4.75%, 30 gal drum , Suspend Polyzone or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$7,284.19 - P	<i>\$7,770.00 - S</i>
41	Lambda-Cyhalothrin-9.70%, 8 oz. bottle , Demand CS or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.36 - P	<i>\$40.35 - S</i>
42	Lambda-Cyhalothrin-9.70%, 32 oz. bottle , Demand CS or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$115.90 - P	<i>\$132.60 - S</i>
43	Lambda-Cyhalothrin-9.70%, 24 qts./case , Demand CS or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,136.00 - P	<i>\$2,864.16 - S</i>
44	(s) Methoprene-2.10%, Altoside® XR Briquets 10 ct. or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Bid No. 2019-061 A/C for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

SECTION I - PESTICIDES			ADAPCO, LLC Sanford, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Target Specialty Products Coppell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Univar Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
45	(s) Methoprene-2.10%, Altoside® XR Briquets 40 ct. or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$154.15 - P	NO BID
46	(s) Methoprene-2.10%, Altoside® XR Briquets 220 ct. or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$752.40 - A	\$734.80 - P	\$752.40 - S
47	Mineral Oil-97%, 5 gal pail , BVA2 or approved equivalent	1	\$45.60 - P	NO BID	\$47.00 - S	NO BID
48	Mineral Oil-97%, 55 gal drum , BVA2 or approved equivalent	1	\$501.60 - A	NO BID	\$450.80 - S	\$450.00*** - P ALT: Max Par G2 60
49	Mineral Oil-97%, 275 gal drum , BVA2 or approved equivalent	1	\$2,466.75 - A	NO BID	\$2,200.00 - S	\$2,000.00*** - P ALT: Max Par G2 60
50	Mineral Oil-10%, 2 x 2.5 gal/case, Cocobear or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$110.40 - S	NO BID	\$35.00*** - P ALT: ML Larvicide Oil
51	Mineral Oil-10%, 30 gal drum, Cocobear or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
52	Mineral Oil-10%, 55 gal drum, Cocobear or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$1,103.30 - S	NO BID	\$403.42*** - P ALT: ML Larvicide Oil
53	Mineral Oil-10%, 275 gal drum, Cocobear or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	\$5,313.00 - S	NO BID	\$2,017.16*** - P ALT: ML Larvicide Oil

P = PRIMARY

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

**Considered non-responsive for bidding not as specified

*** Alternate accepted ^Alternate not accepted

No-Bid received from Pollock

No bids received for items 44 and 51

Tie Bids received for items 36, 37 and 46

No secondary awards made for items 1-3, 9-18, 22-23, 26, 29-30, 33-35, 45

No alternate awards made for items 1-4, 7, 9-23, 25-26, 28-35, 38-43, 45, 47, 50, 52-53

Bid No. 2019-061 A/C for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Products

SECTION II - MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	ADAPCO, LLC Sanford, FL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	Target Specialty Products Coppell, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Univar Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes
1	CDC Gravid Trap, Model 1712, NSN #6545-01-457-5511	1	NO BID	\$603.50	\$129.70 - P	NO BID
2	Collection Bag, Double Ring, Fine Mesh, NSN #3740-01-527-5623, (for use with CDC Gravid Trap, Model 1712)	1	NO BID	\$317.90	\$34.65 - P	NO BID
3	Motor and Fan for Miniature Traps, 6 Volt, John W. Hock Part #: 4.10	1	NO BID	\$70.00	\$22.65 - P	NO BID
4	BG-2 Sentinel Mosquito Trap, 7.5 – 12 Volt, Bioquip 2883	1	\$197.00 - P	NO BID	\$215.00 - S	NO BID
5	Replacement Catch Bag for BG-2 Sentinel Trap, Bioquip 2883C	1	\$6.21 - S	NO BID	\$3.85 - P	NO BID
6	Replacement Power Supply for BG-2, Bioquip 2883PS	1	\$24.55 - S	NO BID	\$23.10 - P	NO BID
7	Battery Charger and Maintainer, 6/12 VDC, ATEC #9003 or approved equivalent	1	NO BID	NO BID	\$79.70 - P Bioquip 2865	NO BID
Discount off Mfg. List Price for other Gravid Trap Replacement Parts				0%	10%	
Discount off Mfg. List Price for other BG-2 Sentinel Trap Replacement Parts			0%		10%	
Discount off Mfg. List Price for items not specified			0%	0%	10% (not applicable to agency or MCP products)	13%

P = Primary

S = Secondary

No secondary awards made for items 1-3, 7