

RFB 2019-194 Annual Contract for Janitorial Supplies

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op-Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Bleach, Germicidal 6% - 1 Gallon Container	0-2,200	\$3.89	\$2.55	no bid	no bid	\$2.96	no bid	\$2.05 -A	no bid	\$2.57
2	Spray Bottle, 32 oz	0-400	\$1.69	\$1.34	no bid	no bid	\$0.52 -A	\$2.89	\$0.61	no bid	\$0.49 -S
3	Sprayer Trigger, 32 oz. bottle	0-400	\$0.74	\$0.75	no bid	no bid	\$0.40 -P	\$1.29	\$0.61	no bid	\$0.40 -S
4	Wood Block Broom, 3.25"W x 24L	0-100	\$14.81	\$11.69	no bid	no bid	\$6.14 -A	no bid	\$7.65	no bid	\$9.11
5	Push Broom Handle, Threaded for Push Broom, 60"L-15/16	0-100	\$3.66	\$3.70	no bid	no bid	\$1.83 -S	no bid	\$2.51	no bid	\$3.62
6	Angle Broom with Plastic Bristles, 13" Length with 42" Wood Handle, Yellow	0-400	\$7.26	\$3.99	no bid	no bid	\$3.13 -P	no bid	\$4.18	no bid	\$8.12
7	Lambswool Extendable Duster, 30"L to 47"L.	0-200	\$6.93	\$5.49	no bid	no bid	\$5.94	no bid	\$4.57 -S	no bid	\$5.31
8	Wooden Brush Deck Brush, 10"L x 2.75"W, Palmyra Bristles.	0-300	\$4.85	\$2.98	no bid	no bid	\$2.00 -P	no bid	\$2.78 -A	no bid	\$5.42

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No				Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
\$2.80	1	Bleach, Germicidal 6% - 1 Gallon Container	0-2,200	\$10.29	\$1.71 -P	\$4.01	\$2.73	\$2.95	no bid	\$3.18	\$1.98 -S
\$0.55	2	Spray Bottle, 32 oz	0-400	\$0.61	\$0.59	\$1.89	\$1.33	\$0.51	\$0.47 -P	\$0.79	\$0.58
\$0.58	3	Sprayer Trigger, 32 oz. bottle	0-400	\$0.61	\$0.59	\$0.49	\$1.02	\$0.47	\$0.44 -A	\$1.19	\$0.58
\$9.20	4	Wood Block Broom, 3.25"W x 24L	0-100	\$11.83	\$5.51 -S	\$23.62	\$11.47	\$8.11	\$5.49 -P	\$11.99	\$7.39
\$2.00 -A	5	Push Broom Handle, Threaded for Push Broom, 60"L-15/16	0-100	\$2.34	\$1.82 -P	\$2.09	\$4.43	\$2.84	\$2.10	\$3.86	\$2.42
no bid	6	Angle Broom with Plastic Bristles, 13" Length with 42" Wood Handle, Yellow	0-400	\$3.85 -S	\$4.59	\$4.99	\$7.65	\$5.25	\$3.98 -A	\$7.99	\$4.03
\$6.90	7	Lambswool Extendable Duster, 30"L to 47"L.	0-200	\$5.51	\$5.49	\$10.19	\$7.02	\$6.26	\$5.29 -A	no bid	\$4.41 -P
\$5.10	8	Wooden Brush Deck Brush, 10"L x 2.75"W, Palmyra Bristles.	0-300	\$7.68	\$2.98	\$5.31	\$5.02	\$5.83	\$3.29	\$4.27	\$2.68 -S

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op-Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
9	Utility Pot Brush, with Poly handle, synthetic block and nylon fill	0-1,200	\$6.74	\$5.46	no bid	no bid	\$3.09	no bid	\$2.36 -S	no bid	\$3.45
10	Wooden Squeegee, 3"W x 18"L, 1-1/8" Tapered Hole, Neoprane Blade.	0-300	no bid	\$7.99 -P	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
11	Plastic Dust Mop Frame, Slide on, 5"W x 36"L	0-300	\$5.34 -P	\$15.96 -A	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
12	Dust Mop Clip-On Handle with Plastic Head.	0-250	\$10.14 -P	\$15.86	no bid	no bid	\$10.54 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
13	Washable Dust Mop Head, Twisted Loop Cotton, 36" x 5"	0-500	\$14.95	\$5.88 -S	no bid	no bid	\$9.57	no bid	\$6.11	no bid	\$14.41
14	Cotton Wet Mop Head, Cut Ends, #32	0-3,200	\$4.04	\$5.80	no bid	no bid	\$2.97	\$6.89	\$2.46 -S	no bid	\$5.60
15	Plastic Head Mop Handle, 60" x 1-1/8", Yellow	0-400	\$20.72	\$5.78	no bid	no bid	\$5.53 -A	no bid	\$7.83	no bid	\$12.90
16	Buffing Pads-Black, 20", Hi-Pro Stripping.	0-100	\$4.36	\$6.83	no bid	no bid	\$2.52	\$20.89	\$3.48	no bid	\$3.43
17	Buffing Pads-White-20", Polishing Shine Gloss	0-400	\$3.38	\$5.99	no bid	no bid	\$2.65	\$20.89	\$2.66	no bid	\$2.41
18	Buffing Pads-Red-20", Floor Pad	0-50	\$3.29	\$5.99	no bid	no bid	\$2.52	\$20.89	\$2.66	no bid	\$2.41
19	Buffing Pads-Green, 20", Floor Pad	0-50	\$3.29	\$5.99	no bid	no bid	\$2.52	\$19.89	\$2.66	no bid	\$3.09

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No				Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
no bid	9	Utility Pot Brush, with Poly handle, synthetic block and nylon fill	0-1,200	\$2.91 -A	\$2.99	\$5.73	\$8.68	\$5.86	\$5.39	\$3.71	\$2.28 -P
no bid	10	Wooden Squeegee, 3"W x 18"L, 1-1/8" Tapered Hole, Neoprane Blade.	0-300	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
no bid	11	Plastic Dust Mop Frame, Slide on, 5"W x 36"L	0-300	no bid	\$12.98 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
no bid	12	Dust Mop Clip-On Handle with Plastic Head.	0-250	no bid	\$13.98 -A	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
\$5.85 -P	13	Washable Dust Mop Head, Twisted Loop Cotton, 36" x 5"	0-500	\$10.99	\$5.89 -A	\$20.15	\$14.88	\$11.47	\$6.19	no bid	\$5.91
\$3.70	14	Cotton Wet Mop Head, Cut Ends, #32	0-3,200	\$2.89 -A	\$2.99	\$5.10	\$5.18	\$3.01	\$2.99	\$5.89	\$2.37 -P
no bid	15	Plastic Head Mop Handle, 60" x 1-1/8", Yellow	0-400	\$5.51 -S	\$4.99 -P	\$13.71	\$8.03	\$6.76	\$5.68	\$10.07	\$7.56
\$3.00	16	Buffing Pads-Black, 20", Hi-Pro Stripping.	0-100	\$2.41 -A	\$2.32 -S	\$1.66 -P	\$3.41	\$3.35	\$3.89	\$11.57	\$3.36
\$2.60	17	Buffing Pads-White-20", Polishing Shine Gloss	0-400	\$2.41 -A	\$2.32 -S	\$4.36	\$3.41	\$2.27 -P	\$2.99	\$9.93	\$2.57
\$2.60	18	Buffing Pads-Red-20", Floor Pad	0-50	\$2.41 -A	\$2.32 -S	\$4.59	\$3.41	\$2.27 -P	\$2.99	\$4.32	\$2.57
\$2.60	19	Buffing Pads-Green, 20", Floor Pad	0-50	\$2.41 -A	\$2.32 -S	\$4.59	\$3.41	\$2.27 -P	\$2.99	\$4.75	\$2.57

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
20	Chlorinated Powder with Sprinkle Top, 20 oz.	0-1,600	no bid	\$5.03	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$1.03 -P
21	Heavy Duty Liquid Detergent Degreaser 1 gallon bottle	0-600	\$9.72	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$27.16	no bid	\$6.57	\$14.36	\$6.25 -A
22	Dry Powdered Disinfectant Detergent, 90 oz. Pail, 0.5 Ct. Packets.	0-3,600	\$23.58 -A	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$26.06	no bid
23	Spray Disinfectant, Steriphene II, 15 oz. can	0-1,400	\$6.25	\$3.10	no bid	no bid	\$2.36 -A	no bid	\$2.08 -S	no bid	\$2.82
24	Liquid Disinfectant, 1 gallon bottle, Lemon Scent.	0-200	\$25.47	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$6.86 -A	no bid	\$9.07	no bid	\$8.68
25	Push Style Soap Dispenser, 800 ML, Bag-In-Box	0-100	\$17.61	\$11.88	no bid	no bid	\$14.12	no bid	\$8.59 -S	no bid	\$14.77
26	Liquid Hand Soap Refill/Pink for Push Style Dispenser 800 ML, Pink Lotion.	0-3,000	\$12.97	\$3.61	no bid	no bid	\$1.68 -P	no bid	\$1.96	no bid	\$4.36
27	Enmotion Tranquil Aloe Foam Hand Soap, 1200mL	0-3,000	\$26.57	\$13.50 -P	no bid	no bid	\$47.12	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$16.62 -A
28	Manual Soap & Sanitizer Dispenser, 5.6" x 4.6" x 10.7"	0-100	\$3.04 -P	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$17.59	no bid	\$6.18 -A	no bid	\$17.76

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No				Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
no bid	20	Chlorinated Powder with Sprinkle Top, 20 oz.	0-1,600	\$1.37 -A	\$1.33 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
\$7.25	21	Heavy Duty Liquid Detergent Degreaser 1 gallon bottle	0-600	\$6.09 -S	\$5.87 -P	no bid	\$7.68	\$7.18	no bid	\$13.28	\$6.35
\$40.00	22	Dry Powdered Disinfectant Detergent, 90 oz. Pail, 0.5 Ct. Packets.	0-3,600	no bid	no bid	\$37.14	\$23.56 -S	\$21.15 -P	\$29.70	no bid	no bid
\$3.00	23	Spray Disinfectant, Steriphene II, 15 oz. can	0-1,400	\$3.22	\$3.15	\$4.67	\$3.62	\$3.47	\$2.39	no bid	\$2.01 -P
\$6.20 -P	24	Liquid Disinfectant, 1 gallon bottle, Lemon Scent.	0-200	\$8.49	\$8.19	\$22.07	\$15.34	\$6.37 -S	no bid	\$12.43	\$8.76
\$15.50	25	Push Style Soap Dispenser, 800 ML, Bag-In-Box	0-100	\$13.19	\$11.95	\$27.81	\$14.05	\$0.00	\$11.69 -A	\$15.01	\$8.29 -P
\$2.48	26	Liquid Hand Soap Refill/Pink for Push Style Dispenser 800 ML, Pink Lotion.	0-3,000	\$2.19	\$1.99	\$7.25	\$1.93 -A	\$2.31	\$2.09	no bid	\$1.89 -S
\$17.50	27	Enmotion Tranquil Aloe Foam Hand Soap, 1200mL	0-3,000	no bid	no bid	\$25.00	no bid	\$16.11 -S	no bid	\$28.50	no bid
no bid	28	Manual Soap & Sanitizer Dispenser, 5.6" x 4.6" x 10.7"	0-100	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.00	no bid	no bid	\$5.97 -S

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op-Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
29	Dust Siphon Drum Pump (fits 15, 30 and 55-gallon drums)	0-250	\$12.04	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$8.65 -P	no bid	\$15.00	no bid	\$11.22 -A
30	Dust Pan, Plastic Black, 12-1/4"	0-50	\$5.76	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2.05	\$3.89	\$2.04	no bid	\$2.01 -A
31	Floor Stripper, Non Ammoniated, 5 gallon	0-50	\$69.41	\$39.79	\$209.70	\$232.00	\$52.94	no bid	\$32.12	\$54.35	\$44.70
32	Floor Finish Wax, Super Finish II, 5 gallon container.	0-150	\$370.89	\$56.35	\$151.20	\$151.20	\$66.82	no bid	\$49.41	\$56.15	\$60.95
33	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser Refills, 1000ML bags	0-250	\$12.07	\$12.25	no bid	no bid	\$10.81	no bid	Did not meet spec	no bid	\$10.16
34	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser, 1000ML, Wall Mount	0-50	\$11.71 -P	\$15.82	no bid	no bid	\$12.59 -A	\$15.89	Did not meet spec	no bid	\$14.39
35	Metered Air Freshener Dispenser, Auto Dispenser with pre-set timer	0-50	\$23.92	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$14.56 -P	no bid	\$18.90	no bid	\$27.37
36	Metered Air Freshener for Auto Dispenser, 7 oz., Lemon Scent	0-100	\$4.07	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2.78	no bid	\$3.69	no bid	\$3.13 -A
37	Magic Eraser Sponge	0-300	\$1.51	\$1.15	no bid	no bid	\$0.87	no bid	\$0.48 -S	no bid	\$0.82
38	Green Scrub Pad, 3 1/2" x 5"	0-350	\$0.41	\$0.79	no bid	no bid	\$0.38	\$39.89	\$0.28	no bid	\$0.31
39	Stainless Steel Cleaner Polish, 1 gallon container	0-50	\$32.84	no bid	\$140.72	\$140.72	\$21.88	no bid	\$35.95	no bid	no bid

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No				Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
no bid	29	Dust Siphon Drum Pump (fits 15, 30 and 55-gallon drums)	0-250	no bid	no bid	\$23.98	\$11.79	\$11.84	\$9.99 -S	no bid	\$14.49
\$2.20	30	Dust Pan, Plastic Black, 12-1/4"	0-50	no bid	\$3.54	\$6.61	no bid	\$2.25	\$1.98 -S	\$4.96	\$1.97 -P
\$38.00	31	Floor Stripper, Non Ammoniated, 5 gallon	0-50	\$27.85 -S	\$26.86 -P	\$51.09	\$63.16	\$40.18	no bid	\$60.07	\$31.02 -A
\$44.39 -P	32	Floor Finish Wax, Super Finish II, 5 gallon container.	0-150	\$49.40	\$47.65 -S	\$93.06	\$76.61	\$51.71	no bid	\$67.22	\$47.73 -A
\$8.94 -S	33	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser Refills, 1000ML bags	0-250	\$9.92	\$8.90 -P	\$12.16	\$12.03	\$9.19 -A	11.98	\$10.87	Did not meet spec
\$0.00	34	Hand Sanitizer Dispenser, 1000ML, Wall Mount	0-50	\$12.61	\$11.89 -S	\$22.30	\$14.80	\$0.00	\$16.99	\$14.79	Did not meet spec
no bid	35	Metered Air Freshener Dispenser, Auto Dispenser with pre-set timer	0-50	\$22.43	\$21.63	\$61.93	no bid	\$23.72	\$15.98 -S	no bid	\$18.26 -A
no bid	36	Metered Air Freshener for Auto Dispenser, 7 oz., Lemon Scent	0-100	\$3.50	\$3.38	\$7.56	\$3.41	\$2.90 -S	\$2.82 -P	no bid	\$3.57
\$1.40	37	Magic Eraser Sponge	0-300	\$0.82	\$0.69 -A	\$2.47	\$0.72	\$1.35	\$1.05	\$1.07	\$0.47 -P
\$0.41	38	Green Scrub Pad, 3 1/2" x 5"	0-350	\$0.85	\$0.54	\$1.39	\$0.52	\$0.20 -S	\$0.20 -P	\$0.55	\$0.27 -A
no bid	39	Stainless Steel Cleaner Polish, 1 gallon container	0-50	\$20.44 -S	\$20.46 -A	\$24.59	\$24.49	\$5.08 -P	no bid	\$38.73	\$34.72

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op-Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
40	Stainless Steel Polish Spray, 18 oz	0-50	\$2.73	no bid	\$11.73	\$11.73	2.36 -A	no bid	\$2.19 -S	\$3.89	\$3.48
41	Blue Glass Cleaner, Ammoniated 1 gallon	0-50	\$5.23	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$5.53	no bid	\$5.19	\$17.57	\$8.45
42	Blue Powder Laundry Detergent, 50 lb. box	0-250	no bid	\$16.53 -P	no bid	no bid	\$25.88	no bid	\$27.18	no bid	no bid
43	Dishwashing Liquid 38 oz bottle.	0-250	\$7.29	\$4.69	no bid	no bid	\$4.91	no bid	no bid	\$5.11	\$4.85
44	Pot and Pan Detergent 38 oz	0-250	\$5.03	\$4.69 -S	\$12.96	\$12.96	\$5.09	no bid	\$5.99	\$5.11	\$4.91
45	Wave Urinal Screens with anti-splash, Ocean Scent	0-400	\$2.23	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$1.60	no bid	\$1.25 -S	no bid	\$1.53
46	Toilet Bowl Clip Block, Apple Spice Scent	0-400	\$17.62	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$1.54	no bid	\$1.24	no bid	\$2.05
47	All-Purpose Cleaner, 1 gallon bottle	0-200	\$11.45	no bid	\$41.22	\$41.22	\$5.34 -S	no bid	\$5.87	\$12.80	\$6.67
48	Multi-Purpose Cleaner Liquid Spray, 16 oz. bottle.	0-250	\$4.95	no bid	\$5.15	\$5.15	\$4.84	no bid	\$3.26	\$3.73	\$2.32 -P
49	Toilet Bowl Liquid Disinfectant, 1 gallon bottle	0-250	\$11.02	no bid	\$40.86	\$40.86	\$9.08	no bid	\$9.07	\$31.00	\$6.40 -P
50	Bathroom Cleaner Spray, Lime Remover, 32 oz. bottle	0-300	\$5.70	no bid	\$10.09	\$10.09	\$3.61 -A	no bid	\$8.60	\$8.92	\$3.34 -S

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No				Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
\$3.90	40	Stainless Steel Polish Spray, 18 oz	0-50	\$4.42	\$4.42	\$6.08	\$2.72	\$3.69	\$2.42 -A	no bid	\$2.12 -P
no bid	41	Blue Glass Cleaner, Ammoniated 1 gallon	0-50	\$4.13 -P	\$4.13 -S	\$11.84	\$5.25	\$4.44 -A	no bid	\$8.64	\$5.01
no bid	42	Blue Powder Laundry Detergent, 50 lb. box	0-250	\$25.30	\$24.4 -A	no bid	no bid	\$16.54 -S	no bid	\$25.39	\$26.25
\$5.00	43	Dishwashing Liquid 38 oz bottle.	0-250	\$4.58 -A	\$4.42 -S	\$7.79	\$2.93 -P	\$4.76	\$4.87	\$5.69	no bid
\$5.36	44	Pot and Pan Detergent 38 oz	0-250	\$4.75 -A	\$4.59 -P	\$7.54	\$5.58	\$4.87	\$4.85	\$5.25	\$5.79
\$1.59	45	Wave Urinal Screens with anti-splash, Ocean Scent	0-400	\$1.67	\$1.61	\$1.84	\$1.96	\$1.57	\$1.49 -A	\$4.33	\$1.18 -P
\$0.66 -P	46	Toilet Bowl Clip Block, Apple Spice Scent	0-400	\$1.61	\$1.55	\$2.92	\$1.93	\$0.67 -S	\$1.53	no bid	\$1.19-A
\$5.45	47	All-Purpose Cleaner, 1 gallon bottle	0-200	\$5.38 -A	\$5.19 -P	\$17.07	\$6.52	\$8.59	no bid	\$11.40	\$5.67
\$4.00	48	Multi-Purpose Cleaner Liquid Spray, 16 oz. bottle.	0-250	\$3.33	\$3.21	\$3.02 -S	no bid	\$4.04	no bid	\$5.81	\$3.15 -A
no bid	49	Toilet Bowl Liquid Disinfectant, 1 gallon bottle	0-250	\$7.42	\$7.16 -A	\$15.72	no bid	\$6.40 -S	no bid	no bid	\$8.76
\$3.00 -P	50	Bathroom Cleaner Spray, Lime Remover, 32 oz. bottle	0-300	\$3.84	\$3.70	\$6.83	\$4.08	\$4.97	no bid	no bid	\$8.31

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op-Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
51	Chemical Labels for Laser Printers- Waterproof, UV Resistant, 3-1/2" x 5"	0-300	\$0.27 -P	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.34	no bid	\$1.53	no bid	\$0.32 -A
52	Chemical Labels for Laser Printers- Waterproof, UV Resistant, 4-3/4" x 7-3/4"	0-300	\$0.53 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.69	no bid	\$1.53	no bid	\$0.64
53	Gallon Utility Jug, White	0-500	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.89 -P	no bid	\$2.94	no bid	no bid
54	Polypropylene Cap, 38/400, white	0-2000	\$0.45 -A	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.07 -P	no bid	\$0.78	no bid	no bid
55	Child Resistant Jugs- Utility, 1 gallon, Heavy-duty Polyethylene	0-300	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.88 -P	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
56	Canvas Drop Cloths, 15"L x 4"W	0-3,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$17.33	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
57	Disinfectant Wipes, 35 wipes per container	0-450	\$4.42	\$2.99	no bid	no bid	\$2.56	no bid	\$8.80	no bid	\$4.95
58	Desk Cleaner, Aerosol Spray, 15 oz. can.	0-300	\$6.06	no bid	\$11.84	\$11.84	\$2.22 -A	no bid	\$1.96 -S	\$3.09	no bid
59	Dry Disposable Wipes, white, 126 sheets per container	0-150	\$7.64	\$7.37	no bid	no bid	\$6.26 -A	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$73.54
60	Large Surface Disposable Wipes, 6 x 6-3/4, 160 wipes per container	0-250	\$18.47	\$11.20	no bid	no bid	\$10.79	no bid	\$14.05	no bid	no bid

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No				Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
no bid	51	Chemical Labels for Laser Printers- Waterproof, UV Resistant, 3-1/2" x 5"	0-300	no bid	no bid	\$0.31 -S	\$0.53	\$0.36	no bid	\$1.35	\$1.48
no bid	52	Chemical Labels for Laser Printers- Waterproof, UV Resistant, 4-3/4" x 7-3/4".	0-300	no bid	no bid	\$0.63 -A	\$0.95	\$0.36 -P	no bid	\$1.01	\$1.48
no bid	53	Gallon Utility Jug, White	0-500	no bid	no bid	\$2.51 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2.84 -A
no bid	54	Polypropylene Cap, 38/400, white	0-2000	no bid	no bid	\$0.33 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.75
no bid	55	Child Resistant Jugs- Utility, 1 gallon, Heavy-duty Polyethylene	0-300	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
\$6.89 -P	56	Canvas Drop Cloths, 15"L x 4"W	0-3,000	no bid	no bid	\$13.66 -A	no bid	\$11.49 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid
\$2.75	57	Disinfectant Wipes, 35 wipes per container	0-450	\$2.64	\$2.39 -S	\$3.96	\$2.93	\$2.42 -A	\$2.32 -P	\$2.99	\$8.44
\$2.25	58	Desk Cleaner, Aerosol Spray, 15 oz. can.	0-300	\$3.83	\$3.70	\$7.50	no bid	\$3.77	\$2.99	\$7.99	\$1.78 -P
\$7.00	59	Dry Disposable Wipes, white, 126 sheets per container	0-150	\$7.44	\$7.18	\$5.73 -P	\$8.53	\$5.78 -S	no bid	\$8.48	no bid
no bid	60	Large Surface Disposable Wipes, 6 x 6-3/4, 160 wipes per container	0-250	no bid	\$6.32 -P	\$8.10	no bid	\$10.70	\$7.79 -A	7.51 -S	\$13.52

			Advantage Supply Fort Worth, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op-Yes	Bargain Source Garland, TX HUB: Yes CO-OP: Yes	Certified Laboratories Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Chemsearch Irving, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Complete Supply, Inc. Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Conserve Flag Co. Sidney, NE HUB: No Co-op: Yes	Dent Enterprises DeSoto, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Ecolab St. Paul, MN HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Empire Paper Co. Wichita Falls, TX HUB: No Co-Op: No
It. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
61	Antimicrobial Santizer Wipes	0-150	\$20.86	\$7.69	no bid	no bid	\$7.79	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$7.74
62	Utility Funnel, flow capacity, 64 oz.	0-200	\$1.14 -P	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.33 -A	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
63	Rectangular Open-Top Utility Wastebasket, 7 gallon, 15-14"H, Black	0-75	\$6.74	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.52 -S	\$5.89	no bid	no bid	\$3.98
64	Round Top Utility Trash Can, 32 gallon, 27-1/4"H, Gray	0-100	\$43.86	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$19.75	\$20.89	\$20.85	no bid	\$37.73
65	Round Top Trash Can for 32 gallon Trash Can, Gray, Snap-On.	0-75	\$14.86	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$7.19	\$8.89	\$5.84 -S	no bid	\$11.28
66	Furniture Polish, Aerosol Can Spray, 20 oz., Lemon Fragrance.	0-30	\$5.14	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$2.24 -S	no bid	\$2.35	no bid	\$3.04
67	No-Slip Rubber Door Wedge, 4-3/4"L x 1-1/4"H x 2-1/4"W	0-30	\$3.00 -S	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$15.61	no bid	\$4.42	no bid	\$3.24 -A

Home Depot Pro, The Jacksonville, FL HUB: No Co-Op: No		Infinity Supply & Service Co. Argyle, TX HUB: No Co-op :Yes	M.A.N.S Distributors Carrollton, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Mavich LLC Southlake, TX HUB: Yes Co-Op: Yes	Medwaste Solutions Dallas, TX HUB-Yes Co-Op: Yes	Pollock Paper Grand Prairie, TX HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Pyramid School Products Tampa, FL HUB: No CO-OP: Yes	Quill LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB: No Co-Op: Yes	Wedge Supply LLC Garland, TX HUB: No Co-Op: Yes		
Unit Price	lt. No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	
no bid	61	Antimicrobial Sautizer Wipes	0-150	\$43.66	\$6.06	\$4.70 -A	\$8.93	\$4.56 -S	\$4.55 -P	\$13.16	no bid
\$2.00 -S	62	Utility Funnel, flow capacity, 64 oz.	0-200	no bid	no bid	\$3.72	no bid	\$3.76	no bid	\$3.41	no bid
\$4.20	63	Rectangular Open-Top Utility Wastebasket, 7 gallon, 15-14"H, Black	0-75	\$3.87	\$3.46 -P	\$7.61	no bid	\$4.88	\$3.93 -A	\$10.49	no bid
\$18.5 -A	64	Round Top Utility Trash Can, 32 gallon, 27-1/4"H, Gray	0-100	\$17.61 -S	\$18.56	\$16.69 -P	no bid	\$21.98	\$24.08	\$38.99	\$20.14
\$8.00	65	Round Top Trash Can for 32 gallon Trash Can, Gray, Snap-On.	0-75	\$7.37	\$6.58 -A	\$14.33	no bid	\$7.19	\$7.17	\$14.19	\$5.64 -P
no bid	66	Furniture Polish, Aerosol Can Spray, 20 oz., Lemon Fragrance.	0-30	\$3.83	\$3.70	\$1.55 -P	\$4.15	\$3.53	\$2.48	no bid	\$2.27 -A
no bid	67	No-Slip Rubber Door Wedge, 4-3/4"L x 1-1/4"H x 2-1/4"W	0-30	no bid	no bid	\$1.73 -P	\$3.86	\$3.67	no bid	\$5.99	\$4.27

Note 1: **P is for Primary Vendor**; *S is for Secondary*; A is for Alternate

Note 2: Line #s 10 and 55 have no secondary (nor alternate) vendors.

Note 3: Line #s 3, 17, 18, 41 and 49 have tie bids. Awards were determined in accordance with Commissioners Court Order No. 60616, Procedure for Awarding Tie Bids.

Note 4: The bid from Pasco Brokerage Inc. is deemed non-responsive as they require a minimum of \$2,200 per Purchase Order.