

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
1A	Air Conditioning & Heating Systems - ACDelco		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
1B	Air Conditioning & Heating Systems - Four Seasons		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
1C	Air Conditioning and Heating Systems - Motorcraft	P		
	Percent Discount	42%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com	BWE-2019	
2A	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - ACDelco		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
2B	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	36%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>	BWE-2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
1A	Air Conditioning & Heating Systems - ACDelco		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
1B	Air Conditioning & Heating Systems - Four Seasons		P	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	56%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Four Seasons 1.7.2019	
1C	Air Conditioning and Heating Systems - Motorcraft			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
2A	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - ACDelco		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
2B	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
1A	Air Conditioning & Heating Systems - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
1B	Air Conditioning & Heating Systems - Four Seasons			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
1C	Air Conditioning and Heating Systems - Motorcraft			A
	Percent Discount	35.50%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
2A	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
2B	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	22%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
2C	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - Ultima		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
3A	Battery - ACDelco			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
3B	Battery - Interstate			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
3C	Battery - Motorcraft	P		
	Percent Discount	20%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com		
4A	Bearings and Seals - Motorcraft	A		
	Percent Discount	35%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com	BWE-2019	
4B	Bearings and Seals - Timken			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
2C	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - Ultima			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	41%
	Price List Type and Date			firstcallonline.com
3A	Battery - ACDelco		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	<i>0%</i>	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019</i>	
3B	Battery - Interstate			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
3C	Battery - Motorcraft		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
4A	Bearings and Seals - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
4B	Bearings and Seals - Timken		P	A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	66%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		National Seals 1.1.2019	firstcallonline.com

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
2C	Alternators, Starters and Electrical - Ultima			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
3A	Battery - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	35%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
3B	Battery - Interstate			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
3C	Battery - Motorcraft			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	20%*
	Price List Type and Date			<i>Motorcraft 3.1.2019</i>
4A	Bearings and Seals - Motorcraft	S		P
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	<i>Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019</i>		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
4B	Bearings and Seals - Timken			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	62%
	Price List Type and Date			12.18.2018

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
5A	Belts & Hoses - ACDELCO		P	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
5B	Belts & Hoses - Gates			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
5C	Belts & Hoses - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	38%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>	BWE-2019	
6A	Brakes and Rotors - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
6B	Brakes and Rotors - BENDIX		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
6C	Brakes and Rotors - Brake Best		3	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
5A	Belts & Hoses - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019</i>	
5B	Belts & Hoses - Gates		P	A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	66%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Gates 10.29.2018	firstcallonline.com
5C	Belts & Hoses - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
6A	Brakes and Rotors - ACDELCO		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
6B	Brakes and Rotors - BENDIX		P	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	70%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Wagner Quick Stop 1.22.2019	
6C	Brakes and Rotors - Brake Best		P	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	70%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Wagner Brake Drum & Rotors 1.1.2019	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
5A	Belts & Hoses - ACDELCO			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
5B	Belts & Hoses - Gates			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	60%
	Price List Type and Date			2.16.2018
5C	Belts & Hoses - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
6A	Brakes and Rotors - ACDELCO			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
6B	Brakes and Rotors - BENDIX			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
6C	Brakes and Rotors - Brake Best			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
6D	Brakes and Rotors - Centric		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
6E	Brakes and Rotors - Motorcraft	P		
	Percent Discount	42%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com	BWE-2019	
6F	Brakes and Rotors - Pronto		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
6G	Brakes and Rotors - Wagner		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
7A	Charging & Starting Systems - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
7B	Charging & Starting Systems - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	38%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>		

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
6D	Brakes and Rotors - Centric			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
6E	Brakes and Rotors - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
6F	Brakes and Rotors - Pronto			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
6G	Brakes and Rotors - Wagner		P	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	70%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Wagner Friction 1.1.2019	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
7A	Charging & Starting Systems - ACDELCO		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
7B	Charging & Starting Systems - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
6D	Brakes and Rotors - Centric			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			11.30.2018
6E	Brakes and Rotors - Motorcraft	A		S
	Percent Discount	36%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		<i>Motorcraft 3.1.2019</i>
6F	Brakes and Rotors - Pronto			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	55%
	Price List Type and Date			11.26.2018
6G	Brakes and Rotors - Wagner			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
7A	Charging & Starting Systems - ACDELCO			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
7B	Charging & Starting Systems - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	12.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
8A	Chassis & Steering Components - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
8B	Chassis & Steering Components - MOOG			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
8C	Chassis & Steering Components - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	38%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com	BWE-2019	
9A	Chemicals and Additives - Berryman			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
9B	Chemicals and Additives - CRC			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
8A	Chassis & Steering Components - ACDELCO		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
8B	Chassis & Steering Components - MOOG		S	P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	67%	248%
	Price List Type and Date		Moog 1.1.2019	firstcallonline.com
8C	Chassis & Steering Components - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
9A	Chemicals and Additives - Berryman		A	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	40%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Berryman Chemicals 9.1.2018	firstcallonline.com
9B	Chemicals and Additives - CRC		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	48%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		CRC 5.4.2018	firstcallonline.com

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
8A	Chassis & Steering Components - ACDELCO			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
8B	Chassis & Steering Components - MOOG			A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	55%
	Price List Type and Date			11.30.2018
8C	Chassis & Steering Components - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
9A	Chemicals and Additives - Berryman			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			08.15.2018
9B	Chemicals and Additives - CRC		S	P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	50%	55%
	Price List Type and Date		<i>TruckPro CRT Screen Print</i>	06.22.2018

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
9C	Chemicals and Additives - Lucas			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
9D	Chemicals and Additives - Permatex			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
9E	Chemicals and Additives - Sta-Bil			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
10A	Cooling System - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
10B	Cooling System - Motorcraft	S	A	
	Percent Discount	38%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>	BWE-2019	
11A	Emission Control & Sensors - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
9C	Chemicals and Additives - Lucas			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	40%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Lucas 1.1.2017R	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
9D	Chemicals and Additives - Permatex		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	45%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Permatex 9.10.2018	firstcallonline.com
9E	Chemicals and Additives - Sta-Bil		S	P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	40%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		<i>Gold Eagle 8.26.2013</i>	firstcallonline.com
10A	Cooling System - ACDELCO		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
10B	Cooling System - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
11A	Emission Control & Sensors - ACDELCO		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
9C	Chemicals and Additives - Lucas		P	A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	50%	40%*
	Price List Type and Date		TruckPro CRT Screen Print	08.31.2011
9D	Chemicals and Additives - Permatex		P	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	50%	50%*
	Price List Type and Date		TruckPro CRT Screen Print	06.21.2018
9E	Chemicals and Additives - Sta-Bil			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
10A	Cooling System - ACDELCO			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
10B	Cooling System - Motorcraft			P
	Percent Discount	16%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
11A	Emission Control & Sensors - ACDELCO			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
11B	Emission Control & Sensors - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	38%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>		
12A	Filters - ACDELCO		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
12B	Filters - Baldwin			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
12C	Filters - Donaldson			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
12D	Filters - Fram			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
12E	Filters - Motorcraft	P		
	Percent Discount	45%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com		

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
11B	Emission Control & Sensors - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
12A	Filters - ACDELCO		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
12B	Filters - Baldwin		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	78%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		WIX Master Price Sheet 10.1.2018	firstcallonline.com
12C	Filters - Donaldson		P	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	78%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		WIX Master Price Sheet 10.1.2018	firstcallonline.com
12D	Filters - Fram		P	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	71%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Fram 3.1.2019	
12E	Filters - Motorcraft			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	firstcallonline.com

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
11B	Emission Control & Sensors Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
12A	Filters - ACDELCO			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
12B	Filters - Baldwin	A		P
	Percent Discount	55%*	55%	80%
	Price List Type and Date	DonaldsonPrice List 1.1.2019	TruckPro CRT Screen Print	
12C	Filters - Donaldson	S	A	
	Percent Discount	55%	45%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>DonaldsonPrice List 1.1.2019</i>	TruckPro CRT Screen Print	
12D	Filters - Fram			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
12E	Filters - Motorcraft			A
	Percent Discount	36%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
12F	Filters - Wix			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13A	Floor Mats - Kraco			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13B	Floor Mats - Premier			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13C	Floor Mats - Weather Tech	P		
	Percent Discount	5%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	Weathertech.com		
14A	Fuel Systems - ACDelco		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
14B	Fuel Systems - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	38%	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>	BWE-2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
12F	Filters - Wix		P	A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	70%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		WIX Master Price Sheet 10.1.2018	firstcallonline.com
13A	Floor Mats - Kraco			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13B	Floor Mats - Premier			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13C	Floor Mats - Weather Tech			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
14A	Fuel Systems - ACDelco		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
14B	Fuel Systems - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
12F	Filters - Wix		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	55%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>TruckPro CRT Screen Print</i>	
13A	Floor Mats - Kraco			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13B	Floor Mats - Premier			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
13C	Floor Mats - Weather Tech			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
14A	Fuel Systems - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
14B	Fuel Systems - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
15A	Ignition - ACDelco		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		<i>BWE-2019</i>	
15B	Ignition - Motorcraft	A		
	Percent Discount	38%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com		
16A	OEM, Dodge			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
16B	OEM, Ford	A		
	Percent Discount	30%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com		
16C	OEM, General Motors			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	38%
	Price List Type and Date			<i>GM Dealer World</i>
16D	OEM, Honda			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
15A	Ignition - ACDelco		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
15B	Ignition - Motorcraft			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	firstcallonline.com
16A	OEM, Dodge	P		
	Percent Discount	40%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	dealerconnect.chrysler.com 3.12.19		
16B	OEM, Ford			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
16C	OEM, General Motors			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
16D	OEM, Honda			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
15A	Ignition - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
15B	Ignition - Motorcraft			S
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		<i>Motorcraft 3.1.2019</i>
16A	OEM, Dodge			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	25%
	Price List Type and Date			<i>Mopar</i>
16B	OEM, Ford	S		P
	Percent Discount	34%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	<i>Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019</i>		Motorcraft 3.1.2019
16C	OEM, General Motors			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
16D	OEM, Honda			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
16E	OEM, Hyundai			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
16F	OEM, Toyota			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
17A	Shocks and Struts - ACDelco		S	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
17B	Shocks and Struts - KYB		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
17C	Shocks & Struts - Monroe		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	25%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		BWE-2019	
17D	Shocks & Struts - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	38%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com		

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
16E	OEM, Hyundai			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
16F	OEM, Toyota			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
17A	Shocks and Struts - ACDelco		A	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	
17B	Shocks and Struts - KYB			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	41%
	Price List Type and Date			<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
17C	Shocks & Struts - Monroe		P	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	57%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Monroe Shocks & Struts 1.1.2019	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
17D	Shocks & Struts - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
16E	OEM, Hyundai			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
16F	OEM, Toyota			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	45%
	Price List Type and Date			?
17A	Shocks and Struts - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
17B	Shocks and Struts - KYB			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	55%
	Price List Type and Date			1.4.2019
17C	Shocks & Struts - Monroe			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
17D	Shocks & Struts - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	35.5%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
18A	Spark Plugs - ACDelco			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
18B	Spark Plugs - Champion Iridium			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
18C	Spark Plugs - Motorcraft	A		
	Percent Discount	38%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	FordParts.com		
18D	Spark Plugs - Toyota			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
19A	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Bosch			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
19B	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Motorcraft	S		
	Percent Discount	36%	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date	<i>FordParts.com</i>		

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
18A	Spark Plugs - ACDelco		A	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	0%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		ACDELCO List & Dealer 2.1.2019	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
18B	Spark Plugs - Champion Iridium		P	A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	60%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Champion Spark Plugs 1.1.2019	firstcallonline.com
18C	Spark Plugs - Motorcraft			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	firstcallonline.com
18D	Spark Plugs - Toyota			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	41%
	Price List Type and Date			firstcallonline.com
19A	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Bosch		P	S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	70%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Anco 1.1.2019	<i>firstcallonline.com</i>
19B	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Motorcraft			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	5%	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date		Motorcraft List & Dealer 2.1.2019	

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
18A	Spark Plugs - ACDelco			P
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	50%
	Price List Type and Date			19D-010 3.1.2019
18B	Spark Plugs - Champion Iridium			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	<i>50%</i>
	Price List Type and Date			<i>10.5.2017</i>
18C	Spark Plugs - Motorcraft			S
	Percent Discount	36.5%	No Bid	<i>39%</i>
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		<i>Motorcraft 3.1.2019</i>
18D	Spark Plugs - Toyota			S
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	<i>40%</i>
	Price List Type and Date			<i>?</i>
19A	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Bosch			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
19B	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Motorcraft	A		P
	Percent Discount	23%	No Bid	39%
	Price List Type and Date	Price List Ford Section 1.1.2019		Motorcraft 3.1.2019

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Auto Nation Ford South Ft. Worth	Buck's Wheel & Equip Co	Freedom Chevrolet
19C	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Trico			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price List Type and Date			
20	DISCOUNT OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Freedom Dodge	IEH Auto Parts	O'Reily Auto Parts
19C	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Trico		P	
	Percent Discount	No Bid	70%	41%
	Price List Type and Date		Anco 1.1.2019	firstcallonline.com
20	DISCOUNT OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	41%

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)

BID NO. 2019-121, Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck Parts and Supplies

Sec.	Section Title	Rush Trucks Centers of Texas, Dallas Light and Medium Duty	Truck Pro	XL Parts
19C	Windshield Wipers and Blades - Trico		S	A
	Percent Discount	No Bid	50%	50%*
	Price List Type and Date		<i>TruckPro CRT Screen Print</i>	11.06.2018%
20	DISCOUNT OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED			
	Percent Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Primary (P) Secondary (S) Alternate (A)