

2019-091 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HANDCUFFS, LEG RESTRAINTS AND RELATED RESTRAINTS

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay Varina, NC HUB: No COOP: Yes		Dana Safety Supply Saginaw, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1.	Handcuff, Standard Size,	150	\$26.98	\$4,047.00	\$21.44	\$3,216.00 -A
2.	Handcuff, Over-Size,	10	\$36.98	\$369.80	\$35.61	\$356.10 -A
3.	High Security Hand Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$142.22	\$7,111.00 -S
4.	Over-sized High Security Hand Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	\$7,500.00 -S
5.	Waist Chain with separated (side) handcuffs	50	\$56.98	\$2,849.00 -A	\$51.56	\$2,578.00 -S
6.	Waist Chain with Linked (front) handcuffs	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$51.56	\$2,578.00 -S
7.	MRI use Wrist Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$146.67	\$7,333.50 -P
8.	Disposable Restraints	50	\$104.98	\$5,249.00 -A	\$94.44	\$4,722.00 -S
9.	Disposable Double Cuff restraints	50	\$175.88	\$8,794.00	\$172.22	\$8,611.00 -A

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

Note: The bids received from BOA Handcuff Company and Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. were deemed Non-Responsive for failure to submit signed Addendum 1, as required. Proforce Marketing, Inc. was not awarded item 3 because their product did not have a high security lock mechanism to be keyed with the current high security cuffs, and therefore, did not meet specifications. There is no alternate award for items 7 & 17 because only two (2) bids were submitted.

2019-091 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HANDCUFFS, LEG RESTRAINTS AND RELATED RESTRAINTS

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Bob Barker Company, Inc. Fuquay Varina, NC HUB: No COOP: Yes		Dana Safety Supply Saginaw, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
10.	Leg Restraint, Standard Size	100	\$37.98	\$3,798.00	\$34.89	\$3,489.00 -S
11.	Leg Restraint, Over-Size	10	\$43.98	\$439.80 -P	\$85.50	\$855.00 -A
12.	High Security Leg Irons	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$136.44	\$6,822.00 -P
13.	High Security Side Cuff Waist Chains	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$161.11	\$8,055.50 -S
14.	High Security Front Cuff Waist Chains	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$161.11	\$8,055.50 -S
15.	Standard Belly Chains	50	\$7.68	\$384.00 -P	\$16.17	\$808.50 -A
16.	Oversized Belly Chains	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.28	\$864.00 -S
17.	Padlock for use with belly chains	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.11	\$305.50 -P

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

Note: The bids received from BOA Handcuff Company and Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. were deemed Non-Responsive for failure to submit signed Addendum 1, as required. Proforce Marketing, Inc. was not awarded item 3 because their product did not have a high security lock mechanism to be keyed with the current high security cuffs, and therefore, did not meet specifications. There is no alternate award for items 7 & 17 because only two (2) bids were submitted.

2019-091 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HANDCUFFS, LEG RESTRAINTS AND RELATED RESTRAINTS

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	GT Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Waco, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1.	Handcuff, Standard Size,	150	\$19.33	\$2,899.50 -P	\$23.43	\$3,514.50
2.	Handcuff, Over-Size,	10	\$33.50	\$335.00 -P	\$39.06	\$390.60
3.	High Security Hand Restraints	50	\$141.11	\$7,055.50 -P	\$150.66	\$7,533.00 -A
4.	Over-sized High Security Hand Restraints	50	\$148.89	\$7,444.50 -P	\$159.15	\$7,957.50 -A
5.	Waist Chain with separated (side) handcuffs	50	\$50.44	\$2,522.00 -P	\$57.00	\$2,850.00
6.	Waist Chain with Linked (front) handcuffs	50	\$50.44	\$2,522.00 -P	\$57.00	\$2,850.00 -A
7.	MRI use Wrist Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$218.19	\$10,909.50 -S
8.	Disposable Restraints	50	\$85.06	\$4,253.00 -P	\$122.50	\$6,125.00
9.	Disposable Double Cuff restraints	50	\$145.41	\$7,270.50 -P	\$165.00	\$8,250.00 -S

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

Note: The bids received from BOA Handcuff Company and Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. were deemed Non-Responsive for failure to submit signed Addendum 1, as required. Proforce Marketing, Inc. was not awarded item 3 because their product did not have a high security lock mechanism to be keyed with the current high security cuffs, and therefore, did not meet specifications. There is no alternate award for items 7 & 17 because only two (2) bids were submitted.

2019-091 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HANDCUFFS, LEG RESTRAINTS AND RELATED RESTRAINTS

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	GT Distributors, Inc. Austin, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. Waco, TX HUB: No COOP: Yes	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
10.	Leg Restraint, Standard Size	100	\$33.61	\$3,361.00 -P	\$39.07	\$3,907.00
11.	Leg Restraint, Over-Size	10	\$83.44	\$834.40 -S	\$94.50	\$945.00
12.	High Security Leg Irons	50	\$148.89	\$7,444.50 -S	\$159.90	\$7,995.00 -A
13.	High Security Side Cuff Waist Chains	50	\$160.00	\$8,000.00 -P	\$171.41	\$8,570.50 -A
14.	High Security Front Cuff Waist Chains	50	\$160.00	\$8,000.00 -P	\$171.41	\$8,570.50 -A
15.	Standard Belly Chains	50	\$14.72	\$736.00 -S	\$18.29	\$914.50
16.	Oversized Belly Chains	50	\$15.83	\$791.50 -P	\$19.47	\$973.50 -A
17.	Padlock for use with belly chains	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.24	\$562.00 -S

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

Note: The bids received from BOA Handcuff Company and Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. were deemed Non-Responsive for failure to submit signed Addendum 1, as required. Proforce Marketing, Inc. was not awarded item 3 because their product did not have a high security lock mechanism to be keyed with the current high security cuffs, and therefore, did not meet specifications. There is no alternate award for items 7 & 17 because only two (2) bids were submitted.

2019-091 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HANDCUFFS, LEG RESTRAINTS AND RELATED RESTRAINTS

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Proforce Marketing, Inc. Prescott, AZ HUB: No COOP: Yes	
			Unit Price	Extended Price
1.	Handcuff, Standard Size,	150	\$20.09	\$3,013.50 -S
2.	Handcuff, Over-Size,	10	\$35.12	\$351.20 -S
3.	High Security Hand Restraints	50	\$38.46	\$1,923.00
4.	Over-sized High Security Hand Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid
5.	Waist Chain with separated (side) handcuffs	50	\$60.04	\$3,002.00
6.	Waist Chain with Linked (front) handcuffs	50	\$60.04	\$3,002.00
7.	MRI use Wrist Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid
8.	Disposable Restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid
9.	Disposable Double Cuff restraints	50	No Bid	No Bid

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

Note: The bids received from BOA Handcuff Company and Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. were deemed Non-Responsive for failure to submit signed Addendum 1, as required. Proforce Marketing, Inc. was not awarded item 3 because their product did not have a high security lock mechanism to be keyed with the current high security cuffs, and therefore, did not meet specifications. There is no alternate award for items 7 & 17 because only two (2) bids were submitted.

2019-091 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR HANDCUFFS, LEG RESTRAINTS AND RELATED RESTRAINTS

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty.	Proforce Marketing, Inc. Prescott, AZ HUB: No COOP: Yes	
			Unit Price	Extended Price
10.	Leg Restraint, Standard Size	100	\$36.25	\$3,625.00 -A
11.	Leg Restraint, Over-Size	10	No Bid	No Bid
12.	High Security Leg Irons	50	No Bid	No Bid
13.	High Security Side Cuff Waist Chains	50	No Bid	No Bid
14.	High Security Front Cuff Waist Chains	50	No Bid	No Bid
15.	Standard Belly Chains	50	\$21.53	\$1,076.50
16.	Oversized Belly Chains	50	No Bid	No Bid
17.	Padlock for use with belly chains	50	No Bid	No Bid

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

Note: The bids received from BOA Handcuff Company and Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. were deemed Non-Responsive for failure to submit signed Addendum 1, as required. Proforce Marketing, Inc. was not awarded item 3 because their product did not have a high security lock mechanism to be keyed with the current high security cuffs, and therefore, did not meet specifications. There is no alternate award for items 7 & 17 because only two (2) bids were submitted.