

BID NO. 2019-071 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LABORATORY TEST KITS, MEDIA AND REAGENTS FOR DAIRY TESTING

SECTION I		Est. Qty.	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Taylor Distribution Group, LLC Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Thomas Scientific LLC Swedesboro, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	VWR International, LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - No
1	Calibration Standard, 422 mH Cryoscope, 10 x 10mL ampules, Advanced Instruments #3LA023	12 packs	\$62.35	\$50.38 - P	NO BID	\$52.59 - S
2	Calibration Standard, 621 mH Cryoscope, 10 x 10mL ampules, Advanced Instruments #3LA033	12 packs	\$62.35	\$53.16 - S	NO BID	\$49.61 - P
3	Reference Solution, Lactrol 530, 10 x 10 mL ampules, Advanced Instruments #3LA030	18 packs	\$80.88	\$66.69 - S	NO BID	\$64.25 - P
4	Heat Transfer Fluid, 150 mL, Advanced Instruments #3DA811	8 each	\$41.65	\$32.01 - S	NO BID	\$29.90 - P
5	Replacement Kit, Probe Wiper, Sponge, Advanced Instruments #4C3840	3 kits	\$91.88 - P	\$99.81 - S	NO BID	\$103.40
6	Filters, Air, Disposable, 6 per box, Advanced Instruments #3D2340	12 boxes	\$95.19	\$85.36 - P	NO BID	\$94.65 - S
7	Paper, Printer, Thermal, 5 rolls per package, Advanced Instruments #FLA835	1 pack	\$69.37	\$62.81 - S	NO BID	\$58.68 - P
8	Test Kit, ALP 225, with NO cuvettes, Advanced Instruments #FLA224	3 kits	\$638.75	\$504.27 - S	NO BID	\$439.70 - P
9	Test Kit, ALP 225, with cuvettes, Advanced Instruments #FLA225	4 kits	\$523.60 - P	\$565.16 - S	NO BID	\$669.57
10	Calibrator Set, ALP Three, 1x3x30 mL, Advanced Instruments #FLA250	10 sets	\$150.24 - P	\$155.44 - S	NO BID	\$168.30
11	Controls, Phosphacheck Milk ALP, 1x9x3 mL, Advanced Instruments #FLA260	7 each	\$150.24 - P	\$155.44 - S	NO BID	\$172.93
12	Control, ALP Daily Instrument, 1x3x30 mL, Advanced Instruments #FLA280	3 each	\$150.24 - S	\$155.44	NO BID	\$138.25 - P
13	DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR ADVANCED INSTRUMENTS CATALOG		0%	3%		15%

BID NO. 2019-071 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LABORATORY TEST KITS, MEDIA AND REAGENTS FOR DAIRY TESTING

SECTION II		Est. Qty.	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Taylor Distribution Group, LLC Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Thomas Scientific LLC Swedesboro, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	VWR International, LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - No
1	Petrifilm Plates, Aerobic Count, for use with 3M Petrifilm Plate Reader, 100 plates/box; 1000 plates/case, 3M #6406	10 cases	\$1,273.33	\$1,271.93	\$714.14	NO BID
2	Coliform Count Plates, High-Sensitivity, for use with 3M Petrifilm Plate Reader, 50 plates/box; 500 plates/case, 3M #6415	10 cases	\$738.20	\$790.72	\$663.97	NO BID
3	Coliform Count Plates, for use with 3M Petrifilm Plate Reader, 50 plates/box; 1000 plates/case, 3M #6416	4 cases	\$890.25	\$980.26	\$785.10	NO BID
4	Antibiotic Residue Test Kit, DSM Delvotest P # 2127	8 kits	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5	Laurel Tryptose Broth, Double-Strength, with 10x75mm Durham Tubes, 100 mL, Polycarbonate Bottle, 10/case, General Laboratory Products 250SQ-1210-1002X	15 cases	\$135.04 - S	\$138.92	\$143.97	\$125.43 - P
6	Nutrient Broth, 500 mL, General Laboratory Products 500EZ-2300-500	8 each	\$140.09 - P	\$16.67 \$200.04/cs of 12	\$14.71 \$176.52/cs of 12	\$147.47 - S
7	Nutrient Broth, Double-Strength, 50 mL, General Laboratory Products 4WM-2300-502X-EA	15 each	\$4.22 - P	\$6.03	\$4.94	\$4.66 - S
8	Bile Broth, Brilliant Green, with Durham Tubes, 10 mL, General Laboratory Products 16GL-1100-10-20PK	3 packs	\$24.66 - P	\$26.05 \$130.25/case	\$29.95	\$25.95 - S
9	Dilution Bottles, Flip-Top, with Phosphate Buffer, 99 mL, Leak-resistant, 2-Year Shelf Life, 3M #FTPHB9966 or approved equal	4,500 bottles	\$44.57^	\$52.49	\$44.13 - P	NO BID
10	DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR ITEMS NOT SPECIFIED		0%	10%	5-47%	15%

P = Primary S = Secondary

Two (2) No-Bids were received from Aldinger Company and AliMed

^Alternate not accepted because of past poor performance of product.

No awards made for Section II, items 1-3 due to high pricing.

No bids received for item 4