

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
CATEGORY A - SYSTEM I HAWORTH				
SYSTEM I - HAWORTH SECTION A				
HAWORTH PREMISE	1 - 3 Projects	\$3,000 to \$6,000	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount from Published List Price		Varies - Due to components	
	Warranty:		Lifetime	
	Product Line Bidding:		Premise	
SYSTEM I - HAWORTH SECTION B				
HAWORTH PREMISE	1 - 3 Projects	\$6,001 to \$10,000	No Bid	No Bid
	For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems.		Varies - Due to components	
	Discount from Published List Price		Lifetime	
	Warranty:		Premise	
	Product Line Bidding:			
SYSTEM I - HAWORTH SECTION C				
HAWORTH PREMISE	1 - 3 Projects	\$10,000 and up	No Bid	No Bid
	For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems.		Varies -Due to components	
	Discount from Published List Price		Lifetime	
	Warranty:		Premise	
	Product Line Bidding:			
	Is the product bid Greenguard Certified?	Yes / No	No	
	Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer specified? Yes /No		Yes	
	If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.			
			N/A	
	Product Line:			
	Discount from Published List Price			

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
SYSTEM I HAWORTH- SECTION D				
1. Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 64" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric HAWORTH PREMISE #NMFF-6442-5P Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE NMFF-6442-SP	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	63%		
	List less discount	\$480.53		
2. Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 64" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric HAWORTH PREMISE #NMFF-6424-5P Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE NMFF-6424-5P	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	63%		
	List less discount	\$380.52		
3. Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric, HAWORTH PREMISE #NMFF-8030-5P Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE NMFF-8030-5P	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	63%		
	List less discount	\$515.76		
4. Glazed Panel, "P", 64" high x 24" wide HAWORTH PREMISE #NMG-644-2480 Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE NMG-624-SN	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	63%		
	List less discount	\$427.28		
5. Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide HAWORTH PREMISE #WURA-2436-LJSA Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE WURA-2436-LJSA	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$106.85		
6. Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide HAWORTH PREMISE #WURA-3072-LJSA Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE WURA-3072-LJSA	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$227.34		

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
7. Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep HAWORTH PREMISE #NVCR-4242-SLJA Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE WUCA-4242-LJSAN	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$237.31		
8. Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long HAWORTH PREMISE #WURD-3060-SLJA Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE WURD-3060-LJSA	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$218.30		
9. Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep HAWORTH PREMISE #UNFS-1642-PMN Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE UNFS-1642-PMN	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$267.40		
10. Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4" deep HAWORTH PREMISE #UNSN-1030-PM Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE UNSN-1030-PM	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$82.61		
11. Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage HAWORTH PREMISE #LUTS-0024-16UEP Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE LUTS-0024-16UEP	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	65%		
	List less discount	\$77.65		
12. Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide HAWORTH PREMISE #VPHA-Z4 Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model	PREMISE VPHA-24-5	No Bid	No Bid
	Discount	58%		
	List less discount	\$172.12		

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS				Vendors		
				Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION					
13. Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep HAWORTH PREMISE #AKPM-16-SLM Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model		PREMISE KU1A-0017-2N	No Bid	No Bid	
	Discount		38%			
	List less discount		\$213.17			
14 HAWORTH PREMISE #AKPM-17-SLM up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep HAWORTH PREMISE #AKPM-21-SLM Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model		PREMISE KU1A-0017-1N	No Bid	No Bid	
	Discount		38%			
	List less discount		\$235.89			
15. Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric HAWORTH PREMISE #NAB-1636 Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model		PREMISE NAB-1636	No Bid	No Bid	
	Discount		63%			
	List less discount		\$121.26			
CATEGORY A - SYSTEM II HON						
SYSTEM II HON SECTION A						
HON ACCELERATE 3-7 Projects \$3,000 - \$6,000 Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems.			No Bid		No Bid	
				63%		
	Warranty: Product Line Bidding			Written Lifetime Accelerate		
SYSTEM II HON SECTION B						
HON ACCELERATE 1-3 Projects \$6,001 to \$10,000 Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems.			No Bid		No Bid	
				63%		
	Warranty: Product Line Bidding			Written Lifetime Accelerate		

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
SYSTEM II HON SECTION C				
	HON ACCELERATE 0-2 Projects \$10,000-up Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems. Warranty: Product Line Bidding	No Bid	63%	No Bid
			Written Lifetime Accelerate	
	Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer specified? Yes /No		Yes	
	If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.			
	Product Line: Discount from Published List Price		N/A	
SYSTEM II HON SECTION D				
			ACCELERATE	
1.	Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	No Bid	HETP6542FP 69" H 65" - H 63% \$165.76	No Bid
2.	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HETP6524FP Grade A Fabric -Core Paint 63% \$134.68	No Bid
3.	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 82" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric, Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	No Bid	Not Available	No Bid
4.	Glazed Panel, "P", 69" high x 30" wide Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	No Bid	Not Available	No Bid

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
5.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HWR2436PN (T-Mold Edge Band)	No Bid
				63%	
				\$127.28	
6.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HWR3072PN (T-Mold Edge Band)	No Bid
				63%	
				\$218.30	
7.	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HWCS4230PN	No Bid
				63%	
				\$241.61	
8.	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HWP3060PN	No Bid
				63%	
				\$231.25	
9.	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HEO RTA1542FD	No Bid
				63%	
				\$175.01	
10.	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HESRTA30	No Bid
				63%	
				\$78.81	
11.	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	HH870930	No Bid
				63%	
				\$83.62	

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
12.	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	BRIGADE H3672012 Box, Box, File, Pedestal 63% \$213.49	No Bid
13.	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE H1706 63% \$178.34	No Bid
14.	Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE H2107 63% \$191.29	No Bid
15.	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	No Bid	ACCELERATE HETB3618 63% \$62.16	No Bid
CATEGORY A - SYSTEM III KIMBALL					
SYSTEM III KIMBALL SECTION A					
KIMBALL - XSITE 1-3 Projects \$3,000 - \$6,000 Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems.			NO BID	NO BID	
Warranty: Product Line Bidding: Discount from Published List Price					Lifetime Kimball Xsite 74%
SYSTEM III KIMBALL SECTION B					
KIMBALL - XSITE 1-3 Projects \$6,001 to \$10,000 Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems.			NO BID	NO BID	
Warranty: Product Line Bidding: Discount from Published List Price					Lifetime Kimball Xsite 74%

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
SYSTEM III KIMBALL SECTION C				
	KIMBALL - XSITE 1-3 Projects \$10,000-up Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems. Warranty: Product Line Bidding: Discount from Published List Price	NO BID	NO BID	
				Lifetime
				Kimball Xsite
				74%
	Is the product bid Greenguard Certified? Yes / No			Yes
	Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer specified? Yes /No			Yes
	If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.			No
	Product Line: Discount from Published List Price			Kimball Perks
				56%
SYSTEM III KIMBALL SECTION D				
1.	Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	XSITE 36P425FNITASC
				74%
				\$311.74
2.	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	XSITE 36P245FNITASC
				74%
				\$209.30
3.	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 82" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric, Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	XSITE 36P305ITASC
				74%
				\$344.78
4.	Glazed Panel, "P", 69" high x 30" wide Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	XSITE 36P245FNITASC
				74%
				\$385.06
5.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide Make /Model Discount Discount from Published List Price List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	FOOTPRINT SS2436WSSL3
				74%
				\$76.96
6.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	FOOTPRINT SS3072WSSL3

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
	30" deep x 72" wide			
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		147.94
7.	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$166.40
8.	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$248.82
9.	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$174.46
10.	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$115.18
11.	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$68.90
12.	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$130.26

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
13.	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	PERKS 99K1706KK1
		Discount			64%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount			\$285.56
14.	Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	PERKS 99K1424KT
		Discount			64%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount			\$60.72
15.	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	PERKS 99K3620TBW
		Discount			64%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount			101.64
CATEGORY A - SYSTEM IV ALLSTEEL					
SYSTEM IV ALLSTEEL SECTION A					
ALLSTEEL - CONCENSYS 1-3 Projects		\$3,000 - \$6,000	NO BID		NO BID
		Discount from Published List Price			69.50%
		Warranty:			Written Lifetime
		Product Line:			CONCENSYS
SYSTEM IV ALLSTEEL SECTION B					
ALLSTEEL - CONCENSYS 1-3 Projects		\$6,001 to \$10,000	NO BID		NO BID
		Discount from Published List Price			69.50%
		Warranty:			Written Lifetime
		Product Line:			CONCENSYS
SYSTEM IV ALLSTEEL SECTION C					
ALLSTEEL - CONCENSYS 0-2 Projects		\$10,000-up	NO BID		NO BID
		Discount from Published List Price			69.50%
		Warranty:			Written Lifetime
		Product Line:			CONCENSYS
Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer specified? Yes /No				Yes	
If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.				Yes	
				N/A	

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
	Product Line: Discount from Published List Price				
SYSTEM IV ALLSTEEL SECTION D					
1.	Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 896942P	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$219.91	
2.	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 896924P	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$156.77	
3.	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric,	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 898230P	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$270.84	
4.	Glazed Panel, "P", 69" high x 24" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 946924HP (Half Glazed)	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$261.69	
5.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 832436MN	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$96.69	
6.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 833072MN	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$183.92	
7.	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 833042MN	NO BID
		Discount		69.50%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount		\$119.87	

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
8.	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	NO BID	833160MN	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$215.64	
9.	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	OH1542FD	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$212.28	
10.	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS CSF30	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$77.17	
11.	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS A870830	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$79.61	
12.	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	ESSENTIAL PH149-232B	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$187.58	
13.	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS AKMI	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$104.92	
14.	Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS AKMX	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$143.66	
15.	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	CONCENSYS 861836	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List less discount		69.50% \$53.99	

Vendors

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABLE/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

Royer and Schutts
Fort Worth, TX
Coop - No

HUB - Yes

Plano Office Supply Co.
Plano, TX
Coop - Yes

HUB - No

TX Interiors Resources,
LLC, DBA
Interior Resources
Coop - Yes
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
---------	-------------	--	--	--

CATEGORY A - SYSTEM V HERMAN MILLER

SYSTEM V HERMAN MILLER SECTION A

HERMAN MILLER 1-3 Projects \$3,000 - \$6,000 Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems. Warranty: Product Line Bidding:	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

SYSTEM V HERMAN MILLER SECTION B

HERMAN MILLER 1-3 Projects \$6,001 to \$10,000 Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems. Warranty: Product Line Bidding:	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

SYSTEM V HERMAN MILLER SECTION C

HERMAN MILLER 0-2 Proje \$10,000-up Discount from Published List Price For use with existing Modular Furniture Systems. Warranty: Product Line Bidding:	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer specified? Yes /No			
If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.			
Product Line: Discount from Published List Price			

SYSTEM V HERMAN MILLER SECTION D

	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1. Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line			
2. Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABLE/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
3.	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric,	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.	Glazed Panel, "P", 69" high x 24" wide	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
9.	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
10.	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4" deep	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
11.	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
12.	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
13.	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14.	Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15.	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model Herman Miller Item # Product Line	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CATEGORY B					
CATEGORY B					
B-1	Modular Furniture System with Accessories, 3" Panel, Minimum 2-5 Projects Discount from Published List Price	Discount Warranty: Product Line Bidding:	NO BID	63% Written lifetime HON Abound (2 5/8" Thick)	74% Lifetime Kimball Narrate
B-2	Modular Furniture with Moveable/Demountable Walls and Accessorie 2-5 Projects Discount from Published List Price	\$250,000 Discount Warranty: Product Line Bidding:	NO BID	63% Written lifetime HON Abound (2 5/8" Thick)	45.50% 5 year Muraflex Mimo
Is the product bid Greenguard Certified? Yes / No			Yes	Yes	Yes

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors		
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION		Yes	No
	Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer bid for Item B-1? Yes / No		Yes	No
	If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.			
	Product Line: Discount from Published List Price			Kimball Perks 56%
Standard items shown for evaluation Purposes for Category B.				
All items included in Manufacturer's Price List shall be part of this contract.				
1.	Standard Acoustical Panel, 66" high x 42" wide Grade III Fabric Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	HON ABOUND HRV6542P, HRVTC42,HRVT6042T
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List Less Discount	63% \$299.00	74% \$278.98
2.	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 66" high x 12" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List Less Discount		74% \$184.86
3.	Standard Acoustical Panel, 78" high x 12" wi Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List Less Discount		74% \$239.98
4.	Glazed Panel, 66" high x 30"	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List Less Discount		74% \$311.48
5.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
	Discount from Published List Price	Discount List Less Discount		74% \$76.96

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS				Vendors		
				Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION					
6.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	SS3072WSSL3	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$147.94	
7.	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	SS30424230WSCCL3	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$166.40	
8.	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	SS3660WSUCL3	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$248.82	
9.	Overhead Storage Cabinet w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	IS144216RP	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$174.46	
10.	Open Bookshelf, Full Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	IS143016OS	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$115.18	
11.	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	KSU25TL	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$68.90	
12.	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	12S2416PUBFM	
		Discount			74%	
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$130.26	

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
13.	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees Accommodates Keyboards up to 20" wide x 8" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	99K1706KK1
	Discount				56%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$285.56
14.	Slide Away Keyboard Platform. 21-1/2" wide x 10" deep	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	99K1424KT
	Discount				56%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			60.72
15	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 16" high Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	99K142KT
	Discount				56%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$101.64
16.	Moveable Walls, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	Mimo
	Discount				45.50%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$1,882.43
17.	Demountable Walls, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	Mimo
	Discount				45.50%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$1,882.43
18.	Glass Panels, Full Height, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide	Make/Model	NO BID	NO BID	Mimo
	Discount				45.50%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$1,372.86
19.	Door Units, 9 ft. high x 3 ft. wide	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	Mimo
	Discount				45.50%
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			\$2,017.05
20.	Hinges	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	Mimo
	Discount				Included on Door unit.
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount			

Vendors

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

Royer and Schutts
Fort Worth, TX
Coop - No

HUB - Yes

Plano Office Supply Co.
Plano, TX
Coop - Yes

HUB - No

TX Interiors Resources,
LLC, DBA
Interior Resources
Coop - Yes
Dallas, TX
HUB - No

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
21.	Lock Sets	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID
		Discount		Mimo
	Discount from Published List Price	List Less Discount		45.50%
				\$806.06

CATEGORY C

C-1 Modular Furniture Systems, with Accessories, 3" Panel Minimum
3-7 Projects \$80,000

Discount from Published List Price	NO BID	63%	74%
Warranty:		Written Lifetime	Lifetime
Product Line Bidding:		HON Abound (2 5/8" thick)	Kimball Narrate
Is the product bid Greenguard Certified? Yes/No			Yes
Does this discount apply to other lines of systems furniture by the manufacturer bid for Item C-1? Yes/No			No
If no, please list the manufacturer's other lines of systems furniture and provide percentage discount off list price.			
Product Line:			Kimball Perks
Discount from Published List Price			56%

Standard items shall be used fore evaluation purpose for Category C. All items included in Manufacturer's Price List shall be part of this contract.

1.	Standard Acoustical Panel, 62" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	33P425FNITTTBP
		Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount			\$278.98
2.	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 62" high x 12" wide Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	33P245FNITTTBP
		Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount			\$184.86
3.	Standard Acoustical Panel, 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	NO BID	NO BID	33P305FNFSITTTBP
		Discount			74%
	Discount from Published List Price	List less discount			\$278.98

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
4.	Glazed Panel, 62" high x 30" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	33P305FNITTTGAP 74% \$311.48
5.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	SS2436WSSL3 74% \$76.96
6.	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	SS3072WSSL3 74% 147.94
7.	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	SS30424230WSCCL3 74% \$166.40
8.	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	SS3660WSUCL3 74% \$248.82
9.	Overhead Storage Cabinet w/Door & Lock 42" wide X 14-1/4" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	IS144216RP 74% \$174.46
10.	Open Bookshelf, Full Height, 30" wide x 13-3/4 deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	IS143016OS 74% 115.18
11.	Task Lighting For use under 30" wide overhead storage Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	KSU25TL 74% \$68.90

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
12.	Honing Pedestal, Bloc/File Drawers 19" high X 22-7/8" deep X 15" wide Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	12S2415PUBFM 74% \$130.26
13.	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360 degrees Accommodated Keyboards up to 20"wide X 16" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	99K1706KK1 56% \$285.56
14.	Slide Away Keyboard Platform 21-1/2" wide X 16" deep Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	99K1424KT 56% \$60.72
15.	Fabric Tackboard 36" wide x 16" high, Grade III Fabric Discount from Published List Price	Make /Model Discount List less discount	NO BID	NO BID	99K3620TBW 56% 101.64
CATEGORY D					
Modular Furniture Executive Workstation - Desk (stand-alone)					
Multiple Manufacturers for each:					
1.	Desk Shell - 72" W x 96" D -Conference Overhang, Knee Space Height 27.0", Drawer Configuration: Box/Box/File & File/File, Modesty Panel Standard Option	Manufacturers	Make/Model -Discount	Make/Model -Discount	Make/Model -Discount
		Haworth	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		HON	NO BID	ABODE --63%	NO BID
		Kimball	NO BID	NO BID	Priority-56%
		Allsteel	NO BID	Cadence 69.5%	NO BID
		Herman Miller	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

BID 2019-065 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS		Vendors			
		Royer and Schutts Fort Worth, TX Coop - No HUB - Yes	Plano Office Supply Co. Plano, TX Coop - Yes HUB - No	TX Interiors Resources, LLC, DBA Interior Resources Coop - Yes Dallas, TX HUB - No	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
2.	Credenza Shell - 72" W x 24" D x 29 H, Pedestal Drawer Configuration, Drawer Configuration: Box/Box/File; File/File, Pedestal Types-Full	Manufacturers Haworth HON Kimball Allsteel Herman Miller	Make/Model -Discount NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID	Make/Model -Discount NO BID ABODE --63% NO BID Cadence 69.5% NO BID	Make/Model -Discount NO BID NO BID Priority -56% NO BID NO BID
3.	Hutch with Doors; 72" W x 14 5/8" D X 7 1/4" H Drawer Configuration: Box/Box/File; File/File Pedestal Types-Full	Manufacturers Haworth HON Kimball Allsteel Herman Miller	Make/Model -Discount NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID	Make/Model -Discount NO BID ABODE --63% NO BID Cadence 69.5% NO BID	Make/Model -Discount NO BID NO BID Priority -56% NO BID NO BID

Royer and Schutts Awarded as Primary in Category A System I Sections A, B, C, and D

Plano Office Supply Awarded as Primary in Category A System II and IV Sections A, B, C, and D.
Category B - B1 and B2 Category C C-1, and Category D 1, 2, and 3

TX Interior Resources dba Interior Resources Awarded as Primary Category A, System III, Sections A, B, C, and D
Category B - B1 and B2 Category C C-1 and Category D 1, 2, and 3.

No awards were made for Category A- System V because no bids were received for these items.

No Bids were received from: Quill, LLC, Ergogenesis Workplace Solutions, llc, and Pollock Investments Inc., dba Pollock