

**BID NO. 2019-053 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LABORATORY TEST KITS AND REAGENTS FOR CLINICAL TESTING**

ITEM #	ITEM	Diagnostics Direct LLC Stone Harbor, NJ HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Lab Supply Specialists, Inc. Haltom City, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
1	Tubes, UTM, 3 mL with FS Applicator, 50/box QUIDEL 402C	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	Tubes, UTM, 3 mL with Flexible Mini-tip, FS, 50/box QUIDEL 403C	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3	Molecular HSV 1+2 Control Set, 1 mL QUIDEL M109	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4	HSV 1+2 Assay Test Kit QUIDEL M210	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5	Test Kit, Rapid Membrane Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of Syphilis SHC VSC-11-01	<b>\$180.00 - P</b>	NO BID	NO BID
6	Control Set, Rapid Membrane Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of Syphilis SHC VSC-11-02	\$37.00 - S	NO BID	NO BID
7	Test Kit, HIV - 1/2 Rapid Immunoassay UNIGOLD RECOMBIGEN #1206506	NO BID	\$277.00	\$295.00
8	Control Set, HIV for use with HIV - 1/2 Rapid Immunoassay Test Kit UNIGOLD RECOMBIGEN #1206530	NO BID	\$33.00	\$75.00
9	Reagent Discs, Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 10/box ABAXIS PICCOLO 07P0208	NO BID	<b>\$89.13 - P</b>	\$115.75
10	Chemistry and Lipid Controls, for Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 6/box ABAXIS PICCOLO 07P0401	NO BID	<b>\$155.68 - P</b>	\$179.89 - S

**P = Primary**

*S = Secondary*

No secondary awards for items 1 and 2.

Two (2) no-bids were received from Lighthouse for the Blind of Fort Worth and VWR International, LLC

**BID NO. 2019-053 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR LABORATORY TEST KITS AND REAGENTS FOR CLINICAL TESTING**

ITEM #	ITEM	Quidel Corporation San Diego, CA HUB - No COOP - No	Taylor Distribution Group, LLC Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	BioPool US Inc. dba Trinity Biotech Distribution Jamestown, NY HUB - No COOP - Yes
1	Tubes, UTM, 3 mL with FS Applicator, 50/box QUIDEL 402C	<b>\$112.45 - P</b>	NO BID	NO BID
2	Tubes, UTM, 3 mL with Flexible Mini-tip, FS, 50/box QUIDEL 403C	<b>\$112.45 - P</b>	NO BID	NO BID
3	Molecular HSV 1+2 Control Set, 1 mL QUIDEL M109	<b>\$250.00 - P</b>	\$321.50 - S	NO BID
4	HSV 1+2 Assay Test Kit QUIDEL M210	<b>\$456.00 - P</b>	\$582.99 - S	NO BID
5	Test Kit, Rapid Membrane Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of Syphilis SHC VSC-11-01	NO BID	NO BID	\$198.00 - S
6	Control Set, Rapid Membrane Immunochromatographic Assay for Detection of Syphilis SHC VSC-11-02	NO BID	NO BID	<b>\$29.00 - P</b>
7	Test Kit, HIV - 1/2 Rapid Immunoassay UNIGOLD RECOMBIGEN #1206506	NO BID	\$186.56 - S	<b>\$165.00 - P</b>
8	Control Set, HIV for use with HIV - 1/2 Rapid Immunoassay Test Kit UNIGOLD RECOMBIGEN #1206530	NO BID	<b>\$20.87 - P</b>	\$23.00 - S
9	Reagent Discs, Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 10/box ABAXIS PICCOLO 07P0208	NO BID	\$104.84 - S	NO BID
10	Chemistry and Lipid Controls, for Comprehensive Metabolic Panel, for use with Piccolo Analyzer, 6/box ABAXIS PICCOLO 07P0401	NO BID	\$183.12	NO BID

**P = Primary**

*S = Secondary*

No secondary awards for items 1 and 2.

Two (2) no-bids were received from Lighthouse for the Blind of Fort Worth and VWR International, LLC