

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

			The Tree House, Inc. Norwood, MA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dream Ranch, LLC Krum, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Limitless Office Products Richardson, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
	Part A: Copier Supplies				
		Est. Qty	Cost or Discount % Off	Cost or Discount % Off	Cost or Discount % Off
1	Fujitsu Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies		No Bid	44% (P)	10-35%
2	Konica Minolta Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies		No Bid	44% (P)	10-35%
3	Kyocera Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies		No Bid	43% (P)	10-35%
4	MICR, All Models Toner Supplies		No Bid	43% (P)	10-35%
5	Okidata Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies		No Bid	44% (P)	10-35%
6	Ricoh Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies		No Bid	43% (P)	10-35%
7	Sharp Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies		No Bid	43% (P)	10-35%

P = Primary

S = Secondary

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Quill, LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	W.M. Corp. dba Beyond Technology Centennial, CO HUB - No COOP - Yes	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Marietta, GA HUB - NO COOP - Yes
	Part A: Copier Supplies			
		Cost or Discount % Off	Cost or Discount % Off	Cost or Discount % Off
1	Fujitsu Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	No Bid	15% (S)	0-30%
2	Konica Minolta Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	No Bid	15% (S)	0-30%
3	Kyocera Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	No Bid	20% (S)	0-30%
4	MICR, All Models Toner Supplies	No Bid	10% (S)	0-30%
5	Okidata Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	No Bid	15% (S)	0-30%
6	Ricoh Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	No Bid	15% (S)	0-30%
7	Sharp Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	No Bid	25% (S)	0-30%

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Supplies Outlet Reno, NV HUB - No COOP - Yes
	Part A: Copier Supplies	
		Cost or Discount % Off
1	Fujitsu Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	12% (A)
2	Konica Minolta Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	12% (A)
3	Kyocera Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	12% (A)
4	MICR, All Models Toner Supplies	12% (A)
5	Okidata Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	12% (A)
6	Ricoh Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	12% (A)
7	Sharp Copiers, All Models Drum, Toner and Maintenance Supplies	12% (A)

P = Primary
 S = Secondday
 A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

			The Tree House, Inc. Norwood, MA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dream Ranch, LLC Krum, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Limitless Office Products Richardson, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
	Part B: Brother Toners and Drums				
1	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN250	0-1	\$33.80 (S)	\$34.30 (A)	\$37.11
2	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR200, DR250	0-1	\$190.50 (A)	\$196.00	\$120.94 (P)
3	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN350	0-5	\$57.95 (S)	\$58.00 (A)	\$63.62
4	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR350	0-5	\$105.60 (S)	\$106.00 (A)	\$115.98
5	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN420	0-25	\$30.15 (A)	\$27.00 (P)	\$33.11
6	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN450	0-10	\$46.05 (A)	\$44.00 (P)	\$49.21
7	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR400	0-10	\$142.25 (S)	\$144.45	\$152.04
8	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR420	0-5	\$70.90 (A)	\$70.00 (S)	\$77.85
9	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN460	0-5	\$74.20 (A)	\$70.00 (P)	\$81.46
10	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN580	0-1	\$94.95 (A)	\$90.00 (S)	\$104.06
11	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR520	0-1	\$181.10	\$175.00 (S)	\$198.96
12	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN620	0-1	\$58.30 (A)	\$53.00 (P)	\$63.03
13	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN650	0-4	\$93.25 (A)	\$93.00 (S)	\$100.86
14	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR620	0-2	\$116.60 (A)	\$115.00 (S)	\$128.07
15	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR630	0-2	\$70.90 (A)	\$65.00 (P)	\$77.85
16	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN750	0-1	\$84.60 (A)	\$80.00 (S)	\$92.94
17	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR720	0-1	\$108.30 (A)	\$105.00 (S)	\$118.97
18	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN850	0-5	\$88.00 (A)	\$87.00 (S)	\$99.15
19	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR820	0-2	\$108.30 (A)	\$107.00 (S)	\$122.06

P = Primary

S = Seconday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Quill, LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	W.M. Corp. dba Beyond Technology Centennial, CO HUB - No COOP - Yes	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Marietta, GA HUB - NO COOP - Yes
	Part B: Brother Toners and Drums			
1	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN250	\$32.99 (P)	\$35.03	\$35.64
2	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR200, DR250	\$174.66 (S)	\$197.56	No BID
3	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN350	\$55.95 (P)	\$60.04	\$59.60
4	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR350	\$99.84 (P)	\$109.46	\$107.10
5	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN420	\$29.61 (S)	\$31.26	\$31.29
6	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN450	\$44.11 (S)	\$47.71	\$46.97
7	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR400	\$132.51 (P)	\$147.52	\$144.33 (A)
8	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR420	\$66.92 (P)	\$73.47	\$71.89
9	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN460	\$70.02 (S)	\$76.90	\$76.28
10	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN580	\$89.66 (P)	\$98.43	\$96.31
11	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR520	\$170.15 (P)	\$187.79	\$183.73
12	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN620	\$55.82 (S)	\$60.43	\$59.26
13	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN650	\$88.19 (P)	\$96.70	\$94.61
14	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR620	\$109.85 (P)	\$120.88	\$118.26
15	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR630	\$67.51 (S)	\$73.47	\$71.89
16	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN750	\$79.74 (P)	\$87.72	\$87.01
17	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR720	\$101.68 (P)	\$112.30	\$109.87
18	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN850	\$83.09 (P)	\$91.27	\$89.24
19	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR820	\$101.35 (P)	\$112.30	\$109.87

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Supplies Outlet Reno, NV HUB - No COOP - Yes
	Part B: Brother Toners and Drums	
1	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN250	\$40.60
2	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR200, DR250	\$196.35
3	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN350	\$69.59
4	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR350	\$126.87
5	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN420	\$33.35
6	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN450	\$50.00
7	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR400	\$170.04
8	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR420	\$83.54
9	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN460	\$89.00
10	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN580	\$105.99
11	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR520	\$176.99 (A)
12	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN620	\$66.99
13	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN650	\$107.20
14	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR620	\$134.00
15	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR630	\$80.75
16	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN750	\$95.00
17	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR720	\$122.75
18	Toner for Brother Facsimile TN850	\$100.59
19	Drum for Brother Facsimile DR820	\$124.00

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

			The Tree House, Inc. Norwood, MA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dream Ranch, LLC Krum, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Limitless Office Products Richardson, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
20	Brother MFC L8850 CDW				
a	TN 331 BK - BLACK	0-1	\$42.60 (S)	\$42.80 (A)	\$46.77
b	TN 331 C - CYAN	0-1	\$47.35 (A)	\$46.00 (S)	\$51.98
c	TN 331 M - MAGENTA	0-1	\$47.35 (A)	\$46.00 (P)	\$51.98
d	TN 331 Y - YELLOW	0-1	\$47.35 (A)	\$46.00 (P)	\$51.98
e	TN 336 BK- HIGH YIELD BLACK	0-1	\$52.75 (A)	\$52.00 (S)	\$57.94
f	TN 336 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	0-1	\$84.55 (A)	\$83.00 (S)	\$92.87
g	TN 336 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	0-1	\$84.55 (A)	\$83.00 (S)	\$92.87
h	TN 336 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	0-1	\$84.55 (A)	\$83.00 (S)	\$92.87
i	DR 331 CL - DRUM	0-1	\$121.70 (S)	\$122.00 (A)	\$133.66
j	BU 320 CL - BELT	0-1	\$92.35 (P)	\$93.00 (S)	\$101.36
k	WT 320 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	0-1	\$17.80 (S)	\$17.00 (P)	\$19.81
21	Brother MFC 9325 CW	0-1			
a	TN 210 BK - BLACK	0-1	\$55.80 (A)	\$55.00 (S)	\$61.25
b	TN 210 C - CYAN	0-1	\$52.10 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$57.18
c	TN 210 M - MAGENTA	0-1	\$52.10 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$57.18
d	TN 210 Y - YELLOW	0-1	\$52.10 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$57.18
e	DR 210 CL - DRUM	0-1	\$111.55 (A)	\$111.00 (S)	\$122.51
f	BU 200 CL - BELT	0-1	\$96.70 (S)	\$97.00 (A)	\$106.18
g	WT 200 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	0-1	\$22.35 (P)	\$22.50 (S)	\$24.51

P = Primary

S = Seconday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Quill, LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	W.M. Corp. dba Beyond Technology Centennial, CO HUB - No COOP - Yes	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Marietta, GA HUB - NO COOP - Yes
20	Brother MFC L8850 CDW			
a	TN 331 BK - BLACK	\$41.29 (P)	\$44.14	\$43.85
b	TN 331 C - CYAN	\$45.92 (P)	\$49.06	\$48.50
c	TN 331 M - MAGENTA	\$46.47 (S)	\$49.06	\$48.50
d	TN 331 Y - YELLOW	\$46.48 (S)	\$49.06	\$48.50
e	TN 336 BK- HIGH YIELD BLACK	\$50.54 (P)	\$54.68	\$58.20
f	TN 336 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	\$80.28 (P)	\$87.65	\$93.29
g	TN 336 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	\$80.28 (P)	\$87.65	\$85.75
h	TN 336 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	\$80.33 (P)	\$87.65	\$93.29
i	DR 331 CL - DRUM	\$117.60 (P)	\$126.15	\$123.43
j	BU 320 CL - BELT	\$112.67	\$95.67	\$93.60 (A)
k	WT 320 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	No BID	\$18.39 (A)	\$20.13
21	Brother MFC 9325 CW			
a	TN 210 BK - BLACK	\$53.33 (P)	\$57.81	\$56.78
b	TN 210 C - CYAN	\$50.38 (P)	\$53.97	\$53.14
c	TN 210 M - MAGENTA	\$50.44 (P)	\$53.97	\$53.14
d	TN 210 Y - YELLOW	\$50.39 (P)	\$53.97	\$53.14
e	DR 210 CL - DRUM	\$106.34 (P)	\$115.64	\$113.63
f	BU 200 CL - BELT	\$91.93 (P)	\$100.22	\$98.96
g	WT 200 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$24.46	\$23.12 (A)	\$23.53

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Supplies Outlet Reno, NV HUB - No COOP - Yes
20	Brother MFC L8850 CDW	
a	TN 331 BK - BLACK	\$48.27
b	TN 331 C - CYAN	\$53.64
c	TN 331 M - MAGENTA	\$53.64
d	TN 331 Y - YELLOW	\$53.64
e	TN 336 BK- HIGH YIELD BLACK	\$59.78
f	TN 336 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	\$95.83
g	TN 336 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	\$95.83
h	TN 336 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	\$95.83
i	DR 331 CL - DRUM	\$139.85
j	BU 320 CL - BELT	\$106.99
k	WT 320 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$20.61
21	Brother MFC 9325 CW	
a	TN 210 BK - BLACK	\$64.00
b	TN 210 C - CYAN	\$59.83
c	TN 210 M - MAGENTA	\$59.83
d	TN 210 Y - YELLOW	\$59.83
e	DR 210 CL - DRUM	\$128.19
f	BU 200 CL - BELT	\$100.00
g	WT 200 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$25.49

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

			The Tree House, Inc. Norwood, MA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dream Ranch, LLC Krum, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Limitless Office Products Richardson, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
22	Brother MFC 9440 CN				
a	TN 110 BK - BLACK	0-1	\$51.80 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$56.86
b	TN 110 C - CYAN	0-1	\$60.50 (A)	\$60.00 (S)	\$66.29
c	TN 110 M - MAGENTA	0-1	\$60.50 (A)	\$60.00 (S)	\$66.29
d	TN 110 Y - YELLOW	0-1	\$60.50 (A)	\$60.00 (S)	\$66.29
e	TN 115 BK - HIGH YIELD BLACK	0-1	\$80.00 (A)	\$80.00 (S)	\$87.80
f	TN 115 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	0-1	\$111.80 (A)	\$111.00 (S)	\$122.73
g	TN 115 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	0-1	\$111.80 (A)	\$111.00 (S)	\$122.73
h	TN 115 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	0-1	\$111.80 (A)	\$111.00 (S)	\$122.73
i	DR 110 CL - DRUM	0-1	\$171.90 (A)	\$170.00 (S)	\$188.57
j	BU 100 CL - BELT	0-1	\$107.00 (A)	\$105.00 (S)	\$117.38
k	WT 100 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	0-1	\$20.75 (S)	\$20.00 (P)	\$22.70
23	Brother MFC 9460CDN, 9970 CDW				
a	TN 310 BK - BLACK	0-1	\$46.85 (A)	\$46.00 (S)	\$51.43
b	TN 310 C - CYAN	0-1	\$52.10 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$57.18
c	TN 310 M - MAGENTA	0-1	\$52.10 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$57.18
d	TN 310 Y - YELLOW	0-1	\$52.10 (A)	\$51.00 (S)	\$57.18
e	TN 315 BK - HIGH YIELD BLACK	0-1	\$87.00 (A)	\$86.00 (S)	\$95.55
f	TN 315 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	0-1	\$92.95 (A)	\$90.00 (S)	\$102.10
g	TN 315 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	0-1	\$92.95 (A)	\$90.00 (S)	\$102.10

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Quill, LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	W.M. Corp. dba Beyond Technology Centennial, CO HUB - No COOP - Yes	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Marietta, GA HUB - NO COOP - Yes
22	Brother MFC 9440 CN			
a	TN 110 BK - BLACK	\$50.42 (P)	\$53.67	\$53.27
b	TN 110 C - CYAN	\$58.34 (P)	\$62.56	\$62.10
c	TN 110 M - MAGENTA	\$58.25 (P)	\$62.56	\$64.04
d	TN 110 Y - YELLOW	\$58.28 (P)	\$62.56	No BID
e	TN 115 BK - HIGH YIELD BLACK	\$75.84 (P)	\$82.87	\$81.83
f	TN 115 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	\$104.73 (P)	\$115.84	\$114.38
g	TN 115 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	\$104.46 (P)	\$115.84	\$114.38
h	TN 115 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	\$104.59 (P)	\$115.84	\$114.38
i	DR 110 CL - DRUM	\$161.53 (P)	\$177.98	\$174.85
j	BU 100 CL - BELT	\$101.79 (P)	\$110.79	\$109.41
k	WT 100 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$21.98	\$21.42 (A)	\$22.61
23	Brother MFC 9460CDN, 9970 CDW			
a	TN 310 BK - BLACK	\$45.40 (P)	\$48.55	\$48.02
b	TN 310 C - CYAN	\$49.85 (P)	\$53.97	\$53.14
c	TN 310 M - MAGENTA	\$49.85 (P)	\$53.97	\$53.14
d	TN 310 Y - YELLOW	\$49.85 (P)	\$53.97	\$53.14
e	TN 315 BK - HIGH YIELD BLACK	\$82.09 (P)	\$90.18	\$88.23
f	TN 315 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	\$86.93 (P)	\$96.36	\$94.28
g	TN 315 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	\$86.88 (P)	\$96.36	\$93.27

P = Primary

S = Seconday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Supplies Outlet Reno, NV HUB - No COOP - Yes
22	Brother MFC 9440 CN	
a	TN 110 BK - BLACK	\$59.50
b	TN 110 C - CYAN	\$69.35
c	TN 110 M - MAGENTA	\$69.35
d	TN 110 Y - YELLOW	\$69.35
e	TN 115 BK - HIGH YIELD BLACK	\$91.99
f	TN 115 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	\$123.00
g	TN 115 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	\$123.00
h	TN 115 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	\$123.00
i	DR 110 CL - DRUM	\$196.24
j	BU 100 CL - BELT	\$122.82
k	WT 100 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$123.62
23	Brother MFC 9460CDN, 9970 CDW	
a	TN 310 BK - BLACK	\$48.26
b	TN 310 C - CYAN	\$59.83
c	TN 310 M - MAGENTA	\$59.83
d	TN 310 Y - YELLOW	\$59.83
e	TN 315 BK - HIGH YIELD BLACK	\$99.99
f	TN 315 C - HIGH YIELD CYAN	\$106.82
g	TN 315 M - HIGH YIELD MAGENTA	\$106.82

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

			The Tree House, Inc. Norwood, MA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dream Ranch, LLC Krum, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Limitless Office Products Richardson, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
h	TN 315 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	0-1	\$92.95 (A)	\$90.00 (S)	\$102.10
i	DR 310 CL - DRUM	0-1	\$133.90 (A)	\$130.00 (S)	\$147.01
j	BU 300 CL - BELT	0-1	\$101.60 (A)	\$100.00 (S)	\$111.49
k	WT 300 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	0-1	\$19.70 (S)	\$19.00 (P)	\$21.43
	Discount Off List Price for all other Brother Toner and Drum Units Not Specified		33% (S)	44% (P)	10-35%
	Part C: Canon Toners				
1	Toner Canon 119	0-1	\$77.20 (S)	\$80.00 (A)	\$81.45
2	Toner Canon 128	0-10	\$77.20	\$70.00 (P)	\$81.45
3	Toner Canon 137	0-1	\$71.35	\$67.00 (P)	\$72.16
4	Toner Canon FX4	0-1	No Bid	\$60.00 (S)	\$40.47 (P)
	Discount Off List Price for all other Canon Toner and Drum Units Not Specified		32% (S)	43% (P)	10-35%
	Part D: Muratec Toners and Drums				
1	Toner for Muratec Facsimilie TS 120	0-2	\$109.90 (S)	\$105.00 (P)	\$121.11
2	Drum for Muratec Facsimilie DK 120	0-2	No Bid	\$80.00 (P)	\$85.76 (S)
3	Toner for Muratec Facsimilie TS 300	0-2	\$131.10 (S)	\$125.00 (P)	\$156.05
4	Drum for Muratec DK2550	0-2	\$82.50 (S)	\$75.00 (P)	\$97.20
5	Toner for Muratec TS40360	0-2	\$158.85 (S)	\$145.00 (P)	\$172.48

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Quill, LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	W.M. Corp. dba Beyond Technology Centennial, CO HUB - No COOP - Yes	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Marietta, GA HUB - NO COOP - Yes
h	TN 315 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	\$86.92 (P)	\$96.36	\$94.28
i	DR 310 CL - DRUM	\$129.32 (P)	\$138.76	\$135.77
j	BU 300 CL - BELT	\$98.09 (P)	\$105.23	\$103.91
k	WT 300 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$21.85	\$20.23 (A)	\$21.59
	Discount Off List Price for all other Brother Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	0%	20% (A)	0%
	Part C: Canon Toners			
1	Toner Canon 119	\$86.56	\$72.74 (P)	\$90.14
2	Toner Canon 128	\$76.33	\$72.74 (S)	\$73.55 (A)
3	Toner Canon 137	\$71.00 (A)	\$69.83 (S)	\$73.12
4	Toner Canon FX4	No BID	No BID	No BID
	Discount Off List Price for all other Canon Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	0%	18% (A)	0-30%
	Part D: Muratec Toners and Drums			
1	Toner for Muratec Facsimilie TS 120	No BID	\$115.89 (A)	No BID
2	Drum for Muratec Facsimilie DK 120	No BID	\$122.33 (A)	No BID
3	Toner for Muratec Facsimilie TS 300	\$161.27	\$135.37 (A)	No BID
4	Drum for Muratec DK2550	\$107.29	\$87.56 (A)	No BID
5	Toner for Muratec TS40360	No BID	\$169.97 (A)	No BID

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Supplies Outlet Reno, NV HUB - No COOP - Yes
h	TN 315 Y - HIGH YIELD YELLOW	\$106.82
i	DR 310 CL - DRUM	\$153.85
j	BU 300 CL - BELT	\$116.65
k	WT 300 CL - WASTER TONER BOX	\$22.31
	Discount Off List Price for all other Brother Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	12%
	Part C: Canon Toners	
1	Toner Canon 119	\$115.69
2	Toner Canon 128	\$84.52
3	Toner Canon 137	\$79.44
4	Toner Canon FX4	\$92.89 (A)
	Discount Off List Price for all other Canon Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	12%
	Part D: Muratec Toners and Drums	
1	Toner for Muratec Facsimilie TS 120	No BID
2	Drum for Muratec Facsimilie DK 120	No BID
3	Toner for Muratec Facsimilie TS 300	No BID
4	Drum for Muratec DK2550	No BID
5	Toner for Muratec TS40360	No BID

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

			The Tree House, Inc. Norwood, MA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Dream Ranch, LLC Krum, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Limitless Office Products Richardson, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
6	Drum for Muratec DK40360	0-2	\$85.10 (S)	\$75.00 (P)	\$85.84 (A)
7	Drum for Muratec DK3510	0-2	\$119.50 (S)	\$117.00 (P)	\$143.57
8	Toner for Muratec TS565US	0-2	\$157.00 (S)	\$148.00 (P)	\$184.95
	Discount Off List Price for all other Muratec Toner and Drum Units Not Specified		32% (S)	43% (P)	10-35%
	Part E: Samsung Fax Machines				
1	Samsung ProXpress Toner MLT-D203L	0-10	\$91.40 (A)	\$90.00 (P)	\$99.04
2	Samsung ProXpress Fuser JC91-01023A	0-10	\$97.10 (A)	\$95.00 (S)	\$104.56
3	Samsung ProXpress Toner MLT-D203S	0-10	\$62.70 (A)	\$60.00 (P)	\$66.87
4	Samsung Toner MLT-D206L	0-10	\$70.75 (P)	\$75.00	\$77.87
5	Samsung Fuser JC91-00925D	0-10	\$102.90 (S)	\$99.00 (P)	\$111.01
	Discount Off List Price for all other Samsung Toner and Drum Units Not Specified		32% (S)	43% (P)	10-35%

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Quill, LLC Lincolnshire, IL HUB - No COOP - Yes	W.M. Corp. dba Beyond Technology Centennial, CO HUB - No COOP - Yes	Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Marietta, GA HUB - NO COOP - Yes
6	Drum for Muratec DK40360	\$87.20	\$90.14	No BID
7	Drum for Muratec DK3510	No BID	\$124.83 (A)	No BID
8	Toner for Muratec TS565US	\$171.25	\$167.39 (A)	No BID
	Discount Off List Price for all other Muratec Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	0%	30% (A)	No BID
	Part E: Samsung Fax Machines			
1	Samsung ProXpress Toner MLT-D203L	\$98.80	\$95.48	\$90.47 (S)
2	Samsung ProXpress Fuser JC91-01023A	No BID	\$98.99	No BID
3	Samsung ProXpress Toner MLT-D203S	\$68.02	\$65.09	\$61.08 (S)
4	Samsung Toner MLT-D206L	No BID	\$74.45 (A)	\$73.66 (S)
5	Samsung Fuser JC91-00925D	No BID	\$103.87 (A)	No BID
	Discount Off List Price for all other Samsung Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	0%	22% (A)	0%

P = Primary

S = Secondday

A = Alternate

BID 2019-018 Annual Contract for Copier and Fax Supplies

		Supplies Outlet Reno, NV HUB - No COOP - Yes
6	Drum for Muratec DK40360	No BID
7	Drum for Muratec DK3510	No BID
8	Toner for Muratec TS565US	No BID
	Discount Off List Price for all other Muratec Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	12%
	Part E: Samsung Fax Machines	
1	Samsung ProXpress Toner MLT-D203L	\$114.94
2	Samsung ProXpress Fuser JC91-01023A	\$75.86 (P)
3	Samsung ProXpress Toner MLT-D203S	\$75.86
4	Samsung Toner MLT-D206L	\$82.49
5	Samsung Fuser JC91-00925D	\$110.99
	Discount Off List Price for all other Samsung Toner and Drum Units Not Specified	12%

P = Primary
 S = Seconday
 A = Alternate