

**Bid No. 2019-016 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck OEM Repair and Service for Chrysler, Dodge, Jeep, Ram, Honda, Hyundai, and Toyota**

		AutoNation CDJR	Clay Cooley Chevrolet	Grapevine Dodge
		Fort Worth, TX	Irving, TX	Grapevine, TX
		HUB-No COOP-Yes	HUB-No COOP-Yes	HUB-No COOP-Yes
Item No.	Description	Price or Discount	Price or Discount	Price or Discount
<b>Section I - Chrysler, Dodge, Jeep, Ram</b>				
1.	Hourly Labor Rate	<b>\$105.00</b>	<b>\$110.00</b>	<b>\$100.00</b>
2.	Additional Fees			
	Shop Fee	<b>\$49.50</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$11.25</b>
	Environmental Fee	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
	Fee	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
	Fee	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>
3.	Pick-up and Delivery Each Way	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$100.00</b>
4.	Parts Mark-UP	<b>40%</b>	<b>10%</b>	<b>30%</b>
<b>Section II - Honda</b>				
1.	Hourly Labor Rate	No Bid	<b>\$110.00</b>	No Bid
2.	Additional Fees			
	Shop Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Environmental Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
3.	Pick-up and Delivery Each Way	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
4.	Parts Mark-UP	No Bid	<b>10%</b>	No Bid

**Bid No. 2019-016 Annual Contract for Automotive and Light Truck OEM Repair and Service for Chrysler, Dodge, Jeep, Ram, Honda, Hyundai, and Toyota**

		AutoNation CDJR	Clay Cooley Chevrolet	Grapevine Dodge
		Fort Worth, TX	Irving, TX	Grapevine, TX
		HUB-No COOP-Yes	HUB-No COOP-Yes	HUB-No COOP-Yes
Item No.	Description	Price or Discount	Price or Discount	Price or Discount
<b>Section III - Hyundai</b>				
1.	Hourly Labor Rate	<b>\$110.00</b>	<b>\$110.00</b>	No Bid
2.	Additional Fees			No Bid
	Shop Fee	<b>\$49.50</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	
	Environmental Fee	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Fee	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Fee	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
3.	Pick-up and Delivery Each Way	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
4.	Parts Mark-UP	<b>40%</b>	<b>10%</b>	No Bid
<b>Section IV - Toyota</b>				
1.	Hourly Labor Rate	No Bid	<b>\$110.00</b>	No Bid
2.	Additional Fees			
	Shop Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Environmental Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
	Fee	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
3.	Pick-up and Delivery Each Way	No Bid	<b>\$0.00</b>	No Bid
4.	Parts Mark-UP	No Bid	<b>10%</b>	No Bid