

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles - Awards by Line Item**

Item	Description	Primary 1	Primary 2	Primary 3
<b>SECTION I - SEDANS</b>				
<b>1</b>	<b>DODGE</b>	<b>Freedom CDJR</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, RWD</b>	\$21,399.00	\$21,497.00	N/A
	Brand / Model	Charger 27A	Charger Pursuit	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	60-100	50-80	N/A
		<b>Freedom CDJR</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, AWD</b>	\$24,475.00	\$24,555.00	N/A
	Brand / Model	Charger 29A	Charger Pursuit AWD	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	60-100	90-140	N/A
<b>2</b>	<b>FORD</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Holiday Ford</b>	<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Responder, Hybrid Sedan</b>	\$26,613.00	\$26,877.34	\$26,984.00
	Brand / Model	Fusion POA	Responder	Fusion Responder
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	90-120	150
<b>SECTION II - PICKUPS</b>				
<b>3</b>	<b>CHEVROLET</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model CC10543, 5.3L V8</b>	\$25,320.00	\$25,391.00	\$25,403.00
	Brand / Model	CC10543	CC10543	CC10543
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	90-120	75-90
		<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 4WD, Model CK10543, 5.3L V8</b>	\$27,278.00	\$27,638.00	\$27,663.00
	Brand / Model	CK10543	CK10543	CK10543
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	90-120	75-90
<b>4</b>	<b>DODGE RAM</b>	<b>Freedom CDJR</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Ram 1500 Crew Cab Pickup, Special Service Vehicle, 4X4, Model DS6T98, 5.7L V8</b>	\$24,572.00	\$24,736.00	N/A
	Brand / Model	1500 SSV	1500 SSV	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	75-120	N/A
<b>5</b>	<b>FORD</b>	<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Randall Reed's Prestige Ford</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model X1C, 5.0L V8</b>	\$24,375.00	\$24,397.00	\$25,300.00
	Brand / Model	X1C	X1C	X1C
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	90-120	75-110
		<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>	<b>Randall Reed's Prestige Ford</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model W1C, 5.0L V8</b>	\$25,790.00	\$25,885.00	\$26,700.00
	Brand / Model	W1C	W1C	W1C
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	150	75-110
		<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Holiday Ford</b>
<b>C</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Crew, Pursuit Responder, 4WD, Model W1P, 3.5L V6 EcoBoost</b>	\$32,488.00	\$32,595.00	\$32,920.68
	Brand / Model	W1P	W1P	W1P
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	90-120	90-120

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles - Awards by Line Item**

Item	Description	Primary 1	Primary 2	Primary 3
<b>SECTION III - UTILITY VEHICLES</b>				
<b>6</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TAHOE</b>	<b>Freedom Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>
<b>A</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 2WD, Model CC15706, 5.3L V8			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5			
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.			
	<b>Total For Item 6A:</b>	\$30,600.00	\$30,644.00	\$30,875.00
Brand / Model	CC15706	CC15706	CC15706	
Delivery Time ARO in Days	60-90	60-90	150	
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Freedom Chevrolet</b>
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5			
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.			
	<b>Total For Item 6B:</b>	\$33,048.00	\$33,468.00	\$33,600.00
Brand / Model	CK15706	CK15706	CK15706	
Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	60-90	60-120	
<b>C</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Special Service, (5W4), 1FL 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	<b>Total For Item 6C:</b>	\$32,852.00	\$33,075.00	\$33,156.00
	Brand / Model	CK15706	CK15706	CK15706
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	60-90	150	65-85
<b>7</b>	<b>CHEVROLET SUBURBAN</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>
<b>A</b>	Chevrolet Suburban, 1500 Commercial 1FL, 2WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8	\$37,875.00	\$38,034.00	\$38,064.00
	Brand / Model	CC15906	CC15906	CC15906
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	120	90-120	65-85
		<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Suburban, 1500 Commercial 1FL, 4WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8	\$40,498.00	\$40,625.00	\$40,800.00
	Brand / Model	CK15906	CK15906	CK15906
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	60-90	120	65-85

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles - Awards by Line Item**

Item	Description	Primary 1	Primary 2	Primary 3
<b>8</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TRAVERSE</b>	Lake Country Chevrolet	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Holiday Chevrolet
<b>A</b>	Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, FWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6	\$24,659.00	\$25,275.00	\$25,650.00
	Brand / Model	1LS - 1NB56	1NB56	
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	120	90-120
		Lake Country Chevrolet	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Holiday Chevrolet
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, AWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6	26598	26980	27045
	Brand / Model	1LS - 1NV56	1NV56	
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	120	90-120
<b>9</b>	<b>DODGE DURANGO</b>	Freedom CDJR	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	N/A
<b>A</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, RWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	\$25,330.00	\$26,284.00	N/A
	Brand / Model	Durango V6 SSV	Durango V6 SSV	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	75-100	N/A
		Freedom CDJR	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	N/A
<b>B</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, AWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	\$28,330.00	\$28,710.00	N/A
	Brand / Model	Durango Pursuit AWD	Durango Pursuit AWD	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	80-110	N/A
<b>10</b>	<b>FORD EXPEDITION</b>	Rockdale Country Ford	Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford
<b>A</b>	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model U1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	\$33,690.00	\$33,790.00	\$34,500.00
	Brand / Model	U1F	U1F	U1F
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	90-120	75-110
		Rockdale Country Ford	Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford
<b>B</b>	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model K1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	\$35,840.00	\$35,940.00	\$36,800.00
	Brand / Model	K1F	K1F	K1F
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	90-120	75-110
<b>11</b>	<b>FORD UTILITY</b>			
<b>A</b>	Ford Utility Police Interceptor, AWD 500A, Model K8A with 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV Engine with 10-Speed Automatic Transmission, Codes 99R/44C	Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Holiday Ford	Rockdale Country Ford
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb), Code 51R			
	Option B: Keyed Alike, 0135x, Code 59D			
	Option C: Cloth Front Buckets/Vinyl Rear, Code 9W			
	Option D: License Plate Bracket, Front, Code 153			
	Option E: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option F: Color, Oxford White, Code YZ			
	Option G: Rear Air Conditioning, Code 17A			
	Option H: Pre-Drilled Holes, Front and Rear Head Lamp Housing, Code 86P			
	Total for Item 11A:	\$30,925.00	\$31,416.00	\$31,875.00
Brand / Model	K8A	K8A	K8A	
Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	90-120	150	
		Sam Pack's Five Star Ford	Rockdale Country Ford	Silsbee Ford
<b>B</b>	Ford Explorer BASE - Special Services, K7B, 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV, 6 Speed Transmission	\$27,405.00	\$27,455.00	\$29,388.00
	Brand / Model	K7B	K7B	K7B
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	150	90

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
Item	Description			
<b>SECTION I - SEDANS</b>				
<b>1</b>	<b>DODGE</b>			
<b>A</b>				<b>1</b>
	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, RWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$21,399.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>Charger 27A</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>60-100</b>
<b>B</b>				<b>1</b>
	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, AWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$24,475.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>Charger 29A</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>60-100</b>
<b>2</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
<b>A</b>				
	<b>Responder, Hybrid Sedan</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford
	City, State	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX	Whitesboro, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
Item	Description			
<b>SECTION I - SEDANS</b>				
<b>1</b>	<b>DODGE</b>			
		<b>2</b>		
<b>A</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, RWD</b>	<b>\$21,497.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>Charger Pusuit</b>	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>50-80</b>	N/A	N/A
		<b>2</b>		
<b>B</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, AWD</b>	<b>\$24,555.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>Charger Pursuit AWD</b>	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-140</b>	N/A	N/A
<b>2</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
				<b>2</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Responder, Hybrid Sedan</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$26,877.34</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>Responder</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Jim Bass Ford	Jerry's GM	Lake Country Chevrolet
	City, State	San Angelo, TX	Weatherford, TX	Jasper, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No	HUB - No COOP- Yes
Item	Description			
<b>SECTION I - SEDANS</b>				
<b>1</b>	<b>DODGE</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, RWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, AWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>2</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Responder, Hybrid Sedan</b>	\$27,840.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	Police Responder Hybrid Fusion	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-105	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
Item	Description			
<b>SECTION I - SEDANS</b>				
<b>1</b>	<b>DODGE</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, RWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, AWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>2</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Responder, Hybrid Sedan</b>	\$27,740.00	No Bid	<b>3</b> <b>\$26,984.00</b>
	Brand / Model	Police Responder Hybrid 2019	N/A	<b>Fusion Responder</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	N/A	<b>\$150.00</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>SECTION I - SEDANS</b>			
<b>1</b>	<b>DODGE</b>		
<b>A</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, RWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Charger Pursuit, Patrol, 4-Door Sedan, AWD</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>2</b>	<b>FORD</b>		
<b>A</b>	<b>Responder, Hybrid Sedan</b>	<b>1</b> <b>\$26,613.00</b>	<b>\$27,658.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>Fusion P0A</b>	Responder Hybrid
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	90-120



**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
Item	Description			
<b>SECTION II - PICKUPS</b>				
<b>3 CHEVROLET</b>				
<b>A</b>		<b>1</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model CC10543, 5.3L V8</b>	<b>\$25,320.00</b>	\$26,200.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>CC10543</b>	Silverado 5W4	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>150</b>	60-120	N/A
<b>B</b>		<b>1</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 4WD, Model CK10543, 5.3L V8</b>	<b>\$27,278.00</b>	\$28,400.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>CK10543</b>	Silverado 5W4	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>150</b>	60-120	N/A
<b>4 DODGE RAM</b>				
<b>A</b>				<b>1</b>
	<b>Ram 1500 Crew Cab Pickup, Special Service Vehicle, 4X4, Model DS6T98, 5.7L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$24,572.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>1500 SSV</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Grapevine, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>SECTION II - PICKUPS</b>				
<b>3 CHEVROLET</b>				
<b>A</b>	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model CC10543, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	\$25,449.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	Silverado	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	90-120	N/A
			<b>2</b>	
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 4WD, Model CK10543, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	\$27,638.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Silverado</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>90-120</b>	N/A
<b>4 DODGE RAM</b>				
<b>A</b>		<b>2</b>		
	<b>Ram 1500 Crew Cab Pickup, Special Service Vehicle, 4X4, Model DS6T98, 5.7L V8</b>	\$24,736.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>1500 SSV</b>	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>75-120</b>	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

Item	Description			
	Vendor Name	Jim Bass Ford	Jerry's GM	Lake Country Chevrolet
	City, State	San Angelo, TX	Weatherford, TX	Jasper, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>SECTION II - PICKUPS</b>				
<b>3 CHEVROLET</b>				
<b>A</b>				<b>2</b>
	Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model CC10543, 5.3L V8	No Bid	\$25,797.90	\$25,391.00
	Brand / Model	N/A	CC10543 Silverado	Silverado 1500 CC SSV CC10543
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	90-120
<b>B</b>				
	Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 4WD, Model CK10543, 5.3L V8	No Bid	\$28,057.00	\$27,687.00
	Brand / Model	N/A	CK10543 Silverado	Silverado 1500 Crew Cab 4X4 CL10543
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	90-120
<b>4 DODGE RAM</b>				
<b>A</b>				
	Ram 1500 Crew Cab Pickup, Special Service Vehicle, 4X4, Model DS6T98, 5.7L V8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

Item	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
Item	Description			
<b>SECTION II - PICKUPS</b>				
<b>3 CHEVROLET</b>				
<b>A</b>			<b>3</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model CC10543, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	<b>\$25,403.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Silverado 1500 Crew Cab 2WD SSV</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>75-90</b>	N/A
<b>B</b>			<b>3</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 4WD, Model CK10543, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	<b>\$27,663.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Silverado 1500 Crew Cab 4WD SSV</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>75-90</b>	N/A
<b>4 DODGE RAM</b>				
<b>A</b>				
	<b>Ram 1500 Crew Cab Pickup, Special Service Vehicle, 4X4, Model DS6T98, 5.7L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>SECTION II - PICKUPS</b>			
<b>3 CHEVROLET</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model CC10543, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet 1500 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 4WD, Model CK10543, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>4 DODGE RAM</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Ram 1500 Crew Cab Pickup, Special Service Vehicle, 4X4, Model DS6T98, 5.7L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>5</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
<b>A</b>	Ford F-150 Super Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model X1C, 5.0L V8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	Ford F-150 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model W1C, 5.0L V8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>C</b>	Ford F-150 Super Crew, Pursuit Responder, 4WD, Model W1P, 3.5L V6 EcoBoost	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Grapevine, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>5</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model X1C, 5.0L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model W1C, 5.0L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>C</b>				<b>3</b>
	<b>Ford F-150 Super Crew, Pursuit Responder, 4WD, Model W1P, 3.5L V6 EcoBoost</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$32,920.68</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>F150 Pursuit Responder</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford</b>	<b>Jerry's GM</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>San Angelo, TX</b>	<b>Weatherford, TX</b>	<b>Jasper, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>5</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model X1C, 5.0L V8</b>	\$25,879.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	F150	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	75-90	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model W1C, 5.0L V8</b>	\$27,246.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	F150	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	75-90	N/A	N/A
<b>C</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Crew, Pursuit Responder, 4WD, Model W1P, 3.5L V6 EcoBoost</b>	\$33,944.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	F150 Pursuit Responder	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	80-95	N/A	N/A



**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Randall Reed's Prestige Ford</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>	<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Garland, tX</b>	<b>Richardson, TX</b>	<b>Rockdale, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>5</b>	<b>FORD</b>			
		<b>3</b>		<b>1</b>
<b>A</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model X1C, 5.0L V8</b>	<b>\$25,300.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$24,375.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>F150 Super Cab 2019</b>	N/A	<b>F150 Super Cab X1C SSV</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>75-110</b>	N/A	<b>150</b>
		<b>3</b>		<b>2</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model W1C, 5.0L V8</b>	<b>\$26,700.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$25,885.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>F150 Crew Cab 2019</b>	N/A	<b>F150 Crew Cab SSV W1C</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>75-110</b>	N/A	<b>150</b>
				<b>1</b>
<b>C</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Crew, Pursuit Responder, 4WD, Model W1P, 3.5L V6 EcoBoost</b>	<b>\$33,600.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$32,488.00</b>
	Brand / Model	Persuit Responder F150	N/A	<b>F150 Super Crew Pursuit W1P</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-100	N/A	<b>150</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>5</b>	<b>FORD</b>		
		<b>2</b>	
<b>A</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model X1C, 5.0L V8</b>	<b>\$24,397.00</b>	<b>\$25,496.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>X1C</b>	<b>X1C</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>60-90</b>
		<b>1</b>	
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Crew Cab, Special Service Vehicle, 2WD, Model W1C, 5.0L V8</b>	<b>\$25,790.00</b>	<b>\$26,992.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>W1C</b>	<b>W1C</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>60-90</b>
		<b>2</b>	
<b>C</b>	<b>Ford F-150 Super Crew, Pursuit Responder, 4WD, Model W1P, 3.5L V6 EcoBoost</b>	<b>\$32,595.00</b>	<b>\$33,144.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>W1P</b>	<b>W1P</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	<b>City, State</b>	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			

**SECTION III - UTILITY  
VEHICLE**

**6 CHEVROLET TAHOE**

		<b>3</b>	<b>1</b>	
<b>A</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 2WD, Model CC15706, 5.3L V8			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5			
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.			
	<b>Total For Item 6A:</b>	<b>\$30,875.00</b>	<b>\$30,600.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>CC15706</b>	<b>Tahoe 9C1</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>150</b>	<b>60-90</b>	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Grapevine, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			

**SECTION III - UTILITY  
VEHICLE**

**6 CHEVROLET TAHOE**

<b>A</b>			<b>2</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 2WD, Model CC15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5</b>			
	<b>Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6A:</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$30,644.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
	<b>Brand / Model</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>Tahoe</b>	<b>N/A</b>
	<b>Delivery Time ARO in Days</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>60-90</b>	<b>N/A</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford</b>	<b>Jerry's GM</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>San Angelo, TX</b>	<b>Weatherford, TX</b>	<b>Jasper, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			

**SECTION III - UTILITY  
VEHICLE**

**6 CHEVROLET TAHOE**

<b>A</b>				
	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 2WD, Model CC15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5</b>			
	<b>Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6A:</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$31,557.18</b>	<b>\$30,932.00</b>
	<b>Brand / Model</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>CC15706 1FL 9C1</b>	<b>Tahoe PPV CC15706 9C1</b>
	<b>Delivery Time ARO in Days</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>60-120</b>	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Randall Reed's Prestige Ford</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>	<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Garland, tX</b>	<b>Richardson, TX</b>	<b>Rockdale, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			

**SECTION III - UTILITY VEHICLE**

**6 CHEVROLET TAHOE**

<b>A</b>				
	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 2WD, Model CC15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5</b>			
	<b>Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6A:</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$30,898.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
	<b>Brand / Model</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>Tahoe PPV 2WD 9C1</b>	<b>N/A</b>
	<b>Delivery Time ARO in Days</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>65-85</b>	<b>N/A</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>SECTION III - UTILITY VEHICLE</b>			
<b>6 CHEVROLET TAHOE</b>			
<b>A</b>			
	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 2WD, Model CC15706, 5.3L V8</b>		
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>		
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>		
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>		
	<b>Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5</b>		
	<b>Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.</b>		
	<b>Total For Item 6A:</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
	<b>Brand / Model</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>Delivery Time ARO in Days</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
			<b>3</b>	
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5			
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.			
	<b>Total For Item 6B:</b>	\$33,675.00	<b>\$33,600.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	CK15706	<b>Tahoe 9C1</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150	<b>60-120</b>	N/A



**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford
	City, State	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX	Whitesboro, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
			<b>2</b>	
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5			
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.			
	<b>Total For Item 6B:</b>	No Bid	<b>\$33,468.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Tahoe</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>60-90</b>	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford</b>	<b>Jerry's GM</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>San Angelo, TX</b>	<b>Weatherford, TX</b>	<b>Jasper, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
				<b>1</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5</b>			
	<b>Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6B:</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$34,381.18</b>	<b>\$33,048.00</b>
	<b>Brand / Model</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>CK10706</b>	<b>Tahoe PPV 4X4 CK15706 9C1</b>
	<b>Delivery Time ARO in Days</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>60-120</b>	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5			
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.			
	<b>Total For Item 6B:</b>	No Bid	\$33,717.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	Tahoe PPV 4WD 9C1	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	65-85	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>B</b>	Chevrolet Tahoe, Police Package, 1FL (9C1) 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8		
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6		
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal		
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ		
	Option D: Vinyl Rear Seating, Code 5T5		
	Option E: Delete Center Console: SEO 9U3 20% Seat Delete. Cloth Front 40/40 Individual Seats, Code AZ3. Option 9U3 Standard 10 Way Power Driver Seat. 6-Way Power Passenger Seat.		
	<b>Total For Item 6B:</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>C</b>		<b>2</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Special Service, (5W4), 1FL 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6C:</b>	<b>\$33,075.00</b>	\$33,300.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>CK15706</b>	Tahoe 5W4	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>150</b>	60-120	N/A
<b>7</b>	<b>CHEVROLET SUBURBAN</b>			
<b>A</b>		<b>1</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet Suburban,1500 Commercial 1FL, 2WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	<b>\$37,875.00</b>	\$38,200.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>CC15906</b>	Suburban 1FL	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>120</b>	90-120	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford
	City, State	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX	Whitesboro, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>C</b>			<b>1</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Special Service, (5W4), 1FL 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6C:</b>	No Bid	<b>\$32,852.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Tahoe</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>60-90</b>	N/A
<b>7</b>	<b>CHEVROLET SUBURBAN</b>			
<b>A</b>				
	<b>Chevrolet Suburban,1500 Commercial 1FL, 2WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford</b>	<b>Jerry's GM</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>San Angelo, TX</b>	<b>Weatherford, TX</b>	<b>Jasper, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>C</b>	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Special Service, (5W4), 1FL 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8</b>			
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>			
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>			
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>			
	<b>Total For Item 6C:</b>	No Bid	\$33,755.18	\$33,174.00
	Brand / Model	N/A	CK105706 5W4	Tahoe SSV CK15706 5W4
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	
	<b>7 CHEVROLET SUBURBAN</b>			
<b>A</b>				<b>2</b>
	<b>Chevrolet Suburban,1500 Commercial 1FL, 2WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	\$38,382.08	<b>\$38,034.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	CC10906	<b>Suburban 1FL CC15906</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	<b>90-120</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>C</b>			<b>3</b>	
	Chevrolet Tahoe, Special Service, (5W4), 1FL 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6			
	Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ			
	<b>Total For Item 6C:</b>	No Bid	<b>\$33,156.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Tahoe SSV 5W4</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>65-85</b>	N/A
<b>7</b>	<b>CHEVROLET SUBURBAN</b>			
<b>A</b>			<b>3</b>	
	Chevrolet Suburban,1500 Commercial 1FL, 2WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8	No Bid	<b>\$38,064.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Suburban 2WD 1FL</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>65-85</b>	N/A



**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>C</b>	<b>Chevrolet Tahoe, Special Service, (5W4), 1FL 4WD, Model CK15706, 5.3L V8</b>		
	<b>Option A: Spot Lamp, Left Hand, Separately Fused, Code 7X6</b>		
	<b>Option B: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal</b>		
	<b>Option C: Color, Summit White, Code GAZ</b>		
	<b>Total For Item 6C:</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
	<b>7</b>	<b>CHEVROLET SUBURBAN</b>	
<b>A</b>	<b>Chevrolet Suburban,1500 Commercial 1FL, 2WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>B</b>		<b>2</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet Suburban, 1500 Commercial 1FL, 4WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	<b>\$40,625.00</b>	\$41,050.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>CK15906</b>	Suburban 1FL	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>120</b>	90-120	N/A
<b>8</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TRAVERSE</b>			
<b>A</b>		<b>2</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, FWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	<b>\$25,275.00</b>	\$25,900.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>1NB56</b>	Traverse 1FL	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>120</b>	90-120	N/A
<b>B</b>		<b>2</b>		
	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, AWD, Model 1NV56, 3.6L V6</b>	<b>\$26,980.00</b>	\$27,900.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>1NV56</b>	Traverse 1FL	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>120</b>	90-120	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford
	City, State	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX	Whitesboro, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>B</b>			<b>1</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet Suburban, 1500 Commercial 1FL, 4WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	<b>\$40,498.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Suburban</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>60-90</b>	N/A
<b>8</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TRAVERSE</b>			
<b>A</b>			<b>3</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, FWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	<b>\$25,650.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Traverse</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>90-120</b>	N/A
<b>B</b>			<b>3</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, AWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	<b>\$27,045.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Traverse</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>90-120</b>	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Jim Bass Ford	Jerry's GM	Lake Country Chevrolet
	City, State	San Angelo, TX	Weatherford, TX	Jasper, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet Suburban,1500 Commercial 1FL, 4WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	\$41,118.08	\$40,959.00
	Brand / Model	N/A	CK10906 1FL	Suburban 1FL CK15906
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	90-120
<b>8</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TRAVERSE</b>			
<b>A</b>	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, FWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	\$26,121.00	<b>\$24,659.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	1NB56	<b>Traverse 1LS 1NB56</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	<b>90-120</b>
				<b>1</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, AWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	\$27,965.00	<b>\$26,598.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	1NV56	<b>Traverse 1LS 1NV56</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	60-120	<b>90-120</b>
				<b>1</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>B</b>			<b>3</b>	
	<b>Chevrolet Suburban, 1500 Commercial 1FL, 4WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	<b>\$40,800.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	<b>Suburban 4WD 1FL</b>	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	<b>65-85</b>	N/A
<b>8</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TRAVERSE</b>			
<b>A</b>				
	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, FWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	\$26,002.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	Traverse LS 1FL FWD*	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	75-95	N/A
<b>B</b>				
	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, AWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	\$27,846.00	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	Traverse LS 1FL AWD*	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	75-95	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet Suburban, 1500 Commercial 1FL, 4WD, Model CC15906, 5.3L V8</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>8</b>	<b>CHEVROLET TRAVERSE</b>		
<b>A</b>	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, FWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Chevrolet Traverse, LS/IFL, AWD, Model 1NB56, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>9</b>	<b>DODGE DURANGO</b>			
<b>A</b>				<b>1</b>
	Dodge Durango, SSV, RWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$25,330.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>Durango V6 SSV</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>90-120</b>
<b>B</b>				<b>1</b>
	Dodge Durango, SSV, AWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$28,330.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>Durango AWD</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>90-120</b>
<b>10</b>	<b>FORD EXPEDITION</b>			
<b>A</b>				
	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model U1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>				
	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model K1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford
	City, State	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX	Whitesboro, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>9</b>	<b>DODGE DURANGO</b>			
		<b>2</b>		
<b>A</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, RWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	\$26,284.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	Durango SSV	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	75-100	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>		<b>2</b>		
	Dodge Durango, SSV, AWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	\$28,710.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	Durango Pursuit AWD	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	80-110	N/A	N/A
<b>10</b>	<b>FORD EXPEDITION</b>			
<b>A</b>	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model U1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>				
	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model K1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A



**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Jim Bass Ford	Jerry's GM	Lake Country Chevrolet
	City, State	San Angelo, TX	Weatherford, TX	Jasper, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>9</b>	<b>DODGE DURANGO</b>			
<b>A</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, RWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, AWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>10</b>	<b>FORD EXPEDITION</b>			
<b>A</b>	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model U1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	\$34,970.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	Expedition	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	125-150	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model K1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	\$37,214.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	Expedition Max	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	125-150	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>9</b>	<b>DODGE DURANGO</b>			
<b>A</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, RWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	Dodge Durango, SSV, AWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>10</b>	<b>FORD EXPEDITION</b>			
<b>A</b>		<b>3</b>		<b>1</b>
	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model U1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	<b>\$34,500.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$33,690.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>Expedition</b>	N/A	<b>Expedition XL U1F</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>75-110</b>	N/A	<b>150</b>
<b>B</b>		<b>3</b>		<b>1</b>
	Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model K1F, 3.5L EcoB V6	<b>\$36,800.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$35,840.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>Expedition EL</b>	N/A	<b>Expedition XL Max K1F</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>75-110</b>	N/A	<b>150</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>9</b>	<b>DODGE DURANGO</b>		
<b>A</b>	<b>Dodge Durango, SSV, RWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Dodge Durango, SSV, AWD, Model WDDE75, 3.6L V6</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A
<b>10</b>	<b>FORD EXPEDITION</b>		
<b>A</b>		<b>2</b>	
	<b>Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model U1F, 3.5L EcoB V6</b>	<b>\$33,790.00</b>	<b>\$34,775.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>U1F</b>	<b>U1F</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>60-90</b>
<b>B</b>		<b>2</b>	
	<b>Ford Expedition, SSV, RWD, 102A, Model K1F, 3.5L EcoB V6</b>	<b>\$35,940.00</b>	<b>\$36,994.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>Expedition</b>	<b>K1F</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>60-90</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Caldwell Country Chevrolet	Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet	Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR
	City, State	Caldwell, TX	Dallas, TX	Duncanville, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>11</b>	<b>FORD UTILITY</b>			
<b>A</b>	Ford Utility Police Interceptor, AWD 500A, Model K8A with 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV Engine with 10-Speed Automatic Transmission, Codes 99R/44C			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb), Code 51R			
	Option B: Keyed Alike, 0135x, Code 59D			
	Option C: Cloth Front Buckets/Vinyl Rear, Code 9W			
	Option D: License Plate Bracket, Front, Code 153			
	Option E: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option F: Color, Oxford White, Code YZ			
	Option G: Rear Air Conditioning, Code 17A			
	Option H: Pre-Drilled Holes, Front and Rear Head Lamp Housing, Code 86P			
	<b>Total for Item 11A:</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Grapevine DCJ, LLC	Holiday Chevrolet	Holiday Ford
	City, State	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX	Whitesboro, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>11</b>	<b>FORD UTILITY</b>			
				<b>2</b>
<b>A</b>	Ford Utility Police Interceptor, AWD 500A, Model K8A with 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV Engine with 10-Speed Automatic Transmission, Codes 99R/44C			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb), Code 51R			
	Option B: Keyed Alike, 0135x, Code 59D			
	Option C: Cloth Front Buckets/Vinyl Rear, Code 9W			
	Option D: License Plate Bracket, Front, Code 153			
	Option E: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option F: Color, Oxford White, Code YZ			
	Option G: Rear Air Conditioning, Code 17A			
	Option H: Pre-Drilled Holes, Front and Rear Head Lamp Housing, Code 86P			
	<b>Total for Item 11A:</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$31,416.00</b>
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	<b>Utility Police Interceptor</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Jim Bass Ford	Jerry's GM	Lake Country Chevrolet
	City, State	San Angelo, TX	Weatherford, TX	Jasper, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>11</b>	<b>FORD UTILITY</b>			
<b>A</b>	Ford Utility Police Interceptor, AWD 500A, Model K8A with 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV Engine with 10-Speed Automatic Transmission, Codes 99R/44C			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb), Code 51R			
	Option B: Keyed Alike, 0135x, Code 59D			
	Option C: Cloth Front Buckets/Vinyl Rear, Code 9W			
	Option D: License Plate Bracket, Front, Code 153			
	Option E: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option F: Color, Oxford White, Code YZ			
	Option G: Rear Air Conditioning, Code 17A			
	Option H: Pre-Drilled Holes, Front and Rear Head Lamp Housing, Code 86P			
	<b>Total for Item 11A:</b>	\$33,194.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	Police Interceptor Utility	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	Vendor Name	Randall Reed's Prestige Ford	Reliable Chevrolet	Rockdale Country Ford
	City, State	Garland, tX	Richardson, TX	Rockdale, TX
		HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes	HUB - No COOP- Yes
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
<b>11</b>	<b>FORD UTILITY</b>			
				<b>3</b>
<b>A</b>	Ford Utility Police Interceptor, AWD 500A, Model K8A with 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV Engine with 10-Speed Automatic Transmission, Codes 99R/44C			
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb), Code 51R			
	Option B: Keyed Alike, 0135x, Code 59D			
	Option C: Cloth Front Buckets/Vinyl Rear, Code 9W			
	Option D: License Plate Bracket, Front, Code 153			
	Option E: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal			
	Option F: Color, Oxford White, Code YZ			
	Option G: Rear Air Conditioning, Code 17A			
	Option H: Pre-Drilled Holes, Front and Rear Head Lamp Housing, Code 86P			
	<b>Total for Item 11A:</b>	\$31,994.00	No Bid	<b>\$31,875.00</b>
	Brand / Model	Police Interceptor Utility 2020	N/A	<b>Police Interceptor K8A</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
<b>11</b>	<b>FORD UTILITY</b>		
		<b>1</b>	
<b>A</b>	Ford Utility Police Interceptor, AWD 500A, Model K8A with 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV Engine with 10-Speed Automatic Transmission, Codes 99R/44C		
	Option A: Spot Lamp, Driver Only (LED Bulb), Code 51R		
	Option B: Keyed Alike, 0135x, Code 59D		
	Option C: Cloth Front Buckets/Vinyl Rear, Code 9W		
	Option D: License Plate Bracket, Front, Code 153		
	Option E: Push Bumper (Go Rhino), Center Mount Only, or approved equal		
	Option F: Color, Oxford White, Code YZ		
	Option G: Rear Air Conditioning, Code 17A		
	Option H: Pre-Drilled Holes, Front and Rear Head Lamp Housing, Code 86P		
	<b>Total for Item 11A:</b>	<b>\$30,925.00</b>	<b>\$31,960.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>K8A</b>	<b>K8A</b>



**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet</b>	<b>Duncanville Chevrolet/ dba Freedom Chevrolet</b>	<b>Duncanville Automotive/ dba Freedom CDJR</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Caldwell, TX</b>	<b>Dallas, TX</b>	<b>Duncanville, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford Explorer BASE - Special Services, K7B, 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV, 6 Speed Transmission</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Grapevine DCJ, LLC</b>	<b>Holiday Chevrolet</b>	<b>Holiday Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Grapevine, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>	<b>Whitesboro, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	<b>90-120</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford Explorer BASE - Special Services, K7B, 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV, 6 Speed Transmission</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford</b>	<b>Jerry's GM</b>	<b>Lake Country Chevrolet</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>San Angelo, TX</b>	<b>Weatherford, TX</b>	<b>Jasper, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	150-165	N/A	N/A
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford Explorer BASE - Special Services, K7B, 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV, 6 Speed Transmission</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Randall Reed's Prestige Ford</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet</b>	<b>Rockdale Country Ford</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Garland, tX</b>	<b>Richardson, TX</b>	<b>Rockdale, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>			
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	90-120	N/A	<b>150</b>
		*		<b>2</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford Explorer BASE - Special Services, K7B, 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV, 6 Speed Transmission</b>	<b>\$27,200.00</b>	No Bid	<b>\$27,455.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>Explorer</b>	N/A	<b>Explorer K7B</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days		N/A	<b>150</b>

**Bid No. 2019-014 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Police Package Vehicles**

	<b>Vendor Name</b>	<b>Sam Pack's Five Star Ford</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford, Inc.</b>
	<b>City, State</b>	<b>Carrollton, TX</b>	<b>Silsbee, TX</b>
		<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>	<b>HUB - No COOP- Yes</b>
<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>		
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>90</b>
		<b>1</b>	<b>3</b>
<b>B</b>	<b>Ford Explorer BASE - Special Services, K7B, 3.3L V6 TI-VCT FFV, 6 Speed Transmission</b>	<b>\$27,405.00</b>	<b>\$29,388.00</b>
	Brand / Model	<b>Explorer</b>	<b>K7B</b>
	Delivery Time ARO in Days	<b>90-120</b>	<b>\$90.00</b>