

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Holiday Chevrolet	Lake Country Chevrolet	Caldwell Country Chevrolet
City State		Whitesboro, TX	Jasper, TX	Caldwell, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION I - CHEVROLET				
		Primary 3		Primary 1
1	SPARK	\$15,323.00	\$16,092.00	\$15,175.00
	Brand / Model Bid			1DS48
	Delivery Time in Days	60	90-120	120
				Primary 1
2	SONIC SEDAN	\$19,171.00	\$17,832.00	\$16,975.00
	Brand / Model Bid		1JV69	1JV69
	Delivery Time in Days	60	90-120	120
			Primary 2	Primary 1
3	SONIC HATCHBACK	\$20,003.00	\$17,930.00	\$17,775.00
	Brand / Model Bid		1JV48	1JV48
	Delivery Time in Days	60	90-120	120
			Primary 3	Primary 1
4	CRUZE LT	\$22,771.00	\$18,122.00	\$17,790.00
	Brand / Model Bid		1BT69	1BT69
	Delivery Time in Days	60	90-120	120
			Primary 3	Primary 1
5	MALIBU LS	\$23,299.00	\$16,982.00	\$16,290.00
	Brand / Model Bid			1ZC69
	Delivery Time in Days	60	90-120	120
			Primary 2	Primary 1
6	IMPALA LS	\$25,960.00	\$21,582.00	\$21,480.00
	Brand / Model Bid			1GX69
	Delivery Time in Days	60	90-120	120
SECTION II - CHRYSLER AND DODGE				
7	300 LIMITED	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
8	CHARGER SE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
9	CHALLENGER SXT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Reliable Chevrolet	Grapevine Dodge	Holiday Ford
City State		Richardson, TX	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION I - CHEVROLET				
		Primary 2		
1	SPARK	\$15,213.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	1D548	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	125-140	N/A	N/A
		Primary 2		
2	SONIC SEDAN	\$17,295.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	1JV69	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	65-90	N/A	N/A
		Primary 3		
3	SONIC HATCHBACK	\$18,041.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	1JV48	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	65-90	N/A	N/A
		Primary 2		
4	CRUZE LT	\$18,011.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	1BT69	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	65-90	N/A	N/A
		Primary 2		
5	MALIBU LS	\$16,616.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	1ZC69	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	65-90	N/A	N/A
		Primary 3		
6	IMPALA LS	\$21,775.00	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	1GX69	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	65-90	N/A	N/A
SECTION II - CHRYSLER AND DODGE				
			Primary 1	
7	300 LIMITED	NO BID	\$25,439.00	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	300 Touring	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	60-90	N/A
			Primary 1	
8	CHARGER SE	NO BID	\$23,019.00	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	SXT	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	60-90	N/A
			Primary 1	
9	CHALLENGER SXT	NO BID	\$26,714.00	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A		N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	60-90	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Jim Bass Ford	Rockdale Country Ford	Gilchrist Automotive
City State		San Angelo, TX	Rockdale, TX	Weatherford, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION I - CHEVROLET				
1	SPARK	NO BID	NO BID	\$15,574.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
				Primary 3
2	SONIC SEDAN	NO BID	NO BID	\$17,695.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
3	SONIC HATCHBACK	NO BID	NO BID	\$18,479.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
4	CRUZE LT	NO BID	NO BID	\$18,418.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
5	MALIBU LS	NO BID	NO BID	\$17,122.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
6	IMPALA LS	NO BID	NO BID	\$22,439.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
SECTION II - CHRYSLER AND DODGE				
7	300 LIMITED	NO BID	NO BID	\$34,214.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
				Primary 2
8	CHARGER SE	NO BID	NO BID	\$27,686.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70
				Primary 2
9	CHALLENGER SXT	NO BID	NO BID	\$22,687.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	70

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Holiday Chevrolet	Lake Country Chevrolet	Caldwell Country Chevrolet
City State		Whitesboro, TX	Jasper, TX	Caldwell, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION III - FORD				
10	FIESTA SE SEDAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
11	FIESTA SE HATCHBACK	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
12	FOCUS SE SEDAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
13	FOCUS SE HATCHBACK	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
14	FUSION S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
15	FUSION SE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
16	MUSTAND P8T	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
SECTION IV - HONDA				
17	CIVIC LX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
SECTION V - HYUNDAI				
18	ELANTRA GLS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
19	SONATA GLS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Reliable Chevrolet	Grapevine Dodge	Holiday Ford
City State		Richardson, TX	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION III - FORD				
				Primary 1
10	FIESTA SE SEDAN	NO BID	NO BID	\$13,471.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60
				Primary 1
11	FIESTA SE HATCHBACK	NO BID	NO BID	\$13,821.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60
12	FOCUS SE SEDAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
13	FOCUS SE HATCHBACK	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
14	FUSION S	NO BID	NO BID	\$20,977.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60
15	FUSION SE	NO BID	NO BID	\$24,711.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60
16	MUSTAND P8T	NO BID	NO BID	\$26,029.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60
SECTION IV - HONDA				
17	CIVIC LX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
SECTION V - HYUNDAI				
18	ELANTRA GLS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
19	SONATA GLS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Jim Bass Ford	Rockdale Country Ford	Gilchrist Automotive
City State		San Angelo, TX	Rockdale, TX	Weatherford, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION III - FORD				
			Primary 3	Primary 2
10	FIESTA SE SEDAN	\$16,787.00	\$15,220.00	\$14,999.00
	Brand / Model Bid		P4B	
	Delivery Time in Days	115-125	120	70
			Primary 3	Primary 2
11	FIESTA SE HATCHBACK	\$17,054.00	\$15,520.00	\$15,275.00
	Brand / Model Bid		P4E	
	Delivery Time in Days	115-125	120	70
			Primary 1	
12	FOCUS SE SEDAN	NO BID	\$26,575.00	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	P3F	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	180	N/A
			Primary 1	
13	FOCUS SE HATCHBACK	NO BID	\$27,775.00	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	P3K	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	180	N/A
		Primary 3	Primary 1	Primary 2
14	FUSION S	\$18,671.00	\$16,945.00	\$17,878.00
	Brand / Model Bid		P0G	
	Delivery Time in Days	75-85	120	70
		Primary 3	Primary 1	Primary 2
15	FUSION SE	\$19,644.00	\$17,740.00	\$18,773.00
	Brand / Model Bid		P0H	
	Delivery Time in Days	75-85	120	70
		Primary 3	Primary 2	Primary 1
16	MUSTAND P8T	\$25,244.00	\$24,575.00	\$24,489.00
	Brand / Model Bid		P8T	
	Delivery Time in Days	100-115	120	70
SECTION IV - HONDA				
17	CIVIC LX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
SECTION V - HYUNDAI				
18	ELANTRA GLS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
19	SONATA GLS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Holiday Chevrolet	Lake Country Chevrolet	Caldwell Country Chevrolet
City State		Whitesboro, TX	Jasper, TX	Caldwell, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION VI - NISSAN				
20	VERSA SEDAN SV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
21	SENTRA SV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
22	ALTIMA SEDAN 2.5S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
23	ALTIMA SEDAN 3.5S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
SECTION VII - TOYOTA				
24	CAROLLA L	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
25	CAROLLA LE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
26	CAMRY L	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
27	CAMRY LE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Reliable Chevrolet	Grapevine Dodge	Holiday Ford
City State		Richardson, TX	Grapevine, TX	Whitesboro, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION VI - NISSAN				
20	VERSA SEDAN SV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
21	SENTRA SV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
22	ALTIMA SEDAN 2.5S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
23	ALTIMA SEDAN 3.5S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
SECTION VII - TOYOTA				
24	CAROLLA L	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
25	CAROLLA LE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
26	CAMRY L	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
27	CAMRY LE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A

Bid No. 2018-193 Annual Contract for the Purchase of Sedans

Vendor Name		Jim Bass Ford	Rockdale Country Ford	Gilchrist Automotive
City State		San Angelo, TX	Rockdale, TX	Weatherford, TX
HUB		No	No	No
Cooperative Participation		Yes	Yes	Yes
ITEM #	Vehicle Description			
SECTION VI - NISSAN				
				Primary 1
20	VERSA SEDAN SV	NO BID	NO BID	\$13,585.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60-90
				Primary 1
21	SENTRA SV	NO BID	NO BID	\$16,059.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60-90
				Primary 1
22	ALTIMA SEDAN 2.5S	NO BID	NO BID	\$19,378.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60-90
				Primary 1
23	ALTIMA SEDAN 3.5S	NO BID	NO BID	\$29,023.00
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	60-90
SECTION VII - TOYOTA				
24	CAROLLA L	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
25	CAROLLA LE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
26	CAMRY L	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A
27	CAMRY LE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Brand / Model Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Delivery Time in Days	N/A	N/A	N/A