

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 1 - MINI VAN, 7 PASSENGER WITH STOW AWAY SEATS OR SEATS REMOVED					
Daily Rental	150 days	\$ 49.00	\$ 7,350.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	130 weeks	\$ 294.00	\$ 38,220.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 900.00	\$ 900.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 2 - MINI VAN, 7 PASSENGER WITH REAR SEATS					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 49.00	\$ 49.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 294.00	\$ 294.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 900.00	\$ 900.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 3 - FULL SIZE VAN, 8-PASSENGER					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 89.00	\$ 89.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 534.00	\$ 534.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 1,150.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 4 - STANDARD VAN, 12-PASSENGER					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 5 - FULL SIZE VAN, 15-PASSENGER					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 6 - MINI CARGO VAN					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 1,080.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 7 - 1/2 TON CARGO VAN					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 1,080.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 8 - 3/4 TON CARGO VAN					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 1,080.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 9 - 3/4 TON CARGO VAN, EXTENDED					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 1,080.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 10 - ONE (1) TON CARGO VAN					
Daily Rental	1 day	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance					
CDW/LDW Insurance					
Weekly Rental	1 week	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance					
CDW/LDW Insurance					
Monthly Rental	1 month	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance					
CDW/LDW Insurance					
ITEM 11 - ONE (1) TON CARGO VAN, EXTENDED					

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
Daily Rental	1 day	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance					
CDW/LDW Insurance					
Weekly Rental	1 week	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance					
CDW/LDW Insurance					
Monthly Rental	1 month	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance					
CDW/LDW Insurance					

ITEM 12 - INTERMEDIATE SUV					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 312.00	\$ 312.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,144.00	\$ 1,144.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 13 - INTERMEDIATE HYBRID SUV					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 52.00	\$ 52.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 312.00	\$ 312.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,144.00	\$ 1,144.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 14 - STANDARD SUV					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 56.00	\$ 56.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 336.00	\$ 336.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,232.00	\$ 1,232.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 15 - LARGE SUV					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 540.00	\$ 540.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,776.00	\$ 1,776.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 16 - FULL SIZE SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 210.00	\$ 210.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 770.00	\$ 770.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 17 - STANDARD SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 204.00	\$ 204.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 748.00	\$ 748.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 18 - STANDARD HYBRID SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Daily Rental	1 day	36.00	\$ 36.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 216.00	\$ 216.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 792.00	\$ 792.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 19 - INTERMEDIATE SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 204.00	\$ 204.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 748.00	\$ 748.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

ITEM 20 - SMALL PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 21 - SMALL PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2 WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 22 - SMALL PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 360.00	\$ 360.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 23 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2 WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 24 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2 WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 25 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2 WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 450.00	\$ 450.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 1,650.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 26 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 510.00	\$ 510.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,700.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 27 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2WD					

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 510.00	\$ 510.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,700.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 28 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 510.00	\$ 510.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 1,700.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 29 - ONE TON PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 30 - ONE (1) TON PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 31 - ONE (1) TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2WD					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 570.00	\$ 570.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 1,750.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
ITEM 32 - SPECIALTY VEHICLE					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 80.00	\$ 80.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 480.00	\$ 480.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 1,760.00	\$ 1,760.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION: I SHORT-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION	RATE per D/W/M	EXTENSION
ITEM 33 - OTHER VEHICLES OFFERED					
Daily Rental	1 day	\$ 33.00	\$ 33.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Weekly Rental	1 week	\$ 196.00	\$ 196.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Monthly Rental	1 month	\$ 725.00	\$ 725.00	NO BID	NO BID
Liability Insurance			Included		
CDW/LDW Insurance			Included		
Example of Make/Model: Hyundai Accent					

Primary: EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 1 - SMALL PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 925.00	\$ 11,100.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 2 - SMALL PICKUP truck, EXTENDED CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 925.00	\$ 11,100.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 3 - SMALL PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 925.00	\$ 11,100.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 4 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 975.00	\$ 11,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 5 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 975.00	\$ 11,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 6 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 4 Vehicles	\$ 975.00	\$ 46,800.00	\$ 775.00	\$ 37,200.00
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		2500
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		0.25

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 7 - 1/2 TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB 4X4					
Monthly Rental	12 months 4 Vehicles	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 52,800.00	\$ 775.00	\$ 37,200.00
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		2500
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		0.25

ITEM 8 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 13,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 9 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 13,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 10 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 13,200.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 11,400.00
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		2500
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		0.25

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 11 - ONE (1) TON PICKUP TRUCK, REGULAR CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 20,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 12 - ONE (1) TON PICKUP TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 20,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 13 - ONE (1) TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 2 WD					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 20,400.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 15,000.00
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		2500
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		0.25

ITEM 14 - 3/4 TON PICKUP TRUCK, CREW CAB, 4 X 4					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,700.00	\$ 20,400.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 11,400.00
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		2500
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		0.25

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 15 - INTERMEDIATE SUV					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 16 - INTERMEDIATE HYBRID SUV					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 17 - STANDARD SUV					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 12,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 18 - LARGE SUV					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,375.00	\$ 16,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 19 - STANDARD SUV, 4 X 4					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,075.00	\$ 12,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 20 - FULL SIZE SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 775.00	\$ 9,300.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 21 - STANDARD SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 750.00	\$ 9,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		
ITEM 22 - STANDARD HYBRID SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 775.00	\$ 9,300.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 23 - INTERMEDIATE SEDAN, 4-DOOR					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 745.00	\$ 8,940.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 24 - SPECIALTY VEHICLE					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,740.00	\$ 20,880.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 25 - MINI VAN, 7-PASSENGER WITH STOW AWAY SEATS OR SEATS REMOVED					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 900.00	\$ 10,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 26 - MINI VAN, 7-PASSENGER WITH REAR SEATS					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 900.00	\$ 10,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 27 - FULL SIZE VAN, 8-PASSENGER					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 13,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 28 - STANDARD VAN, 12-PASSENGER					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 14,400.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 29 - FULL SIZE VAN, 15-PASSENGER					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 13,200.00
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		2500
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		0.25

ITEM 30 - MINI CARGO VAN					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 31 - 1/2 TON CARGO VAN					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		
ITEM 32 - 3/4 TON CARGO VAN					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No	Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No		
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION
ITEM 33 - 3/4 TON CARGO VAN, EXTENDED					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		

ITEM 34 - ONE (1) TON CARGO VAN					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:				
	Price Per Mile above allowance:				

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor

2018-185 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM AND LONG-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS, AND VANS

SECTION II: LONG-TERM RENTAL

		EAN Holdings, LLC d/b/a Enterprise Rent-A-Car Irving, TX COOP - Yes HUB - No		Capps Rent-A-Car, Inc. Dallas, TX COOP - Yes HUB: No	
DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION	MONTHLY RATE	EXTENSION

ITEM 35 - ONE (1) TON CARGO VAN, EXTENDED					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:				
	Price Per Mile above allowance:				

ITEM 36 - OTHER VEHICLES OFFERED					
Monthly Rental	12 months 1 Vehicle	\$ 725.00	\$ 8,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mileage Charge	Miles allowed per month:		3000		
	Price Per Mile above allowance:		0.15		
Example of Make/Model Bid:	Hyundai Accent				

Primary Vendor
Secondary Vendor