

## BID NO. 2018-170, Annual Contract for the Purchase of Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor

			ASCO Equipment			Bane Machinery		
			Eules, TX			Fort Worth, TX		
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES		HUB - NO	COOP - YES	
Item No.	Description	Est. Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Model Number	Delivery ARO	Unit Price	Model Number	Delivery ARO
<b>Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory</b>								
1.	22,500 - 25,999 lbs	0-5	<b>PRIMARY 2 \$121,580.00</b>	<b>Case SV212</b>	<b>90 Days</b>	\$119143.00*	Dynapac CA2500PD	90 Days
1A	22,500 - 25,999 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	<b>PRIMARY 1 \$121,580.00</b>	<b>Case SV212</b>	<b>90 Days</b>	\$139621.00*	Dynapac CA2500PD	90 Days
2.	26,000 - 28,499 lbs	0-5	\$121580.00*	Case SV212	90 Days	\$137278.00*	Dynapac CA3500PD	90 Days
2A	26,000 - 28,499 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	\$121580.00*	Case SV212	90 Days	\$157756.00*	Dynapac CA3500PD	90 Days
3	28,500 - 30,000 lbs	0-5	\$144080.00*	Case SV216	90 Days	<b>PRIMARY 2 \$196,823.00</b>	<b>Dynapac CA4600PD</b>	<b>260 Days</b>
3A	28,500 - 30,000 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	\$144080.00*	Case SV216	90 Days	<b>PRIMARY 2 \$217,301.00</b>	<b>Dynapac CA4600PD</b>	<b>260 Days</b>

### Item 1 & 1A

- (\*) Bane Machinery did not meet specifications for operating weight or weight at drum.
- (\*) RDO Equipment did not meet specifications for weight at drum.

### Item 2 & 2A

- (\*) ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for operating weight or weight at drum.
- (\*) Bane Machinery did not meet specifications for the engine liter.
- (\*) RB Everett did not meet specifications for weight at drum or the engine liter.

### Item 3 & 3A

- (\*) ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for weight at drum.
- (\*) Holt Caterpillar did not meet specifications for the maximum height.

## BID NO. 2018-170, Annual Contract for the Purchase of Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor

			Holt Caterpillar			RB Everett		
			San Antonio, TX			Haltom City, TX		
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES		HUB - NO	COOP - YES	
Item No.	Description	Est. Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Model Number	Delivery ARO	Unit Price	Model Number	Delivery ARO
<b>Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory</b>								
1.	22,500 - 25,999 lbs	0-5	\$152,950.34	CAT CP54B	7 Days	<b>PRIMARY 1 \$115,685.00</b>	<b>Bomag BW211PD-5</b>	<b>14 Days</b>
1A	22,500 - 25,999 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	<b>PRIMARY 3 \$167,113.47.0 0</b>	<b>CATCP56B</b>	<b>7 Days</b>	No Bid	N/A	N/A
2.	26,000 - 28,499 lbs	0-5	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$129208.00*	Bomag BW211PDH-5	60 Days
2A	26,000 - 28,499 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	No Bid	N/A	N/A	\$145790.00*	Bomag BW211PDH-5	90 Days
3	28,500 - 30,000 lbs	0-5	\$219107.16*	CAT CP68B	150 Days	<b>PRIAMRY 1 \$146,389.00</b>	<b>Bomag BW213PDH-5</b>	<b>21 Days</b>
3A	28,500 - 30,000 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	\$227.058.26*	CAT CP74B	150 Days	<b>PRIMARY 1 \$16,3610.00</b>	<b>Bomag BW213PDH-5</b>	<b>90 Days</b>

### Item 1 & 1A

- (\*) Bane Machinery did not meet specifications for operating weight or weight at drum.
- (\*) RDO Equipment did not meet specifications for weight at drum.

### Item 2 & 2A

- (\*) ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for operating weight or weight at drum.
- (\*) Bane Machinery did not meet specifications for the engine liter.
- (\*) RB Everett did not meet specifications for weight at drum or the engine liter.

### Item 3 & 3A

- (\*) ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for weight at drum.
- (\*) Holt Caterpillar did not meet specifications for the maximum height.

## BID NO. 2018-170, Annual Contract for the Purchase of Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory Compactor

			RDO Equipment			Romco Equipment		
			Fort Worth, TX			Carrollton, TX		
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES		HUB - NO	COOP - YES	
Item No.	Description	Est. Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Model Number	Delivery ARO	Unit Price	Model Number	Delivery ARO
<b>Single Drum Padfoot Vibratory</b>								
1.	22,500 - 25,999 lbs	0-5	\$145700.00*	Sakai SV544T	120 Days	<b>PRIMARY 3 \$140,465.00</b>	<b>Volvo SD115BF</b>	<b>30-60 Days</b>
1A	22,500 - 25,999 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	\$159200.00*	Sakai SV544T	120 Days	<b>PRIMARY 2 \$129,882.00</b>	<b>Volvo SD115BF</b>	<b>30-60 Days</b>
2.	26,000 - 28,499 lbs	0-5	No Bid	N/A	N/A	No Bid	N/A	N/A
2A	26,000 - 28,499 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	No Bid	N/A	N/A	No Bid	N/A	N/A
3	28,500 - 30,000 lbs	0-5	No Bid	N/A	N/A	No Bid	N/A	N/A
3A	28,500 - 30,000 lbs with Strike Off Blade	0-5	No Bid	N/A	N/A	No Bid	N/A	N/A

### Item 1 & 1A

- (\*) Bane Machinery did not meet specifications for operating weight or weight at drum.
- (\*) RDO Equipment did not meet specifications for weight at drum.

### Item 2 & 2A

- (\*) ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for operating weight or weight at drum.
- (\*) Bane Machinery did not meet specifications for the engine liter.
- (\*) RB Everett did not meet specifications for weight at drum or the engine liter.

### Item 3 & 3A

- (\*) ASCO Equipment did not meet specifications for weight at drum.
- (\*) Holt Caterpillar did not meet specifications for the maximum height.