

Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Award Recommendation

Section One: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within Tarrant County:

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Emulsions - CRS-2/CRS-2H	27,000 GL	\$2.20	\$59,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Emulsions - CSS-1H	13,500 GL	\$2.25	\$30,375.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2a	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70% water, 30% Product)	32,500 GL	\$0.89	\$28,925.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2b	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (60% water, 40% Product)	100 GL	\$1.08	\$108.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2c	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (20% water, 80% Product)	15,000 GL	\$1.86	\$27,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2d	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (30% water, 70% Product)	15,000 GL	\$1.67	\$25,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP)	2,000 GL	\$2.70	\$5,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3a	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted, (70% water, 30% product)	100 GL	\$1.02	\$102.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3b	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted, (20% water, 80% product)	20,000 GL	\$2.22	\$44,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3c	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted, (30% water, 70% product)	20,000 GL	\$1.98	\$39,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-1P	100 GL	\$2.75*	\$275.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-2P	100 GL	\$2.55	\$255.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Water, per Specifications on Page 15	20,000 GL	\$0.30	\$6,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	CRS-2+ (MAC-150)	100 GL	\$2.45	\$245.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	eFog (FasBlack)	100 GL	\$2.40**	\$240.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total Bid Amount for Section One:			\$268,275.00		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount for items not listed:			0%		N/A		N/A	
Minimum Pick-Up Amount:			N/A		N/A		N/A	
Added cost if below minimum:			N/A		N/A		N/A	
Location of plant:			600 Minton Road Saginaw, TX 76179		N/A		N/A	
Loading Hours:			8a-5p		N/A		N/A	

Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Award Recommendation

Section One: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within Tarrant County:

Item	Description	Est. Qty	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
	Pump Charges:		N/A		N/A		N/A	

Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Award Recommendation

Section One: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within Tarrant County:

Item	Description	Est. Qty	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
	Demurrage Charge		N/A		N/A		N/A	

(*) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: CRS-1P is only available from the Lubbock facility.
Lubbock Facility: 1611 Marshall Street, Lubbock, TX 79403

(**) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: eFog (FasBlack) is only available from the Pleasanton facility
Pleasanton Facility: 907 Second Street, Pleasanton, TX 78064

**Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions
Award Recommendation**

Section Two: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within 125 Mile Radius of Tarrant County

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Emulsions - CRS-2/CRS-2H	100 GL	\$2.20	\$220.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Emulsions - CSS-1H	100 GL	\$2.25	\$225.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2a	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70% water, 30% Product)	100 GL	\$0.89	\$89.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2b	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (60% water, 40% Product)	100 GL	\$1.08	\$108.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2c	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (20% water, 80% Product)	15,000 GL	\$1.86	\$27,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2d	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (30% water, 70% Product)	15,000 GL	\$1.67	\$25,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP)	100 GL	\$2.70	\$270.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3a	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted, (70% water, 30% product)	100 GL	\$1.02	\$102.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3b	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted, (20% water, 80% product)	20,000 GL	\$2.22	\$44,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3c	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted, (30% water, 70% product)	20,000 GL	\$1.98	\$39,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-1P	100 GL	\$2.75*	\$275.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-2P	100 GL	\$2.55	\$255.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Water, per Specifications on Page 15	20,000 GL	\$0.30	\$6,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	CRS-2+ (MAC-150)	100 GL	\$2.45	\$245.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions
Award Recommendation**

Section Two: Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Origin - Provider Storage, Pick-Up Within 125 Mile Radius of Tarrant County

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
5	eFog (FasBlack)	100 GL	\$2.40**	\$240.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Total Bid Amount for Section Two:			\$144,979.00		No Bid		No Bid	
Discount for items not listed:			0%		N/A		N/A	
Minimum Pick-Up Amount:			N/A		N/A		N/A	
Added cost if below minimum:			N/A		N/A		N/A	
Location of plant:			4648 Western Way Temple, TX 76504		N/A		N/A	
Loading Hours:			8a-5p		N/A		N/A	
Pump Charges:			N/A		N/A		N/A	
Demurrage Charge:			N/A		N/A		N/A	

(*) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: CRS-1P is only available from the Lubbock facility.

Lubbock Facility: 1611 Marshall Street, Lubbock, TX 79403

(**) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: eFog (FasBlack) is only available from the Pleasanton facility

Pleasanton Facility: 907 Second Street, Pleasanton, TX 78064

Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Award Recommendation

Section Three: Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Destination - Within Tarrant County

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Emulsions - CRS-2/CRS-2H	100 GL	\$2.34	\$234.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.60	\$260.00
2	Emulsions -CSS-1H	100 GL	\$2.39	\$239.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.70	\$270.00
2a	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70% water, 30% product)	100 GL	\$1.03	\$103.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.12	\$212.00
2b	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (60% water, 40% product)	100 GL	\$1.22	\$122.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.94	\$194.00
3	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP)	100 GL	\$2.84	\$284.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3a	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted (70% water, 30% product)	100 GL	\$1.16	\$116.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3b	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted (60% water, 40% product)	100 GL	\$1.40	\$140.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-1P	100 GL	\$3.08*	\$308.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-2P	100 GL	\$2.69	\$269.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.05	\$305.00
5	Water, per specifications on Page 15	100 GL	\$0.30	\$30.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.55	\$55.00
5	CRS-2+ (MAC-150)	100 GL	2.59	259.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	eFog (FasBlack)	100 GL	\$2.73**	273.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	TR-Fog	101 GL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.60	\$260.00
Total Bid Amount for Section Three:			\$2,377.00		No Bid		\$1,556.00	
Discount for items not listed:			0%		N/A		0%	
Minimum Delivery Amount:			5,500 Gallon		N/A		5,500 Gallon	
Added cost if below minimum:			See additional note below***		N/A		\$0.30 Per 'Empty' Gallon	
Location of plant:			600 Minton Road Saginaw, TX 76179		N/A		1505 Custer Road Brownwood, TX 76801	
Delivery Hours:			8a-5p		N/A		24 Hours	
Pump Charges:			\$90.00 per load		N/A		\$150.00 Per Load	

**Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions
Award Recommendation**

Section Three: Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Destination - Within Tarrant County

Item	Description	Est. Qty	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
	Demurrage Charge		\$80.00/hr after 2 hours		N/A		\$80.00/hr after 2 hours	

(*) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: CRS-1P is only available from the Lubbock facility.
Lubbock Facility: 1611 Marshall Street, Lubbock, TX 79403

(**) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: eFog (FasBlack) is only available from the Pleasanton facility
Pleasanton Facility: 907 Second Street, Pleasanton, TX 78064

(***) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: Tarrant County would be charged for the actual number of gallons of product ordered plus freight on the full 5,500 gallons (From Saginaw \$0.14/gal x 5,500= \$770.00 in freight alone).
Minimum freight from other facilities is \$1,815.00.

Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions

Award Recommendation

Section Four: Less Than Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Destination within Tarrant County

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	Emulsions - CRS-2/CRS-2H	100 GL	\$2.34	\$234.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.80	\$280.00
2	Emulsions -CSS-1H	100 GL	\$2.39	\$239.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.90	\$290.00
2a	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (70% water, 30% product)	100 GL	\$1.03	\$103.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.32	\$232.00
2b	Emulsions - CSS-1H, Diluted (60% water, 40% product)	100 GL	\$1.22	\$122.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.14	\$214.00
3	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP)	100 GL	\$2.84	\$284.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3a	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted (70% water, 30% product)	100 GL	\$1.16	\$116.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3b	Asphalt Emulsified Prime (AEP), Diluted (60% water, 40% product)	100 GL	\$1.40	\$140.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-1P	100 GL	\$3.08*	\$308.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Emulsions - CRS-2P	100 GL	\$2.69	\$269.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.25	\$325.00
5	Water, Per Specifications on Page 15	100 GL	\$0.30	\$30.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.75	\$75.00
5	CRS-2+ (MAC-150)	100 GL	\$2.59	\$259.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	eFog (FasBlack)	100 GL	\$2.73**	\$273.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	TR-Fog	101 GL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.80	\$280.00
Total Bid Amount for Section Four:			\$2,377.00		No Bid		\$1,696.00	
Discount for items not listed:			0%		N/A		0%	
Minimum Delivery Amount:			5,500 Gallons		N/A		3000 Gallon	
Added cost if below minimum:			See additional note below***		N/A		\$0.50 Per 'Empty' Gallon	
Location of plant:			600 Minton Road Saginaw, TX 76179		N/A		1505 Custer Road Brownwood, TX 76801	
Delivery Hours:			8a-5p		N/A		24 hours	
Pump Charges:			\$90.00 per load		N/A		Per Load	
Demurrage Charge:			\$80.00/hr after 2 hours		N/A		\$80.00/hr after 2 hours	

**Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions
Award Recommendation**

Section Four: Less Than Tank Transport Loads Delivered: FOB Destination within Tarrant County

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX			P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX			Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	

(*) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: CRS-1P is only available from the Lubbock facility.
Lubbock Facility: 1611 Marshall Street, Lubbock, TX 79403

(**) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: eFog (FasBlack) is only available from the Pleasanton facility
Pleasanton Facility: 907 Second Street, Pleasanton, TX 78064

(***) Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.: Tarrant County would be charged for the actual number of gallons of product ordered plus freight on the full 5,500 gallons (From Saginaw \$0.14/gal x 5,500= \$770.00 in freight alone).
Minimum freight from other facilities is \$1,815.00.

**Bid No. 2018-166, Annual Contract for Emulsions
Award Recommendation
Section Five: Product; Less Than Transport Loads: FOB Plant**

			Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Austin, TX		P2 Emulsion Plants, LLC Elm Mott, TX		Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC Houston, TX	
			HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes	HUB - No	COOP - Yes
Item	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	P2 Prime Lucky 7-RTU	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.20	\$120.00	No Bid	No Bid
2	P2 Tack 41 RTU	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.65	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid
3	P2 Prime 11 Concentrate	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.99	\$199.00	No Bid	No Bid
4	P2 Stabilizer	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.44	\$244.00	No Bid	No Bid
5	P2 Rejuvenator	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.47	\$247.00	No Bid	No Bid
6	CWE-2	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.74	\$274.00	No Bid	No Bid
7	CWP (Cold Weather Patch)	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.74	\$274.00	No Bid	No Bid
8	ROC (Road Over Coat)	100 GL	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.57	\$257.00	No Bid	No Bid
Total Bid Amount for Section Five:			No Bid		\$1,780.00		No Bid	
Discount for items not listed:			N/A		0%		N/A	
Minimum Pick-Up Amount:			N/A		5000 Gallon		N/A	
Added cost if below minimum:			N/A		Only pertains to delivery		N/A	
Location of plant:			N/A		516 S. McLennan Elm Mott, TX		N/A	
Loading Hours:			N/A		5a-8p		N/A	
Pump Charges:			N/A		\$80.00		N/A	
Demurrage Charge			N/A		\$80.00 - first 2 hours free		N/A	