

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	Austin Asphalt, Inc. Irving, TX		JLB Contracting, LLC Fort Worth, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION I - VIRGIN AGGREGATE MATERIAL			Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
1	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	5,500	\$61.00	\$71.50	\$58.00	\$64.85
2	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	60	\$63.75	\$74.25	No Bid	No Bid
3	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Coarse	40,000	\$64.75	\$75.25	\$58.00	\$64.85
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
4	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
8	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$61.00	\$71.50	No Bid	No Bid
9	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$64.00	\$74.50	No Bid	No Bid
10	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$65.00	\$75.50	No Bid	No Bid
11	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
12	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	60	No Bid	No Bid	\$100.00	\$105.00

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	The Lane Construction Corporation Roanoke, TX		Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company Eules, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION I - VIRGIN AGGREGATE MATERIAL			Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
1	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	5,500	\$50.75	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
2	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	60	\$58.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Milage
3	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Coarse	40,000	\$62.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Milage
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
4	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
8	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$50.75	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
9	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$58.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Milage
10	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$62.00	No Bid	\$61.00	Varies with Milage
11	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.00	Varies with Milage
Patching Material						
12	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	TexasBit Irving, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION I - VIRGIN AGGREGATE MATERIAL			Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
1	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	5,500	\$54.00	Varies with Milage	\$58.00	\$70.50
2	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	60	\$58.00	Varies with Milage	\$58.00	\$70.50
3	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Coarse	40,000	\$57.00	Varies with Milage	\$57.00	\$69.50
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
4	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$80.00	Varies with Milage	\$70.00	No Bid
7	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
8	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$56.00	Varies with Milage	\$61.00	\$73.50
9	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$60.00	Varies with Milage	\$61.00	\$73.50
10	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$59.00	Varies with Milage	\$60.00	\$72.50
11	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
12	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	60	\$97.00	Varies with Milage	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	Austin Asphalt, Inc. Irving, TX		JLB Contracting, LLC Fort Worth, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION II - FRACTIONATED RAP MATERIAL			Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
13	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	16,000	\$53.00	\$63.50	No Bid	No Bid
14	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	0 - Minimal Tons	\$56.00	\$66.50	No Bid	No Bid
15	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Coarse	20,000	\$57.00	\$57.50	No Bid	No Bid
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
16	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
20	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$53.00	\$63.50	No Bid	No Bid
21	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$56.00	\$66.50	No Bid	No Bid
22	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$57.00	\$67.50	No Bid	No Bid
23	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
24	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	The Lane Construction Corporation Roanoke, TX		Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company Eules, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION II - FRACTIONATED RAP MATERIAL			Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
13	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	16,000	\$48.00	No Bid	\$51.00	Varies with Milage
14	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	0 - Minimal Tons	\$49.25	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
15	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Coarse	20,000	\$53.00	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
16	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
20	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$48.00	No Bid	\$51.00	Varies with Milage
21	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$49.25	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
22	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$53.00	No Bid	\$56.00	Varies with Milage
23	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
24	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED USAGE IN TONS	TexasBit Irving, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX	
			HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
SECTION II - FRACTIONATED RAP MATERIAL			Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered	Unit Cost Per Ton Loaded	Unit Cost Per Ton Delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete						
13	Type B; Fine Graded Intermediate Base Course	16,000	\$45.00	Varies with Milage	\$56.00	No Bid
14	Type C; Coarse Graded Surface Course	0 - Minimal Tons	\$49.00	Varies with Milage	\$56.00	No Bid
15	Type D; Fine Graded Surface Coarse	20,000	\$50.00	Varies with Milage	\$55.00	No Bid
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete, Cold Laid						
16	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$68.00	No Bid
19	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Concrete						
20	Type B	0 - Minimal Tons	\$46.00	Varies with Milage	\$59.00	\$71.50
21	Type C	0 - Minimal Tons	\$50.00	Varies with Milage	\$59.00	\$71.50
22	Type D	0 - Minimal Tons	\$51.00	Varies with Milage	\$58.00	\$70.50
23	Type F	0 - Minimal Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Patching Material						
24	High Performance Cold Mix Patching Material	0 - Minimal Tons	\$97.00	Varies with Milage	No Bid	No Bid

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Austin Asphalt, Inc. Irving, TX		JLB Contracting, LLC Fort Worth, TX		The Lane Construction Corporation Roanoke, TX	
		HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
		Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile	Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile	Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile
25	Delivery Charge Per Mile F.O.B. Precinct Garage/Jobsite	\$0.45	\$0.45	\$6.85	\$6.85	No Bid	No Bid
26	Minimum Delivery Charge	\$350.00 /12 Load		\$50.00/hour		No Bid	No Bid
27	Demurrage Charge Per Hour	\$100.00		\$50.00		No Bid	No Bid
28	Discount for Related Items No Specified	0.00%		N/A		No Bid	No Bid
	Plant Location(s)	2301 Austin Rd Fort Worth, TX 76118		7151 Randol Mill Rd. Fort Worth, TX 76124		11801 Harmonson Rd. Justin, TX 76247	

Bid No. 2018-165 Annual Contract for Asphalt Road Surfacing Products

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	Reynolds Asphalt and Construction Company Eules, TX		TexasBit Irving, TX		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX	
		HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES	HUB - NO	COOP - YES
		Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile	Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile	Tandem Truck Ton/Mile	Flowboy Ton/Mile
25	Delivery Charge Per Mile F.O.B. Precinct Garage/Jobsite	\$5.65	\$4.90	\$0.60	\$0.50	N/A	\$0.25
26	Minimum Delivery Charge	12 ton	21 ton	\$6.00		\$275.00	
27	Demurrage Charge Per Hour	\$33.25	\$47.95	\$100.00		\$90.00	
28	Discount for Related Items No Specified	0.00%		No Bid			
	Plant Location(s)	12650 Calloway Cemetery Rd. Eules, TX 76040		1901 Cold Springs Rd. Fort Worth, TX 76102		1111 Gilbert Pit Rd. Millsap, TX 76066	
		10015 Hicks Field Rd. Saginaw, TX 76179		9500 Technology Blvd. Fort Worth, TX 76104			
		617 E. College St. Lewisville, TX 75057		12299 Camp Bowie Blvd. Aledo, TX 76008			