

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
1. Tim Curry Criminal Justice Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	88.00	95.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	88.00	95.00
2. Southeast Annex		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	12.00	12.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	12.00	12.00
3. Northwest Annex		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	15.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	15.00	15.00
4. Tarrant County Family Law Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	68.00	75.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	68.00	75.00
5. Northwest Subcourthouse		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
6. Dick Andersen Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
7. Dionne Phillips Bagsby Southwest Courthouse		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	12.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	12.00	15.00
8. Tarrant County Plaza Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	68.00	75.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	68.00	75.00
9. Scott D. Moore Juvenile Justice Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	60.00	70.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	60.00	70.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
10. Precinct 1 Maintenance Facility		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	14.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	14.00	15.00
11. Precinct 2 Maintenance Facility		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	10.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	10.00	15.00
12. Records Management		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	20.00	18.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	20.00	18.00
13. Criminal Courts Building, Basement, and Jail		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	75.00	85.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	75.00	85.00
14. Lon Evans Corrections Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	80.00	100.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	80.00	100.00
15. Criminal Justice Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	30.00	35.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	30.00	35.00
16. Tom Vandergriff Civil Courts Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	50.00	54.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	50.00	54.00
17. Tarrant County 1895 Courthouse		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	45.00	50.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	45.00	50.00
18. Carpenter Shop		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	7.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	7.00	10.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
19. Subcourthouse at Mansfield		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	15.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	15.00	15.00
20. Medical Examiner Office		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	15.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	15.00	15.00
21. Central Garage		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	6.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	6.00	10.00
22. Premier Street Annex		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	6.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	6.00	10.00
23. Tarrant County Administration Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	45.00	50.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	45.00	50.00
24. Subcourthouse		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	15.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	15.00	15.00
25. Northeast Annex		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	15.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	15.00	15.00
26. Precinct 4 - New Office Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	6.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	6.00	10.00
27. Precinct 4 - Old Office Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	6.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	6.00	10.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
28. Precinct 3 Maintenance Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	15.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	15.00	15.00
29. Election Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	14.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	14.00	15.00
30. Lonnell E. Cooper Community Justice Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	14.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	14.00	10.00
31. Charles F. Griffin Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
32. Miller Avenue Administration Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
33. Green Bay Jail Facility		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	75.00	95.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	75.00	95.00
34. Cold Springs Jail		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	25.00	35.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	25.00	35.00
35. Tarrant County Reproduction/Graphics Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	14.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	14.00	15.00
36. Resource Connection - 1100		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
37. Resource Connection - 1200		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	15.00
38. Resource Connection - 1300		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	10.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	10.00	15.00
39. Resource Connection - 1400		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	10.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	10.00	15.00
40. Resource Connection - 1500		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	12.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	12.00	15.00
41. Resource Connection - 1801		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	6.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	6.00	10.00
42. Resource Connection - 2100		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
43. Resource Connection - 2200		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
44. Resource Connection - 2300		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	10.00	14.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	10.00	14.00
45. Resource Connection - 2400		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	10.00	12.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	10.00	12.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
46. Resource Connection - 2500		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	12.00	15.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	12.00	15.00
47. Resource Connection - 5000		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	6.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	6.00	10.00
48. Resource Connection - 5010		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	5.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	5.00	10.00
49. Resource Connection - 5020		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	5.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	5.00	10.00
50. Resource Connection - 5041		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
51. Resource Connection - 5051		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	12.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	12.00
52. Tarrant County Sign Shop		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	5.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	5.00	10.00
53. Tarrant County Corrections Center		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	250.00	290.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	250.00	290.00
54. 350 West Belknap Jail		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	85.00	95.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	85.00	95.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
55. Sheriff's Dept -- North Patrol Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	7.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	7.00	10.00
56. Sheriff's Dept -- South Patrol Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	7.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	7.00	10.00
57. Sheriff's Dept -- Work Detail Building		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	7.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	7.00	10.00
58. Impound Facility		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	3.00	5.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	3.00	5.00
59. Subcourthouse at Arlington		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	25.00	20.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	25.00	20.00
60. WIC - Arkansas		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
61. WIC - White Settlement		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
62. WIC - Haltom City		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
63. WIC - Euless		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
64. WIC - Fiesta Plaza		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
65. WIC - Randol Mill		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
66. WIC - Lake Worth		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	5.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	5.00	10.00
67. WIC - LaGran Plaza		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
68. WIC - Eastside		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
69. WIC - Mansfield		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
70. WIC - Watauga		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>
DESCRIPTION		
71. WIC - SE Green Oaks Clinic		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
72. WIC - Warehouse		
A. Monthly Cost 8:00 - 5:00	8.00	10.00
B. Monthly Cost after 5:00	8.00	10.00
Total	\$3,192.00	\$3,774.00

SECTION A: TERMITE CONTROL		
Pre-Construction Termite Treatment:		
Price per square foot	\$ 0.20	\$ 0.25
Inclusive Emergency Termite Treatment for:		
Weekend(s) Rate per square foot	\$ 0.20	\$ 0.25
Hourly Rate per square foot	\$ 0.20	\$ 0.25
After-Hours Rate per square foot	\$ 0.20	\$ 0.25
Subterranean Termite Treatment:		
Chemical Soil Treatment		
Minimum Charge for Spot Treatment up to 20 feet	\$ 70.00	\$ 85.00
Cost Per Linear Foot Over 20 feet	\$ 2.65	\$ 3.00
Bait & Monitoring Treatment:		
Minimum Charge for Spot Treatment up to 20 feet	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00
Cost Per Linear Foot Over 20 feet	\$ 2.75	\$ 3.00
Add Rodent Bait Boxes at WIC Clinics	Included	\$ 19.00

BID NO. 2018-158 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR EXTERMINATING / PEST CONTROL AND BEE REMOVAL SERVICES COUNTYWIDE

	Primary	Secondary
VENDOR	Pest Proof Exterminating Dublin, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO	<i>Cantu Enterprises (Dallas), LLC & Cantu Enterprises (Houston), LLC d/b/a/ Cantu Pest Control Addison, TX COOP - YES HUB: NO</i>

SECTION B: BEE REMOVAL SERVICES		
Cost to Capture and Transport Bee Hive:	\$ 500.00	No Bid
Number of Hive(s) Included:	One (1)	No Bid
Additional Cost Per Hive:	\$ 300.00	No Bid
Inclusive Emergency Capture & Transport:		
Weekend(s) Rate:	\$ 500.00	No Bid
Hourly Rate:	N/A	No Bid
After-Hours Rate:	\$ 500.00	No Bid

AWARD RECOMMENDATION:

Primary: Pest Proof Exterminating

Secondary: Cantu Pest Control