

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Cuevas Distribution, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Emergency Medical Products Dublin, OH HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fox Scientific Inc. Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
1	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A464 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.33	\$33.43 - P	NO BID
2	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A949-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.72	\$29.69 - S	NO BID
3	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher HB9823-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$64.17 - P	NO BID	NO BID
4	Acetonitrile, Optima, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A996-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$57.44 - S	\$37.94 - P	NO BID
5	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallon, Stat-Lab High-Def #SL103 ONLY	12 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 Gallon, 4 Gallons/Case, Statlab 6900-1, Leica 3803686, or approved equal	200 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 Gallon, 4 Gallons/Case, Statlab 9500-1, Leica 3803682, or approved equal	200 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8	Applicators, Wooden, Cotton Tipped, 6 in, Non-Sterile, 1000/case, Puritan 806WC or approved equal	50000 Applicators	NO BID	\$0.00400 - S	\$0.00688	NO BID	NO BID
9	Applicators, Wooden, Cotton Tipped 6 in., Sterile, 2/Pack, 100/Box, 10 Boxes per Case, Puritan 258062WC or approved equal	50,000 Applicators	NO BID	\$0.02810	\$0.02356	NO BID	NO BID
10	Aprons, Disposable, 28" x 46", 1.75 mil, 20/Pack, 5 Packs/Case, Kleenguard Breathable, KC 43745 or approved equal	25,000 Aprons	\$0.350 - S	\$0.095**	\$0.408	\$0.371	\$0.044**
11	ART Barrier tips, 20µl, Soft Fit for Rainin 20LTS, 960/Pack, 5 Pack/Case, Thermo Sci 2749	9,600 Tips	\$0.07530 - S	NO BID	\$0.09602	NO BID	NO BID
12	ART Barrier tips, 200 µl, Soft fit for Rainin, 100 & 200LTS, 960/Pack 5 Packs per Case, Thermo Sci 2769	48,000 Tips	\$0.08960 - S	NO BID	\$0.09590	NO BID	NO BID
13	ART Barrier tips, 1000 µl Soft fit for Rainin, 1000LTS, 768/Pack, 4 Packs per Case, Thermo Sci 2779	30,720 Tips	\$0.11070 - S	NO BID	\$0.11687	NO BID	NO BID
14	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/Box, Medline Havaut 60	20000 Blades	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
15	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 Processor, 12/case, Sakura #6045 ONLY	60 Bags	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
16	Benchkote Surface Protectors, 46 x 57cm, 50/Box, Whatman 2300-916	50 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.23 - S	\$2.40	NO BID
17	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-Sterile, 100/Pkg, StatLab CS-B70 or approved equal	20,000 Blades	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.51280	NO BID	NO BID
18	Blades, Microtome, Low-Profile, Sakura Accu-Edge #4689 ONLY	1,200 Blades	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.43 - S	NO BID	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Cuevas Distribution, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Emergency Medical Products Dublin, OH HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fox Scientific Inc. Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
19	Bouffant Caps, 21" blue, 100/Pack 5Packs/Case, Fisher 19-098-915 or approved equal	5,000 Caps	NO BID	\$0.060	\$0.017 - P	NO BID	NO BID
20	Caps, Snapit with Pre-Slit, National Scientific C4011-55, NO SUBS	15,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.286 - S	NO BID	NO BID
21	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer, 6/case, Sakura 9030 ONLY	6 Cases	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
22	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette Printer, Sakura 8170 ONLY	50,000 Cassettes	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.211	NO BID	NO BID
23	Chloroform, Stabilized, OmniSolv®, 99.8% min, 4 Liter Amber Bottles, 4 x 4L per Case, VWR EMCX10591, or approved equal	100 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$54.79 - P	NO BID
24	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" height, Fisher 14-955-117A or equal	20,000 Containers	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.374	\$0.399	NO BID
25	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 86 oz., 7.47" height, Fisher 14-955-120A or approved equal	1,500 Containers	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.18	NO BID	NO BID
26	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 172 oz., 6.98" height, Fisher 14-955-121A or approved equal	500 Containers	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.27 - P	\$2.51	NO BID
27	Duster, Aerosol, 11 oz., 6 per Case, Fisher 23-022523	180 Cans	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.76	NO BID	NO BID
28	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mm, 1,000 Tips, Eppendorf 022492039, NO SUBS	125,000 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.044 - P	NO BID	NO BID
29	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53 mm, 1,000 Tips, Equivalent to Eppendorf 022492039	50000	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.04	NO BID	NO BID
30	Ethyl acetate, Optima, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher E196-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$48.453 - P	NO BID	NO BID
31	Face Shields, Full Length, 25/Pack, 4 Packs/Case, Fisher 19181600A, or approved equal	10,000 Shields	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.48 - P	NO BID	NO BID
32	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/cs, Sakura #4770 ONLY	20 Rolls	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
33	Filter, Fume, Carbon, 2/case, Sakura 6160 ONLY	6 Filters	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
34	Formaguard Pads, Small 8 x 10, 25/pack, Statlab FXG0810 or approved equal	3,125 Pads	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
35	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gal cubitainer, Statlab 286005, Cubitainer ONLY	300 Cubes	NO BID	NO BID	\$27.00	NO BID	NO BID
36	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 gal cubitainer, Statlab 286205, Cubitainer ONLY	40 Cubes	NO BID	NO BID	\$53.94 - S	NO BID	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Cuevas Distribution, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Emergency Medical Products Dublin, OH HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fox Scientific Inc. Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
37	FTA Micro Card, White, 100/pack, Whatman WB20210	10,000 Cards	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.64 - S	\$2.88	NO BID
38	Gauze Sponges, 2 x 2 in., 12 ply, 200/Pack, 225 Packs per Case, Fisher 22-362-178 or approved equal	125,000 Sponges	NO BID	\$0.00570	\$0.00441 - P	NO BID	NO BID
39	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 10 x 75 mm, 1000/case, VWR 47728-568 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02500	NO BID
40	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mm, 1000/case, VWR 47729-570 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02800	NO BID
41	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 15 x 85 mm, 1000/case, Fisher 14-961-28 or approved equal	50,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.051	\$0.050 - S	NO BID
42	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mm, 1000/case, Fisher 14-961-29 or approved equal	50,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.046 - S	\$0.052	NO BID
43	Gowns, Isolation, Universal Size, Blue, 50/case, Dupont 1200PG or approved equal	500 Gowns	NO BID	\$0.49**	\$0.64	NO BID	NO BID
44	Gloves, Latex, Powder-Free, Blue, 11.8" Length, Textured fingertips, Beaded Cuff. Palm Thickness Range: 10.5 - 12.0 mil; Finger Thickness Range: 14.0 - 15.5 mil; Sizes: Small-XL, Microflex SG-375 or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	\$0.132 - P	\$0.236	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
45	Gloves, Exam, Nitrile, Powder-Free, 9.5" L, Textured Fingertips, Beaded Cuff. Min Thickness: PALM - 4.7 mil; FINGER - 5.9 mil; CUFF - 3.5 mil; Sizes: Small-XL, Kimberly Clark/Halyard Safeskin or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	NO BID	\$0.073 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.040**
46	Gloves, Exam, Latex, Powder-Free, 11.4" length, Palm Thickness Range: 9.0 - 11.5 mil; Finger Thickness Range: 11.0 - 12.5 mil, Microflex Synetron XXL or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	\$0.132 - P	\$0.206 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
47	Glove, Exam, Nitrile, Steril, with aloe coating, 12" extended cuff, textured, Chemo Safe, Min. Thickness: PALM - 6.7mil; FINGER - 7.5 mil; Sizes: Small-Large	1000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
48	Headspace Crimp Top, 20 mm, Agilent 9301-0718	144,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.107	NO BID	NO BID
49	Headspace Vials, 20 mm, 23 x 75 mm, 20 ml, Kimble 60827A-2375	10,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
50	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 ml, Statlab SL-100 ONLY	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
51	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 liter, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher H292-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.27 - S	\$42.57	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Cuevas Distribution, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Emergency Medical Products Dublin, OH HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fox Scientific Inc. Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
52	Histoprep File Drawers, 2/cs, Fisher 15-182-511A, NO SUBS	100 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.33 - P	NO BID	NO BID
53	KimWipes, 4 1/1 x 8 1/2, KC 34155	672,000 Wipes	\$0.00650 - S	NO BID	\$0.00815	\$0.00886	NO BID
54	Knives, Macro Prep, Disposable, AMT BL5010 or approved equal	2,000 Knives	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
55	Lab Coat, 35 in., Small-Large, Fisherbrand 17-100-889A or approved equal	100 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.12 - P	\$1.962	NO BID
56	Liner, Lab Mat, 20' x 150' Roll, Fisher 1199918 or approved equal	300 Rolls	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.64 - S	\$43.52	NO BID
57	Masks, Particulate Respirator/Surgical, 3M-1860-bx or approved equal	6,000 Masks	NO BID	\$0.806 - P	\$0.819 - S	NO BID	NO BID
58	Masks, Regular Face, Tie-On ONLY	15,000 Masks	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
59	Methanol, OmniSolv, HR-GC Grade, 4 liter, case of 4 x 4L, VWR EMMX04801 or approved equal	100 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.61 - P	NO BID
60	Methylene Chloride, GC Resolv, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher D154-4, or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	\$49.12	\$33.80 - S	NO BID
61	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted with 45 deg. Corners, One Side/End, 75mm x 25mm x 1mm, Statlab 315+ or Sakura 9035 ONLY	375,000 Slides	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
62	Needles, 16 gauge BD Precision Glide, 100/Pack, 6 Packs per Case, BD 305198	80,000 Needles	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.207 - S	NO BID	NO BID
63	Paraffin, Blue Ribbon, 2 lb bags, Leica 3801320	500 Bags	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.36	NO BID	NO BID
64	Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, graduated, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-9CM	5,000 Pipets	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.03 - S	NO BID	NO BID
65	Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, fine point, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-28	48,000 Pipets	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.064 - S	NO BID	NO BID
66	Pipets, Tips, epTIPS 22491539, NO SUBS	48,000 Pipets	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.053 - P	NO BID	NO BID
67	Reagent, Vintage Bluing, 1 gal, Statlab SL102 ONLY	12 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
68	Rulers, Fractional & Metric Rule, 6" & 15 cm, Plastic, Medtech ORC-9789, NO SUBS	1000 Rulers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
69	Scalpel Blades, #22, straight, sterile, Miltrex Surg MIL 4-322 or approved equal	2000 Blades	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
70	Seal, 20 mm LO Magnetic 100/pk, #20-0000 mL or 50700737, NO SUBS	12,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.08 - P	NO BID	NO BID
71	Sheets, Disposable, 40' x 90", Medline NON24335 or approved equal	2,000 Sheets	NO BID	\$0.32 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
72	Shoe Covers, Universal, Fisher 17-100-903 or approved equal	10,000 Each	NO BID	\$0.0495 - P	\$0.0568	NO BID	NO BID
73	Shoe Covers, XL, Fisher 17-100-904 or approved equal	4,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.060 - P	NO BID	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Cuevas Distribution, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Emergency Medical Products Dublin, OH HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fox Scientific Inc. Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
74	Sodium Fluoride, ACS 500G, Cole Parmer AC424325000 or approved equal	50 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.02 - P	NO BID	NO BID
75	Solidifier Spill Control, 15 oz, Safetec 41103 or approved equal	100 Each	NO BID	\$10.15 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
76	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gal, Apex RDO or approved equal	3 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
77	Syringe, 30-35 cc, w/o needle, 50/box, Moore 81843 or approved equal	25,000 Syringes	NO BID	\$0.35 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
78	Syringe, Hamilton 265 gauge, 5.1 cm, volume 10 ul, Hamilton 80366, NO SUBS	150 Syringes	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.58 - S	\$11.86 - P	NO BID
79	Tips, Wide Orifice, 250 ul, Rainin 17001127 ONLY	125,000 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.049 - P	NO BID	NO BID
80	Treosin Stain, 500 ml, Statlab SL93-16 ONLY	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
81	Tubes, Conical Centrifuge with screw tops, 15 ml, Lab Safety Supply 6VMY0 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
82	Tubes, Conical Centrifuge with screw tops, 50 ml, Lab Safety Supply 6VMY2 or approved equal	100,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
83	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36, 5/Bag, 6 bag/cs, Medline MUP2030P or approved equal	9600	NO BID	\$0.287	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
84	Vial Cap, 9mm Screwcap with T/S Septa, Assorted Colors, 100/Pack or 2,000/Pail, Microliter 09-0030, (G,N,B,Y,K,R), or approved equal	100,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.137 - S	NO BID	NO BID
85	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, National Scientific C4011-51, NO SUBS	250,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.16 - S	NO BID	NO BID
86	Vial Inserts, 0.25 ml, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc Vial, 100 per Pack, SUN SRI 500-304	50,000 Inserts	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.43 - P	NO BID	NO BID
87	Vial Inserts, 350 ul, Conical, Pulled-Point, Microliter 09-0000-101	10,000 Inserts	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.35 - P	NO BID	NO BID
88	Vial, 2ml Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat Base, National Scientific C4011-5W, NO SUBS	250,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.14 - S	NO BID	NO BID
89	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw Thread, 100 per Pack, Microliter 09-2200	50,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.175 - S	NO BID	NO BID
90	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw Thread, 100/pack, Microliter 09-1000	50,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.15 - S	NO BID	NO BID
91	Vials, Septa for headspace vials, 20 mm, #C 4020-30	20,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.131 - P	NO BID	NO BID
92	Weigh Boats, 4 x4 , PS 20ml, 500 per Case, VWR 12577-002 or approved equal	5,000 Boats	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.167	NO BID	NO BID
93	Weigh Boats, 9 x 9, 100 ml, 500 per Case, VWR 12577-027 or approved equal	5,000 Boats	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.213	NO BID	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Cuevas Distribution, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Emergency Medical Products Dublin, OH HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Fox Scientific Inc. Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
94	Weigh Canoes, Antistatic, Large, 250/case, VWR 13451-990 or approved equal	2,500 Boats	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
95	Weigh Paper, 3x3, 500/pack, VWR 12578-121 or approved equal	12,500 Papers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00754 - S	NO BID
96	Weigh Paper, 4x4, 500/pack, VWR 12578-166 or approved equal	1,000 Papers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.01070 - S	NO BID
97	Weigh Paper, 6x6, 500/pack, VWR 12578-201 or approved equal	12,500 Papers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02044	NO BID
98	Wipes, Wypall X60, White, 11" x 23", KC 34770 or approved equal	900 Wipes	\$0.141 - P	NO BID	\$0.231	\$0.204	NO BID
99	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", white, Medline MDS133045W or approved equal	25,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
100	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", red, Medline MDS133045R or approved equal	10,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
101	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", yellow, Medline MDS133045Y or approved equal	10,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
102	Xylene, 1 gal, 4 gal/cs, Statlab 8400-1 or Leica 3803665 or approved equal	200 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.24	\$26.79	NO BID

P = Primary

S = Secondary

** Item does not meet specifications

^Specification sheets not provided as required

DWK Life Sciences, Inc and Bob Barker Company were considered non-responsive.

Amerisochi Inc. not considered for award for poor, past vendor performance.

IMEB, Inc. not awarded as they are not willing to accept any secondary awards.

There are no awards for items 29 and 47 because the end-user needs have changed since the bid was published. No award was made for item 83 because no bids meeting specifications were received.

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No COOP - No	M&R Medical Supply Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Magid Glove and Safety Romeoville, IL HUB - No	IMEB, Inc. San Marcos, CA HUB - No	Mercedes Medical Sarasota, FL HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
1	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A464 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$51.00
2	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A949-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$125.00	\$41.00
3	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher HB9823-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$99.25 - S
4	Acetonitrile, Optima, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A996-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$65.00
5	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallon, Stat-Lab High-Def #SL103 ONLY	12 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
6	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 Gallon, 4 Gallons/Case, Statlab 6900-1, Leica 3803686, or approved equal	200 Gallons	\$8.19	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.00	\$8.00 - S
7	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 Gallon, 4 Gallons/Case, Statlab 9500-1, Leica 3803682, or approved equal	200 Gallons	\$8.31	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.00	\$8.00 - S
8	Applicators, Wooden, Cotton Tipped, 6 in, Non-Sterile, 1000/case, Puritan 806WC or approved equal	50000 Applicators	\$0.07750	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.70	\$4.50
9	Applicators, Wooden, Cotton Tipped 6 in., Sterile, 2/Pack, 100/Box, 10 Boxes per Case, Puritan 258062WC or approved equal	50,000 Applicators	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$4.00
10	Aprons, Disposable, 28" x 46", 1.75 mil, 20/Pack, 5 Packs/Case, Kleenguard Breathable, KC 43745 or approved equal	25,000 Aprons	\$0.328 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	NO BID
11	ART Barrier tips, 20µl, Soft Fit for Rainin 20LTS, 960/Pack, 5 Pack/Case, Thermo Sci 2749	9,600 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
12	ART Barrier tips, 200 µl, Soft fit for Rainin, 100 & 200LTS, 960/Pack 5 Packs per Case, Thermo Sci 2769	48,000 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
13	ART Barrier tips, 1000 µl Soft fit for Rainin, 1000LTS, 768/Pack, 4 Packs per Case, Thermo Sci 2779	30,720 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
14	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/Box, Medline Havaut 60	20000 Blades	\$0.73	\$0.47	NO BID	\$18.00	\$33.00
15	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 Processor, 12/case, Sakura #6045 ONLY	60 Bags	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00	NO BID
16	Benchkote Surface Protectors, 46 x 57cm, 50/Box, Whatman 2300-916	50 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
17	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-Sterile, 100/Pkg, StatLab CS-B70 or approved equal	20,000 Blades	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00	NO BID
18	Blades, Microtome, Low-Profile, Sakura Accu-Edge #4689 ONLY	1,200 Blades	\$1.20**	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.90	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No COOP - No	M&R Medical Supply Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Magid Glove and Safety Romeoville, IL HUB - No	IMEB, Inc. San Marcos, CA HUB - No	Mercedes Medical Sarasota, FL HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
19	Buffant Caps, 21" blue, 100/Pack 5Packs/Case, Fisher 19-098-915 or approved equal	5,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$19.00
20	Caps, Snapit with Pre-Slit, National Scientific C4011-55, NO SUBS	15,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
21	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer, 6/case, Sakura 9030 ONLY	6 Cases	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
22	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette Printer, Sakura 8170 ONLY	50,000 Cassettes	\$0.053**	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.11	NO BID
23	Chloroform, Stabilized, OmniSolv®, 99.8% min, 4 Liter Amber Bottles, 4 x 4L per Case, VWR EMCX10591, or approved equal	100 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
24	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" height, Fisher 14-955-117A or equal	20,000 Containers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.22	NO BID
25	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 86 oz., 7.47" height, Fisher 14-955-120A or approved equal	1,500 Containers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.94	NO BID
26	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 172 oz., 6.98" height, Fisher 14-955-121A or approved equal	500 Containers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.75	NO BID
27	Duster, Aerosol, 11 oz., 6 per Case, Fisher 23-022523	180 Cans	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.00	NO BID
28	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mm, 1,000 Tips, Eppendorf 022492039, NO SUBS	125,000 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$58.50
29	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53 mm, 1,000 Tips, Equivalent to Eppendorf 022492039	50000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
30	Ethyl acetate, Optima, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher E196-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$74.75
31	Face Shields, Full Length, 25/Pack, 4 Packs/Case, Fisher 19181600A, or approved equal	10,000 Shields	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
32	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/cs, Sakura #4770 ONLY	20 Rolls	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$165.00	NO BID
33	Filter, Fume, Carbon, 2/case, Sakura 6160 ONLY	6 Filters	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$110.00	NO BID
34	Formaguard Pads, Small 8 x 10, 25/pack, Statlab FXG0810 or approved equal	3,125 Pads	\$1.27	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.80	\$30.00
35	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gal cubitainer, Statlab 286005, Cubitainer ONLY	300 Cubes	\$17.82 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$61.50	NO BID
36	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 gal cubitainer, Statlab 286205, Cubitainer ONLY	40 Cubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$65.50	NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No COOP - No	M&R Medical Supply Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Magid Glove and Safety Romeoville, IL HUB - No	IMEB, Inc. San Marcos, CA HUB - No	Mercedes Medical Sarasota, FL HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
37	FTA Micro Card, White, 100/pack, Whatman WB20210	10,000 Cards	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
38	Gauze Sponges, 2 x 2 in., 12 ply, 200/Pack, 225 Packs per Case, Fisher 22-362-178 or approved equal	125,000 Sponges	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
39	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 10 x 75 mm, 1000/case, VWR 47728-568 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
40	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mm, 1000/case, VWR 47729-570 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
41	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 15 x 85 mm, 1000/case, Fisher 14-961-28 or approved equal	50,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
42	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mm, 1000/case, Fisher 14-961-29 or approved equal	50,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
43	Gowns, Isolation, Universal Size, Blue, 50/case, Dupont 1200PG or approved equal	500 Gowns	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
44	Gloves, Latex, Powder-Free, Blue, 11.8" Length, Textured fingertips, Beaded Cuff. Palm Thickness Range: 10.5 - 12.0 mil; Finger Thickness Range: 14.0 - 15.5 mil; Sizes: Small-XL, Microflex SG-375 or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	NO BID	\$0.492	\$0.26		NO BID
45	Gloves, Exam, Nitrile, Powder-Free, 9.5" L, Textured Fingertips, Beaded Cuff. Min Thickness: PALM - 4.7 mil; FINGER - 5.9 mil; CUFF - 3.5 mil; Sizes: Small-XL, Kimberly Clark/Halyard Safeskin or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	NO BID	\$0.492	\$0.12		\$3.25
46	Gloves, Exam, Latex, Powder-Free, 11.4" length, Palm Thickness Range: 9.0 - 11.5 mil; Finger Thickness Range: 11.0 - 12.5 mil, Microflex Synetron XXL or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	NO BID	\$0.492	\$0.25		NO BID
47	Glove, Exam, Nitrile, Steril, with aloe coating, 12" extended cuff, textured, Chemo Safe, Min. Thickness: PALM - 6.7mil; FINGER - 7.5 mil; Sizes: Small-Large	1000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
48	Headspace Crimp Top, 20 mm, Agilent 9301-0718	144,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
49	Headspace Vials, 20 mm, 23 x 75 mm, 20 ml, Kimble 60827A-2375	10,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
50	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 ml, Statlab SL-100 ONLY	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$40.00	NO BID
51	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 liter, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher H292-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$60.00

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No COOP - No	M&R Medical Supply Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Magid Glove and Safety Romeoville, IL HUB - No	IMEB, Inc. San Marcos, CA HUB - No	Mercedes Medical Sarasota, FL HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
52	Histoprep File Drawers, 2/cs, Fisher 15-182-511A, NO SUBS	100 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
53	KimWipes, 4 1/1 x 8 1/2, KC 34155	672,000 Wipes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.55	\$2.35
54	Knives, Macro Prep, Disposable, AMT BL5010 or approved equal	2,000 Knives	\$463.65**	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.25	NO BID
55	Lab Coat, 35 in., Small-Large, Fisherbrand 17-100-889A or approved equal	100 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$7.00
56	Liner, Lab Mat, 20' x 150' Roll, Fisher 1199918 or approved equal	300 Rolls	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
57	Masks, Particulate Respirator/Surgical, 3M-1860-bx or approved equal	6,000 Masks	NO BID	\$1.15	NO BID		NO BID
58	Masks, Regular Face, Tie-On ONLY	15,000 Masks	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
59	Methanol, OmniSolv, HR-GC Grade, 4 liter, case of 4 x 4L, VWR EMMX04801 or approved equal	100 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$35.00 - S
60	Methylene Chloride, GC Resolv, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher D154-4, or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$85.50
61	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted with 45 deg. Corners, One Side/End, 75mm x 25mm x 1mm, Statlab 315+ or Sakura 9035 ONLY	375,000 Slides	\$0.07**	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.64	NO BID
62	Needles, 16 gauge BD Precision Glide, 100/Pack, 6 Packs per Case, BD 305198	80,000 Needles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
63	Paraffin, Blue Ribbon, 2 lb bags, Leica 3801320	500 Bags	\$6.77 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	NO BID
64	Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, graduated, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-9CM	5,000 Pipets	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
65	Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, fine point, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-28	48,000 Pipets	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
66	Pipets, Tips, epTIPS 22491539, NO SUBS	48,000 Pipets	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
67	Reagent, Vintage Bluing, 1 gal, Statlab SL102 ONLY	12 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.00	NO BID
68	Rulers, Fractional & Metric Rule, 6" & 15 cm, Plastic, Medtech ORC-9789, NO SUBS	1000 Rulers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
69	Scalpel Blades, #22, straight, sterile, Miltrex Surg MIL 4-322 or approved equal	2000 Blades	\$0.30	NO BID	NO BID		\$40.00
70	Seal, 20 mm LO Magnetic 100/pk, #20-0000 mL or 50700737, NO SUBS	12,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
71	Sheets, Disposable, 40' x 90", Medline NON24335 or approved equal	2,000 Sheets	NO BID	\$0.59	NO BID		NO BID
72	Shoe Covers, Universal, Fisher 17-100-903 or approved equal	10,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
73	Shoe Covers, XL, Fisher 17-100-904 or approved equal	4,000 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No COOP - No	M&R Medical Supply Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Magid Glove and Safety Romeoville, IL HUB - No	IMEB, Inc. San Marcos, CA HUB - No	Mercedes Medical Sarasota, FL HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
74	Sodium Fluoride, ACS 500G, Cole Parmer AC424325000 or approved equal	50 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
75	Solidifier Spill Control, 15 oz, Safetec 41103 or approved equal	100 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
76	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gal, Apex RDO or approved equal	3 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$82.00	NO BID
77	Syringe, 30-35 cc, w/o needle, 50/box, Moore 81843 or approved equal	25,000 Syringes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
78	Syringe, Hamilton 265 gauge, 5.1 cm, volume 10 ul, Hamilton 80366, NO SUBS	150 Syringes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
79	Tips, Wide Orifice, 250 ul, Rainin 17001127 ONLY	125,000 Tips	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
80	Treosin Stain, 500 ml, Statlab SL93-16 ONLY	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
81	Tubes, Conical Centrifuge with screw tops, 15 ml, Lab Safety Supply 6VMY0 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.14	NO BID
82	Tubes, Conical Centrifuge with screw tops, 50 ml, Lab Safety Supply 6VMY2 or approved equal	100,000 Tubes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.16	NO BID
83	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36, 5/Bag, 6 bag/cs, Medline MUP2030P or approved equal	9600	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
84	Vial Cap, 9mm Screwcap with T/S Septa, Assorted Colors, 100/Pack or 2,000/Pail, Microliter 09-0030, (G,N,B,Y,K,R), or approved equal	100,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
85	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, National Scientific C4011-51, NO SUBS	250,000 Caps	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
86	Vial Inserts, 0.25 ml, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc Vial, 100 per Pack, SUN SRI 500-304	50,000 Inserts	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
87	Vial Inserts, 350 ul, Conical, Pulled-Point, Microliter 09-0000-101	10,000 Inserts	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
88	Vial, 2ml Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat Base, National Scientific C4011-5W, NO SUBS	250,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
89	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw Thread, 100 per Pack, Microliter 09-2200	50,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
90	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw Thread, 100/pack, Microliter 09-1000	50,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
91	Vials, Septa for headspace vials, 20 mm, #C 4020-30	20,000 Vials	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
92	Weigh Boats, 4 x 4 , PS 20ml, 500 per Case, VWR 12577-002 or approved equal	5,000 Boats	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
93	Weigh Boats, 9 x 9, 100 ml, 500 per Case, VWR 12577-027 or approved equal	5,000 Boats	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No COOP - No	M&R Medical Supply Dallas, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	Magid Glove and Safety Romeoville, IL HUB - No	IMEB, Inc. San Marcos, CA HUB - No	Mercedes Medical Sarasota, FL HUB - Yes COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
94	Weigh Canoes, Antistatic, Large, 250/case, VWR 13451-990 or approved equal	2,500 Boats	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
95	Weigh Paper, 3x3, 500/pack, VWR 12578-121 or approved equal	12,500 Papers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
96	Weigh Paper, 4x4, 500/pack, VWR 12578-166 or approved equal	1,000 Papers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
97	Weigh Paper, 6x6, 500/pack, VWR 12578-201 or approved equal	12,500 Papers	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID
98	Wipes, Wypall X60, White, 11" x 23", KC 34770 or approved equal	900 Wipes	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$155.00	NO BID
99	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", white, Medline MDS133045W or approved equal	25,000 Each	NO BID	\$0.116 - S	NO BID		NO BID
100	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", red, Medline MDS133045R or approved equal	10,000 Each	NO BID	\$0.116 - S	NO BID		NO BID
101	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", yellow, Medline MDS133045Y or approved equal	10,000 Each	NO BID	\$0.116 - S	NO BID		NO BID
102	Xylene, 1 gal, 4 gal/cs, Statlab 8400-1 or Leica 3803665 or approved equal	200 Gallons	\$10.52	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.50	\$9.50 - P

P = Primary

S = Secondary

** Item does not meet specifications

^Specification sheets not provided as required

DWK Life Sciences, Inc and Bob Barker Company were considered non-responsive.

Amerisochi Inc. not considered for award for poor, past vendor performance.

IMEB, Inc. not awarded as they are not willing to accept any secondary awards.

There are no awards for items 29 and 47 because the end-user needs have changed since the bid was published. No award was made for item 83 because no bids meeting specifications were received.

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Premiere Scientific Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	RND Medical Supplies, dba QPS Medicals Marietta, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Statlab Medical Products McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Unipak Corp Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
1	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A464 or approved equal	200 Bottles	\$35.00 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$62.93
2	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A949-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	\$34.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.09 - P
3	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher HB9823-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$106.28
4	Acetonitrile, Optima, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher A996-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	\$112.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$85.22
5	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallon, Stat-Lab High-Def #SL103 ONLY	12 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
6	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 Gallon, 4 Gallons/Case, Statlab 6900-1, Leica 3803686, or approved equal	200 Gallons	\$8.82	NO BID	\$7.50 - P	NO BID	\$8.89
7	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 Gallon, 4 Gallons/Case, Statlab 9500-1, Leica 3803682, or approved equal	200 Gallons	\$8.82	NO BID	\$7.50 - P	NO BID	\$9.18
8	Applicators, Wooden, Cotton Tipped, 6 in, Non-Sterile, 1000/case, Puritan 806WC or approved equal	50000 Applicators	\$0.00373 - P	\$0.04250	\$0.00410	NO BID	\$0.00868
9	Applicators, Wooden, Cotton Tipped 6 in., Sterile, 2/Pack, 100/Box, 10 Boxes per Case, Puritan 258062WC or approved equal	50,000 Applicators	\$0.01535 - S	\$0.01500 - P	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02770
10	Aprons, Disposable, 28" x 46", 1.75 mil, 20/Pack, 5 Packs/Case, Kleenguard Breathable, KC 43745 or approved equal	25,000 Aprons	\$0.220**	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.399
11	ART Barrier tips, 20µl, Soft Fit for Rainin 20LTS, 960/Pack, 5 Pack/Case, Thermo Sci 2749	9,600 Tips	\$0.07500 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.12400
12	ART Barrier tips, 200 µl, Soft fit for Rainin, 100 & 200LTS, 960/Pack 5 Packs per Case, Thermo Sci 2769	48,000 Tips	\$0.07500 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.12500
13	ART Barrier tips, 1000 µl Soft fit for Rainin, 1000LTS, 768/Pack, 4 Packs per Case, Thermo Sci 2779	30,720 Tips	\$0.08900 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.15600
14	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/Box, Medline Havaut 60	20000 Blades	\$0.31 - P	NO BID	\$0.39 - S	NO BID	\$1.64
15	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 Processor, 12/case, Sakura #6045 ONLY	60 Bags	\$7.17 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.77 - P
16	Benchkote Surface Protectors, 46 x 57cm, 50/Box, Whatman 2300-916	50 Each	\$0.27 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.33
17	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-Sterile, 100/Pkg, StatLab CS-B70 or approved equal	20,000 Blades	\$0.33000 - P	NO BID	\$0.49000	NO BID	\$0.33300 - S
18	Blades, Microtome, Low-Profile, Sakura Accu-Edge #4689 ONLY	1,200 Blades	\$1.10**	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.87 - P

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Premiere Scientific Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	RND Medical Supplies, dba QPS Medicals Marietta, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Statlab Medical Products McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Unipak Corp Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
19	Bouffant Caps, 21" blue, 100/Pack 5Packs/Case, Fisher 19-098-915 or approved equal	5,000 Caps	\$0.019 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.022
20	Caps, Snapit with Pre-Slit, National Scientific C4011-55, NO SUBS	15,000 Caps	\$0.188 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.318
21	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer, 6/case, Sakura 9030 ONLY	6 Cases	\$121.00 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$103.14 - P
22	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette Printer, Sakura 8170 ONLY	50,000 Cassettes	\$0.203	NO BID	\$0.095 - P	NO BID	\$0.158 - S
23	Chloroform, Stabilized, OmniSolv®, 99.8% min, 4 Liter Amber Bottles, 4 x 4L per Case, VWR EMCX10591, or approved equal	100 Bottles	\$155.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$91.55 - S
24	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" height, Fisher 14-955-117A or equal	20,000 Containers	\$0.331	NO BID	\$0.320 - S	NO BID	\$0.207 - P
25	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 86 oz., 7.47" height, Fisher 14-955-120A or approved equal	1,500 Containers	\$1.28	NO BID	\$1.04 - S	NO BID	\$0.81 - P
26	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Container is autoclavable, Non-sterile, Translucent, polyethylene, 172 oz., 6.98" height, Fisher 14-955-121A or approved equal	500 Containers	\$2.14	NO BID	\$1.87 - S	NO BID	\$2.27
27	Duster, Aerosol, 11 oz., 6 per Case, Fisher 23-022523	180 Cans	\$6.25 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.82 - S
28	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mm, 1,000 Tips, Eppendorf 022492039, NO SUBS	125,000 Tips	\$0.058	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.047 - S
29	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53 mm, 1,000 Tips, Equivalent to Eppendorf 022492039	50000	\$0.01	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02
30	Ethyl acetate, Optima, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher E196-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	\$80.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$57.00 - S
31	Face Shields, Full Length, 25/Pack, 4 Packs/Case, Fisher 19181600A, or approved equal	10,000 Shields	\$1.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.02 - S
32	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/cs, Sakura #4770 ONLY	20 Rolls	\$160.80 -S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$127.87 - P
33	Filter, Fume, Carbon, 2/case, Sakura 6160 ONLY	6 Filters	\$138.50 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$128.94 - P
34	Formaguard Pads, Small 8 x 10, 25/pack, Statlab FXG0810 or approved equal	3,125 Pads	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.20 - P	NO BID	\$2.08 - S
35	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gal cubitainer, Statlab 286005, Cubitainer ONLY	300 Cubes	\$20.50	NO BID	\$19.00 - S	NO BID	\$20.46
36	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 gal cubitainer, Statlab 286205, Cubitainer ONLY	40 Cubes	\$34.99**	NO BID	\$35.00 - P	NO BID	\$145.95

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Premiere Scientific Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	RND Medical Supplies, dba QPS Medicals Marietta, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Statlab Medical Products McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Unipak Corp Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
37	FTA Micro Card, White, 100/pack, Whatman WB20210	10,000 Cards	\$2.60 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.85
38	Gauze Sponges, 2 x 2 in., 12 ply, 200/Pack, 225 Packs per Case, Fisher 22-362-178 or approved equal	125,000 Sponges	\$0.00530 - S	\$0.00575	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00550
39	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 10 x 75 mm, 1000/case, VWR 47728-568 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	\$0.023 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.021 - P
40	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mm, 1000/case, VWR 47729-570 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	\$0.027 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.023 - P
41	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 15 x 85 mm, 1000/case, Fisher 14-961-28 or approved equal	50,000 Tubes	\$0.082	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.043 - P
42	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mm, 1000/case, Fisher 14-961-29 or approved equal	50,000 Tubes	\$0.057	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.038 - P
43	Gowns, Isolation, Universal Size, Blue, 50/case, Dupont 1200PG or approved equal	500 Gowns	\$0.40 - P	\$0.51 - S	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.68
44	Gloves, Latex, Powder-Free, Blue, 11.8" Length, Textured fingertips, Beaded Cuff. Palm Thickness Range: 10.5 - 12.0 mil; Finger Thickness Range: 14.0 - 15.5 mil; Sizes: Small-XL, Microflex SG-375 or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	\$0.161 - S	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.202	\$0.217
45	Gloves, Exam, Nitrile, Powder-Free, 9.5" L, Textured Fingertips, Beaded Cuff. Min Thickness: PALM - 4.7 mil; FINGER - 5.9 mil; CUFF - 3.5 mil; Sizes: Small-XL, Kimberly Clark/Halyard Safeskin or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	\$0.091 - S	\$0.066^	\$0.040^	\$0.101	\$0.093
46	Gloves, Exam, Latex, Powder-Free, 11.4" length, Palm Thickness Range: 9.0 - 11.5 mil; Finger Thickness Range: 11.0 - 12.5 mil, Microflex Synetron XXL or approved equal	200,000 Gloves	\$0.280	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.190^	\$0.208
47	Glove, Exam, Nitrile, Steril, with aloe coating, 12" extended cuff, textured, Chemo Safe, Min. Thickness: PALM - 6.7mil; FINGER - 7.5 mil; Sizes: Small-Large	1000	\$0.49	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.18	\$0.66
48	Headspace Crimp Top, 20 mm, Agilent 9301-0718	144,000 Each	\$0.072 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.072 - S
49	Headspace Vials, 20 mm, 23 x 75 mm, 20 ml, Kimble 60827A-2375	10,000 Vials	\$0.260 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.268 - S
50	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 ml, Statlab SL-100 ONLY	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
51	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 liter, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher H292-4 or approved equal	200 Bottles	\$53.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.86 - P

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Premiere Scientific Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	RND Medical Supplies, dba QPS Medicals Marietta, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Statlab Medical Products McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Unipak Corp Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
52	Histoprep File Drawers, 2/cs, Fisher 15-182-511A, NO SUBS	100 Each	\$43.00 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
53	KimWipes, 4 1/1 x 8 1/2, KC 34155	672,000 Wipes	\$0.00740	NO BID	\$0.00625 - P	NO BID	\$0.00790
54	Knives, Macro Prep, Disposable, AMT BL5010 or approved equal	2,000 Knives	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.00 - P	NO BID	\$13.20**
55	Lab Coat, 35 in., Small-Large, Fisherbrand 17-100-889A or approved equal	100 Each	\$1.960 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.93
56	Liner, Lab Mat, 20' x 150' Roll, Fisher 1199918 or approved equal	300 Rolls	\$18.75 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.84
57	Masks, Particulate Respirator/Surgical, 3M-1860-bx or approved equal	6,000 Masks	\$0.907	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.950
58	Masks, Regular Face, Tie-On ONLY	15,000 Masks	\$0.07 - P	\$0.11 - S	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.33
59	Methanol, OmniSolv, HR-GC Grade, 4 liter, case of 4 x 4L, VWR EMMX04801 or approved equal	100 Bottles	\$53.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$56.11
60	Methylene Chloride, GC Resolv, 4 Liter Amber Bottle, Case of 4 x 4L, Fisher D154-4, or approved equal	200 Bottles	\$78.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.04 - P
61	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted with 45 deg. Corners, One Side/End, 75mm x 25mm x 1mm, Statlab 315+ or Sakura 9035 ONLY	375,000 Slides	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.06 - P	NO BID	\$0.19 - S
62	Needles, 16 gauge BD Precision Glide, 100/Pack, 6 Packs per Case, BD 305198	80,000 Needles	\$0.181 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.215
63	Paraffin, Blue Ribbon, 2 lb bags, Leica 3801320	500 Bags	\$20.50	NO BID	\$5.63**	NO BID	\$8.42 - S
64	Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, graduated, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-9CM	5,000 Pipets	\$0.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02 - P
65	Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, fine point, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-28	48,000 Pipets	\$0.062 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.068
66	Pipets, Tips, epTIPS 22491539, NO SUBS	48,000 Pipets	\$0.072	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.059 - S
67	Reagent, Vintage Bluing, 1 gal, Statlab SL102 ONLY	12 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
68	Rulers, Fractional & Metric Rule, 6" & 15 cm, Plastic, Medtech ORC-9789, NO SUBS	1000 Rulers	\$1.25 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
69	Scalpel Blades, #22, straight, sterile, Miltrex Surg MIL 4-322 or approved equal	2000 Blades	\$0.11 - P	NO BID	\$0.23 - S	NO BID	\$0.36
70	Seal, 20 mm LO Magnetic 100/pk, #20-0000 mL or 50700737, NO SUBS	12,000 Each	\$0.13	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.09 - S
71	Sheets, Disposable, 40' x 90", Medline NON24335 or approved equal	2,000 Sheets	\$0.50 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.85
72	Shoe Covers, Universal, Fisher 17-100-903 or approved equal	10,000 Each	\$0.0640	\$0.0983	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.0545 - S
73	Shoe Covers, XL, Fisher 17-100-904 or approved equal	4,000 Each	\$0.083 - S	\$0.088	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.084

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Premiere Scientific Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	RND Medical Supplies, dba QPS Medicals Marietta, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Statlab Medical Products McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Unipak Corp Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
74	Sodium Fluoride, ACS 500G, Cole Parmer AC424325000 or approved equal	50 Each	\$82.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.08 - S
75	Solidifier Spill Control, 15 oz, Safetec 41103 or approved equal	100 Each	\$13.78 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.70
76	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gal, Apex RDO or approved equal	3 Gallons	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.00 - P	NO BID	\$23.32 - S
77	Syringe, 30-35 cc, w/o needle, 50/box, Moore 81843 or approved equal	25,000 Syringes	\$0.37 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.55
78	Syringe, Hamilton 265 gauge, 5.1 cm, volume 10 ul, Hamilton 80366, NO SUBS	150 Syringes	\$20.37	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.01
79	Tips, Wide Orifice, 250 ul, Rainin 17001127 ONLY	125,000 Tips	\$0.057 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
80	Treosin Stain, 500 ml, Statlab SL93-16 ONLY	30 Each	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.00 - P	NO BID	NO BID
81	Tubes, Conical Centrifuge with screw tops, 15 ml, Lab Safety Supply 6VMY0 or approved equal	200,000 Tubes	\$0.11 - S	NO BID	\$0.11 - P	NO BID	\$0.37
82	Tubes, Conical Centrifuge with screw tops, 50 ml, Lab Safety Supply 6VMY2 or approved equal	100,000 Tubes	\$0.14 - P	NO BID	\$0.18 - S	NO BID	\$0.51
83	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36, 5/Bag, 6 bag/cs, Medline MUP2030P or approved equal	9600	\$0.220	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.354
84	Vial Cap, 9mm Screwcap with T/S Septa, Assorted Colors, 100/Pack or 2,000/Pail, Microliter 09-0030, (G,N,B,Y,K,R), or approved equal	100,000 Caps	\$0.130 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.226
85	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, National Scientific C4011-51, NO SUBS	250,000 Caps	\$0.13 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.18
86	Vial Inserts, 0.25 ml, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc Vial, 100 per Pack, SUN SRI 500-304	50,000 Inserts	\$0.46	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.45 - S
87	Vial Inserts, 350 ul, Conical, Pulled-Point, Microliter 09-0000-101	10,000 Inserts	\$0.41 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
88	Vial, 2ml Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat Base, National Scientific C4011-5W, NO SUBS	250,000 Vials	\$0.13 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.16
89	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw Thread, 100 per Pack, Microliter 09-2200	50,000 Vials	\$0.165 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.194
90	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw Thread, 100/pack, Microliter 09-1000	50,000 Vials	\$0.13 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.17
91	Vials, Septa for headspace vials, 20 mm, #C 4020-30	20,000 Vials	\$0.134 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.14
92	Weigh Boats, 4 x 4 , PS 20ml, 500 per Case, VWR 12577-002 or approved equal	5,000 Boats	\$0.022 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.015 - P
93	Weigh Boats, 9 x 9, 100 ml, 500 per Case, VWR 12577-027 or approved equal	5,000 Boats	\$0.037 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.027 - P

Bid No. 2018-149 A/C for Medical Examiner Supplies

			Premiere Scientific Grand Prairie, TX HUB - Yes COOP - Yes	RND Medical Supplies, dba QPS Medicals Marietta, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes	Statlab Medical Products McKinney, TX HUB - No COOP - Yes	Unipak Corp Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International LLC Suwanee, GA HUB - No COOP - Yes
Item	Item Description	Qty	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
94	Weigh Canoes, Antistatic, Large, 250/case, VWR 13451-990 or approved equal	2,500 Boats	\$0.08 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.20 - S
95	Weigh Paper, 3x3, 500/pack, VWR 12578-121 or approved equal	12,500 Papers	\$0.00740 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00770
96	Weigh Paper, 4x4, 500/pack, VWR 12578-166 or approved equal	1,000 Papers	\$0.01040 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.01100
97	Weigh Paper, 6x6, 500/pack, VWR 12578-201 or approved equal	12,500 Papers	\$0.01967 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02000 - S
98	Wipes, Wypall X60, White, 11" x 23", KC 34770 or approved equal	900 Wipes	\$0.196 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
99	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", white, Medline MDS133045W or approved equal	25,000 Each	\$0.110 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.220
100	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", red, Medline MDS133045R or approved equal	10,000 Each	\$0.110 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.221
101	Wristbands, write-on, tri-laminate, snap closure, 12", yellow, Medline MDS133045Y or approved equal	10,000 Each	\$0.110 - P	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.221
102	Xylene, 1 gal, 4 gal/cs, Statlab 8400-1 or Leica 3803665 or approved equal	200 Gallons	\$17.20	NO BID	\$10.00 - S	NO BID	\$66.22

P = Primary

S = Secondary

** Item does not meet specifications

^Specification sheets not provided as required

DWK Life Sciences, Inc and Bob Barker Company were considered non-responsive.

Amerisochi Inc. not considered for award for poor, past vendor performance.

IMEB, Inc. not awarded as they are not willing to accept any secondary awards.

There are no awards for items 29 and 47 because the end-user needs have changed since the bid was published. No award was made for item 83 because no bids meeting specifications were received.