

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
	Description	Est. Qty	
	SECTION A - BROTHER		
1	Brother Model DCP-8085DN	6	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
2	Brother IntelliFax 2820	5	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
3	Brother IntelliFax 2840	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
4	Brother IntelliFax 2900	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
5	Brother IntelliFax 2920	7	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
6	Brother IntelliFax 3800	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
7	Brother IntelliFax 4100e	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
8	Brother IntelliFax 4750e	12	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
9	Brother IntelliFax 5750e	3	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
10	Brother IntelliFax MFC 4350	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
11	Brother IntelliFax MFC 7460DN	4	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
12	Brother IntelliFax MFC 7860DW	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
13	Brother Model MFC 8460N	5	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
14	Brother Model MFC 8480N	3	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
15	Brother Model MFC 8500	7	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
16	Brother Model MFC 8710DW	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
17	Brother Model MFC-8860DN	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
18	Brother Model MFC-9325CW	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
19	Brother Model MFC 9440CN	5	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
20	Brother Model MFC 9460CDN	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
21	Brother Model MFC-9970CDW	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
22	Brother Model MFC-L2700DW	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
23	Brother Model MFC-5750	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
24	Brother Model MFC-L5800DW	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
25	Brother Model MFC-L8850CDW	3	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
	SECTION B - CANON		
1	Canon Model Faxphone L190	4	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
2	Canon Model Faxphone LC 3170	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
3	Canon Model LC 9000S	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
4	Canon Image Class MF 216N	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
5	Canon Image Class MF 4570DN	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
6	Canon Image Class MF 4880 DW	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
7	Canon Image Class MF 6160DW	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
	SECTION C - HP		
1	HP LaserJet Pro 400 MFP M425DN	1	\$49.94
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$164.14
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$40.18
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		40%
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		
2	HP LaserJet Pro MFP M426FDN	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
3	HP LaserJet Pro MFP M277DW	6	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
	SECTION D - MURATEC		
1	Muratec Model F150	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
2	Muratec Model F160	3	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
3	Muratec Model F300	6	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
4	Muratec Model F320	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
5	Muratec Model F360	3	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
6	Muratec Model F525	2	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.

RFB 2018-146 Annual Contract for Facsimile and Multifunction Machine Maintenance, Repair and Supplies

	VENDORS		Office Store Depot, Inc. Pasadena, CA HUB - NO COOP - YES
	SECTION E - SAMSUNG		
1	Samsung ProXpress SL-M3370FD	1	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
2	Samsung ProXpress M4070FR	9	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%
3	Samsung Model SCX 5935FN	12	
A	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor and Travel		\$49.94
B	Maintenance Agreement, Including all Parts, Labor, Travel, Supplies and Consumables (Excluding Paper)		\$164.14
C	Labor Cost Per Hour		\$40.18
	Percentage Discount Off Parts List Price		40%

Award to Office Store Depot, Inc.
No BID Received from Southwest Office Solutions, Inc.