

**BID NO. 2018-125 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR U.S., TEXAS, AND
TARRANT COUNTY FLAGS**

AWARD

ABC Flag Acquisition Corp. d/b/a Lone Star Banner & Flags Haltom City, TX HUB: NO COOP - YES	*ConServ Flags Sidney, NE HUB: NO
---	--

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended	Unit Price	Extended
1	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 3 x 5 Polyester	14	\$26.50	\$371.00	\$18.89	\$264.46
2	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 4 x 6, Polyester	16	\$34.75	\$556.00	\$24.89	\$398.24
3	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 5 x 8, Polyester	3	\$51.50	\$154.50	\$34.89	\$104.67
4	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 6 x 10, Polyester	5	\$78.00	\$390.00	\$56.89	\$284.45
5	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 8 x 12, Polyester	3	\$133.00	\$399.00	\$98.89	\$296.67
6	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 3 x 5, Polyester	12	\$21.00	\$252.00	\$22.87	\$274.44
7	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 4 x 6, Polyester	18	\$30.00	\$540.00	\$34.89	\$628.02
8	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 5 x 8, Polyester	3	\$45.00	\$135.00	\$39.89	\$119.67
9	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 6 x 10, Polyester	6	\$75.00	\$450.00	\$99.89	\$599.34
10	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 8 x 12, Polyester	2	\$114.00	\$228.00	\$149.89	\$299.78
11	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 3 x 5, Polyester	12	\$169.00	\$2,028.00	\$49.89	*\$598.68
12	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 4 x 6, Polyester	8	\$199.00	\$1,592.00	\$69.89	*\$559.12
13	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 5 x 8, Polyester	8	\$243.00	\$1,944.00	\$119.89	*\$959.12
14	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 6 x 10, Polyester	4	\$284.00	\$1,136.00	\$159.89	*\$639.56
15	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 8 x 12, Polyester	10	\$329.00	\$3,290.00	\$169.89	*\$1,698.00
16	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 3 x 5, Nylon	14	\$20.00	\$280.00	\$12.89	\$180.46
17	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 4 x 6, Nylon	16	\$27.50	\$440.00	\$17.89	\$286.24
18	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 5 x 8, Nylon	3	\$40.00	\$120.00	\$25.89	\$77.67
19	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 6 x 10, Nylon	5	\$63.00	\$315.00	\$36.89	\$184.45

**BID NO. 2018-125 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR U.S., TEXAS, AND
TARRANT COUNTY FLAGS**

AWARD

ABC Flag Acquisition Corp. d/b/a Lone Star Banner & Flags Haltom City, TX HUB: NO COOP - YES	*ConServ Flags Sidney, NE HUB: NO
---	--

Item No.	Description	Est. Qty	Unit Price	Extended	Unit Price	Extended
20	Flag, Exterior, U.S., 8 x 12, Nylon	3	\$105.00	\$315.00	\$79.89	\$239.67
21	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 3 x 5, Nylon	12	\$16.00	\$192.00	\$15.89	\$190.68
22	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 4 x 6, Nylon	18	\$22.00	\$396.00	\$22.89	\$412.02
23	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 5 x 8, Nylon	3	\$36.00	\$108.00	\$36.89	\$110.67
24	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 6 x 10, Nylon	6	\$53.50	\$321.00	\$62.89	\$377.34
25	Flag, Exterior, Texas, 8 x 12, Nylon	2	\$87.50	\$175.00	\$89.89	\$179.78
26	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 3 x 5, Nylon Appliqué	12	\$154.00	\$1,848.00	No Bid	No Bid
27	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 4 x 6, Nylon Appliqué	8	\$181.00	\$1,448.00	No Bid	No Bid
28	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 5 x 8, Nylon Appliqué	8	\$221.00	\$1,768.00	No Bid	No Bid
29	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 6 x 10, Nylon Appliqué	4	\$259.00	\$1,036.00	No Bid	No Bid
30	Flag, Exterior, Tarrant County, 8 x 12, Nylon Appliqué	10	\$299.00	\$2,990.00	No Bid	No Bid

*NOTE: ConServ Flag was deemed non-responsive for not bidding all line items per specifications, and requiring a minimum order for line items 11 - 15.