

Bid No. 2018-106, Annual Contract for Propane Fuel and Repair or Purchase of Propane Fueling Equipment

			Yellow Rose Propane			Ferrell Gas		
			Cleburne, TX			Grand Prairie, TX		
			HUB No			No		
			CO-OP Yes			Yes		
Item No.	Description	Est. Quantity per Gallon	Plus or Minus	Differential	Extended Price	Plus or Minus	Differential	Extended Price
Section I: Propane Bulk Delivery								
1.	Propane Fuel Bulk Delivery	6,000	Plus	\$0.25	\$1,500.00	Plus	\$0.40	\$2,400.00
Section II: Propane Cylinder Refill								
1.	Propane Cylinder Refill Delivered	100	Plus	\$0.25	\$25.00	Plus	\$0.70	\$70.00
2.	Propane Cylinder Refill at Vendor Locaiton	100	Plus	\$0.25	\$25.00	Plus	\$0.70	\$70.00

Bid No. 2018-106, Annual Contract for Propane Fuel and Repair or Purchase of Propane Fueling Equipment

			Yellow Rose Propane			<i>Ferrell Gas</i>		
			Cleburne, TX			<i>Grand Prairie, TX</i>		
			No			<i>No</i>		
			Yes			<i>Yes</i>		
Item No.	Description	Est. Quantity Each	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Section III: Cylinder Rental								
1.	Propane Cylinder Rental 12lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>
2.	Propane Cylinder Rental 20lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>
3.	Propane Cylinder Rental 30lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>
4.	Propane Cylinder Rental 40lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>
5.	Propane Cylinder Rental 50lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>
6.	Propane Cylinder Rental 60lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>
7.	Propane Cylinder Rental 100lbs.	5	No Charge	No Charge	No Charge	<i>\$0.0328</i>	<i>\$0.2307</i>	<i>\$1.00</i>

Bid No. 2018-106, Annual Contract for Propane Fuel and Repair or Purchase of Propane Fueling Equipment

		Yellow Rose Propane	Ferrell Gas
		Cleburne, TX	Grand Prairie, TX
HUB		No	<i>No</i>
CO-OP		Yes	<i>Yes</i>
Item No.	Description		
Section IV: Propane Fueling Equipment Repair			
1.	Parts Markup Percentage	No Bid	25%
2.	Hourly Labor Rate		
	Normal Business Hours 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m.	No Bid	\$90.00
	After Hours 5:01 p.m. - 7:59 a.m.	No Bid	\$90.00
	Weekend and County Holiday See Attachment A	No Bid	\$90.00
Section V: Propane Fueling Equipment Purchase			
1.	Cylinders	No Bid	25%
2.	Tanks	No Bid	25%