
RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

 Cuevas 
Distribution                                           

Fort Worth, TX                                                
HUB - Yes            

COOP - Yes 

 Emergency 
Medical Products                              

Dublin, OH                                                            
HUB - No                   

COOP - Yes 

 First Choice 
Medical Supply LLC               

Richland, MS                                        
HUB - No                             

COOP - Yes 

 Fisher 
Healthcare                                                 

Houston, TX                                                              
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

Item Item Description Qty Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 Venipuncture Device, Smith/Jelco 4140 or equal 10000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.19835

2 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 1", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4292 or 
equal 5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.26266

3 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 5/8", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4291 or 
equal 8000 NO BID NO BID $0.31420 $0.26871

4 Syringe, 3 cc, 22G x 1", BD 9572 or equal 17600 NO BID $0.09200 - P $0.13220 $0.14338

5 Syringe, 3 cc, 25G x 5/8", BD 9570 or equal 4000 NO BID $0.09200 - S $0.10520 $0.14395

6 Blood Collection Needle, 22G x 1", Kendall/Covidien 
8881216066 or equal 7000 $0.11550 - S $0.11800 $0.11920 $0.15407

7 Blood Collection Set, Winged, 23G x 3/4", BD 367283 or equal 5000 NO BID $1.08400 $0.99880 $1.28780

8 Retractable Syringe with needle, 23G x 1", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10311 or equal 600 NO BID $0.55000 $0.31780 - P $0.07820**

9 Retractable Syringe with needle, 25G x 5/8", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10301 or equal 600 NO BID NO BID $0.31780 - P $0.14940**

10 Lancet, 21G, 2.2mm, Orange, Surgilance SLN240 or equal 15000 NO BID $0.09900 $0.10500 $0.13266

11 Lancet, 23G, 1.8mm, Gray, Surgilance SLN200 or equal 33000 NO BID $0.10000 $0.05670 - P $0.13266

12 Nebulizer, Teleflex Medical Opti-Neb 1732 or equal 200 NO BID $1.02000 $0.93000 $1.19600

13 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 75mm, 3 ml, Green Top, BD 366667 or 
equal 2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.15136

14 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 100mm, 6 ml, Red Top, BD 367815 or 
equal 4000 NO BID $0.13500 $0.14530 $0.18126

15 Vacutainer Tube, K2 EDTA, 13 x 75mm, 4 ml, Lavender Top, 
BD 367844 or equal 3000 NO BID $0.09000 - P $0.22640 $0.24844

16 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 13 x 100mm, 5 ml, Gold 
Top, BD 367986 or equal 10000 NO BID $0.35900 $0.21640 - S $0.37607

17 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 16 x 100mm, 8.5 ml, 
Gray/Tiger Top, BD 367988 or equal 10000 NO BID $0.23500 - S $0.33640 $0.38031



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

 Cuevas 
Distribution                                           

Fort Worth, TX                                                
HUB - Yes            

COOP - Yes 

 Emergency 
Medical Products                              

Dublin, OH                                                            
HUB - No                   

COOP - Yes 

 First Choice 
Medical Supply LLC               

Richland, MS                                        
HUB - No                             

COOP - Yes 

 Fisher 
Healthcare                                                 

Houston, TX                                                              
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

Item Item Description Qty Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

18 Container, Collection, Sharps, 2 gal, Covidien 8970 or equal 320 $3.20000 - S $3.35000 $3.31000 $5.38450

19 Container, Collection, Sharps, 6.9 qt, BD 305489 or equal 100 $6.75000 $6.50000 NO BID $5.81760 - P

20 Container, Collection, Sharps, 8 gal, Covidien 8980 or equal 20 $8.50000** $9.80000 $9.75000 $13.67000

21 Vials, Amber, Plastic, Childproof, 20 dram 540 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.14936 - S

22 Specimen Transport Bag, Fisherbrand 18007 or equal 3000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.02717 - P

23 Container, Specimen, 4 oz., Sterile, Henry Schein 9007431 or 
equal 110000 NO BID $0.13800 $0.13000** $0.19590

24 Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 16 oz. bottle 140 NO BID $1.07000 - S $1.28250 $1.11000

25 Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium, 2-ply, sterile 70000 $0.00720 $0.00700 $0.00520 - S $0.00995

26 Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-sterile 100000 NO BID $0.00300 $0.00280 $0.00366

27 Disposable Probe Cover for Welch Allyn Thermometer, #05031-
101 ONLY 1000 NO BID $0.03500 - S $0.04000 $0.05024

28 Bandages, Adhesive, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515 or 
equal 30000 NO BID $0.01600*** $0.01060** NO BID

29 Bandages, Adhesive, 1" x 3", Stat Strip 15215 or equal 15000 NO BID $0.02700 - S $0.01230** $0.03393

30 Bandages, Adhesive, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3" 40000 NO BID $0.03600 $0.01040** $0.03733

31 Drape Sheet, Exam, 40"x48", Schein 73711 or equal 8000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

32 Gown, Exam, Adult, 30"x42", Schein 73725 or equal 500 NO BID $0.50000 NO BID NO BID

33 Gown, Personal Protection, Tidi 8576 or equal 4300 NO BID $0.73300 $0.96850 $0.98413

34 Crepe Paper, Exam Table, 21"x125", Schein 73741 or equal 700 NO BID $1.46000 - S NO BID NO BID



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

 Cuevas 
Distribution                                           

Fort Worth, TX                                                
HUB - Yes            

COOP - Yes 

 Emergency 
Medical Products                              

Dublin, OH                                                            
HUB - No                   

COOP - Yes 

 First Choice 
Medical Supply LLC               

Richland, MS                                        
HUB - No                             

COOP - Yes 

 Fisher 
Healthcare                                                 

Houston, TX                                                              
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

Item Item Description Qty Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

35 Cape, Exam, Disposable, 30"x21", Schein 73686 or equal 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36 Lubricant, Surgical, 2.7 gm packets, Dynarex 1250 or equal 1728 NO BID $0.04000 $0.03540 NO BID

37 Sanitizer, Hand, Clear Gel, 70% alcohol, 4 oz., Purell 3131626 
or equal 500 NO BID $1.30000** $0.40000** NO BID

38 Spray, Disinfectant, 19 0z. Lysol RAC 74276 or equal 200 $6.27000 $6.15000 - P NO BID $8.77916

39 Disinfectant, Germicidal, Bleach, 128 oz., Clorox 68978 ONLY 20 $18.87500 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

40 Bleach, Regular, 121 oz. bottle, Clorox ONLY 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.09000

41 Wipes, Germicidal, Disposable, Large 6"x6.75", PDI Super 
Sani Cloth Q55172 or equal 100 $8.68000 $5.68000 $5.54000 $5.93083

42 Vaginal Speculum, Small, Welch Allyn 59000 ONLY 200 NO BID NO BID $1.70958 $2.88697

43 Vaginal Speculum, Medium, Welch Allyn 59001 ONLY 200 NO BID NO BID $1.70958 $2.88697

44 Vaginal Speculum, Large, Welch Allyn 59004 ONLY 200 NO BID NO BID $3.03610 $4.42722

45 Pregnancy Test, 20 hcg, Urine 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.98820

46 Exam Glove, Nitrile, PF, Textured, Palm: 3.1mil; Finger: 4.3 mil

47 Exam Glove, Vinyl, LF, PF, Palm: 4.3 mil; Finger: 3.5 mil 950000 $0.03000** $0.02700^ $0.02440^ $0.09025^

48 Exam Glove, Black, Nitrile, Fully textured, Palm: 4.7 mil; 
Finger: 5.5 mil 50000 $0.06000 $0.05800 - P NO BID $0.09493^

P = PRIMARY AWARD                                   S = SECONDARY AWARD
Tie bids received for items 13, 18 and 38

** Does not meet specifications
***Could not provide a sample as requested
^No specification sheets provided as required

No award is being made for item 46



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

1 Venipuncture Device, Smith/Jelco 4140 or equal 10000

2 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 1", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4292 or 
equal 5000

3 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 5/8", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4291 or 
equal 8000

4 Syringe, 3 cc, 22G x 1", BD 9572 or equal 17600

5 Syringe, 3 cc, 25G x 5/8", BD 9570 or equal 4000

6 Blood Collection Needle, 22G x 1", Kendall/Covidien 
8881216066 or equal 7000

7 Blood Collection Set, Winged, 23G x 3/4", BD 367283 or equal 5000

8 Retractable Syringe with needle, 23G x 1", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10311 or equal 600

9 Retractable Syringe with needle, 25G x 5/8", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10301 or equal 600

10 Lancet, 21G, 2.2mm, Orange, Surgilance SLN240 or equal 15000

11 Lancet, 23G, 1.8mm, Gray, Surgilance SLN200 or equal 33000

12 Nebulizer, Teleflex Medical Opti-Neb 1732 or equal 200

13 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 75mm, 3 ml, Green Top, BD 366667 or 
equal 2000

14 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 100mm, 6 ml, Red Top, BD 367815 or 
equal 4000

15 Vacutainer Tube, K2 EDTA, 13 x 75mm, 4 ml, Lavender Top, 
BD 367844 or equal 3000

16 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 13 x 100mm, 5 ml, Gold 
Top, BD 367986 or equal 10000

17 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 16 x 100mm, 8.5 ml, 
Gray/Tiger Top, BD 367988 or equal 10000

 Henry Schein 
Medical                                                         

Melville, NY                                                       
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

 ICS Jail Supplies                                               
Waco, TX                                                                     
HUB - No 

 Interboro 
Packaging Corp.        
Montgomery, NY    

HUB - Yes 

 M&R Medical 
Supply                                        

Dallas, TX                                                          
HUB - Yes            

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$0.20000 NO BID NO BID $0.23764

$0.26000 - S NO BID NO BID $0.30414

$0.26000 - S NO BID NO BID $0.30414

$0.13000 - S NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.13000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.12000 NO BID NO BID $0.16345

$0.99000 NO BID NO BID $1.50250

$0.33000 NO BID NO BID $0.73173

$0.33000 NO BID NO BID $0.73173

$0.07350 - P NO BID NO BID $0.17909

$0.07350 NO BID NO BID $0.17687

$0.96000 NO BID NO BID $4.35000

$0.14800 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.09000 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.09300 - S NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.21000 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.23200 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

18 Container, Collection, Sharps, 2 gal, Covidien 8970 or equal 320

19 Container, Collection, Sharps, 6.9 qt, BD 305489 or equal 100

20 Container, Collection, Sharps, 8 gal, Covidien 8980 or equal 20

21 Vials, Amber, Plastic, Childproof, 20 dram 540

22 Specimen Transport Bag, Fisherbrand 18007 or equal 3000

23 Container, Specimen, 4 oz., Sterile, Henry Schein 9007431 or 
equal 110000

24 Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 16 oz. bottle 140

25 Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium, 2-ply, sterile 70000

26 Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-sterile 100000

27 Disposable Probe Cover for Welch Allyn Thermometer, #05031-
101 ONLY 1000

28 Bandages, Adhesive, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515 or 
equal 30000

29 Bandages, Adhesive, 1" x 3", Stat Strip 15215 or equal 15000

30 Bandages, Adhesive, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3" 40000

31 Drape Sheet, Exam, 40"x48", Schein 73711 or equal 8000

32 Gown, Exam, Adult, 30"x42", Schein 73725 or equal 500

33 Gown, Personal Protection, Tidi 8576 or equal 4300

34 Crepe Paper, Exam Table, 21"x125", Schein 73741 or equal 700

 Henry Schein 
Medical                                                         

Melville, NY                                                       
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

 ICS Jail Supplies                                               
Waco, TX                                                                     
HUB - No 

 Interboro 
Packaging Corp.        
Montgomery, NY    

HUB - Yes 

 M&R Medical 
Supply                                        

Dallas, TX                                                          
HUB - Yes            

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$3.33000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$6.62000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$9.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.09390 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$1.01000 - P $4.39000 NO BID NO BID

$0.00500 - P $0.07990 NO BID NO BID

$0.00230 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.03592 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.16600 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.26360 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.89000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$1.38000 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

35 Cape, Exam, Disposable, 30"x21", Schein 73686 or equal 500

36 Lubricant, Surgical, 2.7 gm packets, Dynarex 1250 or equal 1728

37 Sanitizer, Hand, Clear Gel, 70% alcohol, 4 oz., Purell 3131626 
or equal 500

38 Spray, Disinfectant, 19 0z. Lysol RAC 74276 or equal 200

39 Disinfectant, Germicidal, Bleach, 128 oz., Clorox 68978 ONLY 20

40 Bleach, Regular, 121 oz. bottle, Clorox ONLY 250

41 Wipes, Germicidal, Disposable, Large 6"x6.75", PDI Super 
Sani Cloth Q55172 or equal 100

42 Vaginal Speculum, Small, Welch Allyn 59000 ONLY 200

43 Vaginal Speculum, Medium, Welch Allyn 59001 ONLY 200

44 Vaginal Speculum, Large, Welch Allyn 59004 ONLY 200

45 Pregnancy Test, 20 hcg, Urine 200

46 Exam Glove, Nitrile, PF, Textured, Palm: 3.1mil; Finger: 4.3 mil

47 Exam Glove, Vinyl, LF, PF, Palm: 4.3 mil; Finger: 3.5 mil 950000

48 Exam Glove, Black, Nitrile, Fully textured, Palm: 4.7 mil; 
Finger: 5.5 mil 50000

P = PRIMARY AWARD                                   S = SECONDARY AWARD
Tie bids received for items 13, 18 and 38

** Does not meet specifications
***Could not provide a sample as requested
^No specification sheets provided as required

No award is being made for item 46

 Henry Schein 
Medical                                                         

Melville, NY                                                       
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

 ICS Jail Supplies                                               
Waco, TX                                                                     
HUB - No 

 Interboro 
Packaging Corp.        
Montgomery, NY    

HUB - Yes 

 M&R Medical 
Supply                                        

Dallas, TX                                                          
HUB - Yes            

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$0.14300 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.03500 - S NO BID NO BID NO BID

$1.30000 - P NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID $7.89340 NO BID NO BID

$20.48000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$5.74000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$1.70000 - S NO BID NO BID NO BID

$1.70000 - S NO BID NO BID NO BID

$2.63000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.47000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.03780** $0.03830** $0.03990**

NO BID $0.05930^ $0.04380** $0.15140



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

1 Venipuncture Device, Smith/Jelco 4140 or equal 10000

2 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 1", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4292 or 
equal 5000

3 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 5/8", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4291 or 
equal 8000

4 Syringe, 3 cc, 22G x 1", BD 9572 or equal 17600

5 Syringe, 3 cc, 25G x 5/8", BD 9570 or equal 4000

6 Blood Collection Needle, 22G x 1", Kendall/Covidien 
8881216066 or equal 7000

7 Blood Collection Set, Winged, 23G x 3/4", BD 367283 or equal 5000

8 Retractable Syringe with needle, 23G x 1", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10311 or equal 600

9 Retractable Syringe with needle, 25G x 5/8", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10301 or equal 600

10 Lancet, 21G, 2.2mm, Orange, Surgilance SLN240 or equal 15000

11 Lancet, 23G, 1.8mm, Gray, Surgilance SLN200 or equal 33000

12 Nebulizer, Teleflex Medical Opti-Neb 1732 or equal 200

13 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 75mm, 3 ml, Green Top, BD 366667 or 
equal 2000

14 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 100mm, 6 ml, Red Top, BD 367815 or 
equal 4000

15 Vacutainer Tube, K2 EDTA, 13 x 75mm, 4 ml, Lavender Top, 
BD 367844 or equal 3000

16 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 13 x 100mm, 5 ml, Gold 
Top, BD 367986 or equal 10000

17 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 16 x 100mm, 8.5 ml, 
Gray/Tiger Top, BD 367988 or equal 10000

 McKesson 
Medical-Surgical 

Inc.                                               
Richmond, VA                                                 

HUB - No             
COOP - Yes 

 Medline 
Industries, Inc.                                          
Northfield, IL                                                      

HUB - No                 
COOP - Yes 

 Mercedes 
Medical                                                           

Sarasota, FL                                                                       
HUB - Yes               

COOP - Yes 

 Midwest Medical 
Supply Co., LLC                                                          
Earth City, MO                                                       

HUB - No                
COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$0.14126 - S $0.23859 $0.14000 - P $0.20000

$0.14470** $0.30600 $0.28000 $0.18460 - P

$0.14466** $0.30600 $0.28000 $0.18460 - P

$0.05522*** $0.16456 $0.16000 $0.05000**

$0.06200 - P $0.16456 $0.13000 $0.05000**

$0.06864*** $0.15725 $0.14000 $0.10600 - P

$0.57640 - S $1.53005 $0.40000 - P $0.96000

$0.36862 $0.76562 NO BID $0.31800 - S

$0.37543 $0.76550 NO BID $0.31800 - S

$0.06670** $0.17903 NO BID $0.07400 - S

$0.06410 - S NO BID NO BID $0.07400

$0.81700 NO BID NO BID $0.61000 - P

$0.15078 $0.20836 $0.14000 - P $0.14770

NO BID $0.28357 $0.10000 - S $0.17400

$0.24180 $0.43388 $0.10500 $0.23700

$0.36180 $0.28357 $0.24000 $0.36250

$0.36291 $0.43523 $0.26000 $0.36360



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

18 Container, Collection, Sharps, 2 gal, Covidien 8970 or equal 320

19 Container, Collection, Sharps, 6.9 qt, BD 305489 or equal 100

20 Container, Collection, Sharps, 8 gal, Covidien 8980 or equal 20

21 Vials, Amber, Plastic, Childproof, 20 dram 540

22 Specimen Transport Bag, Fisherbrand 18007 or equal 3000

23 Container, Specimen, 4 oz., Sterile, Henry Schein 9007431 or 
equal 110000

24 Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 16 oz. bottle 140

25 Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium, 2-ply, sterile 70000

26 Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-sterile 100000

27 Disposable Probe Cover for Welch Allyn Thermometer, #05031-
101 ONLY 1000

28 Bandages, Adhesive, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515 or 
equal 30000

29 Bandages, Adhesive, 1" x 3", Stat Strip 15215 or equal 15000

30 Bandages, Adhesive, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3" 40000

31 Drape Sheet, Exam, 40"x48", Schein 73711 or equal 8000

32 Gown, Exam, Adult, 30"x42", Schein 73725 or equal 500

33 Gown, Personal Protection, Tidi 8576 or equal 4300

34 Crepe Paper, Exam Table, 21"x125", Schein 73741 or equal 700

 McKesson 
Medical-Surgical 

Inc.                                               
Richmond, VA                                                 

HUB - No             
COOP - Yes 

 Medline 
Industries, Inc.                                          
Northfield, IL                                                      

HUB - No                 
COOP - Yes 

 Mercedes 
Medical                                                           

Sarasota, FL                                                                       
HUB - Yes               

COOP - Yes 

 Midwest Medical 
Supply Co., LLC                                                          
Earth City, MO                                                       

HUB - No                
COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$2.51000** $5.12950 $3.75000 $3.01000 - P

$6.03167 - S $7.91330 NO BID $6.61000

$7.78200 - P $11.63500 $10.50000 $8.52000 - S

$0.15789 $0.69000 NO BID NO BID

$0.07576 $0.06000 NO BID NO BID

$0.13030 - S $0.22360 $0.14000 $0.20600

$1.20000 $1.36080 NO BID $1.25000

$0.00635 $0.00790 $0.00700 $0.00660

$0.00439 $0.00310 NO BID $0.00290

$0.03540 $0.05120 NO BID $0.03572

$0.03011 - S $0.01930** NO BID $0.02350 - P

$0.03630 $0.01930** NO BID $0.02670 - P

$0.03646 $0.01930** NO BID $0.03480 - P

$0.20820 $0.16170** NO BID $0.20750 - S

$0.31440 $0.33300 NO BID $0.29300 - S

$0.42342 - P $0.52080 - S NO BID $0.69000

$1.47250 $2.80580 NO BID $1.82000



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

35 Cape, Exam, Disposable, 30"x21", Schein 73686 or equal 500

36 Lubricant, Surgical, 2.7 gm packets, Dynarex 1250 or equal 1728

37 Sanitizer, Hand, Clear Gel, 70% alcohol, 4 oz., Purell 3131626 
or equal 500

38 Spray, Disinfectant, 19 0z. Lysol RAC 74276 or equal 200

39 Disinfectant, Germicidal, Bleach, 128 oz., Clorox 68978 ONLY 20

40 Bleach, Regular, 121 oz. bottle, Clorox ONLY 250

41 Wipes, Germicidal, Disposable, Large 6"x6.75", PDI Super 
Sani Cloth Q55172 or equal 100

42 Vaginal Speculum, Small, Welch Allyn 59000 ONLY 200

43 Vaginal Speculum, Medium, Welch Allyn 59001 ONLY 200

44 Vaginal Speculum, Large, Welch Allyn 59004 ONLY 200

45 Pregnancy Test, 20 hcg, Urine 200

46 Exam Glove, Nitrile, PF, Textured, Palm: 3.1mil; Finger: 4.3 mil

47 Exam Glove, Vinyl, LF, PF, Palm: 4.3 mil; Finger: 3.5 mil 950000

48 Exam Glove, Black, Nitrile, Fully textured, Palm: 4.7 mil; 
Finger: 5.5 mil 50000

P = PRIMARY AWARD                                   S = SECONDARY AWARD
Tie bids received for items 13, 18 and 38

** Does not meet specifications
***Could not provide a sample as requested
^No specification sheets provided as required

No award is being made for item 46

 McKesson 
Medical-Surgical 

Inc.                                               
Richmond, VA                                                 

HUB - No             
COOP - Yes 

 Medline 
Industries, Inc.                                          
Northfield, IL                                                      

HUB - No                 
COOP - Yes 

 Mercedes 
Medical                                                           

Sarasota, FL                                                                       
HUB - Yes               

COOP - Yes 

 Midwest Medical 
Supply Co., LLC                                                          
Earth City, MO                                                       

HUB - No                
COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$0.14280** $0.20090 NO BID $0.18800

$0.03924 $0.05860 NO BID $0.04000

$0.86750** $1.99790 NO BID $0.55000**

$6.27000 - S $7.68000 NO BID $7.21000

$19.22000 - S $22.89000 NO BID $20.34000

NO BID $5.79000 NO BID $5.45000 - S

$4.61000 - P $6.52250 NO BID $5.55000

$1.75000 $2.03320 NO BID $1.71160

$1.75000 $2.03320 NO BID $1.71160

$2.61610 - S $3.11610 NO BID $2.62277

$0.39520 - S $0.91640 $0.40000 $1.91000

NO BID $0.03170^ NO BID $0.03170 - P

$0.08860 $0.05390^ NO BID $0.06090 - S



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

1 Venipuncture Device, Smith/Jelco 4140 or equal 10000

2 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 1", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4292 or 
equal 5000

3 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 5/8", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4291 or 
equal 8000

4 Syringe, 3 cc, 22G x 1", BD 9572 or equal 17600

5 Syringe, 3 cc, 25G x 5/8", BD 9570 or equal 4000

6 Blood Collection Needle, 22G x 1", Kendall/Covidien 
8881216066 or equal 7000

7 Blood Collection Set, Winged, 23G x 3/4", BD 367283 or equal 5000

8 Retractable Syringe with needle, 23G x 1", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10311 or equal 600

9 Retractable Syringe with needle, 25G x 5/8", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10301 or equal 600

10 Lancet, 21G, 2.2mm, Orange, Surgilance SLN240 or equal 15000

11 Lancet, 23G, 1.8mm, Gray, Surgilance SLN200 or equal 33000

12 Nebulizer, Teleflex Medical Opti-Neb 1732 or equal 200

13 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 75mm, 3 ml, Green Top, BD 366667 or 
equal 2000

14 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 100mm, 6 ml, Red Top, BD 367815 or 
equal 4000

15 Vacutainer Tube, K2 EDTA, 13 x 75mm, 4 ml, Lavender Top, 
BD 367844 or equal 3000

16 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 13 x 100mm, 5 ml, Gold 
Top, BD 367986 or equal 10000

17 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 16 x 100mm, 8.5 ml, 
Gray/Tiger Top, BD 367988 or equal 10000

 Moore Medical 
LLC                              

Farmington, CT                                                 
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

 Premiere 
Scientific                                              

Grand Prairie, TX                                            
HUB - Yes 

 Pyramid School 
Products                      

Tampa, FL                                                   
HUB - No                 

 Stat-Technologies 
Inc.                         

Grapevine, TX                                              
HUB - No                         

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$0.19800 $0.16900 NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.14000** NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.14000** NO BID NO BID

$0.13200 $0.90000 NO BID NO BID

$0.13200 $0.90000 NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.12400 NO BID NO BID

$1.23000 $0.80000 NO BID NO BID

$0.35850 $0.34000 NO BID NO BID

$0.35850 $0.34000 NO BID NO BID

$0.12500 $0.11400 NO BID NO BID

$0.12500 $0.11400 NO BID NO BID

$0.70580 - S NO BID NO BID NO BID

$0.14770 - S $0.16700 NO BID NO BID

$0.16650 $0.19500 NO BID NO BID

$0.22660 $0.26500 NO BID NO BID

$0.34670 $0.39500 NO BID NO BID

$0.34780 $0.39700 NO BID NO BID



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

18 Container, Collection, Sharps, 2 gal, Covidien 8970 or equal 320

19 Container, Collection, Sharps, 6.9 qt, BD 305489 or equal 100

20 Container, Collection, Sharps, 8 gal, Covidien 8980 or equal 20

21 Vials, Amber, Plastic, Childproof, 20 dram 540

22 Specimen Transport Bag, Fisherbrand 18007 or equal 3000

23 Container, Specimen, 4 oz., Sterile, Henry Schein 9007431 or 
equal 110000

24 Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 16 oz. bottle 140

25 Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium, 2-ply, sterile 70000

26 Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-sterile 100000

27 Disposable Probe Cover for Welch Allyn Thermometer, #05031-
101 ONLY 1000

28 Bandages, Adhesive, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515 or 
equal 30000

29 Bandages, Adhesive, 1" x 3", Stat Strip 15215 or equal 15000

30 Bandages, Adhesive, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3" 40000

31 Drape Sheet, Exam, 40"x48", Schein 73711 or equal 8000

32 Gown, Exam, Adult, 30"x42", Schein 73725 or equal 500

33 Gown, Personal Protection, Tidi 8576 or equal 4300

34 Crepe Paper, Exam Table, 21"x125", Schein 73741 or equal 700

 Moore Medical 
LLC                              

Farmington, CT                                                 
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

 Premiere 
Scientific                                              

Grand Prairie, TX                                            
HUB - Yes 

 Pyramid School 
Products                      

Tampa, FL                                                   
HUB - No                 

 Stat-Technologies 
Inc.                         

Grapevine, TX                                              
HUB - No                         

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$3.20000 $3.55000 NO BID NO BID

NO BID $6.50000 NO BID NO BID

$9.45000 $10.40000 NO BID NO BID

$0.09770 - P $0.32000 NO BID NO BID

$0.04210 - S $0.05500 NO BID NO BID

$0.13220** $0.18700 NO BID NO BID

$1.20000 $1.41000 NO BID NO BID

$0.00580 $0.00771 NO BID NO BID

$0.00290 $0.00341 NO BID $0.00235 - S

$0.03416 - P $0.04292 NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.03080 NO BID NO BID

$0.03320 $0.03450 NO BID NO BID

$0.03540 - S $0.02640** NO BID NO BID

$0.31940 $0.22000 NO BID NO BID

$0.29960 $0.40000 NO BID NO BID

NO BID $1.16000 NO BID NO BID

$1.64100 $1.91000 NO BID NO BID



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

35 Cape, Exam, Disposable, 30"x21", Schein 73686 or equal 500

36 Lubricant, Surgical, 2.7 gm packets, Dynarex 1250 or equal 1728

37 Sanitizer, Hand, Clear Gel, 70% alcohol, 4 oz., Purell 3131626 
or equal 500

38 Spray, Disinfectant, 19 0z. Lysol RAC 74276 or equal 200

39 Disinfectant, Germicidal, Bleach, 128 oz., Clorox 68978 ONLY 20

40 Bleach, Regular, 121 oz. bottle, Clorox ONLY 250

41 Wipes, Germicidal, Disposable, Large 6"x6.75", PDI Super 
Sani Cloth Q55172 or equal 100

42 Vaginal Speculum, Small, Welch Allyn 59000 ONLY 200

43 Vaginal Speculum, Medium, Welch Allyn 59001 ONLY 200

44 Vaginal Speculum, Large, Welch Allyn 59004 ONLY 200

45 Pregnancy Test, 20 hcg, Urine 200

46 Exam Glove, Nitrile, PF, Textured, Palm: 3.1mil; Finger: 4.3 mil

47 Exam Glove, Vinyl, LF, PF, Palm: 4.3 mil; Finger: 3.5 mil 950000

48 Exam Glove, Black, Nitrile, Fully textured, Palm: 4.7 mil; 
Finger: 5.5 mil 50000

P = PRIMARY AWARD                                   S = SECONDARY AWARD
Tie bids received for items 13, 18 and 38

** Does not meet specifications
***Could not provide a sample as requested
^No specification sheets provided as required

No award is being made for item 46

 Moore Medical 
LLC                              

Farmington, CT                                                 
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

 Premiere 
Scientific                                              

Grand Prairie, TX                                            
HUB - Yes 

 Pyramid School 
Products                      

Tampa, FL                                                   
HUB - No                 

 Stat-Technologies 
Inc.                         

Grapevine, TX                                              
HUB - No                         

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

$0.16030 - S $0.17320 NO BID NO BID

$0.03200 - P $0.04850 NO BID NO BID

$1.68000 - S $1.98000 $1.98000 NO BID

$6.57000 $10.00000 $6.69000 NO BID

$21.00000 $20.46000 NO BID NO BID

NO BID $6.25000 NO BID NO BID

$5.3000 - S $6.35000 NO BID NO BID

$1.65540 - P $2.00830 NO BID NO BID

$1.65540 - P $2.00830 NO BID NO BID

$1.65540 - P $3.06944 NO BID NO BID

$0.39390 - P $0.90000 NO BID NO BID

$0.02100^ $0.03000** $0.02690** NO BID

$0.08820^ $0.09750 $0.04490** NO BID



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

1 Venipuncture Device, Smith/Jelco 4140 or equal 10000

2 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 1", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4292 or 
equal 5000

3 Hypodermic Needle, 25G x 5/8", Orange, Smith/Jelco 4291 or 
equal 8000

4 Syringe, 3 cc, 22G x 1", BD 9572 or equal 17600

5 Syringe, 3 cc, 25G x 5/8", BD 9570 or equal 4000

6 Blood Collection Needle, 22G x 1", Kendall/Covidien 
8881216066 or equal 7000

7 Blood Collection Set, Winged, 23G x 3/4", BD 367283 or equal 5000

8 Retractable Syringe with needle, 23G x 1", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10311 or equal 600

9 Retractable Syringe with needle, 25G x 5/8", 3cc, Vanishpoint 
RTI 10301 or equal 600

10 Lancet, 21G, 2.2mm, Orange, Surgilance SLN240 or equal 15000

11 Lancet, 23G, 1.8mm, Gray, Surgilance SLN200 or equal 33000

12 Nebulizer, Teleflex Medical Opti-Neb 1732 or equal 200

13 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 75mm, 3 ml, Green Top, BD 366667 or 
equal 2000

14 Vacutainer Tube, 13 x 100mm, 6 ml, Red Top, BD 367815 or 
equal 4000

15 Vacutainer Tube, K2 EDTA, 13 x 75mm, 4 ml, Lavender Top, 
BD 367844 or equal 3000

16 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 13 x 100mm, 5 ml, Gold 
Top, BD 367986 or equal 10000

17 Vacutainer Tube, with clot activator, 16 x 100mm, 8.5 ml, 
Gray/Tiger Top, BD 367988 or equal 10000

 Unipak Corp.                               
Brooklyn, NY                                          

HUB - No 

 VWR International 
LLC                                                     

Suwanee, GA                                                 
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.15173

NO BID $0.15173

NO BID $0.16704

NO BID $1.42900

NO BID $0.55317

NO BID $0.22320**

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.16368

NO BID $0.19362

NO BID $0.09322

NO BID $0.40556

NO BID $0.40108



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

18 Container, Collection, Sharps, 2 gal, Covidien 8970 or equal 320

19 Container, Collection, Sharps, 6.9 qt, BD 305489 or equal 100

20 Container, Collection, Sharps, 8 gal, Covidien 8980 or equal 20

21 Vials, Amber, Plastic, Childproof, 20 dram 540

22 Specimen Transport Bag, Fisherbrand 18007 or equal 3000

23 Container, Specimen, 4 oz., Sterile, Henry Schein 9007431 or 
equal 110000

24 Isopropyl Alcohol, 70%, 16 oz. bottle 140

25 Alcohol Prep Pads, Medium, 2-ply, sterile 70000

26 Cotton Balls, Medium, Non-sterile 100000

27 Disposable Probe Cover for Welch Allyn Thermometer, #05031-
101 ONLY 1000

28 Bandages, Adhesive, 3/4" x 3", Henry Schein 101-5515 or 
equal 30000

29 Bandages, Adhesive, 1" x 3", Stat Strip 15215 or equal 15000

30 Bandages, Adhesive, Cartoon, 3/4" x 3" 40000

31 Drape Sheet, Exam, 40"x48", Schein 73711 or equal 8000

32 Gown, Exam, Adult, 30"x42", Schein 73725 or equal 500

33 Gown, Personal Protection, Tidi 8576 or equal 4300

34 Crepe Paper, Exam Table, 21"x125", Schein 73741 or equal 700

 Unipak Corp.                               
Brooklyn, NY                                          

HUB - No 

 VWR International 
LLC                                                     

Suwanee, GA                                                 
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost

NO BID $3.39375

NO BID $7.33416

NO BID $9.34300

NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.09692

NO BID $0.57210

NO BID $1.29417

NO BID $0.00656

NO BID $0.00570

NO BID NO BID

NO BID $0.022475**

NO BID $0.04445

NO BID $0.04337

NO BID $0.32320

NO BID $0.59940

NO BID $1.04940

NO BID $3.95333



RFB NO. 2018-098 MISCELLANEOUS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item Item Description Qty

35 Cape, Exam, Disposable, 30"x21", Schein 73686 or equal 500

36 Lubricant, Surgical, 2.7 gm packets, Dynarex 1250 or equal 1728

37 Sanitizer, Hand, Clear Gel, 70% alcohol, 4 oz., Purell 3131626 
or equal 500

38 Spray, Disinfectant, 19 0z. Lysol RAC 74276 or equal 200

39 Disinfectant, Germicidal, Bleach, 128 oz., Clorox 68978 ONLY 20

40 Bleach, Regular, 121 oz. bottle, Clorox ONLY 250

41 Wipes, Germicidal, Disposable, Large 6"x6.75", PDI Super 
Sani Cloth Q55172 or equal 100

42 Vaginal Speculum, Small, Welch Allyn 59000 ONLY 200

43 Vaginal Speculum, Medium, Welch Allyn 59001 ONLY 200

44 Vaginal Speculum, Large, Welch Allyn 59004 ONLY 200

45 Pregnancy Test, 20 hcg, Urine 200

46 Exam Glove, Nitrile, PF, Textured, Palm: 3.1mil; Finger: 4.3 mil

47 Exam Glove, Vinyl, LF, PF, Palm: 4.3 mil; Finger: 3.5 mil 950000

48 Exam Glove, Black, Nitrile, Fully textured, Palm: 4.7 mil; 
Finger: 5.5 mil 50000

P = PRIMARY AWARD                                   S = SECONDARY AWARD
Tie bids received for items 13, 18 and 38

** Does not meet specifications
***Could not provide a sample as requested
^No specification sheets provided as required

No award is being made for item 46

 Unipak Corp.                               
Brooklyn, NY                                          

HUB - No 

 VWR International 
LLC                                                     

Suwanee, GA                                                 
HUB - No              

COOP - Yes 

Unit Cost Unit Cost

NO BID $0.25650

NO BID NO BID

NO BID $2.27583

NO BID $8.92750

NO BID $45.01000

NO BID $5.31000 - P

NO BID $9.36000

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID $1.20780

$0.03160^ $0.04627**

$0.08500^ $0.09382


	Sheet1

