

RFQ 2018-091, Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

	Value	Aequor Healthcare Piscataway, NJ HUB - Yes	ATC Healthcare Services, LLC Lake Success, NY HUB - No	Bracane Company Plano, TX HUB - Yes
Qualifications and Experience of Agency	25%	10.90%	12.31%	8.97%
Qualification and Experience of Personnel Assigned to Tarrant County	30%	12.36%	10.50%	8.70%
Approach, Methodology and Implementation Plan	30%	12.80%	11.40%	5.40%
Preparation and Presentation of Response	5%	1.55%	1.88%	0.70%
References	10%	5.33%	5.33%	8.47%
Total	100%	42.94%	41.42%	32.24%

Notes:

Cross Country Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

Favorite Healthcare Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

NurseCore Management Services, LLC d/b/a NurseCore of Arlington submitted a "no-bid."

RFQ 2018-091, Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

	Value	Diskriter, Inc. Pittsburgh, PA HUB - No	Jackson & Coker Locum Tenens, LLC Alpharetta, GA HUB - No	Management Health Systems, LLC d/b/a MedPro Healthcare Staffing Sunrise, FL HUB - No
Qualifications and Experience of Agency	25%	15.30%	10.81%	13.42%
Qualification and Experience of Personnel Assigned to Tarrant County	30%	18.63%	10.80%	12.63%
Approach, Methodology and Implementation Plan	30%	15.36%	9.04%	15.97%
Preparation and Presentation of Response	5%	3.33%	1.80%	2.05%
References	10%	9.60%	5.33%	8.47%
Total	100%	62.22%	37.78%	52.54%

Notes:

Cross Country Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

Favorite Healthcare Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

NurseCore Management Services, LLC d/b/a NurseCore of Arlington submitted a "no-bid."

RFQ 2018-091, Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

	Value	Management Recruiters of Fort Worth - SW LP d/b/a Siter-Neubauer & Associates Arlington, TX HUB - No	MedStaffing, Inc. Plano, TX HUB - Yes	Nurses Etc. Staffing San Antonio, TX HUB - Yes
Qualifications and Experience of Agency	25%	15.25%	13.27%	15.67%
Qualification and Experience of Personnel Assigned to Tarrant County	30%	17.43%	12.93%	16.83%
Approach, Methodology and Implementation Plan	30%	18.27%	11.97%	16.92%
Preparation and Presentation of Response	5%	3.10%	1.95%	2.90%
References	10%	9.33%	9.33%	8.80%
Total	100%	63.38%	49.45%	61.12%

Notes:

Cross Country Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

Favorite Healthcare Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

NurseCore Management Services, LLC d/b/a NurseCore of Arlington submitted a "no-bid."

RFQ 2018-091, Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

	Value	Staff Today, Inc. (STI) Covina, CA HUB - Yes	Sunbelt Staffing, LLC Oldsmar, FL HUB - No	The Evolvers Group Flower Mound, TX HUB - Yes
Qualifications and Experience of Agency	25%	11.90%	12.22%	12.14%
Qualification and Experience of Personnel Assigned to Tarrant County	30%	13.44%	13.05%	15.60%
Approach, Methodology and Implementation Plan	30%	14.10%	11.38%	9.07%
Preparation and Presentation of Response	5%	1.95%	2.48%	1.75%
References	10%	8.33%	8.56%	7.67%
Total	100%	49.72%	47.69%	46.23%

Notes:

Cross Country Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

Favorite Healthcare Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

NurseCore Management Services, LLC d/b/a NurseCore of Arlington submitted a "no-bid."

RFQ 2018-091, Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

	Value	VISTA Staffing Solutions / Whitaker Pathways Houston, TX HUB - No
Qualifications and Experience of Agency	25%	11.75%
Qualification and Experience of Personnel Assigned to Tarrant County	30%	12.75%
Approach, Methodology and Implementation Plan	30%	9.74%
Preparation and Presentation of Response	5%	1.85%
References	10%	8.28%
Total	100%	44.37%

Notes:

Cross Country Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

Favorite Healthcare Staffing, Inc. submitted a "no-bid."

NurseCore Management Services, LLC d/b/a NurseCore of Arlington submitted a "no-bid."

RFQ 2018-091, Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

Ranking Order

1. Management Recruiters of Fort Worth - SW LP d/b/a Siter-Neubauer & Associates
2. Diskriter, Inc.
3. Nurses Etc. Staffing
4. Management Health Systems, LLC d/b/a MedPro Healthcare Staffing
5. Staff Today, Inc. (STI)
6. MedStaffing, Inc.
7. Sunbelt Staffing, LLC
8. The Evolvers Group
9. VISTA Staffing Solutions / Whitaker Pathways
10. Aequor Healthcare
11. ATC Healthcare Services, LLC
12. Jackson & Coker Locum Tenens, LLC
13. Bracane Company