

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				<i>Ace Tire &amp; Service</i>		Blagg Tire & Service	
				<i>Fort Worth, TX</i>		Grapevine, TX	
				<b>HUB</b>		No	
				<b>Cooperative</b>		Yes	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	<i>Unit Price</i>	<i>Extended Price</i>	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section I: On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service</b>							
1.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	5	<i>\$12.00</i>	<i>\$60.00</i>	\$35.00	\$175.00
		Mount/ Dismount	1	<i>\$12.00</i>	<i>\$12.00</i>	\$30.00	\$30.00
2.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Metric Sizes 13 centimeter through 22 centimeter	Repair	1	<i>\$12.00</i>	<i>\$12.00</i>	\$35.00	\$35.00
		Mount/ Dismount	1	<i>\$12.00</i>	<i>\$12.00</i>	\$30.00	\$30.00
3.	Commercial/Medium Truck, Sizes 19.5 inch through 24.5 inch	Repair	19	<i>\$21.00</i>	<i>\$399.00</i>	\$35.00	\$665.00
		Mount/ Dismount	8	<i>\$21.00</i>	<i>\$168.00</i>	\$30.00	\$240.00
4.	Service Call	Per Visit, Per Location	33	<i>\$42.50</i>	<i>\$1,402.50</i>	\$45.00	\$1,485.00
<b>Total Amount Bid Section I</b>				<i>\$2,065.50 (S)</i>		\$2,660.00	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

			Bridgestone dba, GCR Tire & Service		Independent Tire & Service LP		
			Nashville, TN		Fort Worth, TX		
			HUB		Yes		
			Cooperative		No		
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section I: On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service</b>							
1.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	5	\$15.00	\$75.00	\$15.00	\$75.00
		Mount/Dismount	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
2.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Metric Sizes 13 centimeter through 22 centimeter	Repair	1	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
		Mount/Dismount	1	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$15.00	\$15.00
3.	Commercial/Medium Truck, Sizes 19.5 inch through 24.5 inch	Repair	19	\$30.00	\$570.00	\$25.00	\$475.00
		Mount/Dismount	8	\$32.50	\$260.00	\$20.00	\$160.00
4.	Service Call	Per Visit, Per Location	33	\$35.00	\$1,155.00	\$75.00	\$2,475.00
<b>Total Amount Bid Section I</b>				\$2,115.00 (A)		\$3,230.00	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				Ricks Tire Service		Southern Tire Mart	
				Arlington, TX		Columbia, MS	
				HUB		Yes	
				Cooperative		Yes	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section I: On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service</b>							
1.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	5	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$100.00</b>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	1	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$20.00</b>	No Bid	
2.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Metric Sizes 13 centimeter through 22 centimeter	Repair	1	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$20.00</b>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	1	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$20.00</b>	No Bid	
3.	Commercial/Medium Truck, Sizes 19.5 inch through 24.5 inch	Repair	19	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$380.00</b>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	8	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$160.00</b>	No Bid	
4.	Service Call	Per Visit, Per Location	33	<b>\$35.00</b>	<b>\$1,155.00</b>	No Bid	
<b>Total Amount Bid Section I</b>				<b>\$1,855.00 (P)</b>		No Bid	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				<i>Ace Tire &amp; Service</i>		Blagg Tire & Service	
				<i>Fort Worth, TX</i>		Grapevine, TX	
				<b>HUB</b>		No	
				<b>Cooperative</b>		Yes	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	<i>Unit Price</i>	<i>Extended Price</i>	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section II: On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Heavy/Off the Road Equipment</b>							
1.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	13	<i>\$25.00</i>	<i>\$325.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/ Dismount	11	<i>\$25.00</i>	<i>\$275.00</i>	No Bid	
2.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 24 inch through 32 inch	Repair	13	<i>\$65.00</i>	<i>\$845.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/ Dismount	11	<i>\$60.00</i>	<i>\$660.00</i>	No Bid	
3.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 34 inch through 48 inch	Repair	13	<i>\$85.00</i>	<i>\$1,105.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/ Dismount	11	<i>\$80.00</i>	<i>\$880.00</i>	No Bid	
4.	Service Call	Per Visit, Per Location	33	<i>\$42.50</i>	<i>\$1,402.50</i>	No Bid	
<b>Total Amount Bid Section II</b>				<i>\$5,492.50 (S)</i>		No Bid	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

			Bridgestone dba, GCR Tire & Service		Independent Tire & Service LP		
			Nashville, TN		Fort Worth, TX		
			<b>HUB</b>		Yes		
			<b>Cooperative</b>		No		
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section II: On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Heavy/Off the Road Equipment</b>							
1.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	13	\$30.00	\$390.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	\$30.00	\$330.00	No Bid	
2.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 24 inch through 32 inch	Repair	13	\$65.00	\$845.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	\$70.00	\$770.00	No Bid	
3.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 34 inch through 48 inch	Repair	13	\$75.00	\$975.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	\$80.00	\$880.00	No Bid	
4.	Service Call	Per Visit, Per Location	33	\$55.00	\$1,815.00	No Bid	
<b>Total Amount Bid Section II</b>				\$6,005.00 (A)		No Bid	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				Ricks Tire Service		Southern Tire Mart	
				Arlington, TX		Columbia, MS	
				HUB		No	
				Cooperative		No	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section II: On-Site Tire and Tube Repairs/Service for Heavy/Off the Road Equipment</b>							
1.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	13	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$260.00</b>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	<b>\$20.00</b>	<b>\$220.00</b>	No Bid	
2.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 24 inch through 32 inch	Repair	13	<b>\$65.00</b>	<b>\$845.00</b>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	<b>\$65.00</b>	<b>\$715.00</b>	No Bid	
3.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 34 inch through 48 inch	Repair	13	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$975.00</b>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	<b>\$75.00</b>	<b>\$825.00</b>	No Bid	
4.	Service Call	Per Visit, Per Location	33	<b>\$35.00</b>	<b>\$1,155.00</b>	No Bid	
<b>Total Amount Bid Section II</b>				<b>\$4,995.00 (P)</b>		No Bid	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				Ace Tire & Service		Blagg Tire & Service	
				Fort Worth, TX		Grapevine, TX	
				HUB		No	
				Cooperative		Yes	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	<i>Unit Price</i>	<i>Extended Price</i>	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section III: In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service</b>							
1.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	5	<b>\$9.00</b>	<b>\$45.00</b>	\$10.00	\$50.00
		Mount/Dismount	1	<b>\$9.00</b>	<b>\$9.00</b>	\$5.00	\$5.00
2.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Metric Sizes 13 centimeter through 22 centimeter.	Repair	1	<b>\$9.00</b>	<b>\$9.00</b>	\$10.00	\$10.00
		Mount/Dismount	1	<b>\$9.00</b>	<b>\$9.00</b>	\$5.00	\$5.00
3.	Commercial/Medium Truck, Sizes 19.5 inch through 24.5 inch	Repair	19	<b>\$21.50</b>	<b>\$408.50</b>	\$35.00	\$665.00
		Mount/Dismount	8	<b>\$21.50</b>	<b>\$172.00</b>	\$30.00	\$240.00
4.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	13	<b>\$25.00</b>	<b>\$325.00</b>	\$35.00	\$455.00
		Mount/Dismount	11	<b>\$25.00</b>	<b>\$275.00</b>	\$30.00	\$330.00
5.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 23 inch through 32 inch	Repair	13	<b>\$45.00</b>	<b>\$585.00</b>	\$45.00	\$585.00
		Mount/Dismount	11	<b>\$45.00</b>	<b>\$495.00</b>	\$65.00	\$715.00
6.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 33 inch through 48 inch	Repair	13	<b>\$85.00</b>	<b>\$1,105.00</b>	\$45.00	\$585.00
		Mount/Dismount	11	<b>\$80.00</b>	<b>\$880.00</b>	\$90.00	\$990.00

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

			Bridgestone dba, GCR Tire & Service		Independent Tire & Service LP		
			Nashville, TN		Fort Worth, TX		
			<b>HUB</b>		Yes		
			<b>Cooperative</b>		No		
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section III: In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service</b>							
1.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	5	\$15.00	\$75.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	1	\$15.00	\$15.00	No Bid	
2.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Metric Sizes 13 centimeter through 22 centimeter.	Repair	1	\$20.00	\$20.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	1	\$20.00	\$20.00	No Bid	
3.	Commercial/Medium Truck, Sizes 19.5 inch through 24.5 inch	Repair	19	\$30.00	\$570.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	8	\$32.50	\$260.00	No Bid	
4.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	13	\$30.00	\$390.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	\$30.00	\$330.00	No Bid	
5.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 23 inch through 32 inch	Repair	13	\$65.00	\$845.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	\$70.00	\$770.00	No Bid	
6.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 33 inch through 48 inch	Repair	13	\$75.00	\$975.00	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	\$80.00	\$880.00	No Bid	



## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				<i>Ricks Tire Service</i>		Southern Tire Mart	
				<i>Arlington, TX</i>		Columbia, MS	
				<b>HUB</b>		No	
				<b>Cooperative</b>		No	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>Section III: In-Store Tire and Tube Repairs/Service</b>							
1.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	5	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$100.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	1	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$20.00</i>	No Bid	
2.	Passenger Vehicle/Light Truck, Metric Sizes 13 centimeter through 22 centimeter.	Repair	1	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$20.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	1	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$20.00</i>	No Bid	
3.	Commercial/Medium Truck, Sizes 19.5 inch through 24.5 inch	Repair	19	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$380.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	8	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$160.00</i>	No Bid	
4.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 14 inch through 22 inch	Repair	13	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$260.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	<i>\$20.00</i>	<i>\$220.00</i>	No Bid	
5.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 23 inch through 32 inch	Repair	13	<i>\$65.00</i>	<i>\$845.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	<i>\$65.00</i>	<i>\$715.00</i>	No Bid	
6.	Heavy/Off-the-Road Equipment, Sizes 33 inch through 48 inch	Repair	13	<i>\$75.00</i>	<i>\$975.00</i>	No Bid	
		Mount/Dismount	11	<i>\$75.00</i>	<i>\$825.00</i>	No Bid	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

				Ace Tire & Service		Blagg Tire & Service	
				Fort Worth, TX		Grapevine, TX	
				HUB		Yes	
				Cooperative		Yes	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	<i>Unit Price</i>	<i>Extended Price</i>	Unit Price	Extended Price
7.	Tire Balance	Passenger Vehicle	3	<b>\$5.00</b>	<b>\$15.00</b>	\$15.00	\$45.00
		Light/Medium Trucks	3	<b>\$5.00</b>	<b>\$15.00</b>	\$15.00	\$45.00
		Commercial Trucks	3	<b>\$8.00</b>	<b>\$24.00</b>	\$45.00	\$135.00
<b>Total Amount Bid Section III</b>				<b>\$4,371.50 (P)</b>		\$4,860.00 (A)	

## Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service

			Bridgestone dba, GCR Tire & Service		Independent Tire & Service LP		
			Nashville, TN		Fort Worth, TX		
			<b>HUB</b>		Yes		
			<b>Cooperative</b>		No		
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
7.	Tire Balance	Passenger Vehicle	3	\$17.00	\$51.00	No Bid	
		Light/Medium Trucks	3	\$19.50	\$58.50	No Bid	
		Commercial Trucks	3	\$21.00	\$63.00	No Bid	
<b>Total Amount Bid Section III</b>				\$5,322.50		No Bid	

**Bid No. 2018-085, Annual Contract for Tire Repair and Service**

				<i>Ricks Tire Service</i>		Southern Tire Mart	
				<i>Arlington, TX</i>		Columbia, MS	
				<b>HUB</b>		No	
				<b>Cooperative</b>		No	
Item No.	Description	Service	Estimated Quantity (EA)	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Extended Price</b>	Unit Price	Extended Price
7.	Tire Balance	Passenger Vehicle	3	<i>\$6.00</i>	<i>\$18.00</i>	No Bid	
		Light/Medium Trucks	3	<i>\$6.00</i>	<i>\$18.00</i>	No Bid	
		Commercial Trucks	3	<i>\$25.00</i>	<i>\$75.00</i>	No Bid	
<b>Total Amount Bid Section III</b>				<i>\$4,651.00 (S)</i>		No Bid	