

BID 2018-063 Purchase of Fitness Center Equipment for Tarrant County

Line	Est. Qty.	Description	Fit Supply, LLC. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No	Fit Supply, LLC. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No
			Unit Price	Extended Price
1	1	7 Smith Series with 255 Pound Plate Package (1 Set)	\$1570.00 (P)	\$1,570.00
2	1	Machine Bar Club Pack, 15 Piece Set	\$1121.00 (P)	\$1,121.00
3	1	Accessory Stand Package Kit with 20 Accessories	\$650.00 (P)	\$650.00
4	1	Quad Station	\$4883.00 (P)	\$4,883.00
5	1	Leg Press	\$1670.00 (S)	\$1,670.00
6	2	Adjustable Workout AB Bench	\$351.00	\$702.00
7	4	Super Flat/Incline Bench	\$397.32 (S)	\$1,589.28
8	4	Multi/Decline Bench	\$569.00	\$2,276.00
9	4	Rubber Coated Dumbbell Set	\$1,245.00	\$4,980.00
10	2	Dumbbell Storage Rack with Forty-Four (44) Deluxe Neoprene or Urethane Dumbbells	\$683.98 (P)	\$1,367.96
11	1	Water Seated Rower	\$1408.00 (S)	\$1,408.00
12	2	Treadmill	\$2875.00 (P)	\$5,750.00
13	2	Adaptive Motion Trainer	\$7946.00 (S)	\$15,892.00
14	1	Upright Bike	\$1525.00 (P)	\$1,525.00
15	1	Recumbent Exercise Bike	\$1700.00 (P)	\$1,700.00
16	40	Speed Jump Rope (7,8 and 9 Feet)	\$10.02 (S)	\$400.80
17	50	Light Resistance Training Tube	\$10.70 (P)	\$535.00

Primary Award to Following Vendors:

Fit Supply, LLC: 1,2,3,4,10,12,14,15,17,18,19,26,28,29

Promaxima MFG: 8,13

BSN Sports, LLC: 5,6,7,9,11,16,20,21,22,23,24,25,27

BID 2018-063 Purchase of Fitness Center Equipment for Tarrant County

Line	Est. Qty.	Description	Fit Supply, LLC. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No	Fit Supply, LLC. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No
18	50	Medium Resistance Training Tube	\$11.40 (P)	\$570.00
19	50	Heavy Resistance Training Tube	\$12.35 (P)	\$617.50
20	4	Bar Wrap Pad	\$16.80	\$67.20
21	40	Stretching Mats	\$55.00	\$2,200.00
22	2	Stretching Mat Rack	\$265.00	\$530.00
23	25	Bosu Balance Trainer	\$193.48	\$4,837.00
24	1	Bosu Balance Trainer Storage Rack	\$309.53	\$309.53
25	1	Medicine Ball Tree Kit	\$320.00 (S)	\$320.00
26	1	Vertical Stability Ball Rack	\$112.00 (P)	\$112.00
27	1	Stability Ball - 55 cm	\$20.00 (S)	\$20.00
28	1	Stability Ball - 65 cm	\$20.00 (P)	\$20.00
29	1	Stability Ball - 75 cm	\$20.00 (P)	\$20.00
		Order Will Be Fulfilled Within Eight (8) Weeks After Receipt of Order?:	Yes	
		Replacement Parts Availability:	Yes	
		Response Time for Equipment under Warranty within Twenty-Four (24) Hours:	Yes	
		Thirty (30) Day Replace Time for Products Found Unsatisfactory:	Yes	
		Number of Years Company Has Been in Business:	12 Years	

Primary Award to Following Vendors:

Fit Supply, LLC: 1,2,3,4,10,12,14,15,17,18,19,26,28,29

Promaxima MFG: 8,13

BSN Sports, LLC: 5,6,7,9,11,16,20,21,22,23,24,25,27

BID 2018-063 Purchase of Fitness Center Equipment for Tarrant County

Line	Est. Qty.	Description	Promaxima MFG Houston, TX HUB - No	Promaxima MFG Houston, TX HUB - No
			Unit Price	Extended Price
1	1	7 Smith Series with 255 Pound Plate Package (1 Set)	\$2004.00 (S)	\$2,004.00
2	1	Machine Bar Club Pack, 15 Piece Set	\$1294.00 (S)	\$1,294.00
3	1	Accessory Stand Package Kit with 20 Accessories	\$731.00 (S)	\$731.00
4	1	Quad Station	\$5213.00 (S)	\$5,213.00
5	1	Leg Press	\$2,099.00	\$2,099.00
6	2	Adjustable Workout AB Bench	\$331.00 (S)	\$662.00
7	4	Super Flat/Incline Bench	\$415.00	\$1,660.00
8	4	Multi/Decline Bench	\$415.00 (P)	\$1,660.00
9	4	Rubber Coated Dumbbell Set	\$1049.00 (S)	\$4,196.00
10	2	Dumbbell Storage Rack with Forty-Four (44) Deluxe Neoprene or Urethane Dumbbells	\$1,166.00	\$2,332.00
11	1	Water Seated Rower	\$2,309.00	\$2,309.00
12	2	Treadmill	\$3,460.00	\$6,920.00
13	2	Adaptive Motion Trainer	\$4090.00 (P)	\$8,180.00
14	1	Upright Bike	\$1,836.00	\$1,836.00
15	1	Recumbent Exercise Bike	\$2,099.00	\$2,099.00
16	40	Speed Jump Rope (7,8 and 9 Feet)	\$60.00	\$2,400.00
17	50	Light Resistance Training Tube	\$14.00 (S)	\$700.00

Primary Award to Following Vendors:

Fit Supply, LLC: 1,2,3,4,10,12,14,15,17,18,19,26,28,29

Promaxima MFG: 8,13

BSN Sports, LLC: 5,6,7,9,11,16,20,21,22,23,24,25,27

BID 2018-063 Purchase of Fitness Center Equipment for Tarrant County

Line	Est. Qty.	Description	Promaxima MFG Houston, TX HUB - No	Promaxima MFG Houston, TX HUB - No
18	50	Medium Resistance Training Tube	\$15.00	\$750.00
19	50	Heavy Resistance Training Tube	\$16.00	\$800.00
20	4	Bar Wrap Pad	\$13.00 (S)	\$52.00
21	40	Stretching Mats	\$51.00 (S)	\$2,040.00
22	2	Stretching Mat Rack	\$259.00 (S)	\$518.00
23	25	Bosu Balance Trainer	\$157.00 (S)	\$3,925.00
24	1	Bosu Balance Trainer Storage Rack	\$214.00 (S)	\$214.00
25	1	Medicine Ball Tree Kit	\$563.00	\$563.00
26	1	Vertical Stability Ball Rack	\$216.00	\$216.00
27	1	Stability Ball - 55 cm	\$28.00	\$28.00
28	1	Stability Ball - 65 cm	\$32.00	\$32.00
29	1	Stability Ball - 75 cm	\$37.00	\$37.00
		Order Will Be Fulfilled Within Eight (8) Weeks After Receipt of Order?:	Yes	
		Replacement Parts Availability:	Yes	
		Response Time for Equipment under Warranty within Twenty-Four (24) Hours:	Yes	
		Thirty (30) Day Replace Time for Products Found Unsatisfactory:	Yes	
		Number of Years Company Has Been in Business:	50 Years	

Primary Award to Following Vendors:

Fit Supply, LLC: 1,2,3,4,10,12,14,15,17,18,19,26,28,29

Promaxima MFG: 8,13

BSN Sports, LLC: 5,6,7,9,11,16,20,21,22,23,24,25,27

BID 2018-063 Purchase of Fitness Center Equipment for Tarrant County

Line	Est. Qty.	Description	BSN Sports, LLC. Dallas, TX HUB - No	BSN Sports, LLC. Dallas, TX HUB - No
			Unit Price	Extended Price
1	1	7 Smith Series with 255 Pound Plate Package (1 Set)	No Bid	No Bid
2	1	Machine Bar Club Pack, 15 Piece Set	No Bid	No Bid
3	1	Accessory Stand Package Kit with 20 Accessories	No Bid	No Bid
4	1	Quad Station	No Bid	No Bid
5	1	Leg Press	\$1167.48 (P)	\$1,167.48
6	2	Adjustable Workout AB Bench	\$175.22 (P)	\$350.44
7	4	Super Flat/Incline Bench	\$370.48 (P)	\$1,481.92
8	4	Multi/Decline Bench	\$524.84 (S)	\$2,099.36
9	4	Rubber Coated Dumbbell Set	\$825.47 (P)	\$3,301.88
10	2	Dumbbell Storage Rack with Forty-Four (44) Deluxe Neoprene or Urethane Dumbbells	\$801.27 (S)	\$1,602.54
11	1	Water Seated Rower	\$1066.67 (P)	\$1,066.67
12	2	Treadmill	\$3139.75 (S)	\$6,279.50
13	2	Adaptive Motion Trainer	No Bid	No Bid
14	1	Upright Bike	\$1675.07 (S)	\$1,675.07
15	1	Recumbent Exercise Bike	\$1939.85 (S)	\$1,939.85
16	40	Speed Jump Rope (7,8 and 9 Feet)	\$.58/.64/.72 (P)	\$23.20/\$25.60/\$28.80
17	50	Light Resistance Training Tube	\$14.16	\$708.00

Primary Award to Following Vendors:

Fit Supply, LLC: 1,2,3,4,10,12,14,15,17,18,19,26,28,29

Promaxima MFG: 8,13

BSN Sports, LLC: 5,6,7,9,11,16,20,21,22,23,24,25,27

BID 2018-063 Purchase of Fitness Center Equipment for Tarrant County

Line	Est. Qty.	Description	BSN Sports, LLC. Dallas, TX HUB - No	BSN Sports, LLC. Dallas, TX HUB - No
18	50	Medium Resistance Training Tube	\$14.92 (S)	\$746.00
19	50	Heavy Resistance Training Tube	\$15.38 (S)	\$769.00
20	4	Bar Wrap Pad	\$7.22 (P)	\$28.88
21	40	Stretching Mats	\$18.34 (P)	\$733.60
22	2	Stretching Mat Rack	\$102.78 (P)	\$205.56
23	25	Bosu Balance Trainer	\$132.37 (P)	\$3,309.25
24	1	Bosu Balance Trainer Storage Rack	\$169.08 (P)	\$169.08
25	1	Medicine Ball Tree Kit	\$234.14 (P)	\$234.14
26	1	Vertical Stability Ball Rack	\$183.74 (S)	\$183.74
27	1	Stability Ball - 55 cm	\$15.49 (P)	\$15.49
28	1	Stability Ball - 65 cm	\$20.04	\$20.04
29	1	Stability Ball - 75 cm	\$23.49	\$23.49
		Order Will Be Fulfilled Within Eight (8) Weeks After Receipt of Order?:	Yes	
		Replacement Parts Availability:	Yes	
		Response Time for Equipment under Warranty within Twenty-Four (24) Hours:	Yes	
		Thirty (30) Day Replace Time for Products Found Unsatisfactory:	Yes	
		Number of Years Company Has Been in Business:	36 Years	

Primary Award to Following Vendors:

Fit Supply, LLC: 1,2,3,4,10,12,14,15,17,18,19,26,28,29

Promaxima MFG: 8,13

BSN Sports, LLC: 5,6,7,9,11,16,20,21,22,23,24,25,27