

Bid# 2018-059

PURCHASE OF PEWS AND METAL BEAM SEATING FOR TARRANT COUNTY SOUTHWEST SUB COURTHOUSE EXPANSION

Award: Section 1: Intelligent Interiors, Inc.

Section 2: Imperial Woodworks, Inc.

Item No.	Tag	Description	Qty	Imperial Woodworks, Inc. Waco, TX HUB = NO	Corporate Source, Ltd Dallas, TX HUB = YES	Intelligent Interiors, Inc. Addison, TX HUB = YES	Furniture by William Webb Carrollton, TX HUB = NO	Hertz Furniture Systems Ramsey, NJ HUB = NO
SECTION I: METAL SEATING								
1.	S19	Perforated Metal Seating - 3 Seat, or approved equal meeting specifications.	17	No Bid	\$ 911.18	\$ 880.40	\$ 904.00	\$ 2,205.45
2.	S20	Perforated Metal Seating - 4 Seat, or approved equal meeting specifications.	10	No Bid	\$ 1,181.67	\$ 1,114.60	\$ 1,135.00	\$ 2,846.35
3.	S21	Perforated Metal Seating - 4 Back to Back, or approved equal meeting specifications.	2	No Bid	\$ 2,288.68	\$ 2,075.95	\$ 2,085.00	\$ 5,481.00
TOTAL				No Bid	\$ 31,884.16	\$ 30,264.70	\$ 31,488.00	\$ 76,918.15
SECTION II: PEWS								
1.	S22A	Courtroom Benches 10 ft.	7	\$ 1,150.00	No Bid	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,714.50	\$ 1,478.25
2.	S22B	Courtroom Benches 9 ft.	2	\$ 1,053.00	No Bid	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 1,548.46	\$ 1,478.25
3.	S22C	Courtroom Benches 7 ft.	2	\$ 917.00	No Bid	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 1,215.46	\$ 1,478.25
TOTAL				\$ 11,990.00	No Bid	\$ 15,300.00	\$ 17,529.34	\$ 16,260.75