

Bid No. 2018-054

PURCHASE OF FURNITURE FOR TARRANT COUNTY SOUTHWEST SUBCOURTHOUSE EXPANSION

Award:									
Item No.	Tag	Description	Qty	Royer & Schutts Fort Worth, TX HUB = Yes	Facilitechinc dba Business Interiors Irving, TX HUB = Yes	Interior Resources Dallas, TX HUB = No	Furniture by William Webb Carrollton, TX HUB = No	Storage Equipment Co. Inc. Dallas, TX HUB = No	Ergogenesis Workplace Solutions LLC Navasota, TX HUB = No
SECTION 1: FILES AND STORAGE									
1.	IC1	Industrial Upper Cabinets	4	\$ 1,499.51	\$ 1,586.13	\$ 1,387.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2.	LF1	5 Drawer Lateral File - 42"	11	\$ 787.55	\$ 814.51	\$ 935.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3.	LF2	5 Drawer Lateral File - 36"	2	\$ 690.92	\$ 740.06	\$ 820.13	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4.	LF3	3 Drawer Lateral File - 36"	1	\$ 465.30	\$ 611.76	\$ 552.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5.	MB1	5 Shelf Metal Bookcase	1	\$ 180.41	\$ 209.82	\$ 210.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6.	MC1	2 Door Metal Storage Cabinet with lock	1	\$ 477.24	\$ 494.74	\$ 565.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7.	MC2	Storage Cabinet	1	No Bid	\$ 454.42	No Bid	\$ 450.00	No Bid	No Bid
8.	MP1	Model Pedestal 2 Box/1 file	3	\$ 189.82	\$ 204.91	\$ 225.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.	FS1	Flammable Safety Cabinet	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,194.90	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10.	SS1	Steel Shelving 48"W x 18"D	(6) Starters (8) Adders	\$ 221.21	No Bid	\$ 228.42	No Bid	\$ 159.40	No Bid
11.	SS2	Steel Shelving 48"W x 24"D	(4) Starters (5) Adders	\$ 266.91	No Bid	\$ 246.80	No Bid	\$ 193.18	No Bid
12.	SS3	Steel Shelving 60"W x 36"D	7	\$ 717.54	No Bid	\$ 738.09	No Bid	\$ 598.70	No Bid
13.	SS5	Steel Shelving 36"W x 18"D	(4) Starters (6) Adders	\$ 199.60	No Bid	\$ 206.91	No Bid	\$ 136.11	No Bid

14.	SS6	Closed Sides Steel Shelving	(2) Starters (2) Adders	\$ 312.44	No Bid	\$ 324.12	No Bid	\$ 237.40	No Bid
15.	VF1	Vertical File Legal size	5	\$ 223.52	\$ 293.94	\$ 263.44	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16.	VF1A	Vertical File Letter size	5	\$ 196.57	\$ 249.32	\$ 231.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL				\$ 33,603.46	\$ 21,887.82	\$ 38,637.28	\$ 450.00	\$ 11,226.82	No Bid
SECTION 2: EXTERIOR FURNITURE									
1.	E1	Litter Receptacle	11	\$ 1,687.20	\$ 1,700.50	\$ 1,690.47	\$ 1,845.03	No Bid	No Bid
2.	E2	Ash Tower	2	\$ 716.92	\$ 901.38	\$ 636.71	\$ 633.00	No Bid	No Bid
3.	E3	Backed bench without arms	4	\$ 2,110.00	\$ 2,180.16	\$ 2,115.13	\$ 2,298.11	No Bid	No Bid
4.	E4	Exterior Seating with Table	5	\$ 3,813.29	\$ 3,972.19	\$ 3,812.16	\$ 4,115.11	No Bid	No Bid
5.	E4-ALT	Perforated Metal Panels Umbrella	5	\$ 2,409.57	\$ 2,480.65	\$ 2,415.62	\$ 2,639.00	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL				\$ 59,547.34	\$ 64,958.22	\$ 59,468.11	\$ 64,524.32	No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 3: SEATING									
1.	S1	Detention Seat	1	\$ 630.57	No Bid	\$ 353.66	\$ 473.45	No Bid	No Bid
2.	S2	Commissioner's Reception Lounge Chair	4	\$ 1,421.59	\$ 1,372.20	\$ 1,389.27	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3.	S2P	Throw Pillow 22 x 11, Folklore Lava	4	No Bid	\$ 140.98	\$ 199.14	\$ 1,492.25	No Bid	No Bid
4.	S3	Upholstered Lounge Chair and Ottoman	(1) Chair (1) Ottoman	\$1,432.56 Keilhauer	\$ 2,654.73	No Bid	\$ 2,462.00	No Bid	No Bid
5.	S3P	Throw Pillow, Pika Azurite	1	No Bid	\$ 570.00	\$ 144.19	\$ 387.90	No Bid	No Bid
6.	S4	Commissioner's Lounge Sofa	1	\$ 2,913.58	\$ 2,854.96	\$ 2,865.71	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7.	S4P	Throw Pillow 18 x 18, Brugge Belfry	2	No Bid	\$ 352.01	\$ 133.43	\$ 919.80	No Bid	No Bid

8.	S4P2	Throw Pillow 18 x 18, Aegean Eggplant	2	No Bid	\$ 267.00	\$ 173.22	\$ 1,012.30	No Bid	No Bid
9.	S5	Judges Sofa	1	\$ 2,550.48	\$ 2,490.97	\$ 2,451.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10.	S5P	Throw Pillow 18 x 18, Mix Ice	2	No Bid	\$ 272.50	\$ 179.38	\$ 818.00	No Bid	No Bid
11.	S6	Commissioner's Lounge Chair	2	\$ 1,339.41	\$ 1,626.02	\$ 1,616.17	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12.	S6P	Throw Pillow 22 x 11, Muse Cinder	2	No Bid	\$ 160.00	\$ 199.14	\$ 1,094.60	No Bid	No Bid
13.	S7	Mother's Chair and Ottoman	1	No Bid	\$ 249.18	\$ 221.84	\$ 356.00	No Bid	No Bid
14.	S8	Modular Lounge Seating	1 package	\$ 7,462.89	\$ 9,330.58	\$ 7,866.84	\$ 8,336.00	No Bid	No Bid
15.	S9	Corridor Bench	4	\$ 1,087.12	\$ 1,152.85	\$ 1,014.33	\$ 1,279.04	No Bid	No Bid
16.	S10	Guest Chair, Situ Pozzolana	2	\$ 423.47	\$ 452.33	\$ 401.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17.	S10A	Guest Chair, Wall Saver, Aegean Eggplant	6	\$ 467.46	\$ 355.80	\$ 426.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18.	S10B	Guest Chair, Wing II Shadow	2	\$ 465.47	\$ 495.31	\$ 435.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19.	S10C	Guest Chair, Wing II Ink	4	\$ 465.47	\$ 478.73	\$ 431.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20.	S10D	Guest Chair, Wing II Punch	4	\$ 465.47	\$ 478.73	\$ 431.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21.	S11	Commissioner's Guest Chair	2	\$ 833.47	\$ 839.34	\$ 850.26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22.	S11A	Constable's Guest Chair	8	\$ 530.65	\$ 691.42	\$ 560.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23.	S12	Cantilever Courtroom Chair	18	\$ 299.28	\$ 441.59	\$ 324.42	\$ 817.06	No Bid	No Bid
24.	S13	Office Guest Chair without arms	15	\$ 230.42	\$ 223.62	\$ 238.50	\$ 503.60	No Bid	No Bid
25.	S13A	Deputies Guest Chair without arms	4	\$ 209.64	\$ 202.38	\$ 216.89	\$ 508.00	No Bid	No Bid

26.	S14	Armless Chair, Fully Upholstered	8	\$ 244.37	\$ 247.04	\$ 247.70	\$ 252.53	No Bid	No Bid
27.	S15A	Armless Chair, Seat: Shimmer Denim	3	\$ 261.47	\$ 276.38	\$ 214.74	\$ 258.39	No Bid	No Bid
28.	S15B	Armless Chair, Seat: Shimmer Cornflower	3	\$ 261.47	\$ 276.38	\$ 214.74	\$ 258.39	No Bid	No Bid
29.	S15C	Armless Chair, Seat: Shimmer Sky	3	\$ 270.97	\$ 276.38	\$ 214.74	\$ 264.94	No Bid	No Bid
30.	S15D	Armless Chair, Seat: Shimmer Caribbean	3	\$ 279.75	\$ 276.38	\$ 214.74	\$ 268.69	No Bid	No Bid
31.	S15E	Stacking Chair, Gray	43	\$ 96.72	\$ 101.91	\$ 103.93	\$ 96.89	No Bid	No Bid
32.	S15F	Stacking Chair, Black	36	\$ 96.72	\$ 102.05	\$ 103.93	\$ 96.89	No Bid	No Bid
33.	S15G	Stacking Chair, Beige	36	\$ 96.72	\$ 102.05	\$ 103.93	\$ 96.89	No Bid	No Bid
34.	S15Dolly	Transport Cart	3	\$ 402.50	\$ 485.36	\$ 432.80	\$ 416.00	No Bid	No Bid
35.	S16A	Waiting Chair, Wall Saver, without arms	(4) STD	\$ 319.37	\$ 353.03	\$230.48 Kimball	\$ 258.78	No Bid	No Bid
35A.	S16AC	Waiting Chair, Wall Saver, without arms	(8) C8	\$ 311.00	\$ 353.03	\$231.09 Kimball	\$ 258.78	No Bid	No Bid
36.	S16B	Waiting Chair, Wall Saver, with arms	(4) STD	\$ 325.24	\$ 363.88	\$243.41 Kimball	\$ 371.55	No Bid	No Bid
36A.	S16BC	Waiting Chair, Wall Saver, with arms	(6) C8	\$ 322.77	\$ 363.88	\$244.93 Kimball	\$ 371.55	No Bid	No Bid
37.	S16C	Waiting Chair, Straight Leg, with arms	11	\$ 290.60	\$ 364.46	\$245.41 Kimball	\$ 309.89	No Bid	No Bid
38.	S16D	Waiting Chair, Straight Leg, without arms	10	\$ 274.86	\$ 354.75	\$232.56 Kimball	\$ 328.00	No Bid	No Bid
39.	S23	Nesting Chair	24	\$ 314.91	\$ 338.03	\$257.11 Kimball	\$ 363.12	No Bid	No Bid
40.	S24	Commissioner's Library Chair	8	\$761.18 Keilhauer	\$ 1,576.52	No Bid	\$ 2,012.09	No Bid	No Bid
41.	S25	High Back Conference Chair	10	\$ 1,998.46	\$ 1,873.66	\$ 1,745.18	\$ 2,667.40	No Bid	No Bid

41A.	S25A	High Back Conference Chair	1	\$ 809.28	No Bid	\$ 827.42	\$ 1,537.90	No Bid	No Bid
42.	S26	Task Chair, Standard Casters	18	\$ 320.72	\$ 408.89	\$ 382.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
43.	S26B	Task Chair, Hard Surface Casters	3	\$ 339.59	\$ 426.36	\$ 404.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
44.	S26C	High Back Task Chair, Hard Surface Casters	3	\$ 355.76	\$ 592.53	\$ 568.18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
46.	S27	Executive Chair	2	\$ 623.33	\$ 914.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
47.	S27 ALT 1	Executive Chair in Leather	2	\$ 2,310.79	\$ 2,118.39	\$ 2,757.62	\$ 3,730.58	No Bid	No Bid
48.	S27 ALT 2	Executive Chair in Leather, Embroidered Seal	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,820.10	No Bid	No Bid
49.	S28	Task Chair	22	No Bid	\$ 670.41	\$ 722.10	\$ 672.77	No Bid	\$ 675.15
50.	S29	Jury Conference Chair	6	\$ 273.54	\$ 414.08	\$ 296.46	\$ 749.84	No Bid	No Bid
51.	S30	Mid-Back Armless Task Stool	3	\$ 130.44	\$ 253.48	\$ 270.23	\$ 278.00	No Bid	\$ 264.18
52.	S31	Commissioner's Conference Chair	4	\$ 802.15	\$ 924.17	\$ 758.91	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
53.	S32	Commissioner's Task Chair	1	\$ 5,338.60	\$ 4,771.35	\$ 4,728.21	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
54.	S33	Work Stool without arms	2	No Bid	\$ 578.44	\$ 664.91	\$ 529.35	No Bid	\$ 562.42
55.	S34	Constable's Task Chair	1	No Bid	\$ 951.55	\$ 939.49	\$ 897.39	No Bid	\$ 857.08
56.	S34 ALT 1	Constable's Task Chair in Leather	1	No Bid	\$ 2,414.77	\$ 2,251.97	\$ 1,029.55	No Bid	\$ 1,041.27
57.	S34 ALT 2	Constable's Task Chair in Leather, Embroidered Seal	1	No Bid	\$ 992.15	\$ 1,020.14	\$ 1,429.55	No Bid	\$ 1,165.70
58.	S35	Stool Height Task Chair	21	\$ 836.81	\$ 995.10	\$ 792.71	\$ 945.06	No Bid	No Bid
59.	S35A	Passport Task Chair	3	\$ 769.31	\$ 905.00	\$ 727.11	\$ 807.75	No Bid	No Bid

TOTAL				\$ 160,687.79	\$ 209,884.14	\$ 171,494.96	\$ 202,386.72	No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 4: TABLES									
1.	T1	Commissioner's Library Table	1	\$ 8,016.94	\$ 7,722.86	\$ 6,651.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2.	T2	Commissioner's Conference Table	1	\$ 3,166.89	\$ 2,673.95	\$ 2,906.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3.	T2A	Deputy's Conference Table	1	\$ 2,392.13	\$ 2,671.47	\$ 2,162.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4.	T2B	Jury Conference Table	1	\$ 1,551.36	\$ 1,847.45	\$ 1,423.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5.	T2C	Attorney's Table	2	\$ 1,382.73	\$ 1,032.66	\$ 1,261.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6.	T3	Attorney's Round Conference Table	1	\$ 470.12	\$ 216.48	\$ 444.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7.	T4	Commissioner's Break Room Table	1	\$ 3,291.57	\$ 3,607.97	\$ 913.78	\$ 3,805.00	No Bid	No Bid
8.	T5	Sign in Table	1 top, 4 base	\$ 948.01	\$ 399.12	\$ 3,093.66	\$ 1,144.00	No Bid	No Bid
9.	T6	Break Room Bola Tables	3	\$ 464.01	\$ 422.25	\$ 450.65	\$ 1,234.00	No Bid	No Bid
10.	T7	Commissioner's Occasional Table	1	\$ 536.98	\$ 558.70	\$ 504.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11.	T7A	Definition End Table	3	\$ 420.23	\$ 434.61	\$ 395.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12.	T8	Reception Round Magazine Table	1	\$ 1,140.22	\$ 1,137.96	\$ 1,195.69	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13.	T9	Mother's Room Side Table	1	\$ 423.04	\$ 540.29	\$ 790.31	\$ 504.00	No Bid	No Bid
14.	T10	Nesting Training Table	8	\$ 625.48	\$ 658.90	\$ 595.95	\$ 585.25	No Bid	No Bid
15.	T11	Folding Training Table	16	\$ 770.40	\$ 819.10	\$ 732.72	\$ 735.90	No Bid	No Bid
16.	T11 Dolly	Table Dolly	2	\$ 844.08	\$ 889.29	\$ 800.68	\$ 832.11	No Bid	No Bid

17.	T12	Round Folding Banquet Table	9	\$ 377.57	\$ 403.49	\$ 373.35	\$ 371.00	No Bid	No Bid
18.	T12 Dolly	Banquet Table Dolly	1	\$ 635.60	\$ 875.63	\$ 600.62	\$ 621.00	No Bid	No Bid
19.	T13	Mobile Laptop Table	1	\$ 220.30	\$ 68.39	\$ 79.55	\$ 85.00	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL				\$ 50,627.87	\$ 51,850.32	\$ 47,282.16	\$ 36,906.92	No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 5: CASEWORK									
1.	B1	Wood Veneer Bookcase	9	\$ 1,010.24	\$ 1,078.81	\$ 947.64	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2.	C1	Commissioner's Office	1 package	\$ 12,954.87	\$ 14,004.65	\$ 11,894.01	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3.	C2	Casework Office	1 package	\$ 3,846.96	\$ 4,253.07	\$ 3,747.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4.	C3	Casework Office	1 package	\$ 4,814.92	\$ 5,258.60	\$ 4,667.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5.	C4	Casework Office	1 package	\$ 4,814.92	\$ 52,558.60	\$ 4,667.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6.	C5	Manager's Office	1 package	\$ 2,539.44	\$ 2,756.70	\$ 2,439.24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7.	C6	Passport Clerks	1 package	\$ 4,738.69	\$ 1,700.95	\$ 4,490.46	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8.	C7	Chief Deputy's Office	1 package	\$ 2,443.98	\$ 2,650.67	\$ 2,459.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9.	C8	Constable's Office	1 package	\$ 4,868.86	\$ 5,223.82	\$ 4,902.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10.	C9	Chief Clerk's Office	1 package	\$ 2,859.66	\$ 3,112.58	\$ 2,623.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11.	C10	Facilities Casework	1 package	\$ 2,231.75	\$ 2,558.02	\$ 2,089.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12.	C11	IT Office	1 package	\$ 2,043.52	\$ 2,307.81	\$ 1,958.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13.	C12	Casework Package Office 1131	1 package	\$ 1,766.97	\$ 2,034.71	\$ 1,692.88	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

14.	C13	Supervisor's Office 1148	1 package	\$ 1,729.60	\$ 1,903.88	\$ 1,664.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15.	C14	Supervisor's Office 1151	1 package	\$ 1,729.60	\$ 1,903.88	\$ 1,461.79	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16.	C15	Judge's Office	1 package	\$ 4,991.69	\$ 5,324.02	\$ 4,074.57	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17.	CR1	Credenza with Glass Top	2	\$ 1,907.35	\$ 2,117.87	\$ 1,814.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18.	CR1A	Credenza	2	\$ 1,831.93	\$ 1,967.87	\$ 1,812.67	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19.	SC1	Locking Storage Cabinet	3	\$ 467.79	\$ 481.17	\$ 450.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20.	SC2	Storage Cabinet	3	\$ 441.85	\$ 453.58	\$ 450.98	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL				\$ 77,675.07	\$ 84,338.57	\$ 73,323.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 6: FURNITURE PANEL SYSTEM									
1.	WS1	Office Workstations 1077	1 package	\$ 25,669.05	\$ 18,800.06	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2.	WS2	Office Workstations 1092	1 package	\$ 27,884.02	\$ 17,234.76	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL				\$ 53,553.07	\$ 36,034.82	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SECTION 7: MISCELLANEOUS									
1.	AC1	Analog Clock with Date	3	No Bid	\$ 62.70	No Bid	\$ 113.85	No bid	No bid
2.	AC2	Analog clock	12 (2 additional)	No Bid	\$ 45.41	No Bid	\$ 106.85	No bid	No bid
3.	AC3	Analog time zone clock	4 (each different)	\$ 254.43	\$ 226.15	No Bid	\$ 348.34	No bid	No bid
4.	BB1	Display Cabinet with Hinged Glass Doors	3	\$ 665.32	\$ 668.09	No Bid	\$ 644.19	No bid	No bid
5.	CL1	Lectern	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,515.00	No bid	No bid
6.	CT1	Coat Tree	1	\$ 328.41	\$ 186.09	No Bid	\$ 443.00	No bid	No bid

7.	FH1	20-tiered Wall Form Holder	3	\$ 204.86	\$ 671.01	No Bid	\$ 166.68	No bid	No bid
8.	FH2	80 Pocket Rotary Form Holder	1	\$ 461.36	\$ 434.48	No Bid	\$ 498.00	No bid	No bid
9.	GB1	Magnetic Glassboard 48" x 60"	5	\$ 1,047.07	\$ 1,092.67	No Bid	\$ 989.92	No bid	No bid
10.	GB2	Non Magnetic Glassboard 48" x 60"	3	\$ 1,078.98	\$ 804.91	No Bid	\$ 655.22	No bid	No bid
11.	GB3	Magnetic Glassboard 48" x 96"	1	\$ 1,348.96	\$ 1,581.01	No Bid	\$ 1,431.65	No bid	No bid
14.	GS1	Gun Safe	1	No Bid	\$ 973.80	No Bid	\$ 1,000.00	No bid	No bid
15.	H1	3 Hook Strip	2	\$ 136.64	\$ 120.02	No Bid	\$ 85.00	No bid	No bid
16.	H2	Longhorn Door Hook	25 (5 additional)	\$ 58.37	\$ 58.55	No Bid	\$ 45.78	No bid	No bid
17.	HF1	Hanging File Pocket	14	\$ 53.16	\$ 50.85	No Bid	\$ 49.19	No bid	No bid
18.	K1	Keyboard	30	\$ 203.39	\$ 335.81	No Bid	\$ 211.08	No bid	No bid
19.	LH1	2 Pocket Literature Holder	7	\$ 334.00	\$ 427.45	No Bid	\$ 438.00	No bid	No bid
20.	LH2	1 Pocket Literature Holder	1	\$ 152.90	\$ 169.72	No Bid	\$ 664.00	No bid	No bid
21.	LH3	Counter Brochure Holder	1	\$ 47.77	\$ 89.43	No Bid	\$ 68.95	No bid	No bid
22.	LH4	10 Pocket Literature Holder	1	\$ 495.80	\$ 477.34	No Bid	\$ 664.00	No bid	No bid
23.	PC1	Printer Cart	22	\$ 112.80	\$ 79.63	No Bid	\$ 98.00	No bid	No bid
24.	RC1	Waste and Recycling Receptacle (2) 20 G, (1) 40 G	5	\$ 1,489.73	\$ 515.69	No Bid	\$ 1,755.15	No bid	No bid
25.	RC2	Waste and Recycling Receptacle (3) 20 G	6	\$ 1,376.29	\$ 1,421.05	No Bid	\$ 1,431.15	No bid	No bid
26.	RC3	Waste and Recycling Receptacle (3) 40 G	1	\$ 1,716.61	\$ 617.71	No Bid	\$ 1,646.70	No bid	No bid

27.	RC4	Paper Recycling Center	1	\$ 572.20	\$ 664.34	No Bid	\$ 542.10	No bid	No bid
28.	TB1	Cork Tackboard 3' x 4'	1	\$ 170.84	\$ 196.35	No Bid	\$ 132.60	No bid	No bid
29.	TB1A	Cork Tackboard 4' x 4'	1	\$ 196.19	\$ 221.70	No Bid	\$ 189.95	No bid	No bid
30.	TB2	Fabric Tackboard 24" x 36"	4	\$ 154.07	\$ 164.27	No Bid	\$ 137.50	No bid	No bid
31.	TL1	Mini Task Lighting	10	No Bid	\$ 236.44	No Bid	\$ 307.70	No bid	No bid
32.	TL2	Task Lighting	14	No Bid	\$ 285.40	No Bid	\$ 382.44	No bid	No bid
33.	TT1	Wheel Cart	1	\$ 472.65	\$ 264.83	No Bid	\$ 387.00	No bid	No bid
34.	W1	Waste Receptacle	84	\$ 11.94	\$ 18.08	No Bid	\$ 11.34	No bid	No bid
35.	W2	Paper Recycling Receptacle	84	\$ 11.94	\$ 18.08	No Bid	\$ 11.34	No bid	No bid
36.	W4	Dual Compartment Wastebasket	5	\$ 132.98	\$ 110.21	No Bid	\$ 91.00	No bid	No bid
TOTAL				\$ 51,273.12	\$ 64,448.33	No Bid	\$ 67,505.44	No bid	No bid

Award:

Interior Resources Section 1; 2 of 16 items, Section 3; 33 of 61 items, Sections 2, 4 and 5

Royer & Schutts Section 1; 8 of 16 items, Section 3; 22 of 61 items

Furniture by William Webb Sections 7, Section 1; 1 of 16 items Section 3; 1 of 61

Business Interiors Sections 6

Ergogenesis Workplace Solution Section 3; 5 of 61 items

Storage Equipment Section 1; 5 of 16 items

* **Note:** Sections 1 and 3 no complete bids received in these sections. These sections will be awarded by manufacture.