
Bid No. 2018-045 Annual Contract for Automotive, Truck and Equipment Tires and Tubes

Primary - Blagg Tire Service Bid #1
Secondary - Blagg Tire Service Bid #3
Alternate 1 - Blagg Tire Service Bid #2
Alternate 2 - Southern Tire Mart 1 of 6

Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Item Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Section A: Tires, Passenger, Radial, All Season Tread, Polyester, Steel Belts, Standard Load Range S1

1 P185/70R14, Goodyear Integrity 
#407-476374 or approved equal 20 $46.95 $939.00 $46.95 $939.00 $48.00 $960.00 $46.95 $939.00 $35.20 $704.00

2 P215/70R15, Goodyear Integrity 
#402-282047 or approved equal 20 $54.95 $1,099.00 $54.95 $1,099.00 $55.99 $1,119.80 $54.95 $1,099.00 $59.95 $1,199.00

3
P235/70R16XL, UTQG: 520AB 
Firestone Designation LE2 #097-
759, or approved equal

30 $103.95 $3,118.50 $103.95 $3,118.50 $107.50 $3,225.00 $103.95 $3,118.50 $104.95 $3,148.50

Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone Destination LE2 
097759

Firestone Destination LE2 
097759

Goodyear Wrangler 
Fortitude 157043622

Firestone Destination LE2 
097759

Firestone Destination LE2 
097759

Brand and Part No. Bid Goodyear Integrity 
402282047

Goodyear Integrity 
402282047

Goodyear Integrity 
402282047

Goodyear Integrity 
402282047 Firestone CFF #014910

Description

Brand and Part No. Bid Goodyear Assurance A/S 
407476374

Goodyear Assurance A/S 
407476374

Goodyear Assurance A/S 
407476374

Goodyear Assurance A/S 
407476374 Zenna #GL1951327485

* The bid from Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specs dues to deviations to terms and conditions that were not acceptable. 

  Blagg Tire Bid #1 
Grapevine, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #3 
Grapevine, TX 

*Goodyear Tire & Rubber                  
Ft. Worth, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #2 
Grapevine, TX 

Southern Tire Mart 
Columbia, MS  



Bid No. 2018-045 Annual Contract for Automotive, Truck and Equipment Tires and Tubes

Primary - Blagg Tire Service Bid #1
Secondary - Blagg Tire Service Bid #3
Alternate 1 - Blagg Tire Service Bid #2
Alternate 2 - Southern Tire Mart 2 of 6

Est. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext. Unit Ext.
Item Qty. Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Description

* The bid from Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specs dues to deviations to terms and conditions that were not acceptable. 

  Blagg Tire Bid #1 
Grapevine, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #3 
Grapevine, TX 

*Goodyear Tire & Rubber                  
Ft. Worth, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #2 
Grapevine, TX 

Southern Tire Mart 
Columbia, MS  

4
P235/55R17, UTQG:340AA-A 
Firestone Designation GT Pursuit 
#003-874 or approved equal

150 $102.99 $15,448.50 $102.99 $15,448.50 $105.00 $15,750.00 $107.95 $16,192.50 $108.00 $16,200.00

5
P265/60R17, UTQG: 340AA 
Firestone GT 108V #023-189, or 
approved equal

200 $112.99 $22,598.00 $112.99 $22,598.00 $116.00 $23,200.00 $119.99 $23,998.00 $121.00 $24,200.00

6
P245-55R18, UTQG: 340AAA 
Firestone, FireHAWK GT Pursuit 
#000-177, or approved equal

100 $112.99 $11,299.00 $112.99 $11,299.00 $116.00 $11,600.00 $126.99 $12,699.00 $127.00 $12,700.00

Brand and Part No. Bid Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732026500

Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732026500

Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732026500 Firestone Firehawk 000177 Firestone Firehawk 000177

Brand and Part No. Bid Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732523500

Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732523500

Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732523500

Firestone GT Pursuit 
023189 Firestone GT Pursuit 023189

Section B: Tires, Police, Radial, Conventional Tread, Blackwall, Polyester, Steel Belts 

Brand and Part No. Bid Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732002500

Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732002500

Goodyear Eagle RSA 
732002500

Firestone GT Pursuit 
003874

Firestone Firehawk PST 
#003874
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* The bid from Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specs dues to deviations to terms and conditions that were not acceptable. 

  Blagg Tire Bid #1 
Grapevine, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #3 
Grapevine, TX 

*Goodyear Tire & Rubber                  
Ft. Worth, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #2 
Grapevine, TX 

Southern Tire Mart 
Columbia, MS  

7
LT255/75R16, Load Range E, 
Firestone Transforce HT #189-752 
or approved equal

20 $112.99 $2,259.80 $112.99 $2,259.80 $113.00 $2,260.00 $112.99 $2,259.80 $112.95 $2,259.00

8
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10 
Firestone Transforce HT #191-316 
or approved equal

35 $120.99 $4,234.65 $120.99 $4,234.65 $157.00 $5,495.00 $120.99 $4,234.65 $121.00 $4,235.00

9
LT245/75R16, Load Range E10, 
Firestone Transforce HT #189-769 
or approved Equal

40 $109.99 $4,399.60 $109.99 $4,399.60 $115.00 $4,600.00 $109.99 $4,399.60 $109.95 $4,398.00

10
LT245/75R17, Load Range E 
Firestone Transforce HT #207-483 
or approved equal

20 $123.99 $2,479.80 $123.99 $2,479.80 $133.00 $2,660.00 $123.99 $2,479.80 $124.95 $2,499.00

Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone Transforce HT 
207483

Firestone Transforce HT 
207483

Goodyear Wrangler SRA 
179636492

Firestone Transforce HT 
207483

Firestone Transforce HT 
207483

Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone Transforce HT 
189768

Firestone Transforce HT 
189768

Goodyear Wrangler HT 
744395900

Firestone Transforce HT 
189768

Firestone Transforce HT 
189769

Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone Transforce HT 
191316

Firestone Transforce HT 
191316

Goodyear Wrangler SRA 
179469492

Firestone Transforce HT 
191316

Firestone Transforce HT 
191316

Section C: Tires, Light Truck, Radial, All Season Tread, Blackwall, Tubeless, Minimum Load Range As Indicated

Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone Transforce HT 
189752

Firestone Transforce HT 
189752

Goodyear Wrangler HT 
744830900

Firestone Transforce HT 
189752

Firestone Transforce HT 
189752
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* The bid from Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specs dues to deviations to terms and conditions that were not acceptable. 

  Blagg Tire Bid #1 
Grapevine, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #3 
Grapevine, TX 

*Goodyear Tire & Rubber                  
Ft. Worth, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #2 
Grapevine, TX 

Southern Tire Mart 
Columbia, MS  

11
LT265-75R16, Load Range E10 
Firestone Transforce HT #189-786 
or approved equal

20 $126.99 $2,539.80 $126.99 $2,539.80 $153.00 $3,060.00 $126.99 $2,539.80 $127.95 $2,559.00

12
11R - 22.5, Load Range H16 
Firestone FS-561 Plus #248-324, or 
approved equal

20 $293.99 $5,879.80 $298.00 $5,960.00 $301.00 $6,020.00 $298.00 $5,960.00 $299.95 $5,999.00

13
11R - 22.5, Load Range G14 
Firestone FD-663, Extra Deep Drive, 
#281-042 or approved equal

80 $269.99 $21,599.20 $342.99 $27,439.20 $278.43 $22,274.40 $342.99 $27,439.20 $349.95 $27,996.00

Section E: Tires, Medium Truck/Bus, Mud and Snow Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless, Minimum Load Range as indicated

Brand and Part No. Bid Dunlop SP431A 271127773 Firestone FD663 281042 Dunlop SP431 271127773 Firestone FD663 281042 Firestone FD663 281042

Section D: Tires, Medium Trucks/Bus, Conventional Tread, Steel Belts, Tubeless, Minimum Load Range as Indicated

Brand and Part No. Bid Goodyear Marathon RSA 
138179737 Firestone FS 561 H 248324 Goodyear Marathon RSA 

138179737 Firestone FS 561 H 248324 Firestone FS 561 H 248324

Brand and Part No. Bid Firestone Transforce HT 
189786

Firestone Transforce HT 
189786

Goodyear Wrangler SRA 
179746492

Firestone Transforce HT 
189786

Firestone Transforce HT 
189786
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* The bid from Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specs dues to deviations to terms and conditions that were not acceptable. 

  Blagg Tire Bid #1 
Grapevine, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #3 
Grapevine, TX 

*Goodyear Tire & Rubber                  
Ft. Worth, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #2 
Grapevine, TX 

Southern Tire Mart 
Columbia, MS  

14
7.50 - 15 (TT), 12 Ply Compactor 
Tube Type, Load Range F12, 
Carlisle #60127 or approved equal

30 $127.54 $3,826.20 $127.54 $3,826.20 $185.00 $5,550.00 $127.54 $3,826.20 $145.00 $4,350.00

Delivery Time (ARO) 1-2 Days 1-2 Days 3-5 Days ARO 1-2 Days 1-5 Days 

Total Amount of Bid: $101,720.85 $107,641.05 $107,774.20 $111,185.05 $112,446.50

Section F: Tires, Smooth Compactor and Roller, Tube or Tubeless Type Nylon

Brand and Part No. Bid Carlisle #60127 Carlisle #60127 Titan Roller Tire 3GR252F Carlisle #60127 Carlisle #60127
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* The bid from Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company did not meet specs dues to deviations to terms and conditions that were not acceptable. 

  Blagg Tire Bid #1 
Grapevine, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #3 
Grapevine, TX 

*Goodyear Tire & Rubber                  
Ft. Worth, TX 

Blagg Tire Bid #2 
Grapevine, TX 

Southern Tire Mart 
Columbia, MS  

Auto Tires

Light Truck/Recreational

Light Truck Bias

Commercial Over-the-road Truck 
Tires

Agriculture Tires

Specialty Tires

Off-the-Road Tires

Tubes Quote Quote No Bid Quote No Bid 

Net Net 28% Net 37%

Quote Quote No Bid Quote No Bid 

Net Net No Bid Net 23%

Net Net 51% Net 37%

Quote Quote 51% Quote 20%

Net Net 45% Net 20%

Discounts Offered on Tires Not Listed

Net Net 45% Net 20%


	Bid Tab Color Coded

