

Bid No. 2017-182, Annual Contract for Purchase of Tandem Drum Articulated Frame Vibratory Rollers

Award Recommendation

	Associated Supply Company Eules, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Bane Machinery Fort Worth, LP Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Kirby-Smith Machinery Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	R.B. Everett & Company Haltom City, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Romco Equipment Company Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Item 1: Tandem Drum Articulated Frame Vibratory Roller, 7,000 lbs. - 9,200 lbs. with a Drum Compaction Width of 51 In. Caterpillar CB32G, Hamm HD13VO or an approved equal	NO BID	(*) \$45,119.82	PRIMARY (2) \$60,748.00	PRIMARY (1) \$48,606.00	NO BID
Brand / Model Bid	NO BID	Dynapac CC1300	Hamm HD13VV	Bomag BW135AD-5	NO BID
Delivery Time ARO	NO BID	120 Days	30 Days	90 Days	NO BID
Standard Warranty	NO BID	1 Year 1,500 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	NO BID
Item 2: Tandem Drum Articulated Frame Vibratory Roller, 16,200 lbs. - 19,500 lbs with a Drum Compaction Width of 59 In. Caterpillar CB7, Hamm HD+70I VO or an approved equal.	NO BID	PRIMARY (1) \$100,162.68	PRIMARY (2) \$119,904.00	(*) \$112,497.00	NO BID
Brand / Model Bid	NO BID	Dynapac CC2200	Hamm HD+80iVV	Bomag BW141AD-5	NO BID
Delivery Time ARO	NO BID	90-120 Days	180 Days	90 Days	NO BID
Standard Warranty	NO BID	1 Year 1,500 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	NO BID

(*) Bid received from Holt Caterpillar is deemed non-responsive for failure to include Addendum #1.

(*) Bane Machinery Fort Worth, LP did not meet specifications for Item 1 because vendor did not bid a 2 In. offset drum as required in the bid specifications.

Bid No. 2017-182, Annual Contract for Purchase of Tandem Drum Articulated Frame Vibratory Rollers

Award Recommendation

	Associated Supply Company Euless, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Bane Machinery Fort Worth, LP Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Kirby-Smith Machinery Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	R.B. Everett & Company Haltom City, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Romco Equipment Company Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
--	---	--	---	---	---

(*) R.B. Everett & Company did not meet specifications for Item 2 because vendor's equipment weight is 14,770 lbs., specifications calls for a weight of 16,200 to 19,500 lbs.

Item 3: Tandem Drum Articulated Frame Vibratory Roller, 20,000 lbs. - 24,400 lbs. with a Drum Compaction Width of 66 In. Caterpillar CB54, Hamm HD+110VV or an approved equal.	PRIMARY (2) \$105,803.00	PRIMARY (3) \$110,972.45	\$151,833.00	\$125,411.00	PRIMARY (1) \$102,892.00
Brand / Model Bid	Case DV209D	Dynapac CC4200VI	Hamm HD+120iVV	Bomag BW161AD-5	Volvo DD 105
Delivery Time ARO	4-6 Months	60-90 Days	45 Days	90 Days	90 Days
Standard Warranty	1 Yr Unlimited Hours	1 Year 1,500 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	2 Years Unlimited Hours
Item 4: Tandem Drum Articulated Frame Vibratory Roller, 26,600 lbs. - 32,600 lbs. with a Drum Compaction Width of 84 In. Caterpillar CB66B, Volvo DD140 or an approved equal.	NO BID	PRIMARY (1) \$134,481.40	PRIMARY (3) \$168,967.00	(*) \$162,406.00	PRIMARY (2) \$135,821.00
Brand / Model Bid	NO BID	Dynapac CC6200VI	Hamm HD+140iVV	Bomag BW206AD-5	Volvo DD 140 C
Delivery Time ARO	NO BID	60-90 Days	45 Days	90 Days	60 Days
Standard Warranty	NO BID	1 Year 1,500 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	1 Year 1,000 Hours	2 Years Unlimited Hours

(*) R.B. Everett & Company did not meet specifications for Item 4 because vendor's bid failed to included Cocoa Mats as required in the specifications.