























**BID NO. 2017-157 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL EXAMINER SUPPLIES**

<p align="center"><b>VENDOR&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>Fox Scientific Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>Global Healthcare Alpharetta, GA HUB - Yes</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No</b></p>
Headspace Vials, 20 mm disposable glass, 23x75 mm, Kimble 60827A-2375	\$0.22300 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 liter amber bottle, Case of 4x4, Fisher H292-4 or approved equal	\$42.57000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Histoprep File Drawers, 2 per case, Fisher 15-182-511A <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Isosorb Liquid Solidifier, 1 lb., ISOSORB13000 or Grainger 3ZDY7 <b>NO SUBS</b> NO BIDS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kim Wipes, 60 pkg/cs, Kimberly Clark 34155 <b>NO SUBS</b>	\$0.00910	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Knives, Macro Prep Disposable, Non-slip handle, 10" stainless steel blade, double-honed edge, 10 per pack, American Master Tech BL5010 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.83200
Lab Coat Fisher Small, Fisher brand 17-100-889A or approved equal	\$2.01133	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher Med, Fisher brand 17-100-890A or approved equal	\$2.01133	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher Large, Fisher brand 17-100-891A or approved equal	\$2.01133	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher XL, Fisher brand 17-100-892A or approved equal	\$2.01133	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher 2XL, Fisher brand 17-100-893A or approved equal	\$2.09966	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liner, Lab Mat, 20"x50", Fisher 1199918 or approved equal	\$44.55000	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Masks 3M N95 Particulate Respirator and Surgical, 8 bx/cs, 3M 1860-bx or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Masks, Regular Face, 50/box; 8 bx/cs, tie-on only	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Methanol, OmniSolv HR-GC Grade, 4 liter amber bottle, case of 4x4, VWR EMMX04801 or approved equal	<b>\$53.54000 - P</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

## BID NO. 2017-157 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL EXAMINER SUPPLIES

VENDOR>>>>>>>>>>	Fox Scientific Alvarado, TX HUB - Yes	Global Healthcare Alpharetta, GA HUB - Yes	Interboro Packaging Montgomery, NJ HUB - Yes	Leica Biosystems Buffalo Grove, IL HUB - No
Methylene, Chloride, GC Resolv, 4 liter amber bottle, case of 4x4, Fisher D154-4 or approved equal	\$34.67000 - S	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Microscope Slides, Colorview, White-Frosted One Side/End, 75mmx25mmx1mm, Statlab 315 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.06552
Needles 16 gauge, 100/pk; 6 pk/cs, BD Precision Glide 305198	\$0.22575	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Paraffin, Blue Ribbon, 2 lb. bags, Leica 3801320	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	<b>\$6.76500 - P</b>
Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, graduated, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-9CM	\$0.04760	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Pipets, Sterile Transfer, 5.8 ml, Fine Point, 500/pkg, Fisher 13-711-28	\$0.06920	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Pipet Tips, epTIPS 22491539 <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Rulers, Fractional, 6"x15cm, plastic gray, 10/pack, MedTech Forensic Case #ORC-9789 <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Scalpel Blades, #22, Straight, Stainless Steel, Sterile, Miltex MIL 4-322 or approved equal	\$0.33600	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.29990
Seal, 20mm, LO Magnetic, 100/pk, #20-0000 mL or 50700737 <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sheets, Disposable 40 x 90, 50/cs, Medline NON24335 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Shoe Covers, Disposable, Universal Size, Fisher 17-100-903 or approved equal	\$0.09050	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Shoe Covers, Disposable, XL, Fisher 17-100-904 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sodium Flouride, ACS 500G, Cole Parmer #AC424325000 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Solidifer Spill Control, Red-Z, 15 oz., Safetec 41103 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Syringe 30-35 cc, latex free, sterile, without needle with safety or leur lock, 50/box, Moore Medical 81843 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID





























## BID NO. 2017-157 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL EXAMINER SUPPLIES

VENDOR>>>>>>>>>>	Ram Surgical Supplies Grand Prairie, TX HUB- Yes	RND Medical Marietta, GA HUB - No	Salam International Laguna Miguel, CA HUB - No	School Health Hanover Park, IL HUB - No
Headspace Vials, 20 mm disposable glass, 23x75 mm, Kimble 60827A-2375	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 liter amber bottle, Case of 4x4, Fisher H292-4 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Histoprep File Drawers, 2 per case, Fisher 15-182-511A <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Isosorb Liquid Solidifier, 1 lb., ISOSORB13000 or Grainger 3ZDY7 <b>NO SUBS</b> NO BIDS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Kim Wipes, 60 pkg/cs, Kimberly Clark 34155 <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Knives, Macro Prep Disposable, Non-slip handle, 10" stainless steel blade, double-honed edge, 10 per pack, American Master Tech BL5010 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.50000 - S	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher Small, Fisher brand 17-100-889A or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher Med, Fisher brand 17-100-890A or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher Large, Fisher brand 17-100-891A or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher XL, Fisher brand 17-100-892A or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Lab Coat Fisher 2XL, Fisher brand 17-100-893A or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Liner, Lab Mat, 20"x50", Fisher 1199918 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Masks 3M N95 Particulate Respirator and Surgical, 8 bx/cs, 3M 1860-bx or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.48000
Masks, Regular Face, 50/box; 8 bx/cs, tie-on only	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Methanol, OmniSolv HR-GC Grade, 4 liter amber bottle, case of 4x4, VWR EMMX04801 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID









**BID NO. 2017-157 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL EXAMINER SUPPLIES**

<p align="center"><b>VENDOR&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;&gt;</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>Stat Lab McKinney, TX HUB - No</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>UniPak Corp. Brooklyn, NY HUB - No</b></p>	<p align="center"><b>VWR International Suwanee, GA HUB - No</b></p>
2-Propanol, 4 liter amber bottle, Case of 4 x 4, Fisher A464 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$62.93000
Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 liter amber bottle, Case of 4x4, Fisher A949-4 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	<b>\$24.75000 - P</b>
Acetonitrile with .1% Formic Acid, 4 liter amber bottle, Case of 4x4, Fisher HB9823-4 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$106.28000 - S
Acetonitrile, Optima, 4 liter amber bottle, Case of 4x4, Fisher A996-4 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$69.81000
Alcohol Reagent 100%, 1 gallon, 4 gal/cs, Statlab 6900, Leica 3803686 or approved equal	\$8.21000 - S	NO BID	\$8.28000
Alcohol Reagent 95%, 1 gallon, 4 gal/cs, Statlab 0500-1, Leica 3803682 or approved equal	<b>\$8.21000 - P</b>	NO BID	\$8.53000
Applicators, Cotton, Non Sterile, 6 in. 1000/case Puritan 806WC	\$0.00800	NO BID	\$0.00870
Applicators, Cotton, Sterile, 6 in., 2 pack, Puritan 258062WC	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02770
Aprons, Disposable, 28"x46", 1.75 mil, 20/pack; 5 pk/cs, Kleenguard breathable Kimberly Clark 43745 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.38800
Art Barrier Tips 20 ul, Soft Fit for Rainin 20LTS, 960/pk; 5 pk/cs, Thermo 2749	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.11590
Art Barrier Tips 200 ul, Soft Fit for Rainin 100 & 200LTS, 960/pk; 5 pk/cs, Thermo 2769	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.11790
Art Barrier Tips 1000 ul, Soft Fit for Rainin 1000LTS, 768/pk; 4 pk/cs, Thermo 2779	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.14700
Autopsy Blades #60, 100/box, Medline Havaut 60	\$0.47300	NO BID	\$1.64000
Benchcoat Surface Protectors, 50/box, Whatman 2300-916	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.32500
Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-sterile, 100/pkg, Statlab CS-B70 or approved equal	\$0.63000	NO BID	<b>\$0.33380 - P</b>

**BID NO. 2017-157 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MEDICAL EXAMINER SUPPLIES**

VENDOR>>>>>>>>>>	Stat Lab McKinney, TX HUB - No	UniPak Corp. Brooklyn, NY HUB - No	VWR International Suwanee, GA HUB - No
Blades, Microtome High Profile, Disposable, Accu-Edge 4685 or approved equal	\$1.40000	NO BID	\$1.81800
Bouffant Caps, 21" blue, 100/pk; 5 pk/cs, Fisher 19-098-915 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02170
Caps, Snap it with pre-slit, National Scientific C4011-55 <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.31800
Cassettes, White with lids, 1500/cs, Statlab EC300 or approved equal	\$0.06000	NO BID	\$0.06700
Chloroform, OmniSolv 99.8% min, 4 liter amber bottles, 4x4 case, VWR EMCx10591 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.56000
Duster, Aerosol, 11 oz., 6 per case, Fisher 23-022523	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.29500 - S
EP Tips, 2-200 uL, 53mm, 1000 tips, Eppendorf 022492039 <b>NO SUBS</b>	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.04760 - S
EP Tips, Eppendorf 022492039, Alternate	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.02570 - S
Ethyl Acetate, Optima, 4 liter amber bottles, Case of 4x4, Fisher E196-4 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$57.87000 - S
Face Shield, Full Length, 25/pk; 4 pk/cs, Fisher 19181600A or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.05700
Formaguard pads, Small 8x10, 25/pk, Statlab FXG0810 or approved equal	\$1.40000	NO BID	\$2.09600
Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gal. cubitainer, Statlab 286005	\$20.00000	NO BID	\$20.46000
Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 gal. cubitainer, Statlab 286205	<b>\$35.00000 - P</b>	NO BID	\$145.95000
FTA Micro Card, White, 100/pk, Whatman WB 120210	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.88500
Gauze Sponges 2x2, 12 ply, 200/pk; 225 pk/cs, Fisher 22-362-178 or approved equal TIE	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00660
Glass tubes, Disposable Culture, 10x75, 1000/cs VWR 47728-568 or approved equal	NO BID	NO BID	<b>\$0.02100 - P</b>











