

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
1	<b>Chevrolet Malibu, Hybrid</b>	<b>Primary (1) \$24,645.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (2) \$24,862.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>Chevrolet Malibu Hybrid 1ZE69</b>			<b>Chevrolet Hybrid Malibu 1ZE69</b>		
	Delivery Time ARO	<b>120 Days</b>			<b>65-85 Days</b>		
2	<b>Chevrolet Silverado 1500, 2WD Hybrid</b>	<b>Primary (1) \$29,288.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (2) \$29,395.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model	<b>Silverado 1500 Crew Cab E-Assit CC15543/PDE</b>			<b>Chevrolet Hybrid Silverado 1500 CC15543</b>		
	Delivery Time ARO	<b>120 Days</b>			<b>65-85 Days</b>		
3	<b>GMC Sierra, 2WD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
4	<b>Ford C-Max Fusion, FWD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary (2) \$23,349.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$21,939.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model		<b>Ford C-Max</b>			<b>Ford C-Max P5A</b>	
	Delivery Time ARO		<b>120-125 Days</b>			<b>60-90 Days</b>	
5	<b>Ford Fusion S, 2WD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary (2) \$23,583.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$23,102.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model		<b>Ford S, 2WD, Hybrid</b>			<b>Ford Fusion S Hybrid P0U</b>	
	Delivery Time ARO		<b>120-125 Days</b>			<b>60-90 Days</b>	
6	<b>Ford Fusion SE, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	<b>Primary (2) \$23,986.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$23,482.00</b>	No Bid
	Brand / Model		<b>Ford Fusion SE Hybrid</b>			<b>Ford Fusion SE Hybrid P0L</b>	
	Delivery Time ARO		<b>120-125 Days</b>			<b>60-90 Days</b>	
7	<b>Honda Accord, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
8	<b>Honda Civic, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
9	<b>Honda CR-Z, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
10	<b>Hyundai Ioniq Blue, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
11	<b>Hyundai Ioniq Limited, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
12	<b>Hyundai Ioniz SEL, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
13	<b>KIA Optima, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
14	<b>KIA Optima EX 4WD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
15	<b>Nissan Murano, FWD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
16	<b>Nissan Murano, AWD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
17	<b>Nissan Rogue, AWD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
18	<b>Nissan Rogue, FWD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
19	<b>Hyundai Sonata, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
20	<b>Hyundai Sonata Limited, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
21	<b>Hyundai Sonata SE, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
22	<b>Toyota Camry LE, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$24,998.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota Camry LE Hybrid 2559</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>
23	<b>Toyota Camry SE, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$26,892.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota Camry ES Hybrid 2561</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
24	<b>Toyota Highlander, 4WD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$34,472.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota Highlander Hybrid LE V6 6964</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>
25	<b>Toyota Highlander, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model						
	Delivery Time ARO						
26	<b>Toyota RAV4, AWD, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$27,202.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota RAV4 Hybrid LE 4436</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>
27	<b>Toyota Prius, Hybrid III</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$25,548.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota PRIUS III 1225</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>

**Bid No. 2017-102, Annual Contract for Purchase of Hybrid Vehicles  
Award Recommendation**

<b>Item</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldell, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Jim Bass Ford, Inc. San Angelo, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Moore CDJR Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Reliable Chevrolet Richardson, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Ford Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>	<b>Silsbee Toyota Silsbee, TX Hub: No</b>
28	<b>Toyota Prius, Hybrid</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$21,108.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota PRIUS C II 1203</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>
29	<b>Toyota Prius, Hybrid V</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$25,769.00</b>
	Brand / Model						<b>Toyota PRIUS Hybrid V 1243</b>
	Delivery Time ARO						<b>90-120 Days</b>
30	<b>Chrysler Pacifica, Hybrid RUEP53</b>	No Bid	No Bid	<b>Primary (1) \$39,595.00</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Brand / Model			<b>Chrysler Pacifica Hybrid</b>			
	Delivery Time ARO			<b>120 Days</b>			