

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>HUB</b>	<b>No</b>
<b>SECTION I - CANON COPIERS</b>	
<b>1.</b>	<b>Canon IR 3300</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>2.</b>	<b>Canon C6010 Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>SECTION II - KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS (Color)</b>	
<b>1.</b>	<b>Bizhub C253 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>2.</b>	<b>Bizhub C258 - (Color)</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>3.</b>	<b>Bizhub C351 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>4.</b>	<b>Bizhub C308 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION II - KONICA (Cont.) MINOLTA COPIERS (Color)</b>	
<b>5.</b>	<b>Bizhub C353 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>6.</b>	<b>Bizhub C360 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>7.</b>	<b>Bizhub C454e - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>8.</b>	<b>Bizhub C550 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>9.</b>	<b>Bizhub C552 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>10.</b>	<b>Bizhub C554 - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION II - KONICA (Cont.) MINOLTA COPIERS (Color)</b>	
<b>11.</b>	<b>Bizhub C652DS - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>12.</b>	<b>Bizhub C554e - Color</b>
A. B&W	0.0073
A. Color	0.065
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>1.</b>	<b>Bizhub 181</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>2.</b>	<b>Bizhub 200</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>3.</b>	<b>Bizhub 222</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>SECTION III - KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>4.</b>	<b>Bizhub 223</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>5.</b>	<b>Bizhub 227</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION III - KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS (Black &amp; White) Cont.</b>	
<b>6.</b>	<b>Bizhub 250</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>7.</b>	<b>Bizhub 250 with Card Reader</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>8.</b>	<b>Bizhub 282</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>9.</b>	<b>Bizhub 284e</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>10.</b>	<b>Bizhub 754e</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>11.</b>	<b>Bizhub 363</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>12.</b>	<b>Bizhub 420</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>13.</b>	<b>Bizhub 421</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION III - KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS (Black &amp; White) Cont.</b>	
<b>14.</b>	<b>Bizhub 500</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>15.</b>	<b>Bizhub 501</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>16.</b>	<b>Bizhub 552</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>17.</b>	<b>Bizhub 554e</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>18.</b>	<b>Bizhub 600</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>19.</b>	<b>Bizhub 751</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>20.</b>	<b>Bizhub 754</b>
A.	0.0073
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>21.</b>	<b>Di 151</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION III - KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS (Black &amp; White) Cont.</b>	
<b>22.</b>	<b>Minolta 5035</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>23.</b>	<b>Di 470</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>24.</b>	<b>Di 2510</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>25.</b>	<b>Di 3010</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>26.</b>	<b>Di 3510</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>27.</b>	<b>Di 5510</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>28.</b>	<b>EP4000</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION IV- KYOCERA COPIERS (Color)</b>	
<b>1.</b>	<b>TASKALFA Color 3051 ci</b>
A. B&W	0.0068
A. Color	0.039
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>2.</b>	<b>TASKALFA Color 4551 ci</b>
A. B&W	0.0068
A. Color	0.039
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>3.</b>	<b>TASKALFA Color 5551 ci</b>
A. B&W	0.0068
A. Color	0.039
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>4.</b>	<b>TASKALFA Color 2551 ci</b>
A. B&W	0.0068
A. Color	0.039
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>SECTION V KYOCERA COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>1.</b>	<b>KM2050</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION V KYOCERA (Cont.) COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>2.</b>	<b>KM2530</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>3.</b>	<b>KM3035</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>4.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 3501i</b>
A.	0.0041
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>5.</b>	<b>KM4035</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>6.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 4501i</b>
A.	0.0041
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>7.</b>	<b>KM5035</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>8.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 5501i</b>
A.	0.0039
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>9.</b>	<b>KM6030</b>
A.	0.0125
B.	69.95
%	22%



**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION V KYOCERA (Cont.) COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>10.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 3010i</b>
A.	0.0041
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>11.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 3500i</b>
A.	0.0041
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>12.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 4500i</b>
A.	0.0041
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>13.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 5500i</b>
A.	0.0039
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>14.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 6500i</b>
A.	0.0035
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>15.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 6501i</b>
A.	0.0035
B.	69.95
%	22%
<b>SECTION V KYOCERA COPIERS (Black &amp; White) Cont.</b>	
<b>16.</b>	<b>Taskalfa 8001i</b>
A.	0.0035
B.	69.95
%	22%

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION VI LANIER COPIERS (Color)</b>	
1.	LD620C - Color
A. B&W	No Bid
A. Color	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>SECTION VII PANASONIC COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
16.	DP-2330
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>SECTION VIII RICOH COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
1.	2022
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
2.	3025
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
3.	MP7000SP
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>SECTION X SHARP COPIERS (Color)</b>	
1	<b>MXM-4100N Color</b>
A. B&W	<b>0.0073</b>
A. Color	<b>0.065</b>
B.	<b>69.95</b>
%	<b>22%</b>

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE,  
SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX</b>
<b>SECTION XI TOSHIBA COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>1.</b>	E-STUDIO 307
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>2.</b>	E-STUDIO 455
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>3.</b>	E-STUDIO 457
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>4.</b>	E-STUDIO 456
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>5.</b>	E-STUDIO 655
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>6.</b>	E-STUDIO 657
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>7.</b>	E-STUDIO 755
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>8.</b>	E-STUDIO 507
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid

**BID NO. 2016-197 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPIER MAINTENANCE, SUPPLIES AND REPAIRS**

VENDOR	Nevill Document Solutions Irving, TX
<b>SECTION XI TOSHIBA (Cont.) COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>9.</b>	E-STUDIO 757
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>10.</b>	E-STUDIO 207L
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>SECTION XII XEROX COPIERS</b>	
<b>1</b>	722 Color Workstation
A. B&W	No Bid
A. Color	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>SECTION IVX SAMSUNG COPIERS (Black &amp; White)</b>	
<b>1.</b>	SL-K4300LX
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid
<b>2.</b>	X4300LX
A.	No Bid
B.	No Bid
%	No Bid

**Award recommendations to the low bidder meeting specifications:**

**PRIMARY: Nevill Document Solutions 63 of 74 Items**

**Notes:**

Bid received from Office Store Depot deemed non- responsive for failure to submit required documents as required in the bid specifications.