

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
SECTION 1 - ENVELOPES								
1.	FPCA Ballot Pack Mail Out , white paper, size: 4-3/4" x 11", no window, printed in black ink on front only, printing includes return address and Official Election Mail Logo (with screen).	1,000	\$ 0.20633 ea	\$ 206.33	\$ 179.61 /M	\$ 179.61	\$ 590.65 /M	\$ 590.65
		2,500	\$ 0.12978 ea	\$ 324.45	\$ 83.38 /M	\$ 208.45	\$ 236.26 /M	\$ 590.65
		5,000	\$ 0.10326 ea	\$ 516.30	\$ 57.03 /M	\$ 285.15	\$ 118.13 /M	\$ 590.65
		10,000	\$ 0.08789 ea	\$ 878.90	\$ 44.71 /M	\$ 447.10	\$ 74.90 /M	\$ 749.00
2.	Partially Invalid and Damaged Ballot for Early Voting , brown kraft paper, size: 12" x 15-1/2", no window, printed on both sides in black ink, no clasp, zip-strip type seal.	500	\$ 0.81715 ea	\$ 408.58	\$ 1,022.65 /M	\$ 511.33	\$ 1,157.55 /M	\$ 578.78
		1,000	\$ 0.61557 ea	\$ 615.57	\$ 546.80 /M	\$ 546.80	\$ 563.13 /M	\$ 563.13
		2,500	\$ 0.49711 ea	\$ 1,242.78	\$ 199.35 /M	\$ 498.38	\$ 350.67 /M	\$ 876.68
		5,000	\$ 0.45634 ea	\$ 2,281.70	\$ 163.40 /M	\$ 817.00	\$ 265.52 /M	\$ 1,327.60
3.	Envelope, Early Voting Mail Out , 24# green paper, size: 6" x 9-1/2", with window size 1-3/4" x 4", open side, diagonal seams, commercial full gum flap, prints 1/0, printed in black ink on front and with return address and Official Election Mail Logo (includes screen). Printed in English and Spanish. Will be processed on Pitney Bowes Mailing System.	2,500	\$ 0.23419 ea	\$ 585.48	\$ 208.07 /M	\$ 520.18	\$ 346.75 /M	\$ 866.88
		5,000	\$ 0.16031 ea	\$ 801.55	\$ 133.35 /M	\$ 666.75	\$ 173.38 /M	\$ 866.90
		10,000	\$ 0.11847 ea	\$ 1,184.70	\$ 99.35 /M	\$ 993.50	\$ 98.25 /M	\$ 982.50
		15,000	\$ 0.10155 ea	\$ 1,523.25	\$ 89.83 /M	\$ 1,347.45	\$ 79.00 /M	\$ 1,185.00
4.	Envelope, Ballot Envelope for Early Voting , 24# gray medium paper, size: 5-3/4" x 8-3/4", no window, open side, side seams, square full gummed flap, prints 1/1 black/black, printed on both sides in black ink. English on front, Spanish on back. Throat size 1/4" Will be processed on a Pitney Bowes Mailing System.	2,500	\$ 0.2505 ea	\$ 626.25	\$ 222.16 /M	\$ 555.40	\$ 321.76 /M	\$ 804.40
		5,000	\$ 0.1557 ea	\$ 778.50	\$ 148.73 /M	\$ 743.65	\$ 160.88 /M	\$ 804.40
		10,000	\$ 0.1035 ea	\$ 1,035.00	\$ 110.21 /M	\$ 1,102.10	\$ 90.62 /M	\$ 906.20
		15,000	\$ 0.0844 ea	\$ 1,266.00	\$ 87.36 /M	\$ 1,310.40	\$ 73.55 /M	\$ 1,103.25

Award Recommendations:

Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2)

Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2)

Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
5.	Envelope, Carrier Envelope for Early Voting Mail-In, 24# canary (yellow) paper, size: 5-7/8" x 8-7/8", no window, open side, side seams, square full gummed flap, printed on front in black ink. Printed on back in black and red ink. Printing includes Official Election Mail Logo (with screen). Printed in English and Spanish. Will be processed on a Pitney Bowes Mailing System.	2,500	\$ 0.4916 ea	\$ 1,229.00	\$ 265.37 /M	\$ 663.43	\$ 341.76 /M	\$ 854.40
		5,000	\$ 0.3079 ea	\$ 1,539.50	\$ 172.58 /M	\$ 862.90	\$ 170.88 /M	\$ 854.40
		10,000	\$ 0.1985 ea	\$ 1,985.00	\$ 128.77 /M	\$ 1,287.70	\$ 96.62 /M	\$ 966.20
		15,000	\$ 0.1562 ea	\$ 2,343.00	\$ 119.28 /M	\$ 1,789.20	\$ 77.36 /M	\$ 1,160.40
5.	black. Printed in English and Spanish with Official Election Mail front. Will be processed on a Pitney Bowes Mailing System. size: 11-7/8" x 15-1/4", no window, printed on front only with blue ink, with blue strip on left side of envelope, right corner diagonally Logo with screen on front, with return address. Will be processed on a Pitney Bowes Mailing System.	15,000	\$ 0.10282 ea	\$ 1,542.30	\$ 104.40 /M	\$ 1,566.00	\$ 73.55 /M	\$ 1,103.25
		1,000			/M		/M	
		2,500			/M		/M	
7.	Envelope, FPCA Carrier for Early Voting Mail In, white paper, size: 5-7/8" x 8-7/8", no window, open side, side seams, square full gummed flap, printed on front in black ink, includes Official Election Mail Logo (includes screen), Printed on back in black and red ink. Printed in English and Spanish. Will be processed on a Pitney Bowes Mailing System.	2,500	\$ 0.474 ea	\$ 1,185.00	\$ 233.04 /M	\$ 582.60	\$ 316.76 /M	\$ 791.90
		5,000	\$ 0.2768 ea	\$ 1,384.00	\$ 146.10 /M	\$ 730.50	\$ 158.38 /M	\$ 791.90
		10,000	\$ 0.1687 ea	\$ 1,687.00	\$ 87.16 /M	\$ 871.60	\$ 90.08 /M	\$ 900.80
		15,000	\$ 0.1336 ea	\$ 2,004.00	\$ 79.26 /M	\$ 1,188.90	\$ 71.92 /M	\$ 1,078.80

Award Recommendations:

Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2)

Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2)

Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes	American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No	Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
8.	Envelope, Election Returns (Envelope 2) , 24# white paper, size: 10" x 15", no window, no printing, with a flap 2-3/8" sealed with latex reusable adhesive. Adhesive strip is approximate 1-1/2" x 8".	1,000	\$ 0.5004 ea	\$ 500.40	\$ 281.99 /M	\$ 281.99	\$ 534.99 /M	\$ 534.99
		3,000	\$ 0.35266 ea	\$ 1,057.98	\$ 217.69 /M	\$ 653.07	\$ 373.00 /M	\$ 1,119.00
		5,000	\$ 0.29585 ea	\$ 1,479.25	\$ 193.75 /M	\$ 968.75	\$ 283.50 /M	\$ 1,417.50
9.	Envelope, Election Returns (Envelope 3) , 24# pink paper, size: 10" x 15", no window, no printing, with a flap 2-3/8" sealed with latex reusable adhesive. Adhesive strip is approximate 1-1/2" x 8".	1,000	\$ 0.57475 ea	\$ 574.75	\$ 311.92 /M	\$ 311.92	\$ 558.54 /M	\$ 558.54
		3,000	\$ 0.426243 ea	\$ 1,278.73	\$ 247.62 /M	\$ 742.86	\$ 395.90 /M	\$ 1,187.70
		5,000	\$ 0.33302 ea	\$ 1,665.10	\$ 223.68 /M	\$ 1,118.40	\$ 306.30 /M	\$ 1,531.50
10.	Envelope, Spoiled Ballot Information and Instructions , 24# white paper, size: 4-1/8" x 9-1/2", no window, printed on front only with black ink (English and Spanish).	1000	\$.16108 ea	\$ 161.08	117.20 /M	\$ 117.20	224.20 /M	\$ 224.20
		3,000	\$.08089 ea	\$ 242.67	60.84 /M	\$ 182.52	115.48 /M	\$ 346.44
		5000	\$.03202 ea	\$ 160.10	50.33 /M	\$ 251.65	69.87 /M	\$ 349.35
11.	Envelope, Spoiled Ballot, 28# brown kraft paper, size: 10" x 15", printed on front only with RED ink. With clasp.	1,000	\$ 0.38516 ea	\$ 385.16	\$ 374.93 /M	\$ 374.93	\$ 463.00 /M	\$ 463.00
		3,000	\$ 0.23467 ea	\$ 709.44	\$ 253.20 /M	\$ 759.60	\$ 289.00 /M	\$ 867.00
		5,000	\$ 0.203414 ea	\$ 1,017.07	\$ 224.01 /M	\$ 1,120.05	\$ 225.49 /M	\$ 1,127.45
12.	Envelope, Irregularly Marked Ballots , 28# brown kraft paper, size: 10" x 15" (new size as of 5/28/08), printed on front only with RED ink.	1,000	\$ 0.38552 ea	\$ 385.52	\$ 318.51 /M	\$ 318.51	\$ 419.08 /M	\$ 419.08
		3,000	\$ 0.23467 ea	\$ 704.01	\$ 226.77 /M	\$ 680.31	\$ 255.62 /M	\$ 766.86
		5,000	\$ 0.20341 ea	\$ 1,017.05	\$ 197.58 /M	\$ 987.90	\$ 192.18 /M	\$ 960.90
13.	Envelope for Requests and Cancelled Ballots , 24# goldenrod paper, size: 9" x 12", no window, printed on front only in black ink.	1,000	\$ 0.69994 ea	\$ 699.94	\$ 312.31 /M	\$ 312.31	\$ 392.06 /M	\$ 392.06
		3,000	\$ 0.34112 ea	\$ 1,023.36	\$ 234.93 /M	\$ 704.79	\$ 225.47 /M	\$ 676.41
14.	Envelope for Thrown Out Ballots , 28# white paper, size: 9" x 12", printed on front only in RED ink. Sealed with latex re-usable seal, seal strip 1" x 7".	1,000	\$ 0.2941 ea	\$ 294.10	\$ 346.13 /M	\$ 346.13	\$ 391.82 /M	\$ 391.82
		2,500	\$ 0.19386 ea	\$ 484.65	\$ 218.61 /M	\$ 546.53	\$ 230.90 /M	\$ 577.25
		5,000	\$ 0.1592 ea	\$ 796.00	\$ 172.79 /M	\$ 863.95	\$ 157.12 /M	\$ 785.60
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes	American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No	Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
15.	Envelope, Voter Registration Certificate , white paper, size: 4-1/2" x 6-1/4", with window size 1-1/8" x 2-3/4". Printed on front in black ink with return address. Printing includes Official Election Logo (with screen).	1,000	\$ 0.62559 ea	\$ 625.59	\$ 620.45 /M	\$ 620.45	\$ 609.42 /M	\$ 609.42
		2,500	\$ 0.29348 ea	\$ 733.70	\$ 293.44 /M	\$ 733.60	\$ 305.16 /M	\$ 762.90
		5,000	\$ 0.18065 ea	\$ 903.25	\$ 172.89 /M	\$ 864.45	\$ 165.68 /M	\$ 828.40
	TOTAL EXTENSION OF SECTION 1 - ENVELOPES:			\$ 49,050.29		\$ 36,886.10		\$ 41,311.98
Award Recommendations:								
Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2)								
Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2)								
Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
SECTION 2 - FORMS AND MISCELLANEOUS PRINTING:								
16.	STATEMENT OF RESIDENCE , yellow #20 Paper, size 7" x 8-1/2", printed both sides in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	2,000	\$ 0.107813 ea	\$ 215.63	\$ 89.92 /M	\$ 179.84	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.064697 ea	\$ 323.49	\$ 52.58 /M	\$ 262.90	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.047503 ea	\$ 475.03	\$ 29.73 /M	\$ 297.30	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.037675 ea	\$ 941.88	\$ 20.08 /M	\$ 502.00	/M	No Bid
		50,000	\$ 0.030671 ea	\$ 1,533.55	\$ 15.22 /M	\$ 761.00	/M	No Bid
17.	Application for Ballot by Mail (English Only) , White 8pt. cardstock. Size: 11" x 9", printed on both sides in black ink, printed in six-point type, fold line or lightly score at 4-1/4" from the top, fold line or lightly scored 5/8" from the bottom with 1/2" permanent PS tape as per sample. Includes intelligent bar code, FIM code and Official Election Mail Logo (with screen).	2,500	\$ 0.385673 ea	\$ 964.18	\$ 142.95 /M	\$ 357.38	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.317784 ea	\$ 1,588.92	\$ 108.39 /M	\$ 541.95	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.261656 ea	\$ 2,616.56	\$ 89.87 /M	\$ 898.70	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.25559 ea	\$ 3,833.85	\$ 72.94 /M	\$ 1,094.10	/M	No Bid
18.	Application for Ballot by Mail (Spanish Only) , White 8pt. cardstock, size 11" x 9", printed on both sides in black ink, printed in six-point type, fold line or lightly score at 4-1/4" from the top, fold line or lightly scored 5/8" from the bottom with 1/2" permanent PS tape as per sample. Includes intelligent bar code, FIM code and Official Election Mail Logo (with screen).	2,500	\$ 0.385673 ea	\$ 964.18	\$ 140.43 /M	\$ 351.08	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.317784 ea	\$ 1,588.92	\$ 107.14 /M	\$ 535.70	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.261656 ea	\$ 2,616.56	\$ 93.00 /M	\$ 930.00	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.25559 ea	\$ 3,833.85	\$ 75.04 /M	\$ 1,125.60	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations:								
Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2)								
Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2)								
Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes	American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No	Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
19.	Combination Form for Early Voting in Person , revised locally to accommodate labels, paper 24# white, size: 14-1/2" x 17-9/16", printed both sides in black ink with screens. Printed in English and Spanish. Pad: 100 sheets per pad. Pad on top of form.	1,000	\$ 0.81595 ea	\$ 815.95	\$ 343.42 /M	\$ 343.42	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.39129 ea	\$ 978.23	\$ 170.27 /M	\$ 425.68	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.24967 ea	\$ 1,248.35	\$ 107.93 /M	\$ 539.65	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.174822 ea	\$ 1,748.22	\$ 82.75 /M	\$ 827.50	/M	No Bid
20.	Document Transfer Form , 3 part carbonless form (white, canary, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed on front only in black ink. No stub, glued on 8-1/2".	2,500	\$ 0.08759 ea	\$ 218.98	\$ 120.20 /M	\$ 300.50	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.067224 ea	\$ 336.12	\$ 86.30 /M	\$ 431.50	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.05308 ea	\$ 530.80	\$ 70.83 /M	\$ 708.30	/M	No Bid
21.	Provisional Reconciliation and Transfer Form , 3 part carbonless form (white, pink, canary), size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed on front only in black ink. No stub, glued on 8-1/2".	2,500	\$ 0.169032 ea	\$ 422.58	\$ 120.20 /M	\$ 300.50	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.119193 ea	\$ 595.97	\$ 86.30 /M	\$ 431.50	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.093158 ea	\$ 931.58	\$ 70.83 /M	\$ 708.30	/M	No Bid
22.	Statement of Compensation and Oaths , White, size 11" x 8-1/2", printed on front in black and red ink. Sections include yellow highlight.	1,000	\$ 0.51574 ea	\$ 515.74	\$ 134.29 /M	\$ 134.29	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.201522 ea	\$ 604.57	\$ 76.69 /M	\$ 230.07	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.14113 ea	\$ 705.65	\$ 55.68 /M	\$ 278.40	/M	No Bid
23.	Election Stickers: "I VOTED EARLY" sticker , self-adhesive label with removable adhesive, rectangular shape with round corners, size 2-1/2" x 1-7/16", 4 color process, print bleeds on label, 500 labels per ROLL. eSlate Sticker.	15,000	\$ 0.040645 ea	\$ 609.68	\$ 85.60 /M	\$ 1,284.00	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.027934 ea	\$ 698.35	\$ 55.37 /M	\$ 1,384.25	/M	No Bid
		50,000	\$ 0.017621 ea	\$ 881.05	\$ 35.48 /M	\$ 1,774.00	/M	No Bid
		75,000	\$ 0.013894 ea	\$ 1,042.05	\$ 32.62 /M	\$ 2,446.50	/M	No Bid
24.	Sign: EARLY VOTING POLLING PLACE , white 8 pt. cardstock, size: 8 1/2" x 14", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish, LAMINATED.	500	\$ 0.71171 ea	\$ 355.86	\$ 734.77 /M	\$ 367.39	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.60832 ea	\$ 608.32	\$ 592.43 /M	\$ 592.43	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.535803 ea	\$ 1,339.51	\$ 523.19 /M	\$ 1,307.98	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations:								
Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2)								
Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2)								
Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
25.	Sign: EARLY VOTING POLLING PLACE , white 8 pt. cardstock, size: 8 1/2" x 14", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	500	\$ 0.1785 ea	\$ 89.25	\$ 339.27 /M	\$ 169.64	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.11952 ea	\$ 119.52	\$ 196.93 /M	\$ 196.93	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.07663 ea	\$ 191.58	\$ 111.59 /M	\$ 278.98	/M	No Bid
26.	Sign: HAVE YOU MOVED? , white paper, size: 8 1/2" x 11", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	500	\$ 0.51575 ea	\$ 257.88	\$ 762.41 /M	\$ 381.21	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.42719 ea	\$ 427.19	\$ 613.85 /M	\$ 613.85	/M	No Bid
27.	STATEMENT OF RESIDENCE , 7 pt. yellow cardstock, size: 6" x 8", printed both sides in black ink. One full horizontal perf line. Printed in English and Spanish.	2,000	\$ 0.124378 ea	\$ 248.76	\$ 142.72 /M	\$ 285.44	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.09695 ea	\$ 484.75	\$ 71.19 /M	\$ 355.95	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.0808668 ea	\$ 808.67	\$ 49.38 /M	\$ 493.80	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.059089 ea	\$ 1,477.23	\$ 35.60 /M	\$ 890.00	/M	No Bid
		50,000	\$ 0.0444114 ea	\$ 2,220.57	\$ 29.27 /M	\$ 1,463.50	/M	No Bid
28.	Sign: PROHIBITION OF CERTAIN DEVICES NOTICE , white paper, size: 8 1/2" x 14", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	1,000	\$ 0.79459 ea	\$ 794.59	\$ 612.71 /M	\$ 612.71	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.62154 ea	\$ 1,864.62	\$ 484.34 /M	\$ 1,453.02	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.55435 ea	\$ 2,771.75	\$ 445.77 /M	\$ 2,228.85	/M	No Bid
29.	Sign: PHOTO ID REQUIRED , 6pt white stock 8 1/2" x 11", printed both sides black, red, blue ink. Printed in English and Spanish	1,000	\$ 0.37488 ea	\$ 374.88	\$ 329.26 /M	\$ 329.26	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.205271 ea	\$ 615.81	\$ 160.43 /M	\$ 481.29	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.153238 ea	\$ 766.19	\$ 110.55 /M	\$ 552.75	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
30.	Sign: PHOTO ID REQUIRED , 8 pt white card stock 11" x17" printed in black with red and blue. English. Laminated 3ml	1,000	\$ 0.94399 ea	\$ 943.99	\$ 884.29 /M	\$ 884.29	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.722215 ea	\$ 2,166.65	\$ 656.08 /M	\$ 1,968.24	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.664461 ea	\$ 3,322.31	\$ 581.78 /M	\$ 2,908.90	/M	No Bid
31.	Sign, PHOTO ID REQUIRED , 8 pt white card stock 11" x17" printed in black with red and blue. Spanish. Laminated 3ml	1,000	\$ 0.94399 ea	\$ 943.99	\$ 884.29 /M	\$ 884.29	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.722215 ea	\$ 2,166.65	\$ 656.08 /M	\$ 1,968.24	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.664461 ea	\$ 3,322.31	\$ 570.53 /M	\$ 2,852.65	/M	No Bid
32.	Sign: VOTER COMPLAINT 8 pt white card stock 11" x17" printed in black. English. Laminated 3ml	1,000	\$ 0.5493 ea	\$ 549.30	\$ 738.94 /M	\$ 738.94	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.51931 ea	\$ 1,557.93	\$ 601.21 /M	\$ 1,803.63	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.50442 ea	\$ 2,522.10	\$ 533.60 /M	\$ 2,668.00	/M	No Bid
33.	Sign: VOTER COMPLAINT 8 pt white card stock 11" x17" printed in black. Spanish. Laminated 3ml	1,000	\$ 0.54931 ea	\$ 549.31	\$ 738.94 /M	\$ 738.94	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.519309 ea	\$ 1,557.93	\$ 601.21 /M	\$ 1,803.63	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.50442 ea	\$ 2,522.10	\$ 533.60 /M	\$ 2,668.00	/M	No Bid
34.	Request to Cancel Application for Ballot by Mail , paper 20# white bond, size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	5,000	\$ 0.065 ea	\$ 325.00	\$ 44.77 /M	\$ 223.85	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.04755 ea	\$ 475.50	\$ 32.67 /M	\$ 326.70	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.043088 ea	\$ 646.32	\$ 26.67 /M	\$ 400.05	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
35.	 Voter Instructions , paper 20# white bond, size: 7" x 8-1/2", printed in black and red ink on front and back. Front printed in English, Back printed in Spanish.	2,500	\$ 0.11716 ea	\$ 292.90	\$ 106.67 /M	\$ 266.68	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.07696 ea	\$ 384.80	\$ 68.55 /M	\$ 342.75	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.05352 ea	\$ 535.20	\$ 47.28 /M	\$ 472.80	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.04751 ea	\$ 712.65	\$ 46.26 /M	\$ 693.90	/M	No Bid
36.	 Notice to Provisional Voter , paper 20# white bond, size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed on front only in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	2,500	\$ 0.049806 ea	\$ 124.52	\$ 61.99 /M	\$ 154.98	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.036726 ea	\$ 183.63	\$ 44.02 /M	\$ 220.10	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.030256 ea	\$ 302.56	\$ 32.49 /M	\$ 324.90	/M	No Bid
37.	 Affidavit for Provisional Ballot Envelope , 2 part combination form/envelope printed in black ink. Green provisional envelope with white tear off sheet, size: 12-7/8" L x 6" W. Part 2 forms green envelope. Envelope printed front and back. Envelope seals with adhesive strip tape. Part 1 is CB white and tears out to size 6" x 4-7/16". Part 2 has a spot CF coating. Printed in English and Spanish. (Recipient pulls open at adhesive end).	15,000	\$ 0.18349 ea	\$ 2,752.35	\$ 208.32 /M	\$ 3,124.80	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.14835 ea	\$ 3,708.75	\$ 156.58 /M	\$ 3,914.50	/M	No Bid
		50,000	\$ 0.1234 ea	\$ 6,170.00	\$ 116.94 /M	\$ 5,847.00	/M	No Bid
		100,000	\$ 0.10951 ea	\$ 10,951.00	\$ 99.68 /M	\$ 9,968.00	/M	No Bid
38.	 List of Provisional Voters , 2 part carbonless paper (white, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed on front only in black ink. No stub, glued on 8-1/2".	1,000	\$ 0.21897 ea	\$ 218.97	\$ 175.07 /M	\$ 175.07	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.13491 ea	\$ 337.28	\$ 91.00 /M	\$ 227.50	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.10803 ea	\$ 540.15	\$ 64.40 /M	\$ 322.00	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations:								
Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2)								
Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2)								
Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes	American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No	Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
39.	Transfer Form , 3 part carbonless paper (white, canary, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 5-1/2", printed on front only in black ink. No stub, glued on 8 1/2".	1,000	\$ 0.184368 ea	\$ 184.38	\$ 158.25 /M	\$ 158.25	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.097663 ea	\$ 244.16	\$ 84.23 /M	\$ 210.58	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.0692 ea	\$ 346.00	\$ 58.57 /M	\$ 292.85	/M	No Bid
40.	Equipment Service Report , 3 part carbonless paper (white, canary, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 5-1/2", printed on front only in black ink. No stub, glued on 8-1/2".	1,000	\$ 0.18437 ea	\$ 184.37	\$ 183.93 /M	\$ 183.93	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.09766 ea	\$ 244.15	\$ 93.61 /M	\$ 234.03	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.0692 ea	\$ 346.00	\$ 65.05 /M	\$ 325.25	/M	No Bid
41.	Register of Spoiled Ballots , paper: 20# white bond, size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed on front in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	1,000	\$ 0.08246 ea	\$ 82.46	\$ 105.03 /M	\$ 105.03	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.04401 ea	\$ 132.03	\$ 46.41 /M	\$ 139.23	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.03672 ea	\$ 183.60	\$ 32.58 /M	\$ 162.90	/M	No Bid
42.	Oaths , paper: 20# white bond, size: 8 1/2" x 14", printed on front in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	1,000	\$ 0.08649 ea	\$ 86.49	\$ 111.63 /M	\$ 111.63	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.04818 ea	\$ 144.54	\$ 59.08 /M	\$ 177.24	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.04077 ea	\$ 203.85	\$ 46.88	\$ 234.40	/M	No Bid
43.	Registration Omissions List , 20# white bond size: 14" x 8-1/2" Printed front and back in black ink. English and Spanish.	1,000	\$ 0.1046 ea	\$ 104.60	\$ 111.63 /M	\$ 111.63	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.0668 ea	\$ 200.40	\$ 59.08 /M	\$ 177.24	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.0589 ea	\$ 294.50	\$ 46.88 /M	\$ 234.40	/M	No Bid
44.	Poll List , 4 part carbonless paper (white, yellow, blue, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 14", printed on front in black ink. No stub, glued on 8-1/2". Printed in English and Spanish.	10,000	\$ 0.140753 ea	\$ 1,407.53	\$ 110.37 /M	\$ 1,103.70	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.130519 ea	\$ 1,957.79	\$ 100.12 /M	\$ 1,501.80	/M	No Bid
		20,000	\$ 0.125889 ea	\$ 2,517.78	\$ 94.82 /M	\$ 1,896.40	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
45.	Poll List , 2 part carbonless paper (white, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 14", printed on front in black ink. No stub, glued on 8-1/2". Printed in English and Spanish.	10,000	\$ 0.069443 ea	\$ 694.43	\$ 58.44 /M	\$ 584.40	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.05929 ea	\$ 889.35	\$ 52.83 /M	\$ 792.45	/M	No Bid
		20,000	\$ 0.053846 ea	\$ 1,076.92	\$ 48.68 /M	\$ 973.60	/M	No Bid
46.	Register of Official Ballots , 3 part carbonless paper, continuous tractor feed paper (white, canary, pink). Size with stubs: 9-1/2" x 14", without stubs 8-1/2" x 14". Printed on front in black ink.	1,000	\$ 0.38848 ea	\$ 388.48	\$ 220.58 /M	\$ 220.58	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.20119 ea	\$ 603.57	\$ 145.02 /M	\$ 435.06	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.16407 ea	\$ 820.35	\$ 109.63 /M	\$ 548.15	/M	No Bid
47.	Standard Affidavit , 3 part carbonless paper (white, canary, pink), size: 8-1/2" x 11", printed on front in black ink (English and Spanish). No stub, glued on 8-1/2".	1,000	\$ 0.41907 ea	\$ 419.07	\$ 204.93 /M	\$ 204.93	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.17606 ea	\$ 528.18	\$ 127.51 /M	\$ 382.53	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.13209 ea	\$ 660.45	\$ 88.47 /M	\$ 442.35	/M	No Bid
48.	Register of Official Seals and Proper Installation , 3 part carbonless paper, continuous tractor feed paper (white, canary, pink), size with stubs: 9-1/2" x 14", without stubs 8-1/2" x 14", printed on front in black ink.	1,000	\$ 0.38952 ea	\$ 389.52	\$ 220.58 /M	\$ 220.58	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.20119 ea	\$ 603.57	\$ 123.22 /M	\$ 369.66	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.16407 ea	\$ 820.35	\$ 109.63 /M	\$ 548.15	/M	No Bid
49.	Instructions for Poll List , 8 pt. white stock, size: 8 1/2" x 11", printed on front in black ink.	1,000	\$ 0.08246 ea	\$ 82.46	\$ 149.78 /M	\$ 149.78	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.04401 ea	\$ 132.03	\$ 72.95 /M	\$ 218.85	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.03672 ea	\$ 183.60	\$ 58.51 /M	\$ 292.55	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
50.	Election Stickers: ELECTION OFFICIAL NAME BADGES, self adhesive label, removable adhesive, rectangular shape, 3 3/4" x 2 3/8", white label printed red and blue. Labels on ROLL. Liner perfed between labels. Maximum 500 labels per roll.	15,000	\$ 0.0523942 ea	\$ 785.91	\$ 33.30 /M	\$ 499.50	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.0418931 ea	\$ 1,047.33	\$ 26.63 /M	\$ 665.75	/M	No Bid
		50,000	\$ 0.0347165 ea	\$ 1,735.83	\$ 21.60 /M	\$ 1,080.00	/M	No Bid
		75,000	\$ 0.0327254 ea	\$ 2,454.41	\$ 19.08 /M	\$ 1,431.00	/M	No Bid
51.	Election Stickers: "Yo Hablo Español" , self adhesive white label, removable adhesive, 3" circle, printed red and blue. Labels on roll with perf line separating labels.	1,000	\$ 0.409987 ea	\$ 409.99	\$ 117.20 /M	\$ 117.20	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.175435 ea	\$ 438.59	\$ 84.95 /M	\$ 212.38	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.097072 ea	\$ 485.36	\$ 59.50 /M	\$ 297.50	/M	No Bid
52.	Election Stickers: "Toi Nói Tiếng Việt" , self adhesive white label, removable adhesive, 3" circle, printed red and blue. Labels on roll with perf line separating labels.	500	\$ 0.748 ea	\$ 374.00	\$ 208.00 /M	\$ 104.00	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.40999 ea	\$ 409.99	\$ 118.00 /M	\$ 118.00	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.17543 ea	\$ 438.58	\$ 91.00 /M	\$ 227.50	/M	No Bid
53.	Sign: VOTER INFORMATION / IDENTIFICATION IS REQUIRED FOR VOTING , white 9 pt. cardstock, size: 11" x 17", printed in black ink. Front printed in Spanish.	500	\$ 0.75898 ea	\$ 379.49	\$ 365.06 /M	\$ 182.53	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.67205 ea	\$ 672.05	\$ 224.46 /M	\$ 224.46	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.62352 ea	\$ 1,558.80	\$ 140.46 /M	\$ 351.15	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.61173 ea	\$ 3,058.65	\$ 112.22 /M	\$ 561.10	/M	No Bid
54.	Sign: VOTER INFORMATION/IDENTIFICATION IS REQUIRED FOR VOTING , white 9 pt. cardstock, size: 11" x 17", printed in black ink. Front printed in English. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	500	\$ 0.75898 ea	\$ 379.49	\$ 1,076.96 /M	\$ 538.48	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.67205 ea	\$ 672.05	\$ 936.36 /M	\$ 936.36	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.62352 ea	\$ 1,558.80	\$ 818.50 /M	\$ 2,046.25	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.61173 ea	\$ 3,058.65	\$ 767.62 /M	\$ 3,838.10	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
55.	Sign: NOTICE OF TOTAL NUMBER OF VOTERS , white 9 pt. cardstock, size: 8 1/2" x 9 1/2", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish.	1,000	\$ 0.10591 ea	\$ 105.91	\$ 172.49 /M	\$ 172.49	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.06899 ea	\$ 206.97	\$ 82.23 /M	\$ 246.69	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.06184 ea	\$ 309.20	\$ 64.18 /M	\$ 320.90	/M	No Bid
56.	Sign: DISTANCE MARKER , white cardstock, size: 8 1/2" x 14", printed one side in black ink, printed in English and Spanish. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	500	\$ 0.7117 ea	\$ 355.85	\$ 795.16 /M	\$ 397.58	/M	No Bid
		1,000	\$ 0.6083 ea	\$ 608.30	\$ 655.68 /M	\$ 655.68	/M	No Bid
		2,500	\$ 0.5358 ea	\$ 1,339.50	\$ 579.40 /M	\$ 1,448.50	/M	No Bid
57.	Sign: INSTRUCTIONS FOR VOTING ON OPTICAL SCANNER , buff 8 pt. cardstock, size: 11" x 17", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	1,000	\$ 0.70256 ea	\$ 702.56	\$ 947.74 /M	\$ 947.74	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.63527 ea	\$ 1,905.81	\$ 820.06 /M	\$ 2,460.18	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.6126 ea	\$ 3,063.00	\$ 761.45 /M	\$ 3,807.25	/M	No Bid
58.	Sign: VOTE HERE , 110# white cardstock, size: 8 1/2" x 11", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	1,000	\$ 0.4568 ea	\$ 456.80	\$ 945.10 /M	\$ 945.10	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.38897 ea	\$ 1,166.91	\$ 807.89 /M	\$ 2,423.67	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.36685 ea	\$ 1,834.25	\$ 747.13 /M	\$ 3,735.65	/M	No Bid
59.	Sign: NO PUBLIC RESTROOM , white paper, size: 11" x 8 1/2", printed one side in black ink. Printed in English and Spanish. LAMINATED. (3 ml).	1,000	\$ 0.45681 ea	\$ 456.80	\$ 593.39 /M	\$ 593.39	/M	No Bid
		3,000	\$ 0.38898 ea	\$ 1,166.94	\$ 468.39 /M	\$ 1,405.17	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.36685 ea	\$ 1,834.25	\$ 413.93 /M	\$ 2,069.65	/M	No Bid
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								

BID NO. 2016-186 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR ELECTION PRINTED FORMS

		Vendor Location	Castle Business Solutions Dallas, Texas HUB: Yes		American Solutions for Business Carrollton, Texas HUB: No		Jayden Graphics, Inc. Melissa, Texas HUB: No	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. QTY.	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE
60.	VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATION (ENGLISH ONLY), 67# Vellum Bristol (white) 8 pt. cardstock, Flat size: 6" x 9 1/2", printed both sides in black ink, No Bleed, Finish size folds to 6" x 4" (double postcard), with 1 1/2" fold at top and another 5 1/2" from top, 1/2" glue strip located at top inside card, Score card at 1 1/2" from top and 5 1/2" from top of form (at folds). Printed with Business Reply Mail. Includes intelligent bar code.	5,000	\$ 0.28632 ea	\$ 1,431.60	\$ 117.77 /M	\$ 588.85	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.25933 ea	\$ 2,593.30	\$ 88.05 /M	\$ 880.50	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.191343 ea	\$ 4,783.58	\$ 58.62 /M	\$ 1,465.50	/M	No Bid
		50,000	\$ 0.139049 ea	\$ 6,952.45	\$ 39.27 /M	\$ 1,963.50	/M	No Bid
61.	VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATION (SPANISH ONLY), 67# Vellum Bristol (white) 8 pt. cardstock, Flat size: 6" x 9 1/2", printed both sides in blue ink, No Bleed, Finish size folds to 6" x 4" (double postcard), with 1 1/2" fold at top and another 5 1/2" from top, 1/2" glue strip located at top inside card, Score card at 1 1/2" from top and 5 1/2" from top of form (at folds). Printed with Business Reply Mail. Includes intelligent bar code.	1,000	\$ 0.44554 ea	\$ 445.54	\$ 320.00 /M	\$ 320.00	/M	No Bid
		5,000	\$ 0.3332 ea	\$ 1,666.00	\$ 117.77 /M	\$ 588.85	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.22293 ea	\$ 3,343.95	\$ 72.29 /M	\$ 1,084.35	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.16223 ea	\$ 4,055.75	\$ 59.62 /M	\$ 1,490.50	/M	No Bid
62.	VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATION FOR DEPUTY REGISTRARS (English Only), white 7 pt. cardstock, size: 6" x 10", printed both sides in black ink. Two full horizontal perf lines. Perf lines located 1-1/2" from bottom of form.	5,000	\$ 0.115032 ea	\$ 575.16	\$ 81.09 /M	\$ 405.45	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.068189 ea	\$ 681.89	\$ 51.18 /M	\$ 511.80	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.05323 ea	\$ 798.45	\$ 43.34 /M	\$ 650.10	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.039349 ea	\$ 983.73	\$ 35.27 /M	\$ 881.75	/M	No Bid
63.	VOTER REGISTRATION APPLICATION FOR DEPUTY REGISTRARS (Spanish Only), white 7 pt. Cardstock, size: 6" x 10", printed both sides in blue ink. Two full horizontal perf lines. Perf lines located 1-1/2" from bottom of form.	5,000	\$ 0.115032 ea	\$ 575.16	\$ 92.40 /M	\$ 462.00	/M	No Bid
		10,000	\$ 0.068189 ea	\$ 681.89	\$ 56.17 /M	\$ 561.70	/M	No Bid
		15,000	\$ 0.05323 ea	\$ 798.45	\$ 46.44 /M	\$ 696.60	/M	No Bid
		25,000	\$ 0.039349 ea	\$ 983.73	\$ 36.86 /M	\$ 921.50	/M	No Bid
TOTAL EXTENSION OF SECTION 2 - FORMS AND MISCELLANEOUS PRINTING:				\$ 184,922.03		\$ 144,612.18		NO BID
Award Recommendations: Primary: American Solutions for Business (Section 1 and 2) Secondary: Jayden Graphics (Section 1) & Castle Business Solutions (Section 2) Alternate: Castle Business Solutions (Section 1)								