

Bid No. 2016-162 Annual Contract for Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

Award Recommendation:	Primary	Primary	Primary
Item	Martin Marietta Materials Dallas, TX HUB - No	S.A.T. Trucking, Inc. Azle, TX HUB - No	Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No
1. Item 302, Type B-3 Coverstone Loaded on County Truck	\$18.00 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
2. Item 302, Type B-4 Coverstone Loaded on County Truck	\$18.00 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	\$25.00
3. Item 302, Type B-5 Coverstone Loaded on County Truck	\$18.00 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
4. Item 302, Type B Grade Spec. Manu Sand Load on County Truck	\$11.00 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
5. Item 340.2(C), Cushion Sand - Fine Aggregate Loaded on County Truck	\$11.00 (Tin Top, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
6. Item 432, Riprap, 12" Loaded on County Truck	\$18.50 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
7. Item 432, Riprap, 15" Loaded on County Truck	\$18.50 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
8. Item 432, Riprap, 18" Loaded on County Truck	\$20.50 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
9. Item 432, Riprap, 24" Loaded on County Truck	\$22.50 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	No Bid
10. Item 459, Gabion Stone, 6" Loaded on County Truck	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.00

Vulcan Construction Materials did not meet specifications for item 10 because they bid 8" gabion stones instead of 6" gabion stones.

Bid No. 2016-162 Annual Contract for Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

Award Recommendation:	Primary	Primary	Primary
Item	Martin Marietta Materials Dallas, TX HUB - No	S.A.T. Trucking, Inc. Azle, TX HUB - No	Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No
11. Item 459, Gabion Stone, 9" Loaded on County Truck	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12. Item 459, Gabion Stone, 12" Loaded on County Truck	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13. Item 459, Gabion Stone, Greater than 12" Loaded on County Truck	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14. Manufactured Sand Loaded on County Truck	\$10.00 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	\$11.00
15. Rock, Belt Run, 1 1/2" Loaded on County Truck	\$18.00 (Bridgeport, TX)	No Bid	\$14.00
16. Delivery Price (Carrier Rate), FOB Job Site of Material listed above	\$0.18 per ton, per mile	\$4.10 per ton plus fuel surcharge to Pct. 4 ONLY	\$0.19 per ton, per mile
Discount for Related Items Not Specified	0%	0%	0%
Demurrage Charge Per Hour	\$50.00	NA	\$90.00
Location of Plant	Bridgeport, TX, Tin Top, TX, Chico, TX	NA	IH-20 - West of Weatherford 17 miles @ Milsap Exit
Loading Hours	Varies	NA	M-F: 5:30 a.m. to 3:30 a.m. Sat: 5:30 a.m. to 12:00 p.m.

Vulcan Construction Materials did not meet specifications for item 10 because they bid 8" gabion stones instead of 6" gabion stones.