

Bid No. 2016-152 Annual Contract for Flexible Road Base Material

Award Recommendation

	PRIMARY	PRIMARY	PRIMARY	PRIMARY
Item	CJA Enterprises LLP Collinsville, TX HUB - Yes	Lehigh Hanson Aggregates Irving, TX HUB - No	Q. Roberts Trucking, Inc. Dallas, TX HUB - Yes	S.A.T. Trucking, Inc. Azle, TX HUB - No
1. Type A, Grade 1 & 2 Loaded on County Truck	7.00	Gr. 1 - \$6.00 Gr. 2 - \$5.90	6.95	No Bid
2. Delivery Charges For Item No. 1	0.22	0.25	0.24	No Bid
3. Type A, Grade 4 Loaded on County Truck	7.00	No Bid	6.95	No Bid
4. Delivery Charges For Item No. 3	0.22	No Bid	0.24	No Bid
5. Transportation / Delivery Rate for All Material Specified Above	0.22	No Bid	0.24	4.10 Pct. 4 ONLY; additional charges for other locations
Discount for related items not listed	0%	0%	0%	0%
Demurrage charge per hour	NA	120.00	85.00	NA
Loading Hours	5 a.m. - 5 p.m.	5 a.m. - 4 p.m. M-F	7 a.m. - 5 p.m. M-F	NA
Location of Plants	Bridgeport, TX	Bridgeport, TX	Blum, TX	NA

Big City Crushed Concrete failed to meet specifications because vendor changed the specifications on the Price Form

Bid No. 2016-152 Annual Contract for Flexible Road Base Material

Award Recommendation

	PRIMARY	PRIMARY	PRIMARY
Item	P&K Stone, LLC Chico, TX HUB - No	Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX HUB - No	Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC Fort Worth, TX HUB - No
1. Type A, Grade 1 Loaded on County Truck	7.50	5.50	10.00
2. Delivery Charges For Item No. 1	No Bid	No Bid	0.18
3. Type A, Grade 2 Loaded on County Truck	7.50	No Bid	No Bid
4. Delivery Charges For Item No. 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5. Transportation / Delivery Rate for All Material Specified Above	No Bid	No Bid	0.18
Discount for related items not listed	0%	0%	0%
Demurrage charge per hour	NA	N/A	90.00
Loading Hours	4 a.m. - 5 p.m. M-F	6:30 A - 5:30 P M-F	6 a.m. - 6 p.m. M-F
Location of Plants	Chico, TX	Blum, TX	Weatherford, TX

Big City Crushed Concrete failed to meet specifications because vendor changed the specifications on the Price Form