Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source Plano Office Supply Preferred Business Solutions
Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 1 ALLSTEEL
DESK-WOOD
Concensys double ped veneer desk ] ] . ]
72"L X 36D 10 No Bid Discontinued No Bid
Concensys double ped veneer desk ] ] . ]
60"L X 30"D 10 No Bid Discontinued No Bid
Concensys double ped veneer desk ] ] . ]
79"L X 36D 10 No Bid Discontinued No Bid
DESK-LAMINATE
dgg;;;?fy; 22}.:2'6 ped wood laminate 10 No Bid Discontinued No Bid
dgg;gg?fy; 28::2'6 ped wood laminate 10 No Bid Discontinued No Bid
dgg;;;?fy; 22}.:2'6 ped wood laminate 10 No Bid Discontinued No Bid
DESK-METAL
EA-CAD-09.12 AY | 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
BOOKCASE-WOOD
YWBK330 10 | No Bid $ 1,160.00 | $ 11,600.00 | No Bid
YWBK430 10 | No Bid $ 1,319.50 | $ 13,195.00 | No Bid
YWBK530 10 | No Bid $ 1,62350 | $ 16,235.00 | No Bid
CATEGORY 1 ALLSTEEL
KL283624A 10 | No Bid $ 705.00 | $ 7,055.00 | No Bid
KL424818A 10 | No Bid $ 1,310.50 | $ 13,105.00 | No Bid
KLBC653615A 10 | No Bid $ 1,10450 | $ 11,045.00 | No Bid
KLBC723615A 10 | No Bid $ 1,178.50 | $ 11,785.00 | No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 1 ALLSTEEL
BOOKCASE-METAL
EBC30 10 | No Bid $ 253.00 | $ 2,530.00 | No Bid
EBCA42 10 | No Bid $ 30450 | $ 3,045.00 | No Bid
EBC60 10 | No Bid $ 387.50 | $ 3,875.00 | No Bid
EBC72 10 | No Bid $ 40450 | $ 4,045.00 | No Bid
LATERAL FILES
ELF236NB 10 | No Bid $ 437.00 | $ 4,370.00 | No Bid
ELF436NB 10 | No Bid $ 743.50 | $ 7,435.00 | No Bid
ELF536NB 10 | No Bid $ 933.00 | $ 9,330.00 | No Bid
VERTICAL FILES
A982 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
A984 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
A985 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
A982C 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
A984C 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
A985C 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid
TABLES
AW3LT1872F 10 | No Bid $ 173.00 | $ 1,730.00 | No Bid
AW3LT3060F 10 | No Bid $ 17850 | $ 1,785.00 | No Bid
AW3LT3072F 10 | No Bid $ 21350 | $ 2,135.00 | No Bid
TASK CHAIRS
SUM - MWA.2.0.A1.PAL.BLK * 10 | No Bid $ 648.50 | $ 6,485.00 | No Bid
(SUM.MW.2.0.BLK.1 correction)




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source Plano Office Supply Preferred Business Solutions
Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 2 ERGOGENESIS/BODYBILT
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

J3507-Leather 10 | No Bid $ 1675001 3% 16,750.00 | $ 1,08350 | $ 10,335.39

J3507-Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 1,190.00 | $ 11,900.00 | $ 81554 | $ 7,655.79

J3507-Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 1,070.00|$ 10,700.00 | $ 71458 | $ 6,769.27

R2607-Mesh Fabric Seat 10 | No Bid $ 720.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 503.73 | $ 4,537.69

J2507-Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 1,065.00]|$% 10,650.00 | $ 709.98 | $ 6,600.19
J2507-Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 94250 | $ 9,425.00 | $ 635.27 | $ 5,856.09
TASK CHAIRS

[ 12504 (Fabric) [ 10 | No Bid [$ 1,46750|$ 14,675.00 | $ 702.76 | $ 6,528.00

CATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
DESK-WOOD

Dufferin DD6030EE 60" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Dufferin DD6630EE 66" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dufferin DD7236EE 72" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
DESK-LAMINATE

Zira Z3060F22 60" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Zira Z3066F23 66" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zira Z3672F24 72" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
DESK-METAL

Streamline SD3048BG 48" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Streamline SD3060HH 60"X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
BOOKCASE-WOOD
Dufferin DB23615 (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dufferin DB43615 (3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dufferin DB53615 (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dufferin DB63615 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
BOOKCASE LAMINATE
Zira ZHBC48 ( 3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zira ZHBC65 ( 4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zira ZHBC72 ( 5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
BOOKCASE-METAL
91SBC2-36 (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
91SBC3-36 (3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
91SBC4-36 (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
91SBC5-36 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
LATERAL FILES
9336P-2F1H (2 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
9336P-4F1H (4 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
9336P-5FiH (5 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
VERTICAL FILES
25-201 (2 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
25-401 (4 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
25-501 (5 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
25-251 (2 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
25-451 (4 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
25-551 (5 Drawer) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
I I I I

TABLES

GFFT1872 18" X 72" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

GFFT3072 30" X 72" 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Boardroom Tables OV9648D 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Boardroom Tables OV12048D 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Boardroom Tables RO42D 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boardroom Tables RO48D 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TABLES

Boardroom Tables TD18 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boardroom Tables TX22 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

Accord 2670LM-2 Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Accord 2676LM-2 Mesh / Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Accord 2670-2 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Accord 2671-4 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Accord 2670-2 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accord 2671-4 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TASK CHAIRS

Ride 2621-1 Mesh Back/Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ride 2631-1 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Graphic 2739 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ride 2631-1 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Graphic 2739 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truform TS5451-3 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source Plano Office Supply Preferred Business Solutions
Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
GUEST CHAIRS

Rest 2624 (Fabric) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rest 2634 (Vinyl) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Rest 2604 (Fabric) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rest 2614 (Fabric) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
STACK CHAIRS

Sonic 6523WS (Arms) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sonic 6518WS 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sonic 6513WS (Arms) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
STACK CHAIRS
[ Sonic 6508Ws [ 10 [ No Bid [ [ No Bid [ No Bid [
DESK-WOOD

HPAO061D 68" X 30" 10| $ 1,298.70 | $ 12,987.00 | No Bid $ 151133 (% 11,513.30
HPAQ75D 72" X36" 10| $ 1,449.22 | $ 14,492.20 | No Bid $ 1,284.86 | $ 12,848.60
DESK-LAMINATE

H10771 60" X 30" 10| $ 462.56 | $ 4,625.60 | No Bid $ 42244 | $ 4,224.40

H10775 68" X30" 10| $ 52293 | $ 5,229.30 | No Bid $ 47751 | $ 4,775.70
H10791 72" X 36" 10| $ 54762 | $ 5,476.20 | No Bid $ 500.13 | $ 5,001.30
DESK-METAL

H38252L 48" X 30" 10| $ 468.05 | $ 4,680.50 | No Bid $ 418.86 | $ 4,188.60

H38155 60" X 30" 10| $ 550.37 | $ 5,503.70 | No Bid $ 49261 | $ 4,921.60
H38170 68" X 30" 10| $ 616.22 | $ 6,162.20 | No Bid $ 551.68 | $ 5,516.30
BOOKCASE-WOOD

HPC670X (2 Shelves) 10| $ 234.02 | $ 2,340.20 | No Bid $ 20549 | $ 2,054.60

HPC673X (4 Shelves) 10| $ 37985 | $ 3,798.50 | No Bid $ 333.66 | $ 3,336.60




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
Item [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 4 HON
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE

H105532 (2 Shelves) 10| $ 168.17 | $ 1,681.70 | No Bid $ 146.06 | $ 1,460.60

H105533 (3 Shelves) 10| $ 21364 | $ 2,136.40 | No Bid $ 18580 | $ 1,858.00

H105534 (4 Shelves) 10| $ 252.06 | $ 2,520.60 | No Bid $ 219.10 | $ 2,191.00
H105535 (5 Shelves) 10 [ $ 29322 | $ 2,932.20 | No Bid $ 259.91 | $ 2,599.10
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE

HS30ABC (2 Shelves) 10| $ 82711 $ 827.10 | $ 83.13 | $ 83130 | $ 59.95 | $ 599.50

HS42ABC (3 Shelves) 10| $ 99.18 | $ 991.80 | $ 99.68 | $ 996.80 | $ 7217 | $ 721.70

HS60ABC (4 Shelves) 10| $ 14857 | $ 1,485.70 | $ 14933 | $ 1,493.30 | $ 107.96 | $ 1,079.60
HS72ABC (5 Shelves) 10| $ 168.95 | $ 1,689.50 | $ 169.81 | $ 1,698.10 | $ 122.80 | $ 1,228.00
LATERAL FILES

H682 (2 Drawers) 10 | $ 27087 | $ 2,708.70 | $ 27225 | $ 2,72250 | $ 201.08 | $ 2,010.80

H684 (4 Drawers) 10| $ 470.79 | $ 4,707.90 | $ 47319 | $ 4,731.90 | $ 34949 | $ 3,494.90
H685 (5 Shelves) 10| $ 611.91 | $ 6,119.10 | $ 615.03 | $ 6,150.30 | $ 45425 | $ 4,542.50
VERTICAL FILES

H312 (2 Drawer) Letter 10 | $ 156.02 | $ 1,560.20 | $ 156.81 | $ 1,568.10 | $ 11291 | $ 1,129.10

H314C (4 Drawer) Letter 10| $ 21286 | $ 2,128.60 | $ 24901 | $ 2,490.10 | $ 178.38 | $ 1,783.80

H315 (5 Drawer) Letter 10 | $ 31242 | $ 3,124.20 | $ 314.02 | $ 3,140.20 | $ 276.11 | $ 2,261.10

H312C (2 Drawer) Legal 10| $ 188.94 | $ 1,889.40 | $ 18991 | $ 1,899.10 | $ 13590 | $ 1,359.00

H314C (4 Drawer) Legal 10 | $ 24774 | $ 2,477.40 | $ 249.01 | $ 2,490.10 | $ 178.38 | $ 1,783.80
H314C (5 Drawer) Legal 10| $ 35437 | $ 3,543.70 | $ 356.18 | $ 3,561.80 | $ 25521 | $ 2,552.10
TABLES

HTLE4896 Oval 10| $ 297.14 | $ 297140 | $ 882.95 | $ 8,829.50 | $ 756.81 | $ 7,568.10

HTLE48120 Oval 10 | $ 350.84 | $ 3,508.40 | $ 1,430.61 | $ 14,306.10 | $ 1,226.15 | $ 12,261.50

HTLE42 Round 10| $ 15053 | $ 1,505.30 | $ 24310 | $ 2,431.00 | $ 20442 | $ 2,044.20

HTLE480 Round 10 | $ 169.34 | $ 1,693.40 | $ 13751 | $ 1,375.10 | $ 139.88 | $ 1,398.80




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
Item [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 4 HON
TABLES

HTLR48 Base 10 | $ 267.74 | $ 2,677.40 | $ 269.10 | $ 2,691.00 | $ 226.26 | $ 22,162.60
HTLP96 Base 10| $ 208.15 | $ 2,081.50 | $ 209.21 | $ 2,092.10 | $ 18437 | $ 1,843.70
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

H2091 Leather 10| $ 251.66 | $ 2,516.60 | $ 25295 | $ 252950 | $ 22518 | $ 2,251.80

HN1 Mesh Back Leather seat 10| $ 41513 | $ 4,151.30 | $ 41725 | $ 417250 | $ 43497 | $ 4,349.70

H2091 Vinyl 10| $ 21011 | $ 2,101.10 | $ 21118 | $ 2,111.80 | $ 18795 | $ 5,750.00

H2092 Vinyl 10 | $ 200.70 [ $ 2,007.00 | $ 201.73 | $ 2,017.30 | $ 179.36 | $ 1,793.60

H2091 Fabric 10| $ 21011 | $ 2,101.10 | $ 21118 | $ 2,111.80 | $ 21050 | $ 2,105.00
H2092 Fabric 10 | $ 200.70 [ $ 2,007.00 | $ 201.73 | $ 2,017.30 | $ 201.91 [ $ 2,019.10
TASK CHAIRS

HN1 Mesh,High Back 10 | $ 336.73 | $ 3,367.30 | $ 33845 $ 3,384.50 | $ 30752 | $ 3,075.20

HN1 Vinyl High Back 10| $ 336.73 | $ 3,367.30 | $ 33845 | $ 3,38450 | $ 30752 | $ 3,075.20

HN1 Vinyl Mid Back 10 | $ 336.73 | $ 3,367.30 | $ 33845 | $ 3,384.50 | $ 30752 | $ 3,075.20

HN1 Fabric High Back 10| $ 336.73 | $ 3,367.30 | $ 33845 | $ 3,384.50 | $ 32256 | $ 3,225.60

HN1 Fabric Midback 10 | $ 336.73 | $ 3,367.30 | $ 33845 $ 3,384.50 | $ 32256 | $ 3,225.60

HVL220 Arms 10| $ 11564 | $ 1,156.40 | $ 116.23 | $ 1,162.30 | $ 11820 | $ 1,182.00
HVL210 10| $ 7762 $ 776.20 | $ 78.01 | $ 780.10 | $ 80.98 | $ 809.80
GUEST CHAIRS

H6008 Sled Fabric 10 | $ 175.62 | $ 1,756.20 | $ 176.51 | $ 1,765.10 | $ 153.94 | $ 1,539.40

H4003 Leg Fabric 10| $ 104.27 | $ 1,042.70 | $ 10480 | $ 1,048.00 | $ 93.08 | $ 930.80
HIGCL 10 | $ 148.96 | $ 1,489.60 | $ 155.24 | $ 1,552.40 | $ 141.05 | $ 1,410.50
STACK CHAIRS

| H4041 Sled No Arms [10]s 61.64 [ $ 616.40 | $ 247.83 | $ 2,478.30 | $ 225.18 | $ 251.80




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 5 HUMANSCALE
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Freedom F211GZ101 Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Liberty L111BM10V101 Mesh/Leathe| 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freedom F211GK101 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freedom F211GF101 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TASK CHAIRS
Freedom F211GK101 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freedom F111GF101 Fabric Arms | 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freedom F110GF101 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 5 HUMANSCALE
GUEST CHAIRS
Cinto C35510V101 Sled Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cinto C30S10V101 Sled Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Liberty L406BM10V101 Fabric Arms | 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Liberty L400BM10K101 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
STACK CHAIRS
Cinto C35S10 Sled Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cinto C30S10 Sled 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cinto C15S10 Leg Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cinto C10S10 Leg 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 6 KIMBALL
DESK-WOOD

Priority 53K3060DDFBW8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Priority 53K3066DDFBW8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Priority 53K3672DDFBW8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
DESK-LAMINATE

Priority 53K3060DDFBL8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Priority 53K3066DDFBL8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Priority 53K3672DDFBL8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
BOOKCASE-WOOD

Priority 53K3628BCOFW (2) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Priority 53K3640BCOFW (3) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Priority 53K3653BCOFW (4) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Priority 53K3667BCOFW (5) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE

Priority 53K3628BCOFL (2) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Priority 53K3640BCOFL (3) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Priority 53K3653BCOFL (4) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Priority 53K3667BCOFL (5) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
LATERAL FILES

Fundamental FND18362 - 2 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fundamental FND18364 - 4 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Fundamental FND183625 - 5 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
Item [ Oty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 6 KIMBALL
TABLES
Conferencing Solutions CCS4896RCW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Conferencing Solutions CCS48120RCW | 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Conferencing Solutions CCS42RDW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Conferencing Solutions CCS48RDW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Conferencing Solutions CBS2716CYW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Conferencing Solutions CBS2327RTW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Xtreme K31WY-L7 Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hero K275H Mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31WY Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Xtreme K31JM Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31WY Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31JM Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TASK CHAIRS
ltsa K38AA Mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31WY Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31JM Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31WY Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Xtreme K31JM Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS
Hero K570H Mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Event 95-3D-2 Sled Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Beo K58EE Legs Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Event 95-1D-2 Legs Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 6 KIMBALL
STACK CHAIRS
Bingo K50A Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bingo K50N 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
DESK-WOOD
Waveworks WWN3060DDFW8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WWN3066DDFW 8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WWN3672DDFW8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
DESK-LAMINATE
Waveworks WWN30CODDFL8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WWN3060DDFL8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WWN3672DDFLS 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
DESK-METAL
Waveworks WW3048DRFLM1 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3060DDFLM8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3066DDFLM8 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3640BCOFW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3653BCOFW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3669BCOFW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE
Waveworks WW3628BCOFL 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3640BCOFL 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3653BCOFL 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3669BCOFL 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
Item [ Oty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
BOOKCASE-METAL
Waveworks WW3642BCOFM 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3654BCOFM 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3666BCOFM 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
LATERAL FILES
Waveworks WW1836LFF2M 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW1836LFF4M 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW1836LFF5M 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TABLES
Waveworks WW3060WSSL 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW3072WSSL 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WWN4896RC2W 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WWN48120RC2W 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW42RDW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waveworks WW48RDW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Basics BW-18 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Basics 10N2428PNW 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Respect N75BAC-GR L7 Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mix-it NI5MR mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Respect N75BAC High Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Respect N75BCC Mid Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Respect N75BAC High Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Respect N75BCC Mid Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
Item [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
I I I I I
TASK CHAIRS
Mix-it N15MR Mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mix-it N12MR High Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mix-it N12JR Mid Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mix-it N12MR High Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mix-it N12JR Mid Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gotcha N25DDCX Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS
Respect N75WS-GR 2 Sled-Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Respect N75WS-GR 6 Sled 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mix-it N12QQ Legs Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jiminy N52GHM-GR2 Leg Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
STACK CHAIRS
Cinch N45AP Leg-Arm 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cinch N45AP Leg 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATAGORY 8 SIT-ON-IT
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Prava 6423T a105 (L) Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Focus 5623T a92 B1 Mesh 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prava 6423T a105 (V) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prava 6422T a105 (V) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prava 6423T a105 (F) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prava 6422T a105 (F) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATAGORY 8 SIT-ON-IT
TASK CHAIRS
Focus 5623T a92 B4 (V) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Focus 5622T a92 B4 (V) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Focus 5623T a92 B4 (F) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Focus 5622T a92 B4 (F) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non-Stop 672T2 a68 (F) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Non-Stop 672T2 (F) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS
Freelance 5234 (F) Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freelance 5233 (V) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freelance 5214 (F) Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freelance 5213 (V) 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
STACK CHAIRS
Freelance 5234 Sled Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freelance 5233 Sled 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freelance 5214 Legs Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Freelance 5213 Legs 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 9 VIA
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Carmel 6903-29C-90A Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proform 152-9C-95A Mesh 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proform Parallel 172-9C-95A 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proform 171-9C-95A Mid Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Voss 2V25-29C-19A High Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Voss 2V23-29C-80A Mid Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source Plano Office Supply Preferred Business Solutions
Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 9 VIA
TASK CHAIRS

Genie 405-61C-41A1 Arms Mesh 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Proform 172-9C-50A11 Arms Vinyl | 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Proform 171-9C-50A11 Arms Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Palmer 154-29C-50A7 H-Arms Fabri¢ 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Palmer 155-29C-50A7 M-Arm Fabric| 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brisbane HD 1503-24C-41A5 Arms | 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brisbane HD 1503-24C-0A 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS

Proform 151-24CR Sled Arms Fabric| 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vista 324B Leg Arm Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vista 304B Leg Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
STACK CHAIRS

Camden Tapered 223B Arm 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Camden Tapered 203B 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATAGORY 10 VIRCO
DESK-METAL
| Virco 543 [10]s 729.60 | $7,296.00] No Bid | [ No Bid [
BOOKCASE-METAL
| Virco BCM3652 (3) [10]s 360.00 | $ 3,600.00 [ No Bid | [ No Bid [
TABLES

Virco 603060 10 $ 165.60 | $ 1,656.00 | No Bid No Bid

Virco 603072 10| $ 17232 | $ 1,723.20 | No Bid No Bid

Virco 623072 1013 250.08 | $ 2,500.80 | No Bid No Bid

Virco Core-A-Gator 611896 10 $ 47760 | $ 4,776.00 | No Bid No Bid

Virco Core-A-Gator 613096 10| $ 52320 | $ 5,232.00 | No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Ofiice Furniture

Texas Furniture Source

Plano Office Supply

Preferred

Business Solutions

Farmers Branch, TX Plano, TX Irving, TX
HUB: yes HUB: no HUB: no
Item [ Oty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
Miscellaneous Furnitture Manufacturers Discount of List Price
% % %
1. Paoli No Bid No Bid No Bid
2. Eurotech 54.60% No Bid No Bid
3. Neutral Posture No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. Spec Furniture No Bid No Bid No Bid
5. Cabpt Wrenn No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. Arconas No Bid No Bid No Bid
7. Krug No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
PERCENT OFF LIST

ALLSTEEL No Bid 50.00% No Bid
ERGOGENESIS No Bid No Bid 67.52%
GLOBAL No Bid No Bid No Bid
HON 60.80% 60.60% TXMAS
HUMANSCALE No Bid No Bid No Bid
KIMBALL No Bid No Bid No Bid
NATIONAL No Bid No Bid No Bid
SIT-ON-IT No Bid No Bid No Bid
VIA No Bid No Bid No Bid
VIRCO 52.00% No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 1 ALLSTEEL
DESK-WOOD
Concensys double ped veneer desk ] . ]
72"L X 36D 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concensys double ped veneer desk ] . ]
60"L X 30"D 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concensys double ped veneer desk ] . ]
79"L X 36D 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DESK-LAMINATE
Concensys Double ped wood laminate . . .
desk 72"L X 36"D 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concensys Double ped wood laminate . . .
desk 60"L X 30D 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Concensys Double ped wood laminate . . .
desk 72"L X 36"D 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DESK-METAL
EA-CAD-09.12 AY | 10 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid
BOOKCASE-WOOD
YWBK330 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
YWBK430 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
YWBK530 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 1 ALLSTEEL
KL283624A 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
KL424818A 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
KLBC653615A 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
KLBC723615A 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 1 ALLSTEEL
BOOKCASE-METAL
EBC30 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EBC42 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EBC60 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
EBC72 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
LATERAL FILES
ELF236NB 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ELF436NB 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ELF536NB 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
VERTICAL FILES
A982 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
A984 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
A985 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
A982C 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
A984C 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
A985C 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TABLES
AW3LT1872F 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
AW3LT3060F 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
AW3LT3072F 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
TASK CHAIRS
SUM - MWA.2.0.A1.PAL.BLK 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 2 ERGOGENESIS/BODYBILT
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

J3507-Leather 10 | No Bid $ 1,333.00 | $ 13,300.00 | No Bid

J3507-Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 1,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | No Bid

J3507-Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 876.00 | $ 8,760.00 | No Bid

R2607-Mesh Fabric Seat 10 | No Bid $ 616.00 | $ 6,160.00 | No Bid

J2507-Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 870.00 | $ 8,700.00 | No Bid
J2507-Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 778.00 | $ 7,780.00 | No Bid
TASK CHAIRS

[ 12504 (Fabric) [ 10 [ No Bid [$ 118867 [$  11,884.70 | No Bid

GLOBALCATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
DESK-WOOD

Dufferin DD6030EE 60" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 1,556.21 | $ 15,532.10 | $ 1,596.94 | $ 15,969.40

Dufferin DD6630EE 66" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 1,604.23 | $ 16,042.30 | $ 1,648.83 | $ 16,485.30
Dufferin DD7236EE 72" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 162911 (% 16,291.10 | $ 1,675.27 | $ 16,752.70
DESK-LAMINATE

Zira Z3060F22 60" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 804.16 | $ 8,041.60 | $ 788.86 | $ 7,889.60

Zira Z3066F23 66" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 829.48 | $ 8,294.80 | $ 816.06 | $ 8,060.60
Zira Z3672F24 72" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 843.88 | $ 8,438.80 | $ 831.54 | $ 8,315.40
DESK-METAL

Streamline SD3048BG 48" X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 564.97 | $ 5,649.70 | $ 582.00 | $ 5,820.30

Streamline SD3060HH 60"X 30" 10 | No Bid $ 681.67 | $ 6,816.70 | $ 75040 | $ 7,504.00




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

GLOBALCATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
BOOKCASE-WOOD

Dufferin DB23615 (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 482.39 | $ 482390 | $ 400.53 | $ 4,005.30

Dufferin DB43615 (3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 59413 | $ 594130 | $ 500.42 | $ 5,004.20

Dufferin DB53615 (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 71329 | $ 7,13290 | $ 607.35 | $ 6,073.50

Dufferin DB63615 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 77091 | $ 7,709.10 | $ 658.94 | $ 6,589.40

Zira ZHBCA48 ( 3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 29514 | $ 2,951.40 | $ 27952 | $ 2,795.20

Zira ZHBCB65 ( 4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 37851 | % 3,785.10 | $ 369.10 | $ 3,691.00
Zira ZHBC72 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 389.42 | $ 3,804.20 | $ 380.83 | $ 3,808.30
BOOKCASE-METAL

91SBC2-36 (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 12535 | $ 1,25350 | $ 97.08 | $ 970.80

91SBC3-36 (3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 137.14 | $ 1,371.40 | $ 109.75 | $ 1,097.50

91SBC4-36 (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 173.36 | $ 1,733.60 | $ 148.67 | $ 1,486.70
91SBC5-36 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid $ 20741 | % 2,07410 | $ 185.25 | $ 1,852.50
LATERAL FILES

9336P-2F1H (2 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 29363 | % 29363 | $ 353.16 | $ 3,531.60

9336P-4F1H (4 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 47541 | $ 4,754.10 | $ 52434 | $ 6,378.40
9336P-5FiH (5 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 589.77 | $ 5897.70 | $ 637.84 | $ 6,378.40
VERTICAL FILES

25-201 (2 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 150.03 | $ 1,500.30 | $ 12897 | $ 1,289.70

25-401 (4 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 188.44 | $ 188440 | $ 17025 | $ 1,702.50

25-501 (5 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 260.90 | $ 2,609.00 | $ 24810 | $ 2,481.00

25-251 (2 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 169.24 | $ 169240 | $ 14961 | $ 1,496.10

25-451 (4 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 211.14 | $ 2,111.40 | $ 194.63 | $ 1,946.30

25-551 (5 Drawer) 10 | No Bid $ 26745 | $ 2,67450 | $ 255.14 | $ 2,551.40




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
GLOBALCATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
I I I I I

TABLES

GFFT1872 18" X 72" 10 | No Bid $ 106.61 | $ 1,066.10 | $ 9521 | $ 652.10

GFFT3072 30" X 72" 10 | No Bid $ 11795 | $ 1,17950 | $ 10740 | $ 1,074.40

Boardroom Tables OV9648D 10 | No Bid $ 1,73530 | $ 17,353.00 | $ 1,703.41 | $ 17,034.10

Boardroom Tables OV12048D 10 | No Bid $ 2,14733 | $ 21,473.30 | $ 2,146.14 | $ 21,461.40

Boardroom Tables RO42D 10 | No Bid $ 687.66 | $ 6,876.60 | $ 67442 | $ 6,744.20
Boardroom Tables RO48D 10 | No Bid $ 754.00 | $ 7,540.00 | $ 74571 | $ 7,457.10
TABLES

Boardroom Tables TD18 10 | No Bid $ 37188 | $ 3,71880 | $ 39959 | $ 3,995.90
Boardroom Tables TX22 10 | No Bid $ 37057 | $ 3,750.70 | $ 398.18 | $ 3,981.80
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

Accord 2670LM-2 Leather 10 | No Bid $ 680.25 | $ 6,802.50 | $ 603.60 | $ 6,036.00

Accord 2676LM-2 Mesh/Leather 10 | No Bid $ 620.02 | $ 6,200.20 | $ 596.10 | $ 5,961.00

Accord 2670-2 Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 49780 | $ 4,978.00 | $ 500.42 | $ 5,004.20

Accord 2671-4 Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 403.09 | $ 4,030.90 | $ 398.65 | $ 3,986.50

Accord 2670-2 Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 47772 | $ 477720 | $ 500.42 | $ 5,004.20
Accord 2671-4 Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 383.01 (% 3,830.10 | $ 398.60 | $ 39.00
TASK CHAIRS

Ride 2621-1 Mesh Back/Fabric 10 | No Bid Discontinued $ 590.00 | $ 5,900.00

Ride 2631-1 Vinyl 10 | No Bid Discontinued No Bid

Graphic 2739 Vinyl 10 | No Bid Discontinued $ 590.00 | $ 5,900.00

Ride 2631-1 Fabric 10 | No Bid Discontinued $ 296.88 | $ 2,968.80

Graphic 2739 Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 275.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 28281 | % 2,828.10

Truform TS5451-3 10 | No Bid $ 33238 | $ 3,323.80 | $ 34425 | $ 3,442.50




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 3 GLOBAL
GUEST CHAIRS

Rest 2624 (Fabric) 10 | No Bid $ 300.51 | $ 3,005.10 | $ 310.01 | $ 3,100.10

Rest 2634 (Vinyl) 10 | No Bid $ 27040 | $ 2,704.00 | $ 27765 | $ 2,776.50

Rest 2604 (Fabric) 10 | No Bid $ 283.93 | $ 283.93 [ $ 292,19 | $ 2,921.90
Rest 2614 (Fabric) 10 | No Bid $ 25381 | $ 2,538.10 | $ 259.83 | $ 2,598.30
STACK CHAIRS

Sonic 6523WS (Arms) 10 | No Bid $ 153.86 | $ 1,538.60 | $ 15242 | $ 1,524.20

Sonic 6518WS 10 | No Bid $ 13247 | $ 1,324.70 | $ 129.44 | $ 1,294.40
Sonic 6513WS (Arms) 10 | No Bid $ 135.96 | $ 1,359.60 | $ 133.20 | $ 1,332.00
STACK CHAIRS
[ Sonic 6508WS [ 10 [ No Bid [$ 232.00 [ $ 1,132.60 [ $ 108.81 [ $ 1,088.10
DESK-WOOD

HPA061D 68" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,457.72 | $ 14,577.20
HPAQ75D 72" X36" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 1,62668]|% 16,266.80
DESK-LAMINATE

H10771 60" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 519.20 | $ 5,192.00

H10775 68" X30" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 586.96 | $ 5,869.60
H10791 72" X 36" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 614.68 | $ 6,146.80
DESK-METAL

H38252L 48" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 525.36 | $ 5,253.60

H38155 60" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 617.76 | $ 6,177.60
H38170 68" X 30" 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 691.68 | $ 6,916.80
BOOKCASE-WOOD

HPC670X (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 262.68 | $ 2,626.80

HPC673X (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 426.36 | $ 4,263.60




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
Item [ Oty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 4 HON
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE

H105532 (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 188.76 | $ 1,887.60

H105533 (3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 239.80 | $ 2,398.00

H105534 (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 282.92 | $ 2,829.20
H105535 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 329.12 | $ 3,291.20
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE

HS30ABC (2 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 92.84 | $ 928.40

HS42ABC (3 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 11132 | $ 1,113.20

HSG60ABC (4 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 166.76 | $ 1,667.60
HS72ABC (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 189.64 | $ 1,896.40
LATERAL FILES

H682 (2 Drawers) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 304.04 | $ 3,040.40

H684 (4 Drawers) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 528.44 | $ 5,284.40
H685 (5 Shelves) 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 686.84 | $ 6,868.40
VERTICAL FILES

H312 (2 Drawer) Letter 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 175.12 | $ 1,751.20

H314C (4 Drawer) Letter 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 238.48 | $ 2,384.80

H315 (5 Drawer) Letter 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 350.68 | $ 3,506.80

H312C (2 Drawer) Legal 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 212.80 | $ 2,120.80

H314C (4 Drawer) Legal 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 278.08 | $ 2,780.80
H314C (5 Drawer) Legal 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 397.76 | $ 3,977.60
TABLES

HTLE4896 Oval 10 | No Bic No Bid $ 986.04 | $ 9,860.40

HTLE48120 Oval 10 | No Bic No Bid $ 1,597.64 | $ 12,976.40

HTLE42 Round 10 | No Bic No Bid $ 168.96 | $ 1,689.60

HTLE480 Round 10 | No Bic No Bid $ 190.08 | $ 1,900.80




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 4 HON
TABLES

HTLR48 Base 10 | No Bic No Bid $ 30052 | $ 3,005.20
HTLP96 Base 10 | No Bic No Bid $ 23364 9% 2,336.40
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

H2091 Leather 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 28248 | $ 2,824.80

HN1 Mesh Back Leather seat 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 465.96 | $ 4,659.60

H2091 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 299.20 [ $ 2,922.00

H2092 Vinyl 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 288.64 | $ 2,675.20

H2091 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 299.20 [ $ 2,992.00
H2092 Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 256.96 | $ 2,569.60
TASK CHAIRS

HN1 Mesh,High Back 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 37796 | $ 3,779.60

HN1 Vinyl High Back 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 399.08 | $ 3,990.80

HN1 Vinyl Mid Back 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 399.08 | $ 3,990.80

HN1 Fabric High Back 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 399.08 | $ 3,990.80

HN21 Fabric Midback 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 399.08 | $ 3,990.80

HVL220 Arms 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 129.80 | $ 12,938.00
HVL210 10 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS

H6008 Sled Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 197.12 | $ 1,971.20

H4003 Leg Fabric 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 117.04 | $ 1,170.40
HIGCL 10 | No Bid No Bid $ 19448 | $ 1,944.80
STACK CHAIRS

| H4041 Sled No Arms [ 10 [ No Bid No Bid $ 276.76 | $ 2,767.60




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 5 HUMANSCALE
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Freedom F211GZ101 Leather 10 | No Bid $ 730.25 | $ 7,302.50 | No Bid
Liberty L111BM10V101 Mesh/Leathe| 10 | No Bid $ 483.75 | $ 4,837.50 | No Bid
Freedom F211GK101 Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 566.63 | $ 5,666.30 | No Bid
Freedom F211GF101 Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 59425 | $ 5,942.50 | No Bid
TASK CHAIRS
Freedom F211GK101 Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 566.63 | $ 5,666.30 | No Bid
Freedom F111GF101 Fabric Arms 10 | No Bid $ 507.13 | $ 5,071.30 | No Bid
Freedom F110GF101 Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 46250 | $ 4,625.00 | No Bid
CATEGORY 5 HUMANSCALE
GUEST CHAIRS
Cinto C35S10V101 Sled Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 158.63 | $ 1,586.30 | No Bid
Cinto C30S10V101 Sled Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 137.38 | $ 1,378.80 | No Bid
Liberty L406BM10V101 Fabric Arms | 10 | No Bid $ 281.88 | $ 2,818.80 | No Bid
Liberty L400BM10K101 Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 24575 | $ 2,457.50 | No Bid
STACK CHAIRS
Cinto C35S10 Sled Arms No Bid $ 14163 | $ 1,416.30 | No Bid
Cinto C30S10 Sled No Bid $ 120.88 | $ 1,203.80 | No Bid
Cinto C15S10 Leg Arms No Bid $ 12463 | $ 1,246.30 | No Bid
Cinto C10S10 Leg No Bid $ 10338 | $ 1,033.80 | No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 6 KIMBALL
DESK-WOOD

Priority 53K3060DDFBW8 101]$ 157168 | $ 15,716.80 | $ 153820 | $ 15,382.40 | $ 1,471.36 | $ 14,713.60

Priority 53K3066DDFBW8 10| $ 1,585.78 | $ 15,857.80 | $ 1,552.04 | $ 15,520.40 | $ 1,48456 | $ 14,845.60
Priority 53K3672DDFBW8 10 | $ 1,667.09 | $ 16,670.90 | $ 1,631.62 | $ 16,316.20 | $ 1,560.68 | $ 15,606.80
DESK-LAMINATE

Priority 53K3060DDFBL8 10($ 1,027.42 | $ 10,274.20 | $ 1,005.56 | $ 10,055.60 | $ 961.84 | $ 9,618.40

Priority 53K3066DDFBL8 10| $ 1,040.58 | $ 10,405.80 | $ 1,01844 | $ 10,184.40 | $ 974.16 | $ 9,741.60
Priority 53K3672DDFBLS8 10 | $ 1,094.63 | $ 10,946.30 | $ 1,071.34 | $ 10,71340 | $ 1,024.76 | $ 10,247.60
BOOKCASE-WOOD

Priority 53K3628BCOFW (2) 10| $ 496.79 | $ 4,967.90 | $ 486.22 | $ 4,862.20 | $ 465.08 | $ 4,650.80

Priority 53K3640BCOFW (3) 10 | $ 607.24 | $ 6,072.40 | $ 59432 | $ 594320 | $ 568.48 | $ 5,684.80

Priority 53K3653BCOFW (4) 10| $ 71769 | $ 7,176.90 | $ 70242 | $ 7,024.20 | $ 67188 | $ 6,718.80
Priority 53K3667BCOFW (5) 10 | $ 87749 | $ 8,774.90 | $ 858.82 | $ 8,588.20 | $ 82148 | $ 8,214.80
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE

Priority 53K3628BCOFL (2) 10 | $ 27589 | $ 2,758.90 | $ 270.02 | $ 2,700.20 | $ 258.28 | $ 2,582.80

Priority 53K3640BCOFL (3) 10| $ 33746 | $ 3,374.60 | $ 330.28 | $ 3,302.80 | $ 31592 | $ 3,159.20

Priority 53K3653BCOFL (4) 10 | $ 398.56 | $ 3,985.60 | $ 390.08 | $ 3,900.80 | $ 37312 | $ 3,731.20
Priority 53K3667BCOFL (5) 10| $ 487.86 | $ 4,878.60 | $ 47778 | $ 477480 | $ 456.72 | $ 4,567.20
LATERAL FILES

Fundamental FND18362 - 2 10| $ 528.75 | $ 5,287.50 | $ 430.56 | $ 4,305.60 | $ 41184 | $ 4,118.40

Fundamental FND18364 - 4 10 | $ 73555 | $ 7,355.50 | $ 632.96 | $ 6,329.60 | $ 605.44 | $ 6,054.40

Fundamental FND183625 - 5 10| $ 931.07 | $ 9,310.70 | $ 82432 | $ 8,243.20 | $ 788.48 | $ 7,884.80




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 6 KIMBALL
TABLES

Conferencing Solutions CCS4896RCW | 10 | $ 1,069.72 | $ 10,697.20 | $ 982.10 | $ 9,821.00 | $ 1,001.44 | $ 10,014.40

Conferencing Solutions CCS48120RCW | 10 | $ 1,502.12 | $ 15,021.20 | $ 1,379.08 | $ 13,790.80 | $ 1,406.24 | $ 14,062.40

Conferencing Solutions CCS42RDW 10 | $ 477.05 | $ 4,770.50 | $ 43792 | $ 437920 | $ 446.60 | $ 4,466.00

Conferencing Solutions CCS48RDW 10 | $ 598.31 | $ 5,983.10 | $ 549.24 | $ 549240 $ 560.12 | $ 5,601.20

Conferencing Solutions CBS2716CYW | 10 | $ 502.43 | $ 5,024.30 | $ 491.74 | $ 4917.40 | $ 470.36 | $ 4,703.60
Conferencing Solutions CBS2327RTW 10 | $ 830.49 | $ 8,304.90 | $ 81282 | $ 8,128.20 | $ 77748 | $ 7,774.80
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

Xtreme K31WY-L7 Leather 10 | $ 841.77 | $ 8,417.70 | $ 743.82 | $ 7,438.20 | $ 788.04 | $ 7,880.40

Hero K275H Mesh & Fabric 10 | N/A $ 939.78 | $ 9,397.80 | $ 92224 | $ 9,222.40
Xtreme K31WY Vinyl 10| $ 642.02 | $ 6,420.20 | $ 628.36 | $ 6,283.60 | $ 601.04 | $ 6,010.40
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

Xtreme K31JM Vinyl 10| $ 611.94 | $ 6,119.40 | $ 508.92 | $ 5,989.20 | $ 57288 | $ 5,728.80

Xtreme K31WY Fabric 10| $ 642.02 | $ 6,420.20 | $ 628.36 | $ 6,283.60 | $ 601.04 | $ 6,010.40
Xtreme K31JM Fabric 10| $ 611.94 | $ 6,119.40 | $ 508.92 | $ 5,989.20 | $ 57288 | $ 5,728.88
TASK CHAIRS

Itsa K38AA Mesh & Fabric 10| $ 37741 | $ 3,774.10 | $ 356.50 | $ 3,565.00 | $ 35332 | $ 3,533.20

Xtreme K31WY Vinyl 10 | $ 642.02 | $ 6,420.20 | $ 628.36 | $ 6,283.60 | $ 601.04 | $ 6,010.40

Xtreme K31JM Vinyl 10| $ 611.94 | $ 6,119.40 | $ 508.92 | $ 5,989.20 | $ 57288 | $ 5,728.80

Xtreme K31WY Fabric 10 | $ 642.02 | $ 6,420.20 | $ 619.62 | $ 6,196.20 | $ 601.04 | $ 6,010.40
Xtreme K31JM Fabric 10| $ 611.94 | $ 6,119.40 | $ 508.92 | $ 5,989.20 | $ 57288 | $ 5,728.80
GUEST CHAIRS

Hero K570H Mesh & Fabric 10| $ 430.05 | $ 4,300.50 | $ 396.52 | $ 3,965.20 | $ 402.60 | $ 4,026.00

Event 95-3D-2 Sled Vinyl 10 | $ 21573 | $ 2,157.30 | $ 211.14 | $ 2,111.40 | $ 201.96 | $ 2,019.60

Beo K58EE Legs Fabric 10| $ 459.19 | $ 4,591.90 | $ 500.48 | $ 5,004.80 | $ 429.88 | $ 4,298.80

Event 95-1D-2 Legs Vinyl 10 | $ 159.33 | $ 1,593.30 | $ 155.94 | $ 155940 | $ 149.16 | $ 1,491.60




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
Item [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 6 KIMBALL
STACK CHAIRS
Bingo K50A Arms 10| $ 260.85 | $ 2,608.50 | $ 25530 | $ 2,553.00 | $ 24420 | $ 2,422.00
Bingo K50N 10 | $ 21103 | $ 2,110.30 | $ 206.54 | $ 2,065.40 | $ 19756 | $ 1,975.60
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
DESK-WOOD
Waveworks WWN3060DDFW 8 10 | No Bid $ 153042 | $ 15,304.02 | $ 1,452.90 | $ 14,529.00
Waveworks WWN3066DDFW 8 10 | No Bid $ 1,608.62 | $ 16,086.20 | $ 152714 | $ 15,271.40
Waveworks WWN3672DDFW8 10 | No Bid $ 1,676.24 | $ 16,762.40 | $ 159133 | $ 15,913.30
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
DESK-LAMINATE
Waveworks WWN30CODDFLS8 10 | No Bid $ 992.22 | $ 9,922.20 | $ 941.96 | $ 9,419.60
Waveworks WWN3060DDFL8 10 | No Bid $ 1,030.40 | $ 10,304.00 | $ 978.21 | $ 9,782.10
Waveworks WWN3672DDFLS 10 | No Bid $ 1,073.18 | $ 10,731.80 | $ 1,018.82 | $ 10,188.20
DESK-METAL
Waveworks WW3048DRFLM1 10 | No Bid $ 525.78 | $ 525780 | $ 499.15 | $ 4,991.50
Waveworks WW3060DDFLM8 10 | No Bid $ 642.16 | $ 6,421.60 | $ 609.63 | $ 6,096.30
Waveworks WW3066DDFLM8 10 | No Bid $ 665.62 | $ 6,656.20 | $ 631.90 | $ 6,391.00
Waveworks WW3640BCOFW 10 | No Bid $ 57730 | $ 5773.00 | $ 548.06 | $ 5,480.60
Waveworks WW3653BCOFW 10 | No Bid $ 680.80 | $ 6,808.00 | $ 646.32 | $ 6,463.20
Waveworks WW3669BCOFW 10 | No Bid $ 852.38 | $ 852,380.00 | $ 703.96 | $ 7,039.60
BOOKCASE-LAMINATE
Waveworks WW3628BCOFL 10 | No Bid $ 247.02 | $ 2,470.20 | $ 23451 | $ 2,345.10
Waveworks WW3640BCOFL 10 | No Bid $ 287.96 | $ 2,879.60 | $ 27337 | $ 2,733.70
Waveworks WW3653BCOFL 10 | No Bid $ 32982 | $ 3,298.20 | $ 31311 | $ 3,131.10
Waveworks WW3669BCOFL 10 | No Bid $ 41952 | $ 419520 | $ 346.30 | $ 34,636.00




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
BOOKCASE-METAL

Waveworks WW3642BCOFM 10 | No Bid $ 245.18 | $ 2,45180 | $ 23276 | $ 2,327.00

Waveworks WW3654BCOFM 10 | No Bid $ 282.44 | $ 2,824.40 | $ 268.13 | $ 2,681.30

Waveworks WW3666BCOFM 10 | No Bid $ 327.06 | $ 3,270.60 | $ 31049 | $ 3,104.90
LATERAL FILES

Waveworks WW1836LFF2M 10 | No Bid $ 336.72 | $ 3,367.20 | $ 319.66 | $ 3,196.60

Waveworks WW1836LFF4M 10 | No Bid $ 523.02 | $ 5,230.20 | $ 496.53 | $ 4,965.30
Waveworks WW1836LFF5M 10 | No Bid $ 692.30 | $ 6,923.00 | $ 657.23 | $ 6,572.30
TABLES

Waveworks WW3060WSSL 10 | No Bid $ 47748 | $ 477480 | $ 17162 | $ 1,716.20

Waveworks WW3072WSSL 10 | No Bid $ 51290 | $ 5,129.00 | $ 20525 | $ 2,052.50

Waveworks WWN4896RC2W 10 | No Bid $ 1,418.64 | $ 14,186.40 | $ 1,346.78 | $ 13,467.80

Waveworks WWN48120RC2W 10 | No Bid $ 1,992.26 | $ 19,922.60 | $ 1,891.35| $ 18,913.50

Waveworks WW42RDW 10 | No Bid $ 708.86 | $ 7,088.60 | $ 67295 | $ 6,729.50

Waveworks WW48RDW 10 | No Bid $ 87584 | $ 8,758.40 | $ 83148 | $ 8,314.80

Basics BW-18 10 | No Bid $ 531.30 | $ 5,313.00 | $ 504.39 | $ 5,043.90
Basics 10N2428PNW 10 | No Bid $ 679.88 | $ 6,798.80 | $ 645.44 | $ 6,454.40
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

Respect N75BAC-GR L7 Leather 10 [ No Bid $ 76452 | $ 7,645.20 | $ 725.80 | $ 7,258.00

Mix-it N15MR mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 370.30 | $ 3,703.00 | $ 35154 | $ 3,515.40

Respect N75BAC High Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 44114 1 $ 441140 | $ 418.80 | $ 4,188.00

Respect N75BCC Mid Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 42780 | $ 4,278.00 | $ 406.13 | $ 4,061.30

Respect N75BAC High Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 44114 1 $ 441140 | $ 418.80 | $ 4,188.00

Respect N75BCC Mid Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 42780 | $ 4,278.00 | $ 406.13 | $ 4,061.30




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem [ Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATEGORY 7 NATIONAL
I I I I

TASK CHAIRS

Mix-it NI5SMR Mesh & Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 370.30 | $ 3,703.00 | $ 351.54 [ $ 3,515.40

Mix-it N12MR High Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 42458 | $ 424580 | $ 403.70 | $ 4,037.00

Mix-it N12JR Mid Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 411.24 | $ 411240 | $ 39041 [ $ 3,904.10

Mix-it N12MR High Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 42458 | $ 424580 | $ 403.70 | $ 4,030.70

Mix-it N12JR Mid Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 411.24 | $ 411240 | $ 39041 [ $ 3,904.10
Gotcha N25DDCX Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 454.94 | $ 4549.50 | $ 431.90 | $ 4,319.00
GUEST CHAIRS

Respect N75WS-GR 2 Sled-Arms 10 | No Bid $ 341.78 | $ 3,417.80 | $ 32447 | $ 3,244.70

Respect N75WS-GR 6 Sled 10 | No Bid $ 386.40 | $ 3,864.00 | $ 366.83 | $ 3,668.30

Mix-it N12QQ Legs Arms 10 | No Bid $ 300.38 | $ 3,003.80 | $ 28517 | $ 2,851.70
Jiminy N52GHM-GR2 Leg Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 277.38 | $ 2,773.80 | $ 263.33 [ $ 2,633.30
STACK CHAIRS

Cinch N45AP Leg-Arm 10 $ 156.40 [ $ 15,640.00 | $ 458.97 | $ 4,589.70

Cinch N45AP Leg 10 $ 327.06 | $ 3,270.60 | $ 31049 | $ 3,104.90
CATAGORY 8 SIT-ON-IT
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS

Prava 6423T al05 (L) Leather 10 | No Bid $ 574.04 | $ 5,740.40 | No Bid

Focus 5623T a92 B1 Mesh 10 | No Bid $ 27458 | $ 2,745.80 | No Bid

Prava 6423T a105 (V) 10 | No Bid $ 379.00 | $ 3,790.00 | No Bid

Prava 6422T a105 (V) 10 | No Bid $ 364.28 | $ 3,642.80 | No Bid

Prava 6423T a105 (F) 10 | No Bid $ 379.00 | $ 3,790.00 | No Bid

Prava 6422T al105 (F) 10 | No Bid $ 364.28 | $ 3,642.80 | No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
CATAGORY 8 SIT-ON-IT
TASK CHAIRS
Focus 5623T a92 B4 (V) 10 | No Bid $ 336.22 | $ 3,362.00 | No Bid
Focus 5622T a92 B4 (V) 10 | No Bid $ 32150 | $ 3,215.00 | No Bid
Focus 5623T a92 B4 (F) 10 | No Bid $ 32522 | $ 3,252.00 | No Bid
Focus 5622T a92 B4 (F) 10 | No Bid $ 32150 | $ 3,215.00 | No Bid
Non-Stop 672T2 a68 (F) 10 | No Bid $ 653.62 | $ 6,536.20 | No Bid
Non-Stop 672T2 (F) 10 | No Bid $ 580.02 | $ 5,800.20 | No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS
Freelance 5234 (F) Arms 10 | No Bid $ 281.94 | $ 2,819.40 | No Bid
Freelance 5233 (V) 10 | No Bid $ 255.26 | $ 2,552.60 | No Bid
Freelance 5214 (F) Arms 10 | No Bid $ 218.00 | $ 2,180.00 | No Bid
Freelance 5213 (V) 10 | No Bid $ 19132 | $ 1,913.20 | No Bid
STACK CHAIRS
Freelance 5234 Sled Arms 10 | No Bid $ 239.62 | $ 2,396.20 | No Bid
Freelance 5233 Sled 10 | No Bid $ 21294 | $ 2,129.40 | No Bid
Freelance 5214 Legs Arms 10 | No Bid $ 173.68 | $ 1,736.80 | No Bid
Freelance 5213 Legs 10 | No Bid $ 147.00 | $ 1,470.00 | No Bid
CATEGORY 9 VIA
EXECUTIVE CHAIRS
Carmel 6903-29C-90A Leather No Bid $ 872.04 | $ 8,720.40 | No Bid
Proform 152-9C-95A Mesh No Bid $ 460.79 | $ 4,607.90 | No Bid
Proform Parallel 172-9C-95A No Bid $ 633.28 | $ 6,332.80 | No Bid
Proform 171-9C-95A Mid Vinyl No Bid $ 597.56 | $ 5,975.60 | No Bid
Voss 2V25-29C-19A High Fabric No Bid $ 866.87 | $ 8,668.70 | No Bid
Voss 2V23-29C-80A Mid Fabric No Bid $ 63281 | $ 6,328.10 | No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price

CATEGORY 9 VIA
TASK CHAIRS

Genie 405-61C-41A1 Arms Mesh No Bid $ 439.64 | $ 4,396.40 | No Bid

Proform 172-9C-50A11 Arms Vinyl No Bid $ 565.13 | $ 5,651.30 | No Bid

Proform 171-9C-50A11 Arms Vinyl No Bid $ 529.88 | $ 5,298.80 | No Bid

Palmer 154-29C-50A7 H-Arms Fabric No Bid $ 531.29 | $ 5,312.90 | No Bid

Palmer 155-29C-50A7 M-Arm Fabric No Bid $ 49980 | $ 4,998.00 | No Bid

Brisbane HD 1503-24C-41A5 Arms No Bid $ 502.62 | $ 5,026.20 | No Bid
Brisbane HD 1503-24C-0A No Bid $ 44457 | $ 4,485.70 | No Bid
GUEST CHAIRS

Proform 151-24CR Sled Arms Fabric| 10 | No Bid $ 408.62 | $ 4,086.20 | No Bid

Vista 324B Leg Arm Fabric 10 | No Bid $ 289.24 | $ 2,892.40 | No Bid
Vista 304B Leg Vinyl 10 | No Bid $ 288.30 | $ 2,883.00 | No Bid
STACK CHAIRS

Camden Tapered 223B Arm 10 | No Bid $ 278.90 | $ 2,789.00 | No Bid

Camden Tapered 203B 10 | No Bid $ 251.17 | $ 2,511.70 | No Bid
CATAGORY 10 VIRCO
DESK-METAL
[ virco 543 | 10 | No Bid [ B 577.39 | $ 5,773.90 | No Bid [
BOOKCASE-METAL
| virco BCM3652 | 10 | No Bid [ B 331.98 | $ 3,319.80 | No Bid [
TABLES

Virco 603060 10 | No Bid $ 136.40 | $ 1,364.00 | No Bid

Virco 603072 10 | No Bid $ 14099 | $ 1,409.90 | No Bid

Virco 623072 10 [ No Bid $ 196.05 [ $ 1,960.50 | No Bid

Virco Core-A-Gator 611896 10 | No Bid $ 350.16 | $ 3,501.60 | No Bid

Virco Core-A-Gator 613096 10 | No Bid $ 389.93 | $ 3,899.30 | No Bid




Bid No. 2016-082 Annual Contract for Miscellaneous Office Furniture

Interior Resources Royer & Schutts Business Interiors
Dallas, TX Fort Worth TX Irving TX
HUB: no HUB: yes HUB: yes
ltem | Qty Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price Price Ext. Price
Miscellaneous Furnitture Manufacturers Discount of List Price
% % %
1. Paoli No Bid No Bid 61.4% (TXMAS)
2. Eurotech No Bid No Bid 51.88%
3. Neutral Posture No Bid 40.00% No Bid
4. Spec Furniture No Bid 40.00% No Bid
5. Cabpt Wrenn No Bid 40.00% No Bid
6. Arconas No Bid 40.00% No Bid
7. Krug No Bid 40.00% No Bid
40.00% No Bid
PERCENT OFF LIST
ALLSTEEL No Bid No Bid No Bid
ERGOGENESIS No Bid 57.62% No Bid
GLOBAL No Bid 56.35% 53.10%
HON No Bid No Bid 56.00%
HUMANSCALE No Bid 57.50% No Bid
KIMBALL 53.00% 54.00% 56.00%
NATIONAL No Bid 54.00% 56.33%
SIT-ON-IT No Bid 54.00 %+Delivery No Bid
VIA No Bid 52.68% No Bid
VIRCO No Bid 60.57% No Bid
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