
Bid No. 2016-061
Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

Section 1 Qty

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension
Standard 0-1000 $31.00 $38.75 $38,750.00 $28.00 $38.00 $38,000.00
Overtime 0 $46.50 $58.21 $0.00 $42.00 $57.00 $0.00
Holiday 0 $46.50 $58.21 $0.00 $42.00 $57.00 $0.00

Standard 0-1700 $20.00 $25.00 $42,500.00 $19.00 $25.50 $43,350.00
Overtime 0 $30.00 $37.50 $0.00 $28.50 $38.25 $0.00
Holiday 0 $30.00 $37.50 $0.00 $28.50 $38.25 $0.00

$81,250.00 $81,350.00

Section 2
Standard 0-40 $14.00 $17.50 $700.00 $12.60 $17.00 $680.00
Overtime 0 $21.00 $25.20 $0.00 $18.90 $25.50 $0.00
Holiday 0 $21.00 $25.20 $0.00 $18.90 $25.50 $0.00

$700.00 $680.00

Section 3

Standard 0-40 $14.00 $17.50 $700.00 $11.94 $16.00 $640.00
Overtime 0 $21.00 $25.20 $0.00 $17.91 $24.00 $0.00
Holiday 0 $21.00 $25.20 $0.00 $17.91 $24.00 $0.00

$700.00 $640.00

Section 4

Standard 0-1200 $14.00 $17.50 $21,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Overtime 0 $21.00 $25.20 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Holiday 0 $21.00 $25.20 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$21,000.00 No Bid

Secondary

Alternate 1

Section 2 Total

Alternate 2 Secondary
Certified Medical Assistant (CMA)

Section 3 Total

Bracane Company
Plano, TX
HUB - Yes

The Evolvers Group
Flower Mound, TX                                                                                                                      

HUB - Yes
Primary

Registered Nurse (RN)

Licensed Vocational Nurse (LVN)

Section 1 Total

Certified Medical Coding 
Specialist

Section 4 Total

Alternate 1 Secondary
Phlebotomist / Laboratory 
Technician



Bid No. 2016-061
Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

Section 1 Qty

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension
Standard 0-1000 $28.10 $37.89 $37,890.00 $29.00 $38.28 $38,280.00
Overtime 0 $42.15 $56.84 $0.00 $43.50 $60.90 $0.00
Holiday 0 $42.15 $56.84 $0.00 $43.50 $60.90 $0.00

Standard 0-1700 $19.00 $25.62 $43,554.00 $20.00 $26.40 $44,880.00
Overtime 0 $28.50 $38.43 $0.00 $30.00 $42.00 $0.00
Holiday 0 $28.50 $38.43 $0.00 $30.00 $42.00 $0.00

$81,444.00 $83,160.00

Section 2
Standard 0-40 $12.50 $16.86 $674.40 $14.00 $18.48 $739.20
Overtime 0 $18.75 $25.28 $0.00 $21.00 $29.40 $0.00
Holiday 0 $18.75 $25.28 $0.00 $21.00 $29.40 $0.00

$674.40 $739.20

Section 3

Standard 0-40 $11.41 $15.39 $615.60 $13.00 $17.16 $686.40
Overtime 0 $17.12 $23.08 $0.00 $19.50 $27.30 $0.00
Holiday 0 $17.12 $23.08 $0.00 $19.50 $27.30 $0.00

$615.60 $686.40

Section 4

Standard 0-1200 $11.67 $15.74 $18,888.00 $13.00 $17.16 $20,592.00
Overtime 0 $17.51 $23.60 $0.00 $19.50 $27.30 $0.00
Holiday 0 $17.51 $23.60 $0.00 $19.50 $27.30 $0.00

$18,888.00 $20,592.00

Advance'd Temporaries, Inc.
Tyler, TX
HUB - No

Alternate 1 Alternate 2

Primary Secondary

Primary Alternate 1

Staff Today, Inc.
Covina, CA
HUB - No

Primary

Section 3 Total

Registered Nurse (RN)

Licensed Vocational Nurse (LVN)

Section 1 Total

Certified Medical Coding 
Specialist

Section 4 Total

Phlebotomist / Laboratory 
Technician

Section 2 Total

Certified Medical Assistant (CMA)



Bid No. 2016-061
Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

Section 1 Qty

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension
Standard 0-1000 $31.00 $40.30 $40,300.00 $31.00 $45.60 $45,600.00
Overtime 0 $46.50 $60.45 $0.00 $46.50 $68.40 $0.00
Holiday 0 $46.50 $60.45 $0.00 $46.50 $68.40 $0.00

Standard 0-1700 $22.00 $28.60 $48,620.00 $24.00 $35.50 $60,350.00
Overtime 0 $33.00 $42.90 $0.00 $36.00 $53.25 $0.00
Holiday 0 $33.00 $42.90 $0.00 $36.00 $53.25 $0.00

$88,920.00 $105,950.00

Section 2
Standard 0-40 $14.00 $18.20 $728.00 $15.50 $24.50 $980.00
Overtime 0 $21.00 $27.30 $0.00 $23.25 $36.75 $0.00
Holiday 0 $21.00 $27.30 $0.00 $23.25 $36.75 $0.00

$728.00 $980.00

Section 3

Standard 0-40 $14.00 $18.20 $728.00 $15.50 $24.50 $980.00
Overtime 0 $21.00 $27.30 $0.00 $23.25 $36.75 $0.00
Holiday 0 $21.00 $27.30 $0.00 $23.25 $36.75 $0.00

$728.00 $980.00

Section 4

Standard 0-1200 $14.00 $18.20 $21,840.00 $17.00 $26.00 $31,200.00
Overtime 0 $21.00 $27.30 $0.00 $25.50 $39.00 $0.00
Holiday 0 $21.00 $27.30 $0.00 $25.50 $39.00 $0.00

$21,840.00 $31,200.00

Expedient Medical Staffing
Arlington, TX
HUB - Yes

JWS Health Consultants, Inc. dba UltraStaff
Houston, TX
HUB - Yes

Licensed Vocational Nurse (LVN)

Section 1 Total

Alternate 2
Phlebotomist / Laboratory 
Technician

Registered Nurse (RN)

Section 4 Total

Certified Medical Coding 
Specialist

Section 2 Total

Certified Medical Assistant (CMA)

Section 3 Total

Alternate 2



Bid No. 2016-061
Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

Section 1 Qty

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension

Hourly Pay 
Rate to 

Temporary 
Employee

Hourly Bill Rate 
to Tarrant 

County Extension
Standard 0-1000 $34.00 $54.00 $54,000.00 $32.45 $59.00 $59,000.00
Overtime 0 $51.00 $81.00 $0.00 $48.68 $88.50 $0.00
Holiday 0 $51.00 $81.00 $0.00 $48.68 $88.50 $0.00

Standard 0-1700 $24.00 $39.00 $66,300.00 $23.10 $42.00 $71,400.00
Overtime 0 $36.00 $58.50 $0.00 $34.65 $63.00 $0.00
Holiday 0 $36.00 $58.50 $0.00 $34.65 $63.00 $0.00

$120,300.00 $130,400.00

Section 2
Standard 0-40 $15.00 $24.00 $960.00 $15.95 $29.00 $1,160.00
Overtime 0 $22.50 $36.00 $0.00 $23.93 $43.50 $0.00
Holiday 0 $22.50 $36.00 $0.00 $23.93 $43.50 $0.00

$960.00 $1,160.00

Section 3

Standard 0-40 $15.00 $24.00 $960.00 $14.85 $27.00 $1,080.00
Overtime 0 $22.50 $36.00 $0.00 $22.28 $40.50 $0.00
Holiday 0 $22.50 $36.00 $0.00 $22.28 $40.50 $0.00

$960.00 $1,080.00

Section 4

Standard 0-1200 $15.00 $24.00 $28,800.00 $15.40 $28.00 $33,600.00
Overtime 0 $22.50 $36.00 $0.00 $23.10 $42.00 $0.00
Holiday 0 $22.50 $36.00 $0.00 $23.10 $42.00 $0.00

$28,800.00 $33,600.00Section 4 Total

Certified Medical Assistant (CMA)

Section 3 Total

Phlebotomist / Laboratory 
Technician

Section 2 Total

Certified Medical Coding 
Specialist

NurseCore Management Services, LLC
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No

Cross Country Staffing, Inc.
Boca Raton, FL

HUB - No

Registered Nurse (RN)

Licensed Vocational Nurse (LVN)

Section 1 Total



Bid No. 2016-061
Annual Contract for Temporary Healthcare Personnel

Award Recommendation: Primary Bracane Company
Secondary The Evolvers Group
Alternate 1 Staff Today, Inc.
Alternate 2 Advance'd Temporaries, Inc.

Primary Staff Today, Inc.
Secondary The Evolvers Group
Alternate 1 Bracane Company `

Alternate 2 Expedient Medical Staffing

Primary Staff Today, Inc.
Secondary The Evolvers Group
Alternate 1 Advance'd Temporaries, Inc.
Alternate 2 Bracane Company

Primary Staff Today, Inc.
Secondary Advance'd Temporaries, Inc.
Alternate 1 Bracane Company
Alternate 2 Expedient Medical Staffing

    

Section 4

Section 2

Section 3

Section 1
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