BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No

1. Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11 Price per Thousand No Bid 33,640 $4.90
White over 84 Briteness. Price per Ream $3.36 $2.45
Sheets per Box 5000 5000

Price per Case $33.64 $24.50

Brand Bid Domtar Domtar/Georgia Pacific

2. Bond Paper, RECYCLED, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Price per Thousand No Bid 35,230 $7.90
Briteness: 84 or greater, Price per Ream $3.52 $3.95
100% Post-Consumer Waste. Sheets per Box 5000 5000

Price per Case $35.23 $39.50
3. Bond Paper, 20 |b., 8-1/2 x 11, Color. Price per Thousand No Bid 44,500 $7.46
Price per Ream $4.45 $3.73
Sheets per Box 5000 5000

Price per Case $44.50 $37.30
4, Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, White. Price per Thousand No Bid 45,010 $7.42
Price per Ream $4.50 $3.71
Sheets per Box 5000 5000

Price per Case $45.01 $37.10




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
5. Bond Paper, RECYCLED, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, Price per Thousand No Bid 47920 510.66
Briteness: 84 or greater, Price per Ream $4.79 55.33
100% Post-Consumer Waste. Sheets per Box 5000 5000
Price per Case $47.92 553.30
6. Bond Paper, 20 |b., 8-1/2 x 14, Color. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $10.18
Price per Ream $5.09
Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $50.90
7. Bond Paper, 20 Ib., 11 x 17, White. Price per Thousand No Bid 33,000 $11.66
Price per Ream $3.30 $5.83
Sheets per Box 2500 2500
Price per Case $33.00 $29.15
8. Bond Paper, 20 1b., 11 x 17, Color. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $15.98
Price per Ream $7.99
Sheets per Box 2500

Price per Case

$39.95




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
9. Paper, 20 Ib., Writing, 8-1/2 x 11 Capitol Bond, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
25% Cotton Bright White, Recycled, with Price per Ream
Tarrant County Watermark, Light Cockle Finish. Sheets per Box
One (1) Delivery. Price per Case
10. Paper, 24/60 |b., 8-1/2 x 11, White, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid
Accent Opaque only. Price per Ream $4.18
Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $41.80
11. Paper, 24/60 |b., 8-1/2 x 14, White, Text Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accent Opaque only. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
12.  Paper, 24/60 |b., 11 x 17, White, Text Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Accent Opaque only.

Price per Ream
Sheets per Box

Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No

13. Paper, 24/60 |b., 8-1/2 x 11, Assorted Colors, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $9.58
Pastels, Text. Price per Ream $4.79
Sheets per Box 5000

Price per Case $47.90

14. Paper, 24/60 |b., 8-1/2 x 14, Assorted Colors, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $12.86
Pastels, Text. Price per Ream $6.43
Sheets per Box 5000

Price per Case $64.30

15.  Paper, 24/60 |b., 11 x 17, Assorted Colors Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $20.22
Pastels, Text. Price per Ream $10.11
Sheets per Box 2500

Price per Case $50.55

16. Paper, 60 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Assorted Colors, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Text, Astrobrites only.

Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
17.  Paper, 60 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, Assorted Colors, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Text, Astrobrites only. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
18. Paper, 60 |b., 8-1/2 x 11 Color and White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Astrobrites only. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
19. Paper, 60 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Colors and White, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $92.80
Uncoated crack and peel Price per Ream $9.28
Sheets per Box 2000
Price per Case $185.60
20. Paper, 60 Ib., Metro Pressure Sensitive, Colors, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $121.10
Uncoated crack and peel. Hot Colors, Astrobrites Price per Ream $12.11
Sheets per Box 2000
Price per Case $242.20
21. Paper, Cover, 65 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Colors, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Parchment - Astroparch only

Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
22.  Paper, Vellum Cover, 67 |b., 8-1/2 x 11, White. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $16.40
Price per Ream $4.10
Sheets per Box 2000
Price per Case $32.80
23.  Paper, Vellum Cover, 67 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Color. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $17.32
Price per Ream $4.33
Sheets per Box 2000
Price per Case $34.64
24.  Paper, Vellum Cover, 67 Ib., Colors, 23 x 35. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $148.64
Price per Ream $37.16
Sheets per Box 750
Price per Case $111.48
25.  Vellum White Sheet, 23 x 35, 67 |bs. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $141.00
Price per Ream $35.25
Sheets per Box 750
Price per Case $105.75




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
26. Bond Paper, 70 |b., 11 x 17, White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accent Opaque, No Exceptions. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
27. Paper, 70 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, White, Accent Opaque, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Exceptions. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
28. Paper, 70 1b., 8-1/2 x 11, Color, Text. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $11.50
Price per Ream $5.75
Sheets per Box 4000
Price per Case $46.00
29. Paper, 70 1b., 8-1/2 x 14, Color, Text. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
30. 70# Springhill, Cream, 8-1/2 x 11, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Springhill only. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
31. Paper,701b., 11 x 17, Color, Text. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $24.22
Price per Ream $12.11
Sheets per Box 2000
Price per Case $48.44
32. Paper, 70 |b., 8 1/2 x 11 White Linen Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
33. Paper, 701b., 8-1/2 x 14, White Linen Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No

34. Paper, 70 lb., 8-1/2 x 11, Color, Linen, Text Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case

35. Paper, 70 |lb., 8-1/2 x 14, Color, Linen, Text, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case

36. Paper70lb., 8-1/2 X 14 White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Accent Opaque only Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case

37. Paper, 801b., 8-1/2 X 11, Color, Linen Cover Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
38. Paper, 80 1Ib., 8-1/2 X 11 White, Linen Cover Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
or comparable Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
39. 80# Cover - Accent Opaque - White, 8-1/2 X 11 Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $23.24
or comparable Price per Ream $5.81
Sheets per Box 2000
Price per Case $46.48
40. 80# Cover - Vellum, Colours, 8-1/2 X 11 Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
or comparable Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
41.  65# Cover - Vellum, Colours, 8-1/2 X11 Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $19.60
or comparable Price per Ream $4.90
Sheets per Box 2500
Price per Case $49.00




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No

42. Paper, 80 lb., 8-1/2 X 11, Text Futura Laser Gloss, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $10.96
or comparable. Price per Ream $5.48
Sheets per Box 4000

Price per Case $43.84

43. Paper, 80 Ib., 8-1/2 x 17, Text Futura Laser Gloss, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $21.92
or comparable. Price per Ream $10.96
Sheets per Box 2000

Price per Case $43.84

44,  Paper, 80 lb., 12 x 18, Text Futura Laser Gloss, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $25.44
or comparable. Price per Ream $12.72
Sheets per Box 1500

Price per Case $38.16

45.  Paper, 80 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Text, Future Laser Dull, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $11.22
or comparable. Price per Ream $5.61
Sheets per Box 4000

Price per Case $44.88

46. Paper, 80 |b., 11 x 17, Text, Future Laser Dull, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $22.44
or comparable. Price per Ream $11.22
Sheets per Box 2000

Price per Case $44.88




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No

47.  Paper, 80 lb., 12 x 18, Text Future Laser Dull, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $26.04
or comparable. Price per Ream $13.02
Sheets per Box 1500

Price per Case $39.06

48. Paper, 801b., 12 x 18, Cover Future Laser Gloss, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $21.48
or comparable. Price per Ream $5.37
Sheets per Box 2000

Price per Case $42.96

49. Paper, 801Ib., 11 x 17, Cover Futura Laser Gloss, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $42.96
or comparable. Price per Ream $10.74
Sheets per Box 1000

Price per Case $42.96

50. Paper, 80 Ib., 12 x 18, Cover Futura Laser Gloss Gloss, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $48.88
or comparable. Price per Ream $12.22
Sheets per Box 750

Price per Case $36.66

51. Paper, 80 1b., 8-1/2 x 11, Cover Futura Laser Dull, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $22.00
or comparable. Price per Ream $5.50
Sheets per Box 2000

Price per Case $44.00




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
52. Paper, 801b., 11 x 17, Cover Futura Dull, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $44.00
Price per Ream $11.00
Sheets per Box 1000
Price per Case $44.00
53.  Paper, 80 Ib., 12 x 18 Cover Futura Laser Dull, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $50.00
or comparable Price per Ream $12.50
Sheets per Box 750
Price per Case $37.50
54.  Paper, Card Cover, 80 Ib., 3-1/2 X 8-1/2 Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hi Bulk - Vellum Finish, Wrapped 500/pkg Price per Ream
At lease 11.5 pt Sheets per Box
Price per Case
Brand Bid
55.  Paper, Index, 90 lb., 22-1/2 x 35 Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $165.20
Assorted Colors, Boxed 500/box. Price per Ream $41.30
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $82.60




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
56. Paper, Index, 90 |b. 22-1/2 x 35 White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $156.92
Boxed, 500/box Price per Ream $39.33
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $78.46
57. Paper, 20 Ib., 25% Cotton, 8-1/2 x 11 Nekoosa Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
Brand Bid
58. Envelope, #10, 24 |Ib., White, No Window, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $14.98
Executive Flap, or Pointed Flap, 500/bx., Price per Ream $7.49
2500/cs. No Exceptions. Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $37.45
Brand Bid Print Master
59. Envelope, #14, 28 |Ib., No Window, Brown Kraft, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $49.14
500/box 25000/cs Price per Ream $24.57
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $122.85

Brand Bid

Print Master




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
60. Envelope, #11, 24 Ib., Standard Window, White, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $32.14
Top open Gummed flap 500/bx. Price per Ream $16.02
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $80.10
Brand Bid Print Master
61. Envelope, #11, 24 Ib., No Window, White, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $28.60
Top open Gummed flap 500/bx. Price per Ream $14.30
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $71.50
Brand Bid Print Master
62. Envelope, #10, 24 Ib., Window, White, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $17.98
500/bx., 2500/cs Price per Ream $8.99
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $44.95
Brand Bid Print Master
63. Envelopes, #10 24 Ib., Brown Kraft. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $23.00
Price per Ream $11.50
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $57.50

Brand Bid

Print Master




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
64. Envelopes#9 24 |b., Colors, 500/bx., 2500/cs. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $22.32
Price per Ream $11.16
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $55.80
Brand Bid Print Master
65. #10 Envelopes — Astrobrites. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
66. #9 Envelopes — Astrobrites Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
67. #10 Envelopes — Pastels. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
68. #10 Envelopes — Springhill, Cream Only Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $22.32
Price per Ream $11.16
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $55.80
Brand Bid
69. #9 Envelopes — Standard Window — White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $17.98
Price per Ream $8.99
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $44.95
70.  #9 Envelopes —Standard Window -White with Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $20.26
blue inside tint Price per Ream $10.13
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $50.65
Brand Bid Print Master
71. #10 Envelopes —Standard Window -White with Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $20.26
blue inside tint Price per Ream $10.13
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $50.65




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
72. #10 Envelopes - Right Hand Window. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $18.26
Price per Ream $9.13
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $45.65
73.  #14 Envelope - White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $41.72
Price per Ream $20.86
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $104.30
74. Catalog Envelope, #12-1/2, 28 |b., Open End, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $83.32
Peel and Seal, 9-1/2 x 12-1/2, Brown Kraft. Price per Ream $41.66
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $41.66
75. 60#, #10 Standard Envelpes Springhill Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $22.32
Price per Ream $11.16
Sheets per Box 500
Price per Case $55.80

Brand Bid




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No

76. Catalog Envelopes, #1, 24 |b., 6 x 9 Open End Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $27.12

Kraft Brown Price per Ream $13.56
Sheets per Box 500

Price per Case $13.56

77. Catalog Envelope, #1, 24 Ib., 6 x 9 Open End Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $25.98

White Price per Ream $12.99
Sheets per Box 500

Price per Case $12.99

78. Envelopes, #9, 24 |b., White, No Window Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $15.70

3-7/8 x 8-7/8 Price per Ream $7.85

Sheets per Box 500

Price per Case $39.25

79. Catalogue Envelopes, Open End, 24 |b., White Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $72.54

Peel and Seal, 9x 12 Price per Ream $36.27
Sheets per Box 500

Price per Case $36.27




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
80. Cards, Baronial 5-1/2" Folding Panel Cards, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah Classic Crest, Color: Classic Cream. Price per Ream
No Exceptions. Sheets per Box
Price per Case
81. Envelopes, Baronial 6" Panel Cards, , Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah Classic Crest, Color: Classic Cream. Price per Ream
No Exceptions. Sheets per Box
Price per Case
82. Envelopes, Baronial 5-1/2" Envelopes, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah Classic Crest, Color: Classic Cream. Price per Ream
No Exceptions. Sheets per Box
Price per Case
83. Envelopes, Baronial 6" Envelopes, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Neenah Classic Crest, Color: Classic Cream. Price per Ream
No Exceptions. Sheets per Box
Price per Case
84.  Fan A Part Adhesive - Nekoosa only Price per Quart No Bid No Bid $32.14
Quart
Price per Case $32.14




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
85. NCR Paper, 201b., 8-1/2 x 11, 2 Pt,, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $14.40
Black Ink Transfer only, Reverse,. Price per Ream $7.20
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $72.00 <Neroosa Bid
86. NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, 3 Pt., Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $16.22
Black Ink Transfer only, Reverse , Price per Ream $8.11
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $81.10 <Neroosa Bid
87. NCR Paper, 201b., 8-1/2 x 11, 4 Pt., Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $17.34
Black Ink Transfer only, Reverse Sequence, Price per Ream $8.67
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $86.70 <Neroosa Bid
88. NCR Paper, 20 Ib., 8-1/2 x 14, 2 Pt., Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $18.32
Black Ink Transfer only, Reverse Sequence, Price per Ream $9.16
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $91.60 <Neroosa Bid




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
89. NCR Paper, 20 Ibs., 8-1/2 x 14, 3 Pt, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $20.64
Black Ink Transfer only, Reverse, Price per Ream $10.32
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $103.20 <Neroosa Bid
90. NCR Paper, 20 Ibs., 8-1/2 x 14, 4 Pt., Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $22.08
Black Ink Transfer only, Reverse, Price per Ream $11.04
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $110.40 <Neroosa Bid
91. NCR Paper,20 lbs., 8-1/2x 11,1 Pt,, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $16.06
White Coated Back only and Black Ink Transfer. Price per Ream $8.03
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $80.30 <Neroosa Bid
92. NCR Paper, 8-1/2x11,1Pt,, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $19.46
White Coated Back Front and Black. Price per Ream $9.73
Excel. Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $97.30 <Neroosa Bid




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
93. NCR Paper, 20 Ibs., 8-1/2 x 11, 1 part, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $19.68
Black Ink Transfer only, Coated Front and Back, Price per Ream $9.84
Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Golden Rod. Sheets per Box 5000
Excel. Price per Case $98.40 <Neroosa Bid
94. NCR Paper, 20 Ibs., 8-1/2 x 11, 1 part, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $12.68
Black Ink Transfer only, Coated Front Price per Ream $6.34
Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Golden Rod, Sheets per Box 5000
Excel. Price per Case $63.40 <Neroosa Bid
95. NCR Paper, 201b., 8-1/2 x 11, 1 part, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $16.28
Black Ink Transfer only, Coated Back Price per Ream $8.14
Colors: Yellow, Pink, Blue, Green, Golden Rod. Sheets per Box 5000
Excel. Price per Case $81.40 <Neroosa Bid
96. NCR Manila Card, 90 Ib., 8-1/2 x 11, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $37.40
Black Ink Transfer Only. Coated on Front, Price per Ream $9.35
Excel. Sheets per Box 2500
Price per Case $93.50 <Neroosa Bid




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
97. NCR-1-part 8-1/2 x 14 — CFB, Colors. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $25.06
Black Ink Transfer. Excel. Price per Ream $12.53
Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $125.30 <Neroosa Bid
98. NCR-1-part 8-1/2 x 14 — CB, White. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $20.60
Black Ink Transfer. Excel. Price per Ream $10.30
Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $103.00 <Neroosa Bid
99. NCR-1-part 8-1/2 x 14 — CF, Colors. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $16.10
Black Ink Transfer. Excel. Price per Ream $8.05
Sheets per Box 5000
Price per Case $80.50 <Neroosa Bid
100. NCR Computer Paper, 21 lbs., 9-1/2 x 11, 1-Part No Bid No Bid
Continuous, Bright White, Laser Bond, Price per Thousand $10.50
1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs each side. Count per Box 2500
Price per Case $26.25
Brand Bid Alliance -TST




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
101. NCR Paper, 20 lb., 9-1/2 x 11, 2-Part Continuous No Bid No Bid
Form, Bright White CB, White CF, Laser Bond, Price per Thousand $32.10
1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs each side. Carbonless. Count per Box 1700
Price per Case $54.57
Brand Bid Alliance -TST
102. NCR Paper, 9-1/2 x 11, 19 |b., 3-Part Continuous No Bid No Bid
Form, Bright White, White CFB, White CF, Laser Price per Thousand $50.70
Bond 1/2" Pin-Fed Perfs each side. Carbonless. Count per Box 1200
Price per Case $60.84
Brand Bid Alliance -TST
103. NCR Paper, 19 |b., 9-1/2 x 11, 3-Part Continuous No Bid No Bid
Form, W/C/P, Black Ink Transfer. Price per Thousand $53.55
Count per Box 1200
Price per Case $64.26
Brand Bid Alliance -TST
104. Green Bar Computer Paper, 1-pt Grn, No Bid No Bid
14-7/8 x 11". Price per Thousand $15.70
Count per Box 2700
Price per Case $42.39

Brand Bid

Alliance -TST




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Executive Forms Lighthouse for the Blind Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
105. Labels, 2-Up, Cut Sheet, Bright White,
Laser Quality, 4" w x 1-7/16" |, 14 Labels per Sheet, Price per Thousand $82.00 No Bid No Bid
1,000 Sheets per Carton, Four (4) 250-Sheet Sheets per Box
Individually Wrapped Packets per Carton. Price per Case 25,000 minimum
106. Labels, 2-Up, Cut Sheet, Bright White,
Laser Quality, 3-1/2" w x 3/4" |, 28 Labels per Sheet, Price per Thousand $105.00 1-4 cases No Bid No Bid
1,000 Sheets per Carton, Four (4) 250-Sheet Sheets per Box $92.00 5+ cases
Individually Wrapped Packets per Carton. Price per Case
107. Computer Labels, 4-Up, Continuous Pin Feed, Price per Thousand $3.00 No Bid No Bid
3.3"x 15/16", 48 Labels Per Sheet, 20,000 Per Box Price per Ream 3 BOX of 20,000 =
Sheets per Box 60,000 min order
Price per Case
108. Card Stock, Cut Sheet, Bright White, Laser Quality,
8-1/2"w x 10" 1, 2 each, 8" w x 5" | Cards per Sheet, Price per Thousand $44.00 No Bid No Bid

1/2" Tear-Off Strip Along One Side of 8-Separation
Perf Between the 2 Cards, 1/2" w, 1,000 Sheets

per Carton, Four (4) 250-Sheet Individually Wrapped
per Carton

Sheets per Box
Price per Case

30,000 Minimum




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
109. #6 Tags with Reinforced Hole, Manila 10 point,
Gangs of 4. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
Brand Bid
110. #6 Tags with Reinforced Hole, Hot Colors, 10 point,
Gangs of 4. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
Brand Bid
111. #8 Tags with Reinforced Hole, Manila 10 point, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gangs of 4. Price per Thousand
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
112. #8 Tags with Reinforced Hole, Hot Colors, 10 point, No Bid No Bid No Bid

Gangs of 4.

Price per Thousand
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

VENDORS

Executive Forms

Lighthouse for the Blind

Western-BRW Paper Co.

} of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
113. Door Hangers, Die Cut, 3 up on 81/2 x 11, Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hot Color. Price per Ream
Sheets per Box
Price per Case
114. Chipboard, 8-1/2 x 11, .22 thick. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $28.00
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box 960
Price per Case $28.00
115. Chipboard, 8-1/2 x 14, .22 thick. Price per Thousand No Bid No Bid $28.00
Price per Ream
Sheets per Box 720
Price per Case $28.00
116 Letterhead Boxes - Knock-down, #6040 for No Bid No Bid No Bid

8-1/2 x 11.

Price per Thousand
Sheets per Box
Price per Case




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
117. Business Card Boxes #581001 - 7-% x 3% x 2. No Bid No Bid No Bid
(Knock-down - flat in bundles). Price per Thousand
Count per Box
Price per Case
Required Sample Furnished
118. Engineering Bond, 20 Ibs. 24 x 500, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Océ Only. Price Per EA
Price pre roll/pack or box:
Feet Per Roll:
119. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 18 x 500, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Océ Only. Price Per EA
Price pre roll/pack or box:
Feet Per Roll:
120. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 18 x 500, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid
Equivalent to Océ.
Price pre roll/pack or box: $10.74
#rolls per case 4 RL per case
If bidding equivalent, state brand: Roll Bond




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
121. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 24 x 500 Roll, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Océ Only.
Price pre roll/pack or box:
#rolls per case
122. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 24 x 500 Roll, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid
Equivalent to Océ
Price pre roll/pack or box: $15.95
#rolls per case 2 RL per case
If bidding equivalent, state brand: Roll Bond
123 Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 30 x 500 Roll, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Océ Only.
Price pre roll/pack or box:
124. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 30 x 500 Roll, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid
Equivalent to Océ
Price pre roll/pack or box: $19.50
#rolls per case 2 RL per case
If bidding equivalent, state brand: Roll Bond




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
Oklahoma City, OK of Fort Worth Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
125. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 36 x 500 Roll, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid No Bid
Océ Only.
Price pre roll/pack or box:
#rolls per case
126. Engineering Bond, 24 Ibs. 36 x 500 Roll, 3" CR, No Bid No Bid
Equivalent to Océ
Price pre roll/pack or box: $23.45
#rolls per case 2 RL per case
If bidding equivalent, state brand: Roll Bond
127. Engineering Bond, 3"Core, 42"X150', No Bid No Bid
Océ PHPPR 8MIL Satin Photopaper for.
Océ ColorWave 600 Printer
Price pre roll/pack or box: $97.60
128. Engineering Bond, 3"Core, 42"X150', No Bid No Bid No Bid

Océ 6028-28 lbs Presentation Paper for,
Océ ColorWave 600 Printer
Price pre roll/pack or box:




BID NO. 2016-027 SEMI-ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR COPY PAPER, STOCK PAPER AND ENVELOPES

ITEM VENDORS
NO. DESCRIPTION
Lighthouse for the Blind
Executive Forms Western-BRW Paper Co.
. of Fort Worth
Oklahoma City, OK Carrollton, TX
HUB-No Fort Worth, TX HUB- No
HUB - No
129 Engineering Bond, 3"Core, 36"X500', No Bid No Bid $20.80
Océ 4511R 20lbs Bond for Océ
Océ ColorWave 600 Printer
Price pre roll/pack or box:
130 Engineering Bond, 3" Core, 24"X550', No Bid No Bid $14.75

Océ 4511R 20lbs Bond for Océ
Océ ColorWave 600 Printer

Price pre roll/pack or box:
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